City of

Ofinge Beach

Life is better here

UNIT PRICE BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Name:

ATHLETIC UNIFORMS (PARKS & REC)

Requisition No. 2018-0206

Bid Date: February 8, 2018
Bid Opening Time: 11:00 AM

DAVID BOWEN AMERICAN SOCCER COMPANY RIVERBEND ENTERPRISES
DEEP SOUTH APPAREL SPORTING GOODS BSN SPORTS dba SCORE SPORTS PROTIME SPORTS dba EAST BAY ENGRAVING RIDDELL
Sport Item Style and Description Qty Sizes Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Soccer Jersey: High Five Mundo —Y #322861, A #322860 150 Youth $14.00 $16.35 $18.00 $6.50 $12.10 $16.80 $14.96
Front Print — One color OB horizontal logo center chest 20 Adult $15.00 $17.65 $19.00 $6.50 $13.10 $16.80 $17.47
Back Print — One color sponsor logo & 6” number
Shorts: High Five Primo — Y #325391, A #325390 150 Youth $7.00 $6.75 $7.00 $5.00 $5.20 $8.35 $6.89
20 Adult $8.00 $8.05 $8.00 $5.00 $5.40 $8.35 $8.69
Socks: High Five Athletic Sock — #328030 170 Pairs All $4.25 $3.25 $4.00 $2.00 $2.70 $3.95 $4.44
"Soccer" Subtotal: $48.25 $52.05 $56.00 $25.00 $38.50 $54.25 $52.45
Basketball Jersey: Champro Reversible Clutch — Y #BBJ11Y, A #BBJ11 150 Youth $14.50 $24.20 $28.00 $8.50 $12.25 $21.25 $20.88
Front Print — One color OB horizontal logo center chest & 4” number 40 Adult $14.75 $24.65 $28.00 $8.50 $13.15 $21.25 $23.39
Back Print — One color sponsor logo & 6” number
Shorts: Champro Clutch — Y #BBS11Y, A #BBS11 150 Youth $6.00 $6.00 $5.75 $6.00 $8.05 $7.55 $4.78
40 Adult $6.50 $6.75 $5.75 $6.00 $8.95 $7.55 $5.48
""Basketball" Subtotal: $41.75 $61.60 $67.50 $29.00 $42.40 $57.60 $54.53
Baseball Jersey: Champro Wildcard 2-Button — Y #BS63Y, A #BS63A 150 Youth $11.50 $14.80 $15.00 $17.95 $11.60 $18.85 No Bid
Front Print — One color OB horizontal logo center chest 30 Adult $12.00 $15.25 $16.00 $17.95 $12.60 $18.85 No Bid
Back Print — One color sponsor logo & 6” number
Pants: Champro MVP Open Bottom — Y #BP4UY, A #BP4U 150 Youth $10.50 $12.00 $12.50 $9.20 $10.20 $12.95 $10.38
30 Adult $11.50 $13.70 $13.00 $9.20 $11.10 $14.45 $11.90
Belts: Champro MVP Baseball Belt — Y #A062, A #A062 150 Youth $3.50 $2.95 $2.75 $3.95 $2.70 $4.65 $2.37
30 Adult $3.50 $2.95 $2.75 $3.95 $2.70 $4.65 $2.37
Hats: OC Sports Cotton Twill Cap with Velcro Back — #MLB808 150 Youth $7.25 $8.30 $6.00 $7.45 $7.50 $7.90 No Bid
One color vertical OB logo embroidered on front 30 Adult $7.25 $8.30 $6.00 $7.45 $7.50 $7.90 No Bid
"Baseball" Subtotal: $67.00 $78.25 $74.00 $77.10 $65.90 $90.20 $27.02
Softball Jersey: Augusta Two Button Sleeveless — Y #551, A #550 60 Youth $11.50 $14.75 $14.50 $9.85 $14.85 $14.45 $12.35
Front Print — One color OB horizontal logo center chest 15 Adult $12.50 $16.50 $16.50 $9.85 $15.75 $14.45 $16.10
Back Print — One color sponsor logo & 6” number
Pants: Champro Tournament Low-Rise Fastpitch — Y #BP11Y, A #BP11 60 Youth $11.25 $12.75 $13.00 $9.20 $11.50 $17.90 $11.20
15 Adult $12.75 $15.40 $14.00 $9.20 $12.40 $17.90 $13.30
Socks: Champro Solid Color Socks 75 Pairs All $3.75 $2.35 $2.50 $2.00 $2.70 $3.95 $2.18
Belts: Champro MVP Baseball Belt — Y #A062, A #A062 60 Youth $3.50 $2.95 $2.75 $3.95 $2.70 $4.65 $2.37
15 Adult $3.50 $2.95 $2.75 $3.95 $2.70 $4.65 $2.37
Visors: OC Sports Cotton Twill Visor — #PCTV-100 75 All $7.25 $8.30 $6.25 $7.45 $7.50 $7.90 No Bid
One color OB logo embroidered on front
"Softball" Subtotal: $66.00 $75.95 $72.25 $55.45 $70.10 $85.85 $59.87
GRAND TOTAL: $223.00 $267.85 $269.75 $186.55 $216.90 $287.90 $193.87
Substitutions Substitutions Substitutions +$22:tr;5::lzx|.

Tabulated by R.Eberly 2/8/2018




