BID TABULATION FOR FIRE HYDRANTS

COMPANY NAME HYDRANT 4FT 5FT TERMS-DELIVERY-NOTES
AND ADRESS MAKE & MODEL BURY BURY
Mueller Company Mueller Super $1,725.00 $1,825.00 2% 15 days net 30
500 West Eldorado Street Centurion 250 28 day lead time

Decatur, IL 82522

American Cast lron Pipe Co. American- $1,792.75 $1,893.75 Deliver 3-4 weeks ARO
1501 31st Ave., North Dariing **AFC Fire Hydrants are also avallable
|Birmingham, AL 35207 with a 6" Alpha base in lieu of a 6" MJ

base at $1,827.75 for 4ft ydrant and
$1,928.75 for 5ft hydrant




BID TABULATION FOR HYDRANT REPAIR PARTS

MUELLER 5-1/4" CENTURION FIRE HYDRANTS

PART NO
R

A-301
A-1
A-2
A-3
A-4
A-5
A6
A7
A-8
A-S
A-10
A-11
A-12
A-25
A-26
A-27
A-28
A-29
A-30
A-31
A-45
A-46
A-51

DESCRIPTION MUELLER CO AMERICAN CAST IRON

Safety Flange Repair Kit $185.59 NO BID
Operating Nut $148.72 NO BID
Weather Cap $22.76 NO BID
Hold Down Nut O-Ring $5.86 NO BID
Hold Down Nut $47.25 NO BID
Bonnet O-Ring $5.86 NO BID
Anti-Friction Bearing $1.74 NO BID
Oil Filler Plug $3.05 NO BID
Bonnet Gasket $235.10 NO BID
Bonnet Bolt & Nut $6.58 NOBID
Bonnet Gasket $12.53 NO BID
Upper Stem $131.73 NO BID
Stem O-Ring $5.86 NO BID
Safety Stem Coupling $56.42 NO BID
Safety Flange Bolt & Nut $6.58 NO BID
Safety Flange Gasket $12.53 NO BID
Safety Flange $62.57 NO BID
Cotter Pin $1.28 NO BID
Clevis Pin $8.08 NO BID
Lower Stem $100.57 NO BID
Main Valve $116.45 NO BID
Lower Valve Plate $19.59 NO BID
Hydrant Lubricating Oil-per gal. $38.65 NO BID
Main Valve Repair Kit #2680359 $353.35 NO BID
Extension Kit complete with
stem,barrel,steel coupling,flange,
gaskets,lubricant,botls,nuts,pins

6" Length $297.62 NO BID

12" Length $349.96 NO BID

18" Length $396.21 NO BID

24" Length $445.66 NO BID

TOTAL $3,078.15 $0.00



MUELLER 5-1/4" IMPROVED FIRE HYDRANTS

PART NO DESCRIPTION MUELLER CO AMERICAN CAST IRON
A-301-01 Safety Flange Repair Kit $127.94 NO BID
H-51 Operating Nut $148.72 NO BID
H-52 Weather Cap $23.81 NO BID
H-101 Hold Down Nut O-Ring $5.86 NO BID
H-102 Lock Washer $10.69 NO BID
H-100 Bonnet O-Ring $5.86 NO BID
H-53 Hold Down Nut $47.25 NO BID
H-98 Oil Filler Plug $3.05 NO BID
H-99 Bonnet NO BID NO BID
H-59 Bonnet Gasket $12.53 NO BID
H-65 Bonnet Boit $6.58 NO BID
H-93 O-Ring $5.86 NO BID
H-103 Upper Stem $144.08 NO BID
H-137 Cotter Pin $1.28 NO BID
H-136 Clevis Pin $8.08 NO BID
H-125 Safety Stem Coupling $56.42 NO BID
H-76 Safety Flange Gasket $12.53 NO BID
H-77 Safety Flange $62.57 NO BID
H-78 Safety Flange Bolt $6.58 NO BID

TOTAL $689.69 $0.00

MUELLER 5-1/4" MODERN IMPROVED FIRE HYDRANTS

PART NO DESCRIPTION MUELLER CO AMERICAN CAST IRON
A-307 Safety Flange Repair Kit $167.16 NO BIiD
H-51 Operating Nut $148.72 NO BID
H-100 Housing O-Ring $5.86 NOBID
H-201 Weather Cap NO BID NO BID
H-101 Hold Down Nut O-Ring $5.86 NO BID
H-203 Lock Washer $15.80 NO BID
H-202 Hold Down Nut $60.74 NOBID
H-93 Stem O-Ring $5.86 NOBID
H-206 Upper Stem $116.85 NOBID
H-209 Safety Flange Bolt & Nut $6.58 NOBID
H-210 Safety Flange Kit $5.37 NO BID
H-208 Upper Barrel Seal $35.03 NO BID
H-136 Clevis Pin $6.08 NO BID
H-125 Safety Stem Coupling $56.42 NO BID
H-137 Cotter Pin $1.28 NO BID

TOTAL $639.71 $0.00



