TULARE CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT
BID OPENING RECAP

PROJECT NAME: INSTALLATION OF PAINTING AT VARIOUS SITES
DATE/TIME: MARCH 18, 2020 AT 11:00 A.M.
LOCATION: TULARE CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT BOARD ROOM, 600 N CHERRY ST. TULARE CA.
ATTENDED
MANDATORY WALK SUFFICIENT BID
DESIGNATION | WORKERS | NONCOLLUSION FINGERPRINT GARDEN LOS TULES
BIDDERS NAME THROUGH ON FUND DIR BOND/CASHIER | ADDEN #1 | ADDEN #2 [MAPLE SCHOOL
OF SUBS COMP. DEC. ACKNOWLEDGEMENT SCHOOL MIDDLE SCHOOL
03/03/20 DECLARATION CHECK
(Y ORN)

COLOR NEW COMPANY
22855 CALIF ST. y N y Y Y y Y BID BOND Y Y $127,000.00 $74,000.00 $34,000.00
WOODLAND HILLS, CA.
D & D PAINTING CO.
44 WORELL ROAD y N y Y Y y Y BID BOND Y y $35,000.00 $28,000.00 $16,500.00
ANTIOCH, CA.
DISTRICT COUNCIL 16
4650 E. WEATHERMAKER y NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRESNO, CA
EUROPEAN STYLE PAINT
P.0. BOX 1242 y N y Y Y y Y BID BOND Y y $44,880.00 $32,000.00 $14,900.00
CRESTLINE, CA
GDL PAINTERS INC.
9015 E AVE, R 8 y N y Y Y y Y BID BOND Y y $51,680.00 $31,920.00 $15,300.00
LITTLE ROCK, CA
H.B. RESTORATION INC.
5907 26TH ST y N y Y Y y Y BID BOND Y Y $72,000.00 $57,000.00 $18,000.00
RIO LINDA, CA.
J P B DESIGNS INC
6021 KEATS CIRCLE y N y Y Y y Y BID BOND Y Y $100,000.00 $69,000.00 $30,000.00
ORANGEVALE, CA
KREEL & COMPANY
1609 ESTES AVE y N y Y Y y Y BID BOND Y y NO BID $39,945.00 $18,965.00

CORCORAN, CA.




ATTENDED
MANDATORY WALK SUFFICIENT BID
DESIGNATION | WORKERS | NONCOLLUSION FINGERPRINT GARDEN LOS TULES
BIDDERS NAME THROUGH ON OF SUBS COMP DEC FUND DIR ACKNOWLEDGEMENT BOND/CASHIER | ADDEN #1 | ADDEN #2 [MAPLE SCHOOL SCHOOL MIDDLE SCHOOL
03/03/20 . . DECLARATION CHECK
(YORN)

KRONOS PAINT
8444 ACBIA STREET Y N Y Y Y Y Y BID BOND Y Y $64,900.00 $94,860.00 $33,950.00
DOWNEY, CA.
OMEGA CONSTRUCTION
P.0. BOX 7038 Y NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Y Y NO BID NO BID NO BID
NORTHRIDGE, CA
PACIFIC CONTRACTORS
19025 PARTHENIA ST. Y N Y Y Y Y Y BID BOND Y Y $92,000.00 $58,000.00 $24,000.00
NORTHRIDGE, CA
PIANA CONSTRUCTION
16352 BARNESTON ST. Y N Y Y Y Y Y BID BOND % Y $94,000.00 $54,000.00 $34,000.00
GRANADA HILLS, CA
PREP RIGHT PAINTING
11445 OAK STREET Y NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ARMONA, CA
PRO EX CONSTRUCTION
2216 CEMO CIRCLE, STE B Y N Y Y Y Y Y BID BOND Y Y $35,893.00 $21,500.00 VOID BID
RANCHO CARDOVA, CA.
RAMUSSEN PAINTING
2315 S. UNIVERSITY Y NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VISALIA, CA
TARLTON AND SON
3562 S.ELM Y NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRESNO, CA,
US NATIONAL CORP
10205 SAN FERNANDO RD Y N Y Y Y Y Y BID BOND Y Y $29,500.00 $22,000.00 $18,000.00
PACOIMA CA
VLA CONSTRUCTION
22815 VENTURES BLVD #157 Y N Y Y Y Y Y BID BOND % Y $105,000.00 $66,000.00 $46,900.00
WOODLAND HILLS, CA
WN B. SALEH CO
1364 N. JACKSON AVE Y N Y Y Y % Y BID BOND % Y $107,500.00 $71,700.00 $28,250.00
FRESNO, CA

THIS JOB REQUIRES PREVAILING WAGE
PAYMENT SCHEDULES 95% AT COMPLETION (BOARD ACCEPTANCE)-5% HELD 35 DAYS UNTIL LIEN PERIOD HAS PASSED
BID RESULTS WILL BE PRESENTED TO THE BOARD AT MEETING ON MARCH 24, 2020 BIDDERS WILL BE NOTIFIED IN WRITING OF THE BOARD'S DECISION ON MARCH 25, 2020.






