HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
Purchasing Divislon

AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED BIDS

T8 18-018
POLYETHYLENE PIPES AND COUPLERS

@id opening: 2/12/2018
Bidder: Core B Main, LP

T {34) PERF. T::: ;:li:: W/KNITTED (4n) :c;u—rear {5A) SMOOTH BORE NP {BA) SMOOTH BORE W/ENITTED
SIZE EC PRICE/FT gl
PRICE/FT PRICE/FT PRICE/FT
8" $3.09 No bid s458 $5.08
10" $4.20 No bid $6.38 $7.06
12* $7.12 No bid $672 $7.60
15" No bid $9.27 4953 $10.53
18" No bid $11.79 $12.50 $14.00
24" No bid $19.29 $21.02 $2296
30" No bid No bid $20.19 No bid
36" No bid No bid $37.30 o bid
e Y {48) SPLIT CPL NON PERF (S8) CPCL W/GASKET m“"::'ﬂz'.“:;::mn
siz PRICE PER EA e e ot FABRIC
PRICE FER EA
8 $1200 $6.52 No bid No bid
1 $14 39 $9.63 $18.80 No bid
12 No bid $10.87 $2148 No bid
15" No bid 51810 $3759 No bid
8- No bid $30.83 544 75 No bd
24" No bid $43.48 §62.65 No bid
" No bid No bid $150.36 No bid
6" No bid No trd $205.86 No bid
VENDOR PHONE E-VERIFY
Core & Main, LP 407-383.7008 1219073

Local Preference and WIMBE Preference was not used 10 award th bid.

RECOMMEND AWARDING TO THE $OLE BIDDER, Core & Main LP.,, FOR THE 8ID PERIOD

wo:lzou - 31!201
3// o/ 18
W, Kyle Green/HCBCC Road & Bridge Director ate

3-14-/%

Chrls Davls, HCBCC Purchaslng Manager Date
RECOMMENDATION APPROVED

O0s 3[4 /n

Randy Vosburg, ACBCC County Admini
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