Purchasing Division

HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

NOTICE OF INTENT TO ACCEPT OFFER TO PURCHASE SURPLUS PROPERTY

ITB 19-020

Sale of County Owned Property

Property Minimum Bid Offer Bidder
A-15-33-28-190-0000-0050 Minimum Bid
12 E. PALMETTO ST., AVON PARK S 3,340.80 NO BID NO BID
A-27-33-28-100-00B0-0110 Minimum Bid
120 E. CORNELL ST., AVON PARK S 1,717.20 | BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN
C-01-33-28-010-0000-1399 Minimum Bid
1961 W. TANAGER RD., AVON PARK S 1,350.00 NO BID NO BID
C-01-33-28-010-0000-1480 Minimum Bid
2387 N. CYPRESS RD., AVON PARK S 1,350.00 NO BID NO BID
C-01-33-28-010-0000-1778 Minimum Bid
2720 N. SENECA DR. E, AVON PARK S 3,060.00 NO BID NO BID
C-01-33-28-010-0001-3379 Minimum Bid
1675 W. BATAVIA RD., AVON PARK S 3,060.00 NO BID NO BID
C-03-35-29-050-0000-0010 Minimum Bid
3703 CR 17S, SEBRING S 2,142.00 | BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN
C-03-36-29-050-0230-0830 Minimum Bid
13461 LYNWOOD ST., SEBRING S 2,700.00 | BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN
C-04-34-28-020-0210-0210 Minimum Bid
3712 PALAZZO ST., SEBRING S 2,880.00 | BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN
C-04-34-28-050-0530-0320 Minimum Bid
3813 ALMERIA AVE., SEBRING S 4,500.00 | BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN
C-04-34-28-080-0810-0490 Minimum Bid
7137 CASILLIA ST., SEBRING S 1,800.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-080-0810-0540 Minimum Bid*
7309 CASILLA ST., SEBRING S 1,800.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-080-0810-0570 Minimum Bid*
7335 CASILLA ST., SEBRING S 1,800.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-080-0810-0610 Minimum Bid*
7501 CASILLA ST., SEBRING S 1,800.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-080-0810-0640 Minimum Bid*
7529 CASILLA ST., SEBRING S 1,800.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-080-0810-0670 Minimum Bid*
7613 CASILLA ST., SEBRING S 1,800.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-080-0810-0680 Minimum Bid*
7621 CASILLA ST., SEBRING S 1,800.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-130-2810-0550 Minimum Bid*
5838 GRANDA BLVD., SEBRING S 5,400.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3310-0300 Minimum Bid*
6944 SAN BRUNO DR., SEBRING S 5,400.00 NO BID NO BID




Property Minimum Bid Offer Bidder
C-04-34-28-160-3320-0090 Minimum Bid*
6903 DICKINSON DR., SEBRING S 5,454.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3320-0440 Minimum Bid*
6958 SAN BENITO DR., SEBRING S 5,454.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3340-0120 Minimum Bid*
6222 CORTEZ BLVD SEBRING S 5,671.80 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3340-0150 Minimum Bid*
6324 CORTEZ BLVD SEBRING S 5,508.90 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3340-0180 Minimum Bid*
6356 CORTEZ BLVD SEBRING S 5,784.30 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3360-0010 Minimum Bid*
6720 JILL ST., SEBRING S 6,804.00 | § 6,850.00 Chinmay Bhandare
C-04-34-28-160-3360-0341 Minimum Bid*
6906 MEXICAN HAT DR., SEBRING S 2,722.50 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3360-0350 Minimum Bid*
6908 MEXICAN HAT DR., SEBRING S 5,454.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3360-0440 Minimum Bid*
6728 JILL ST., SEBRING S 6,480.00 | § 6,500.00 Chinmay Bhandare
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0100 Minimum Bid*
5347 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 19,278.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0150 Minimum Bid*
5323 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 19,278.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0170 Minimum Bid*
5315 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 19,278.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0310 Minimum Bid*
5257 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 19,278.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0340 Minimum Bid*
5239 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 19,278.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0350 Minimum Bid*
5233 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 19,278.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0370 Minimum Bid*
5221 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 18,900.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0380 Minimum Bid*
5215 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 18,900.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0410 Minimum Bid*
5163 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 18,900.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0420 Minimum Bid*
5157 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 19,089.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0440 Minimum Bid*
5135 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 19,467.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0450 Minimum Bid*
5123 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 19,467.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3420-0480 Minimum Bid*
5105 PEBBLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 19,467.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0290 Minimum Bid*
4978 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 25,704.00( § 26,100.00 Jordan Hernandez




Property Minimum Bid Offer Bidder
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0300 Minimum Bid*
4970 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING $ 25,704.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0310 Minimum Bid*
4966 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING $ 25,704.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0320 Minimum Bid*
4962 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 25,704.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0330 Minimum Bid*
4954 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 25,704.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0340 Minimum Bid*
4950 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 25,704.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0350 Minimum Bid*
4946 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 25,704.00| S 26,200.00 Raymond Hornick
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0360 Minimum Bid*
4942 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 25,704.00| s 26,200.00 Raymond Hornick
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0370 Minimum Bid*
4936 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 25,704.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0380 Minimum Bid*
4930 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 25,452.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0390 Minimum Bid*
4924 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 25,200.00| s 26,200.00 Raymond Hornick
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0420 Minimum Bid*
4906 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 25,200.00| s 25,500.00 Jordan Hernandez
C-04-34-28-160-3440-0430 Minimum Bid*
4900 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 25,200.00| s 25,500.00 Jordan Hernandez
C-04-34-28-160-3450-0240 Minimum Bid*
4638 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3450-0270 Minimum Bid*
4618 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00| S 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3450-0280 Minimum Bid*
4610 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 | § 9,500.00 Kyle Kamisar
C-04-34-28-160-3450-0290 Minimum Bid*
4600 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3450-0300 Minimum Bid*
4558 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3450-0310 Minimum Bid*
4550 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3450-0320 Minimum Bid*
4544 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3450-0340 Minimum Bid*
4530 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,047.70 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3450-0410 Minimum Bid*
4983 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,153.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0130 Minimum Bid*
4829 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 10,756.80 | § 11,156.80 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0140 Minimum Bid*
4817 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 10,756.80( § 11,156.80 Heritage Investments




Property Minimum Bid Offer Bidder
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0290 Minimum Bid*
4712 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,423.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0300 Minimum Bid*
4720 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,423.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0310 Minimum Bid*
4728 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,423.00 9,823.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0320 Minimum Bid*
4734 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,423.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0350 Minimum Bid*
4750 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,423.00 9,823.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0370 Minimum Bid*
4800 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,423.00 9,823.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0380 Minimum Bid*
4810 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,423.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0390 Minimum Bid*
4818 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,423.00 9,823.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0430 Minimum Bid*
4840 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,423.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0440 Minimum Bid*
4846 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,423.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3460-0450 Minimum Bid*
4850 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,423.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3470-0020 Minimum Bid*
4907 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3470-0040 Minimum Bid*
4879 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3470-0050 Minimum Bid*
4871 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,360.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3470-0090 Minimum Bid*
4847 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,576.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3470-0130 Minimum Bid*
4817 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,576.00 9,976.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3470-0140 Minimum Bid*
4805 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,576.00 9,976.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3470-0190 Minimum Bid*
4682 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,792.00 10,192.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3470-0230 Minimum Bid*
4720 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,792.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3470-0240 Minimum Bid*
4726 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,792.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3470-0260 Minimum Bid*
4734 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3470-0270 Minimum Bid*
4742 SAN LARENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0020 Minimum Bid*
4510 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID




Property Minimum Bid Offer Bidder
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0040 Minimum Bid*
4524 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING $ 9,360.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0090 Minimum Bid*
4554 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0240 Minimum Bid*
4711 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,576.00 9,976.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0250 Minimum Bid*
4703 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0260 Minimum Bid*
4675 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0290 Minimum Bid*
4653 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0300 Minimum Bid*
4647 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0310 Minimum Bid*
4641 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0320 Minimum Bid*
4633 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0350 Minimum Bid*
4611 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0370 Minimum Bid*
4559 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0390 Minimum Bid*
4545 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3480-0400 Minimum Bid*
4539 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3490-0030 Minimum Bid*
4642 MIGNON DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3490-0040 Minimum Bid*
4638 MINGON DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3490-0110 Minimum Bid*
4550 MIGNON DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3490-0120 Minimum Bid*
4542 MIGNON DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3490-0240 Minimum Bid*
4553 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3490-0350 Minimum Bid*
4657 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3500-0030 Minimum Bid*
4643 MIGNON DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3500-0040 Minimum Bid*
4639 MIGNON DR., SEBRING $ 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3500-0100 Minimum Bid*
4561 MIGNON DR., SEBRING $ 9,360.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3500-0150 Minimum Bid*
4743 SAN LORENZO DR, SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID




Property Minimum Bid Offer Bidder
C-04-34-28-160-3500-0160 Minimum Bid*
4749 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3500-0170 Minimum Bid*
4757 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 9,400.00 Heritage Investments
C-04-34-28-160-3510-0030 Minimum Bid*
4816 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,160.20 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3510-0080 Minimum Bid*
4850 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,160.20 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3510-0150 Minimum Bid*
4938 SAN LORENZO DR., SEBRING S 9,160.20 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3510-0250 Minimum Bid*
5045 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,283.50 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3520-0010 Minimum Bid*
4995 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 11,840.40 12,200.00 Raymond Hornick
C-04-34-28-160-3520-0020 Minimum Bid*
4987 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 10,503.00 12,200.00 Raymond Hornick
C-04-34-28-160-3520-0060 Minimum Bid*
4961 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 10,503.00 12,200.00 Raymond Hornick
C-04-34-28-160-3520-0080 Minimum Bid*
4949 MYTRLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 10,503.00 12,200.00 Raymond Hornick
C-04-34-28-160-3520-0090 Minimum Bid*
4945 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 10,503.00 12,200.00 Raymond Hornick
C-04-34-28-160-3520-0100 Minimum Bid*
4941 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 10,503.00 10,753.00 Mark McKelvey
C-04-34-28-160-3520-0130 Minimum Bid*
4923 MYRTLE BEACH DR., SEBRING S 10,350.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3520-0170 Minimum Bid*
4900 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,360.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3520-0180 Minimum Bid*
4908 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3520-0200 Minimum Bid*
4918 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,000.00 10,800.00 Richard Bavmann
C-04-34-28-160-3520-0250 Minimum Bid*
4938 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,140.40 NO BID NO BID




Property Minimum Bid Offer Bidder
C-04-34-28-160-3520-0300 Minimum Bid*
4966 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,140.40 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3530-0130 Minimum Bid*
5024 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,140.40 NO BID NO BID
C-04-34-28-160-3530-0140 Minimum Bid*
5020 SAN IGNACIO DR., SEBRING S 9,140.40 NO BID NO BID
C-04-35-29-030-4960-0170 Minimum Bid
4716 ALHAMBRA AVE., SEBRING S 6,970.50 | BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN
C-12-34-28-010-0000-0110 Minimum Bid
3201 RED WATER DR., AVON PARK S 4,680.00 | BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN
C-14-37-29-090-1190-0230 Minimum Bid
104 ARVIN CT. NE, LAKE PLACID S 900.00| BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN
C-14-37-29-130-1680-0080 Minimum Bid

893 LAKE GROVES RD. NW, LAKE PLACID S 3,600.00 | BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN

C-14-37-29-300-1980-0010 Minimum Bid

242 COMMERCE ST. NW, LAKE PLACID S 1,935.00( $ 2,222.00 Nelson & Lorna Orta
C-16-35-31-010-0000-0160 Minimum Bid
609 RANCHETTE DR., LORIDA S 2,401.20( S 2,651.00 Daniel Myers
C-21-34-29-030-4120-0060 Minimum Bid
105 AMY AVE., SEBRING S 1,417.50 [ BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN
C-22-37-30-140-1230-0130 Minimum Bid
107 FASCINATION DR., LAKE PLACID S 6,300.00 | BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN
C-24-35-28-010-0000-0270 Minimum Bid
608 VIBURNUM DR., SEBRING S 7,200.00 NO BID NO BID
C-27-33-28-150-0000-101A Minimum Bid
446 W. GOBOURNE ST., AVON PARK S 22,253.40| $ 24,500.00 James Brown
C-28-34-29-091-0000-0300 Minimum Bid
106 MONTEGO DR., SEBRING S 3,825.00 | BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN
C-35-34-28-020-0330-0240 Minimum Bid
235 BRANT AVE., SEBRING S 2,259.90 [ BID WITHDRAWN BID WITHDRAWN
S-13-34-28-050-2710-0310 Minimum Bid
2025 CLEVELAND RD., SEBRING S 2,945.70 NO BID NO BID
S-33-34-29-100-1660-0020 Minimum Bid
2420 GREENWAY DR., SEBRING S 4,140.00 | S 4,276.00 Lee Thomas

Notice of Intent to Accept Offer was posted to HCBCC.NET at 11:00 A.M. on February 13, 2019.

The Board of County Commissioners will consider the offers at their Board Meeting on March 5, 2019. The
meeting will be held in the Government Center Boardroom Chambers at 600 S. Commerce Avenue in
Sebring, Florida. The Board Meeting will start at 9:00 am.

Anyone requiring reasonable accommodations as provided for in the Americans with Disabilities Act or
Section 286.26, Florida Statutes, should contact Ms. Pamela Rogers, ADA Coordinator at: 863-402-6509
(Voice), or via Florida Relay Service 711, or by email at progers@hcbcc.org. Request for CART or interpreter
services should be made at lease 24 hours in advance to permit coordination of service.
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