BID TABULATION

Town of Taos

Road and Construction Materials and Services
Town Hall 400 Camino de la Placita, Room 109
Taos, NM 87571

Robert Medina &

November 5, 2019, 3:00 PM Sons Northern Mountain Constructors, Inc. | A & S Construction
ITB No.: 19-20-02
Bid
Item # A
Item Description UNIT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT 5% Preference UNIT AMOUNT
EARTHWORK
1 |Subgrade Preparation (1 - 250 SY) SY no bid S 20.00 | S 19.05 no bid
2 |Subgrade Preparation (250 - 500 SY) SY no bid S 15.00 | S 14.29 no bid
3 |Subgrade Preparation (501+ SY) SY no bid S 5.00 | S 4.76 no bid
BASE COURSE (IN PLACE)
4 |Base Course (1 -250SY/IN) SY/IN no bid S 550 (S 524 | S 12.00
5 Base Course (251 - 500 SY/IN) SY/IN no bid S 450 |S 429 |S 10.00
6 |Base Course (501+ SY/IN) SY/IN no bid S 200 (S 190 | S 7.50
COLD MILLING
7 |Cold Milling (1 - 10,000 SY/IN) SY/IN no bid S 275|S 2.62 no bid
8 Cold Milling (10,001 - 50,000 SY/IN) SY/IN no bid S 250 (S 2.38 no bid
9 |Cold Milling (50,001+ SY/IN) SY/IN no bid S 200 (S 1.90 no bid
ASPHALT (IN PLACE)
10 |Pothole Repair SY no bid no bid no bid S 56.75
11 |Street Paving SY no bid S 30.50 | S 29.05 no bid
12 [Street Overlay SY/IN no bid S 850 (S 8.10 no bid
13 |Parking Lots SY no bid S 3450 | S 32.86 [ S 34.00
14 [Parking Lot Overlay SY/IN no bid S 10.50 | S 10.00 | S 15.00
15 |[Speed Humps (Drawing B) EACH no bid S 4,000.00 | S 3,809.52 | S 2,850.00
CONCRETE REMOVAL AND PLACEMENT
16 [Structural Concrete, Class A cYy no bid no bid S 800.00
17 |Reinforced Concrete for Minor Structures CcY no bid no bid S 800.00
18 [Flowable Fill CcYy no bid no bid no bid
19 |Removal of Structures and Obstruction Per Hour no bid no bid S 530.00




Removal and Placement of Curb & Gutter (1 -

20 |450LF) LF no bid no bid S 32.00
21 |Removal of Curb and Gutter (1 - 450 LF) LF no bid no bid S 16.00
22 |Removal of Curb and Gutter (451 - 900 LF) LF no bid no bid S 15.00
23 |Removal of Curb and Gutter (901+ LF) LF no bid no bid S 15.00
CONCRETE REMOVAL AND PLACEMENT
Removal and Replacement of Sidewalk (1 -
24 (250 S8Y) Sy no bid no bid S 51.00
25 |Removal of Sidewalk (1 - 250 SY) SY no bid no bid S 15.00
26 |Removal of Sidewalk (251 - 500 SY) Sy no bid no bid S 15.00
27 |Removal of Sidewalk (501+ SY) SY no bid no bid S 15.00
28 [Concrete Sidewalk 4" (1 - 250 SY) Sy no bid no bid S 45.00
29 |Colored Concrete Sidewalk 4" (1 - 250 SY) SY no bid no bid S 50.00
30 |Concrete Sidewalk 4" (251 - 500 SY) Sy no bid no bid S 48.00
31 [Colored Concrete Sidewalk 4" (251 - 500 SY) SY no bid no bid S 48.00
32 |Concrete Sidewalk 4" (501+ SY) Sy no bid no bid S 48.00
33 |Colored Concrete Sidewalk 4" (501+ SY) Sy no bid no bid S 49.00
34 |Drive Pad 6" Sy no bid no bid S 55.00
35 [Concrete Median Pavement 4" SY no bid no bid S 48.00
Concrete Median Pavement 4" (colored &
36 |patterned) Sy no bid no bid S 75.00
Concrete Mountable Curb & Gutter 6" x 18"
37 |(1-450LF) LF no bid no bid S 23.50
Concrete Mountable Curb & Gutter 6" x 18"
38 |(451-900 LF) LF no bid no bid S 23.50
Concrete Mountable Curb & Gutter 6" x 18"
39 ((901+ LF) LF no bid no bid S 23.50
CONCRETE REMOVAL AND PLACEMENT
40 |Concrete Mountable Curb & Gutter 6" x 24" ( LF no bid no bid S 24.00
41 [Concrete Mountable Curb & Gutter 6" x 24" ( LF no bid no bid S 24.00
42 |Concrete Mountable Curb & Gutter 6" x 24" ( LF no bid no bid S 24.00
43 [Concrete Barrier Curb & Gutter 6" x 18" (1 - 4 LF no bid no bid S 24.00
44 |Concrete Barrier Curb & Gutter 6" x 18" (451 LF no bid no bid S 24.00




45 [Concrete Barrier Curb & Gutter 6" x 18" (901 LF no bid no bid S 24.00
46 |Concrete Barrier Curb & Gutter 6" x 24" (1 - 4 LF no bid no bid S 24.00
47 |Concrete Barrier Curb & Gutter 6" x 24" (451 LF no bid no bid S 24.00
48 |Concrete Barrier Curb & Gutter 6" x 24" (901 LF no bid no bid S 24.00
49 [Concrete Valley Gutter (6" x Variable Width) Sy no bid no bid S 48.00
50 |Concrete Laydown Curb & Gutter 6" x 24" (1 1 LF no bid no bid S 24.00
51 |Concrete Laydown Curb & Gutter 6" x 24" (45 LF no bid no bid S 24.00
52 |Concrete Laydown Curb & Gutter 6" x 24" (90 LF no bid no bid S 24.00
MISCELLANEOUS CONSTRUCTION
53 |Storm Inlet Type "A" (NMDOT Drawing 2201)| EACH no bid no bid S 6,800.00
54 |Storm Inlet Type "B" (NMDOT Drawing 2203)| EACH no bid no bid S 6,800.00
55 |Modified Storm Inlet (NMDOT Drawing 2237)] EACH no bid no bid S 7,000.00
Manhole Adjustments (frame and cover to
56 |be considered incidental to the pay item) EACH no bid no bid S 920.00
57 |Water Valve Adjustment EACH no bid no bid S 650.00
3/4" Water Service Line 0 - 20 LF including T
& BF (0 - 5' Deep) (Drawing E) Town Will
58 |Provide and Set Meter Only LF no bid no bid S 1,500.00
1" Water Service Line 0 - 20 LF including T &
BF (0 - 5' Deep) (Drawing E) Town Will
59 |Provide and Set Meter Only LF no bid no bid S 1,500.00
4" PVC Sewer Service Line 0 - 20 LF Including
60 [T &BF(0-6'Deep) (Drawing D) LF no bid no bid S 1,500.00
6" C-900 Water Line 0 - 20 LF Including T &
61 |BF (0-5'Deep) NMDOT Drawings 2301, LF no bid no bid S 1,500.00
8" C-900 Water Line 0 - 20 LF Including T &
62 |BF (0-5'Deep) NMDOT Drawings 2301, LF no bid no bid S 1,600.00
4" PVC Sewer Service Line 0 - 20 LF Including
63 |T & BF (6'-10' Deep) (Drawing D) LF no bid no bid S 2,000.00
64 |[3' Tall CMU Wall (Stucco) (Drawing C) LF no bid no bid S 180.00
65 [3'Tall CMU Wall (No Stucco) (Drawing C) LF no bid no bid S 160.00
66 [4' Tall CMU Wall (Stucco) (Drawing C) LF no bid no bid S 195.00
67 |4' Tall CMU Wall (No Stucco) (Drawing C) LF no bid no bid S 180.00
68 |[Light Pole Base(s) (Drawing A) EACH no bid no bid S 460.00




MISCELLANEOUS MATERIAL

Plant Mix Bituminous Pavement

a. Picked up by Town Staff Per Ton no bid S 86.00 | S 81.90 no bid
b. Delivered to Town Yard Per Ton no bid S 90.00 | $§ 85.71 no bid
Plaster Sand
a. Picked up by Town Staff PerTon |$ 28.75 | S 28.00 | S 26.67 no bid
b. Delivered to Town Yard PerTon | S 2961 | S 30.00 | S 28.57 no bid
Concrete Sand (unwashed)
a. Picked up by Town Staff PerTon | S 27.50 | S 23.00 | S 21.90 no bid
b. Delivered to Town Yard PerTon |$ 28.35 | S 25.00 | S 23.81 no bid
Concrete
a. Class A 3000 psi Cuvyd |S 145.75 | S 138.00 | S 131.43 no bid
b. Class AA 4000 psi CuYd S 165.25 | S 144.00 | S 137.14 no bid
c. Grout Cuvyd |S 152.25 | S 140.00 | S 133.33 no bid
d. Flowable Fill CuYd S 112.25 | S 110.00 | S 104.76 no bid
Base Course
$13.00/ton from
main yard &
$8.00/ton from
crusher Gravel Pit
a. Picked up by Town Staff Per Ton |Road S 10.50 | S 10.00 no bid
b. Delivered to Town Yard PerTon |$ 13.00 | S 13.50 | S 12.86 no bid
Aggregate (3/4" - 1")
$14.50/ton Taos
a. Picked up by Town Staff Per Ton |material S 16.50 | S 15.71 no bid
$14.93/ton from
Taos Crusher
b. Delivered to Town Yard Per Ton [(Tandum loads) S 19.50 | S 18.57 no bid

NOTES FROM ROBERT MEDINA & SONS:

A three (3) yard minimum will apply on delivery of Concrete.

Hold up time will apply at 1.50/minute.
A minimum of $150.00 to deliver dry materials.




