



**AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED BIDS**  
**ITB 18-007**  
**HERBICIDES AND FERTILIZERS**

Bid opening: 9/7/17

BASE FOR AWARD

DESCRIPTION/BIDDER	VENDOR'S ITEM #	PACKAGING	UNIT / BASE FOR AWARD	PRICE PER UNIT	LOCAL PREFERENCE	PRICE PER CASE	RANK
<b>1 2-4-D DIMETHYLAMINE / Per Gl. 2-4-D DIMETHYLAMINE salt of 2-4-D, 4-pound acid equivalent, bid price per gallon in 2.5 gl. containers. For Aquatic use.</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION	WEEDAR 64	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$10.880		\$27.20	1
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	WEEDAR 64	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$13.800		\$34.50	2
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.	WEEDAR 64	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$14.250		\$35.63	3
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	NEVIGATE AQUATIC	1 - 50 LBS	LB	\$2.889		\$144.45	
<b>2 REWARD / 1 gallon or 2.5 gallon containers</b>							
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.	TRIBUNE	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$41.250		\$103.13	1
CROP PRODUCTION	TRIBUNE	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$41.260		\$103.15	2
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	TRIBUNE DIQUAT	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$41.576		\$103.94	3
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	ROW RUNNER	1 - 1 GALL	GALL	\$51.200		\$51.20	4
<b>3 ARSENAL / 2.5 gallon containers</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION		1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$48.000		\$120.00	1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.	POLARIS	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$50.000		\$125.00	2
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	ECOMAZAPRY 2 SL	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$53.000		\$132.50	3
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	POLARIS	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$71.956		\$179.89	4
<b>4 RODEO or equivalent 53.8% Glyphosate, N-(Phosphonomethyl) Glycine, in the form of its Isopropylamine salt. 2.5 gal container</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION	AQUANEAT	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$14.780		\$36.95	1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.	ROUNDUP CUSTOM	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$17.250		\$43.13	2
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	AQUANEAT	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$20.524		\$43.25	3
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	ROUNDUP CUSTOM	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$18.200		\$45.50	4
<b>5 SONAR SRP AQUATIC HERBICIDE / per pound</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION		1 - 40 LB	LB	\$31.680		\$1,267.20	1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 40 LB	LB	\$31.680		\$1,267.20	1
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		NO BID				NO BID	
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>6 SONAR QUICK RELEASE ACQUATIC HERBICIDE / per pound</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION		1 - 40 LB	LB	\$30.230		\$1,209.20	1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 40 LB	LB	\$30.230		\$1,209.20	1
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE		1 - 8 LB	LB	\$39.992		\$319.94	2
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>7 KAMMO (NO SUBSTITUTES) 2.5 gallon containers</b>							
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.	KAMMO PLUS	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$25.350		\$63.38	
CROP PRODUCTION		1 - 40 LBS	LBS	\$30.230		\$1,209.20	
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		NO BID				NO BID	
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>8 ROUNDUP or equivalent of 41% Glyphosate / 2.5 gl. containers</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION	MAD DOG PLUS	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$10.900		\$27.25	1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.	RANGER PRO	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$11.750		\$29.38	2
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	RANGER PRO	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$15.144		\$37.86	3
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>9 F-239 CLEANER / 55 gallon containers</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION		1 - 55 GALL	GALL	\$10.400		\$572.00	1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 55 GALL	GALL	\$11.650		\$640.75	2
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	GLYSTAR PRO	1 - 55 GALL	GALL	\$12.900		\$709.50	3
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	LESCOSOL	1 - 2 LBS	LBS	\$2.535		\$5.07	

DESCRIPTION/BIDDER	VENDOR'S ITEM #	PACKAGING	UNIT / BASE FOR AWARD	PRICE PER UNIT	LOCAL PREFERENCE	PRICE PER CASE	RANK
<b>10 AQUATHOL SUPER-K GRANULES / per pound</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION		1 - 20 LBS	LBS	\$18.250		\$365.00	1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 20 LBS	LBS	\$18.250		\$365.00	1
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE		1 - 10 LBS	LBS	\$21.065		\$210.65	2
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>11 AQUATHOL SUPER-K / 2.5 gallon containers</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION	AQUATHOL K	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$70.500		\$176.25	1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$70.500		\$176.25	1
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		NO BID				NO BID	
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>12 AQUATHOL SUPER-K / 30 gallon drum</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION	AQUATHOL K	1 - 30 GALL	GALL	\$70.500		\$2,115.00	1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 30 GALL	GALL	\$70.500		\$2,115.00	1
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		NO BID				NO BID	
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>13 ACCURACY (NO SUBSTITUTES) / per quart</b>							
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 1 QT	QT	\$10.200		\$10.20	1
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		NO BID				NO BID	
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>14 HABITATE / 2.5 gallon containers</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION	POLARIS	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$48.000		\$120.00	1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.	POLARIS	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$50.000		\$125.00	2
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	ECOMAZAPRY 2 SL	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$53.000		\$132.50	3
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	POLARIS	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$71.965		\$179.91	4
<b>15 GARLON 3 / 2.5 gallon containers</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION		1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$45.300		\$113.25	1
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	TAHOE 3A	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$49.336		\$123.34	2
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	GARLON 3A	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$66.000		\$165.00	3
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.	TRYCERA	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$78.500		\$196.25	4
<b>16 MONUMENT / per packet</b>							
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	MONUMENT	1 - 1 PKT	PKT	\$242.500		\$242.50	1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 1 PKT	PKT	\$245.000		\$245.00	2
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	MONUMENT 75WG	1 - 1 GRAM	GRAM	\$245.000		\$245.00	2
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>17 SPREADER STICKER / per gallon</b>							
CROP PRODUCTION	BREWER 90-10	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$10.290		\$25.73	1
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	LESCO 90/10	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$12.728		\$31.82	2
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.	INLET	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$13.250		\$33.13	3
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	CLING	1 - 1 GALL	GALL	\$24.700		\$24.70	4
<b>18 FERTILIZER 18-0-10 WITH 1.15 ATRAZINE / per pound</b>							
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	1.05 ATRIAZINE	1 - 50 LBS	LBS	\$0.265		\$13.24	1
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		NO BID				NO BID	
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>19 FERTILIZER 10 - 20 - 20 / per pound</b>							
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		1 - 50 LBS	LBS	\$0.235		\$11.75	1
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	10-20-20 A/C	1 - 50 LBS	LBS	\$0.238		\$11.88	2
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>20 FERTILIZER 21-0-0 / per pound</b>							
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		1 - 50 LBS	LBS	\$0.215		\$10.75	1
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	10-0-0 100% AS	1 - 50 LBS	LBS	\$0.232		\$11.62	2
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		NO BID				NO BID	

DESCRIPTION/BIDDER	VENDOR'S ITEM #	PACKAGING	UNIT / BASE FOR AWARD	PRICE PER UNIT	LOCAL PREFERENCE	PRICE PER CASE	RANK
<b>21 FERTILIZER 15-2-15 with Ronstar / per pound</b>							
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	W/OXADIAZON	1 - 50 LBS	LBS	\$0.480		\$24.00	1
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	15-3-15	1 - 50 LBS	LBS	\$0.516		\$25.81	2
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>22 ORTHENE / per pound</b>							
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	ACEPHATE 97 UP	1 - 10 LBS	LBS	\$7.720		\$77.20	1
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	ORTHENE 97 Tt	1 - 7.73 LBS	LBS	\$9.323		\$72.07	2
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>23 TRIMEC CLASSIC / per gallon</b>							
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	LESCO 3WAY	1 - 2.25 GALL	GALL	\$22.028		\$49.56	1
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	TRIPLET SF	1 - 1 GALL	GALL	\$24.900		\$24.90	2
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 2.25 GALL	GALL	\$35.500		\$79.88	3
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>24 TRIBUTE TOTAL / per ounce</b>							
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 6 OZ	OZ	\$56.511		\$339.07	1
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE		1 - 6 OZ	OZ	\$56.512		\$339.07	1
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>25 TAL STAR / per pound</b>							
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	CROSSCHECK PL	1 - 25 LBS	LBS	\$0.461		\$11.52	1
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	WISDOM LAWN	1 - 1 LBS	LBS	\$0.520		\$0.52	2
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 25 LBS	LBS	\$0.690		\$17.25	3
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>26 CLIPPER (active ingredient flumioxazin) price in 5 lb. containers. (NO SUBSTITUTES)</b>							
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 5 LBS	LBS	\$22.000		\$110.00	1
CROP PRODUCTION		1 - 5 LBS	LBS	\$110.000		\$550.00	2
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		NO BID				NO BID	
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>27 TRACKER DYE (BLUE) 16-OUNCE (PINT) BOTTLES</b>							
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.	SPEC SPRAY INDIC	1 - 1 GALL	GALL	\$15.750		\$15.75	1
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	LESCO TRACKER BLU	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$16.168		\$40.42	2
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>28 BIFENTHRIN INSECTICIDE (LIQUID) GALLON JUG</b>							
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.	BIFEN I/T	1 - 1 GALL	GALL	\$27.250		\$27.25	1
CROP PRODUCTION	BESECT L	1 - 1 GALL	GALL	\$27.820		\$27.82	2
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	LESCO CROSSCHECK	1 - 1 GALL	GALL	\$29.110		\$29.11	3
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	UPSTAR GOLD	1 - 1 GALL	GALL	\$29.200		\$29.20	4
<b>29 RESOLUTE OR EQUIVALENT-GRANULAR 5LB JUG</b>							
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 5 LBS	LBS	\$8.800		\$44.00	1
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	LESCO STONEWALL	1 - 10 LBS	LBS	\$9.121		\$91.21	2
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	PRODIAMINE WDG	1 - 5 LBS	LBS	\$10.200		\$51.00	3
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>30 REGIMAX PGR OR EQUIVALENT (LIQUID) GALLONS</b>							
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	T-NEX PGR 12%	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$116.280		\$290.70	1
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	GROOM	1 - 1 GALL	GALL	\$119.000		\$119.00	2
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		NO BID				NO BID	
<b>31 SIMAZINE 4L (LIQUID) 2.5 GALLON JUGS</b>							
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE		1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$15.576		\$38.94	1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$19.250		\$48.13	2
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER	SIMTROL 4L	1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$19.600		\$49.00	3
CROP PRODUCTION		1 - 2.5 GALL	GALL	\$19.800		\$49.50	4

BASE FOR AWARD

DESCRIPTION/BIDDER	VENDOR'S ITEM #	PACKAGING	UNIT / BASE FOR AWARD	PRICE PER UNIT	LOCAL PREFERENCE	PRICE PER CASE	RANK
<b>20-0-10 FERTILIZER WITH FOLLOWING BLEND FOR 2000 POUNDS (ONE PALLET) NO SUBSTITUTES TO THIS FORMULATION 925 LBS AMMONIUM SULFATE (21-0-0) 526 LBS SULFUR COATED UREA (SCU) 333 LBS MURIATE OF POTASH (KCL) 189 LBS FILLER (BIO-SOLIDS-ACTIVATED SLUDGE)</b>							
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE	20-0-10 BASIC NUT	1 - 50 LBS	LBS	\$0.252		\$12.58	1
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER		1 - 50 LBS	LBS	\$0.274		\$13.70	2
CROP PRODUCTION		NO BID				NO BID	
HELENA CHEMICAL CO.		NO BID				NO BID	

REMAINDER OF THIS PAGE WAS LEFT BLANK INTENTIONALLY

VENDORS	PHONE #	E-VERIFY	MIN ORDER	DELIVERY
CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC. 2100 MOORES LANE MULBERRY, FL 33860	352-222-0655	836151	NONE	
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER CO, INC. 4100 GLADES CUT-OFF RD FT PIERCE, FL 34981	772-201-0099	93188	\$300.00	3 CAL DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER
HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY PO BOX. 1758 DADE CITY, FL 33526	352-521-3538	CONFIRMED	NONE	2-4 CAL DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER
SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY 2740 S COMBEE RD LAKELAND, FL 33803	800-321-5325	760915	NONE	2-10 CAL DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER

Local Vendors are indicated by the designation (LV). Award based off of Local Preference is indicated by the designation (LPA).  
 Minor discrepancies between the case price on the submitted bid and the award are due to roundings.

**RECOMMEND AWARDING TO ALL VENDORS BASED ON PRICE AND AVAILABILITY FOR THE BID PERIOD 10/01/2017 - 09/30/2018.**

*Vicki Pontius* 10-9-17  
 Vicki Pontius, HCBCCL Leisure Services Director Date

*Tasha Morgan* 10/6/2017  
 Tasha Morgan, HCBCCL Business Services Director Date

**RECOMMENDATION APPROVED BY:**

*June Fisher* 10/9/17  
 June Fisher, HCBCCL County Administrator Date