
ESCAMBIA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL ENFORCEMENT COMMERCIAL/RESIDENTIAL ABATEMENT PROJECTS

Vendor Registry Quote#

Open Date: 5/14/2020

Bids Due Close Date: 11/30/2020 @ 2:00 p.m.

Mandatory Walk-through

KMK Meadows

Maintenance 

Project Address Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount

1 $575.00 $700.00 $950.00 $400.00 $800.00 $725.00 NO BID $800.00

2 171 ZION ST $1,150.00 $1,150.00 $1,500.00 $400.00 $1,700.00 $875.00 NO BID $800.00

3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8,600.00 $17,400.00 $25,000.00 $8,500.00

4 $3,850.00 $2,150.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $2,400.00 NO BID $7,500.00

5 $1,500.00 $700.00 $900.00 $400.00 $1,700.00 $965.00 NO BID $800.00

6 $3,800.00 $2,750.00 $3,200.00 $5,000.00 $4,700.00 $2,200.00 NO BID $3,200.00

7 $1,150.00 $1,400.00 $1,800.00 $350.00 $1,000.00 $1,740.00 NO BID $800.00

8 $1,250.00 $900.00 $950.00 $600.00 $1,700.00 $1,140.00 NO BID $1,200.00

9 $4,500.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 NO BID $5,900.00 $5,900.00 NO BID $5,200.00

10 $2,500.00 $1,550.00 NO BID $3,000.00 $1,700.00 $2,240.00 NO BID $3,500.00

11 $3,850.00 $4,450.00 NO BID NO BID $5,200.00 $3,200.00 NO BID $5,000.00

12 $20,000.00 NO BID $37,000.00 NO BID $17,000.00 $24,400.00 NO BID $16,000.00

13 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,800.00 $8,300.00 $9,500.00 $5,800.00

14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8,200.00 $9,700.00 $14,000.00 $7,500.00

15 $4,000.00 $4,900.00 $6,500.00 NO BID $5,200.00 $5,400.00 NO BID $4,500.00

16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,800.00 $10,300.00 $12,500.00 $8,000.00

Vendor Totals $48,125 $24,650 $59,800 $80,000 $96,885 $61,000 $79,100

RESULTS ARE UNDER REVIEW AND NOT FINAL UNTIL ALL INSURANCE AND PERMITTING REQUIREMENTS HAVE BEEN 

CONFIRMED DO NOT COMMENCE ANY WORK OR OBTAIN ANY PERMITS UNITL YOUR PURCHASE ORDER HAS BEEN 

RECEIVED FROM ESCAMBIA COUNTY.

200 W DETROIT BLVD

3545 GODWIN LN

801 DECATUR AVE

7 MARINE DR

7030 JEFFERSON AVE

7470 N CENTURY BLVD

280 W ROACH RD

2720 VICTOR RD

1821 WILLIAMS DITCH RD

9309 OLD FLOMATON RD

4361 HWY 4A

241 FRONT ST

120 FRONT ST

401 HECKER RD

ANDALA ENT LARRY GATES Demolition Pros

8480 N CENTURY BLVD.

EE CLEANUPS 2020-11-24

3/19/2020 beginning @ 8:30 a.m.

BR BONNERS Collins Land 

Castellani 

Hauling


