



HIGHLANDS COUNTY
 BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
 Purchasing Division

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD
ITB 19-010
Traffic Control Devices, Material and Hardware

	LOCAL VENDOR
Osburn Associates, Inc.	NO
US Standard Sign	NO
Vulcan Inc. dba Vulcan Aluminum	NO

Award to lowest bidder by line item on the attached tabulation sheet and as allowed by the solicitation. Lowest bid for each line item is highlighted on the attached Bid Tabulation Sheet.

Local Preference was not used to award this project.

Notice of Intent to Award is posted to HCBC.C.NET at 4:30 A.M. (P.M.) on FEB 1, 2019.
 End of protest period: 4 P.M. on FEBRUARY 6, 2019

FAILURE TO FOLLOW THE PURCHASING PROTEST PROCEDURE REQUIREMENTS WITHIN THE TIME FRAMES PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 24 OF THE HIGHLANDS COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PURCHASING MANUAL SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF YOUR PROTEST AND ANY RESULTING CLAIMS. THAT PURCHASING MANUAL IS AVAILABLE FOR PUBLIC INSPECTION IN THE PURCHASING DIVISION AND ON THE HIGHLANDS COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS' WEBSITE (WWW.HCBC.C.NET) AND MAY BE OBTAINED FROM THE HIGHLANDS COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS PURCHASING DIVISION.

Christine Davis 2-1-19
 Christine Davis, Purchasing Manager Date

Clinton Howerton 2-1-19
 Clinton Howerton, P.E., County Engineer Date

19-010 Bid Tabulation Sheet

LINE ITEM	DESCRIPTION OF SIGN	Osburn Associates, Inc.			US Standard Sign			Vulcan Inc.		
		QUANTITY			QUANTITY			QUANTITY		
		0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +
1	3 X 6 SINGLE HOLE	0.37	0.37	0.37	15.00	7.00	7.00	0.63	0.63	0.63
2	4 X 8 STANDARD HOLE	0.66	0.66	0.66	15.00	7.50	7.50	0.87	0.87	0.87
3	6 X 12 With 2 Holes	1.48	1.48	1.48	2.21	1.84	1.84	1.52	1.52	1.52
4	12 X 6 With 2 Holes	1.48	1.48	1.48	2.21	1.84	1.84	1.44	1.44	1.44
5	36 X 36 SCHOOL CROSSING DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	26.55	26.55	26.55	29.76	24.8	24.8	21.84	21.84	21.84
6	9 X 24 With 4 Holes	4.43	4.43	4.43	5.54	4.62	4.62	4.00	4.00	4.00
7	9 X 30 With 4 Holes	5.53	5.53	5.53	6.68	5.57	5.57	4.89	4.89	4.89
8	9 X 36 With 4 Holes	6.64	6.64	6.64	7.98	6.65	6.65	6.13	6.13	6.13
9	9 X 42 With 4 Holes	7.73	7.73	7.73	9.60	8.00	8.00	7.10	7.10	7.10
10	9 X 48 With 4 Holes	8.88	8.88	8.88	10.66	8.88	8.88	8.02	8.02	8.02
11	9 X 54 With 4 Holes	9.94	9.94	9.94	13.57	11.31	11.31	9.32	9.32	9.32
12	12 X 18 With 2 Holes	4.43	4.43	4.43	5.34	4.45	4.45	4.13	4.13	4.13
13	24 X 12 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	5.90	5.90	5.90	6.83	5.69	5.69	5.83	5.83	5.83
14	12 X 36 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	8.85	8.85	8.85	10.25	8.54	8.54	8.76	8.76	8.76
15	36 X 12 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	8.85	8.85	8.85	10.25	8.54	8.54	8.76	8.76	8.76
16	21 X 15 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	6.43	6.43	6.43	7.46	6.22	6.22	6.36	6.36	6.36
17	18 X 24 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	8.85	8.85	8.85	10.25	8.54	8.54	8.61	8.61	8.61
18	24 X 18 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	8.85	8.85	8.85	10.25	8.54	8.54	8.61	8.61	8.61
19	48 X 18 With 2 Holes	17.70	17.70	17.70	50.51	17.09	17.09	15.87	15.87	15.87

	DESCRIPTION	Osburn Associates, Inc.			US Standard Sign			Vulcan, Inc.		
		0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +
20	24 X 36 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	17.70	17.70	17.70	20.51	17.09	17.09	17.18	17.18	17.18
21	36 X 24 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	17.70	17.70	17.70	20.51	17.09	17.09	17.18	17.18	17.18
22	24 X 48 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	23.60	23.60	23.60	27.36	22.80	22.80	22.83	22.83	22.83
23	48 X 24 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	23.60	23.60	23.60	27.36	22.80	22.80	22.83	22.83	22.83
24	30 X 18 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	11.06	11.06	11.06	12.82	10.68	10.68	10.81	10.81	10.81
25	30 X 36 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	22.13	22.13	22.13	25.64	21.37	21.37	21.68	21.68	21.68
26	48 X 30 With 4 Holes	29.50	29.50	29.50	34.18	28.48	28.48	26.29	26.29	26.29
27	30 X 60 With 4 Holes	36.88	36.88	36.88	42.74	35.62	35.62	32.87	32.87	32.87

	DESCRIPTION	Osburn Associates, Inc.			US Standard Sign			Vulcan, Inc.		
		0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +
28	36 x 20 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	14.75	14.75	14.75	20.46	17.05	17.05	14.47	14.47	14.47
29	48 X 36 With 4 Holes	35.40	35.40	35.40	41.04	34.20	34.20	31.63	31.63	31.63
30	18 X 18 With 2 Holes Drilled Square FOR FDOT Z- BAR	6.64	6.64	6.64	7.68	6.40	6.40	6.61	6.61	6.61
31	18 X 18 With 2 Holes Drilled Diamond Shape	6.64	6.64	6.64	7.68	6.40	6.40	6.14	6.14	6.14
32	24 X 24 With 2 Holes DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	11.80	11.80	11.80	13.68	11.40	11.40	11.43	11.43	11.43
33	30 X 30 With 2 Holes Drilled Square FOR FDOT Z- BAR	18.44	18.44	18.44	21.36	17.80	17.80	17.82	17.82	17.82
34	30 X 30 With 2 Holes Drilled Diamond Shape DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	18.44	18.44	18.44	21.36	17.80	17.80	17.82	17.82	17.82
35	36 X 36 Drilled FOR FDOT Z- BAR	26.55	26.55	26.55	30.78	25.65	25.65	25.91	25.91	25.91
36	36 x 36 Circle DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	26.55	26.55	26.55	31.98	26.65	26.65	23.93	23.93	23.93
37	36 X 36 With 2 Holes Drilled Diamond Shape FOR FDOT Z- BAR	26.55	26.55	26.55	30.78	25.65	25.65	25.91	25.91	25.91
38	36 Octagon DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	26.55	26.55	26.55	29.21	24.34	24.34	22.95	22.95	22.95
39	36 Triangle DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	20.65	20.65	20.65	17.32	14.43	14.43	12.04	12.04	12.04
40	30 Octagon DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	18.44	18.44	18.44	20.28	16.90	16.90	15.97	15.97	15.97

	DESCRIPTION	Osburn Associated, Inc.			US Standard Sign			Vulcan		
		0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	14.22	50 - 99	100 or +
41	24 X 24 Pentagon County Route Marker (CRM) DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	12.54	12.54	12.54	16.57	13.81	13.81	10.55	10.55	10.55
42	30 x 24 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	14.75	14.75	14.75	17.10	14.25	14.25	14.22	14.22	14.22
43	48 X 48 With 4 Holes Drilled Diamond	47.20	47.20	47.20	54.71	45.59	45.59	45.60	45.60	45.60
44	24 X 30 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	14.75	14.75	14.75	17.10	14.25	14.25	14.22	14.22	14.22

		Osburn Associates, Inc.			US Standard Sign			Vulcan, Inc.		
SIGN BRACKETS AND CAPS										
		0 - 49	50-99	100 & UP	0 - 49	50-99	100 & UP	0 - 49	50-99	100 & UP
45	FLAT SIGN BRACKETS SHALL FIT POSTS 2 3/8 AND 2 1/2	4.25	4.25	4.25	No Bid			No Bid		
46	STREET SIGN TWIST BRACKET FOR U CHANNEL POST	7.50	7.50	7.50	No Bid			No Bid		

ROUND SIGN POSTS:			Osburn Associates, Inc.								
	MATERIAL	DIAMETER	10' LENGTH			12' LENGTH			14' LENGTH		
			0-49	50-99	100 & UP	0-49	50-99	100 & UP	0-49	50-99	100 & UP
47	GALV	2 3/8" DIA									
48	ALUM	2.5" DIA	28.20	28.20	28.20	33.84	33.84	33.84	39.48	39.48	39.48
49	ALUM	3.0" DIA	34.80	34.80	34.80	41.76	41.76	41.76	48.72	48.72	48.72
50	ALUM	3.5" DIA	59.04	59.04	59.04	70.85	70.85	70.85	82.66	82.66	82.66
51	ALUM	4.0" DIA	67.92	67.92	67.92	81.50	81.50	81.50	95.09	95.09	95.09
52	ALUM	4.5" DIA	100.68	100.68	100.68	120.82	120.82	120.82	140.95	140.95	140.95

No Bid from US Standard Sign and Vulcan, Inc. for this category.

Osburn Associates, Inc.								
"U" CHANNEL POSTS GALVANIZED ONLY								
LIGHTWEIGHT / 3 LBS. PER FOOT 10 FT. & PLUS+								
	QTY	6'	7'	8'	9'	10'	12'	14'
53	0-49	7.31	8.53	9.74	10.96	31.18	37.41	43.65
54	50-99	7.31	8.53	9.74	10.96	31.18	37.41	43.65
55	100 & OVER	7.31	8.53	9.74	10.96	31.18	37.41	43.65

US Standard Sign and Vulcan were No Bid in this category.

GALVANIZED U- BOLT		Osburn Associates, Inc			US Standard Sign		
		QUANTITY			QUANTITY		
		0 - 49	50-99	100 & UP	0 - 49	50-99	100 & UP
56	SIZE 2 1/2"	2.51	2.51	2.51	No Bid		
57	SIZE 3 0"	2.72	2.72	2.72			
58	SIZE 3.5"	2.86	2.86	2.86	Vulcan, Inc.		
59	SIZE 4 0"	3.12	3.12	3.12	QUANTITY		
60	SIZE 4.5	4.05	4.05	4.05	0 - 49	50-99	100 & UP
61	10' GALVANIZED SQUARE TUBE POST 10 GAUGE THICKNESS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		

Osburn Associates, Inc.						US Standard Sign					Vulcan, Inc.						
"U" CHANNEL POSTS GALVANIZED ONLY 4 LBS. PER FOOT						"U" CHANNEL POSTS GALVANIZED ONLY 4 LBS. PER FOOT					"U" CHANNEL POSTS GALVANIZED ONLY						
	QTY	10'	12'	14'	16'	QTY	10'	12'	14'	16'	QTY	10'	12'	14'	16'		
62	0-49	41.33	49.59	57.86	66.12	0-49	No Bid					0-49	No Bid				
63	50-99	41.33	49.59	57.86	66.12	50-99											
64	100 & OVER	41.33	49.59	57.86	66.12	100 & OVER											

		Osburn Associates, Inc			US Standard Sign			Vulcan, Inc.		
		QUANTITY			QUANTITY			QUANTITY		
DESCRIPTION		0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +
65	12" x 24" BLANK DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	5.90	5.90	5.90	6.83	5.69	5.69	No Bid		
66	12" x 30" BLANK DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	7.38	7.38	7.38	8.53	7.11	7.11			
67	12" x 36" BLANK DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	8.85	8.85	8.85	10.25	8.54	8.54			
68	12" x 42" BLANK DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	10.33	10.33	10.33	12.90	10.75	10.75			
69	12" x 48" BLANK DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	11.80	11.80	11.80	13.68	11.4	11.4			
70	12" x 54" BLANK DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	13.28	13.28	13.28	18.11	15.09	15.09			
71	12" x 60" BLANK DRILLED FOR FDOT Z- BAR	14.75	14.75	14.75	17.10	14.25	14.25			

		Osburn Associates, Inc.			US Standard Sign			Vulcan, Inc.		
DESCRIPTION		0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +
72	ALUMINUM Z-BAR 1 3/4" X 8"	2.87	2.87	2.87	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
73	ALUMINUM Z-BAR 1 3/4" X 14"	4.28	4.28	4.28						
74	ALUMINUM Z-BAR 1 3/4" X 20"	6.20	6.20	6.20						
75	ALUMINUM Z-BAR 1 3/4" X 26"	8.56	8.56	8.56						
76	ALUMINUM Z-BAR 1 3/4" X 32"	10.14	10.14	10.14						
77	ALUMINUM Z-BAR 1 3/4" X 38"	11.00	11.00	11.00						
78	ALUMINUM Z-BAR 1 3/4" X 46"	13.00	13.00	13.00						
79	ALUMINUM Z-BAR 1 3/4" X 52"	15.72	15.72	15.72						
80	30" STOP FACE	18.75	18.75	18.75						
81	36" STOP FACE	27.00	27.00	27.00						

		Osburn Associates, Inc.			US Standard Sign			Vulcan, Inc.		
DESCRIPTION (ALL RETRO- REFLECTIVE MATERIALS shall)		0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +	0 - 49	50 - 99	100 or +
82	4" X 84" WHITE REFLECTIVE POST PANEL WITH 4- HOLES	19.46	19.46	19.46	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
83	4" X 84" YELLOW REFLECTIVE POST PANEL WITH 4- HOLES	19.46	19.46	19.46						
84	4" X 84" LIME- GREEN REFLECTIVE POST PANEL WITH 4- HOLES	19.46	19.46	19.46						
85	4" X 84" ORANGE REFLECTIVE POST PANEL WITH 4- HOLES	19.46	19.46	19.46						
86	REVERSE TWIST BRACKET FOR STREET SIGNS	7.50	7.50	7.50						
87	ALUMINUM SOIL PLATE DRILLED VERTICALLY & SLOTTED HORIZONTALLY	13.50	13.50	13.50						