UNIT PRICE BID TABULATION SHEET

Ofinge Beach

SAND & TOPSOIL

Project Name: Bid Date: November 7, 2017

Requisition No. 2017-1214 Bid Opening Time: 11:00 AM
Bidder's Name Baldwin Sand & Gravel New Smith Construction Precision Sand Products
Ryan Young Jeffrey Page Michael Taylor
Contact ryan@baldwinsandandgravel.com jcpage29@yahoo.com michael@headwaterholdings.com
(251) 943-7263 (251) 232-2218 (251) 988-1460
Bid Amount Loaded Delivered Loaded Delivered Loaded Delivered
A - Topsoil $8.00 / Cu. Yd. $12.75 / Cu. Yd. $9.99 / Cu. Yd. $15.50 / Cu. Yd. No Bid No Bid
B - Sand Clay Base $3.50 / Cu. Yd. $8.25 / Cu. Yd. $2.99 / Cu. Yd. $8.49 / Cu. Yd. No Bid No Bid
C - Fill Sand $3.50 / Cu. Yd. $7.75 / Cu. Yd. $3.50 / Cu. Yd. $9.49 / Cu. Yd. $3.15 / Cu. Yd. $12.00/ Cu. Yd.
D - Beach Sand $7.00 / Cu. Yd. $11.50 / Cu. Yd. $6.99 / Cu. Yd. $14.99 / Cu. Yd. $9.04 / Cu. Yd. $17.61/ Cu. Yd.
E - Washed Sand $7.00 / Cu. Yd. $11.50 / Cu. Yd. $6.99 / Cu. Yd. $14.99 / Cu. Yd. $9.04 / Cu. Yd. $17.61/ Cu. Yd.

Tabulated by R. Eberly 12/11/2017




