Purchasing Department

’/(/, HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED BIDS
ITB 17-007
HERBICIDES AND FERTILIZERS
Bid opening: 8/24/16

BASE FOR AWARD

E UNIT/ LOCAL
DESCRIPTION/BIDDER :;EE':::RS i PACKAGING BASE FOR ;’:;E PER | pReFERE z:f: PER | Rank
a0 | AWARD | nee
1 2-4-D DIMETHYLAMINE/ Per GI 2-4-D DIMETHYLAMINE salt of 2-4-D 4-pound acid equnvalent, bid price per gallon!nz.sd.comahe
CROP PRODUCTION |1 - 25 GAL | GAL | $1080 $27.00 1
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER ?:”ALLIGA‘RE:Z}4D 1 - 25 GALL tGAEL | $12.35 $30.88 2
HARRELL'S LLC. (LV) 1 - 25 GAL | GALL | $12.73 $12.09 | $31.82 3
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) | |1 . 25 GAL | GALL | $14.30 $1359 | $35.75 4
HELENA CHEMICALCO. | WEED RHAP 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $14.35 $35.88 5
WINFIELD SOLUTIONS | SHEDDERAMINE 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $14.76 $36.90 6
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE | WEEDAR 64 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $23.09 $57.73 7
UNIVARUSA | B NO BID
2 REWARD o :
CROP PRODUCTION | DIQUATSPC 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $39.90 $99.75 i
HELENACHEMICALCO. | TRIBUNE 1 . 25 GALL | GALL | $42.00 $105.00 | 2
 SITE ONE LANDSCAPE | TRIBUNEDISQUA| 1 - 2.5 GALL | GALL | $47.45 $11863 | 3
DIAMONDRFERTILIZER | ROWRUNNER | 1 - 1 GALL | GALL | $48.92 $48.92 4
RESEIDEX-TURFGRASS(LV) | | 1 . 25 GAL | GalL | $52.00 $49.40 | $130.00 5
K HARRELL'S LLC. (LV) 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $79.00 $75.05 | $19750 | 6
% WINFIELD SOLUTIONS 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $79.00 $197.50 7
. UNIVARUSA [ SYGENTA |1 - 1 GALL | GALL | $9168 59168 | 8
3 ARSENAL : —
CROP PRODUCTION ] |1 . 25 6Aau | GAw $46.50 $116.25 | 1
_ HELENACHEMICALCO. | POLARIS 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $49.35 $123.38 2
WINFIELD SOLUTIONS | POLARIS 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $59.52 $14880 | 3
STEONELANDSCAPE | POLARIS | 1 - 25 GALL | GALL $82.12 $20530 | 4
OTHERBIDDERS:NOBID | | |
4 RODEO or equivalent 53.8% GIyphosate, N—(Phosphonomethyl) Glycme, in the form of its Isopropylamine salt. 2.5 gal container
CROP PRODUCTION AQUA NEAT 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $1490 $37.25 1
.~ DIAMONDRFERTILIZER | AQUASTAR 1 - 25 GAL GALL | $15.98 $39.95 2
WINFELDSOLUTIONS | ROUNDUPCUSTC 1 - 2.5 GALL | GALL | $16.39 $40.98 3
i RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) | N 1 - 25 GAL E'GA_LL’W $17.30 (LPA) | $16.44 | $43.25 4
§ HELENA CHEMICAL CO. | ROUNDUPCUSTC 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $16.85 $42.13 5
? _ UNIVAR USA DOW AGRO 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $17.14 $42.85 6
 SITE ONE LANDSCAPE AQUA NEAT 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $21.20 $53.00 7
HARRELLSLLC. (Lv) | ] - | ['nosD
5  SONAR SRP AQUATIC HERBICIDE
HELENA CHEMICALCO. | - 1 LB B $31.05 $31.05
CROP PRODUCTION - 40 LB B | $31.05 $1,242.00
~ OTHER BIDDERS: NO BID ] LB B -
6  SONAR QUICK RELEASE ACQUATIC HERBICIDE
CROP PRODUCTION o . 40 B | LB | $29.60 $1,184.00
HELENA CHEMICAL CO. -1 1B 1B | $2964 $29.64
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE 1 - 8 B B | $44.75 $358.00
OTHER BIDDERS: NO BID BN
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BASE FOR AWARD

[ | uNIT/ LOCAL
DESCRIPTION/BIDDER i:_’ri:::kls PACKAGING BASE FOR Z’S;E PER | pReFeRe ::Isc: PER | Rank
‘ | AWARD : | NCE
7 KAMMO (NO SUBSTITUTES) 2.5 gallon containers .
HELENACHEMICALCO. | 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $2330 $58.25 1
OTHER BIDDERS: NO BID_ | '
8 ROUNDUP or equivalent of 41% Glyphosate / 2 5gl contamers = e
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) t 1 . 25 GALL | GALL $10.92 (LPA) | $10.37 | $27.30 1
UNIVAR USA | VARTINSERASER 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $10.68 $26.70 2
CROP PRODUCTION | MADDOGPLUS 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $11.00 $27.50 3
DIAMONDRFERTILIZER | GLYSTARPRO | 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $11.80 $29.50 4
WINFIELD SOLUTIONS | CORNERSTONE | 1 - 2.5 GALL | GALL $12.50 $31.25 5
HELENACHEMICALCO. | RANGERPRO | 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $1385 $34.63 6
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE | PROSECUTORPRC 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $1843 $46.08 7
~ HARRELLSLLC.(LV) - B NO BID
9  F-239 CLEANER (55 gallon containers)
CROP PRODUCTION | 1 - 55 GALL | GALL | $10.80 $594.00
HELENA CHEMICAL CO. ] 1 - 55 GALL | GALL | $1L10 $610.50
{ SITE ONE LANDSCAPE | REJECT, ITEM BID ISN'T LIQUID
10  AQUATHOL SUPER-K GRANULES |
CROP PRODUCTION 1 1 - 20 1BS | 1BS | $1692 $33840 | 1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO. B 1 - 1 8BS | lBS | $17.67 $17.67 2
,L WINFIELD SOLUTIONS | - 1 . 20 1BS | 1BS | $17.99 $359.80 | 3
I UNIVAR USA | UNITEDPHOS | 1 - 20 BS | LBS | $20.30 $406.00 | 4
OTHER BIDDERS:NOBID | ] T
11  AQUATHOL SUPER-K
CROP PRODUCTION o 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $64.86 $16215 | 1
HELENA CHEMICAL CO. N 1 - 25 GALL | GALL $68.68 $171.70 | 2
WINFIELD SOLUTIONS 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $69.99 $174.98
OTHER BIDDERS: NOBID | - |
12 AQUATHOL SUPER-K
CROP PRODUCTION - 30 GALL | GALL | $64.86 $1,945.80
HELENA CHEMICAL CO. ‘ - 30 GAL GALL | $68.68 $2,060.40
i WINFIELD SOLUTIONS a - 30 GALL | GALL | $69.50 $2,085.00
OTHER BIDDERS: NO BID B ] GALL | GALL | $0.00
13 ACCURACY (NO SUBSTITUTES)
HELENA CHEMICAL CO. 1 - 1 ar ar | $10.20 $10.20 1
OTHER BIDDERS: NO BID “ ' -
14  HABITATE / 2.5 gallon contamers S
HELENA CHEMICALCO. | 1 . 25 GALL | GALL | $49.75 $124.38 | 1
WINFIELD SOLUTIONS | POLARIS 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $59.52 $148.80 | 2
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) | POLARIS 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $72.50 $68.88 | $181.25 | 3
CROP PRODUCTION | 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $75.00 $187.50 | 4
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE | a 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $82.12 $20530 | 5
OTHER BIDDERS: NOBID | B R T 1
15 GARLON 3
CROP PRODUCTION ' - 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $44.48 $111.20 1
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) | 1 . 25 GALL | GALL | $53.00 $50.35 | $132.50 | 2
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE | TAHOE3A 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $56.31 $140.78 | 3
x WINFIELD SOLUTIONS o 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $68.66 $171.65 | 4
i HELENA CHEMICAL CO. 1 . 25 GALL | GALL | $72.50 $18125 | 5
f OTHER BIDDERS: NO BID -
| 16 MONUMENT 25G o 1
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BASE FOR AWARD

: UNIT/ LOCAL
DESCRIPTION/BIDDER :,'ri'::gks PACKAGING BASE FOR mﬁe PER | PREFERE Z:'sf PER | Rank
AWARD NCE
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) 1 - 5 GR | GR | $9.60 $9.12 $9.60 1
HARRELLSLLC. (LV) B 5 - 5 GR | GR | $970 $9.22 | $48.50 2
HELENA CHEMICAL CO. B 1 - 25 GR | GR | $9.70 $242.50 | 3
WINFIELD SOLUTIONS 1 - 25 GR | GR | $9.70 $24250 | 4
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER | 1 - 25 GR | GR | $9.70 $24250 | 5
UNIVAR USA SYNGENTA |5 - 5 GR | GR $9.70 $48.50 6
SITE ONELANDSCAPE 1 - 5 G | GR $11.45 $57.25 7
CROPPRODUCTION o BN ~ NOBID
17  SPREADER STICKER [ T e
UNIVAR USA | DREXELSURF 1 - 1 GALL | GALL | $11.44 $11.44 1
CROPPRODUCTION | ACTIVATORS0 1 - 25 GALL | GAEIZ“_M_'.“ $12.00 $3000 |2
5 RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) | HALO90 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $12.85(LPA) | $1221 | $3213 3
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE | LESCO 90/10 1 . 25 GALL | GALL | $1245 $31.13 4
HELENA CHEMICALCO. | INLET 1 - 1 GAL | GALL | $1285 $12.85 5
WINFELDSOLUTIONS | ARTECH | 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $16.99 $42.48 6
HARRELL'S LLC. (LV) [ 1 -1 eaw | eAl $29.44 $27.97 | $29.44 7
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER o NO BID
18  FERTILIZER 18-0-10 WITH 1.15 ATRAZlNE e VR
HARRELL'S LLC. (LV) 1 50 LBS *1 LBS $0.36 $0.34 $17.77 2
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) 1 . 50 LBS | ILBS | 5038 $0.36 $19.00 1
- . = e |
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE REJECT, BID ITEM DIFFERS FROM SPEC
OTHER BIDDERS: NO BID -
19 FERTILIZER 10 - 20 - 20
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER 1 . 50 1BS $11.05
‘ SITE ONELANDSCAPE o 1 - 50 lBS | $13.75
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) ] 1 - 50 LBS " $0.30 $16.00
5 HARRELL'S LLC. (LV) N ' ~ | REJECT, MINIMUM REQ. 1 PALLET
OTHER BIDDERS: NOBID I 3
20 FERTILIZER 21-0-0
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER 1 - 50 1BS | LBS 150,19 $9.50 1
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) V 1 - 50 LBS s | s0.22 $0.21 $11.00 2
HARRELL'S LLC. (LV) - 1 - 50 LBS T $0.22 $0.21 $11.07 2
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE | |1 - 50 B ‘ LBS $0.24 $12.10 3
OTHER BIDDERS: NOBID 1 - 1 1BS | LBS
21  FERTILIZER 15-2-15 with Ronstar
§ DIAMOND R FERTILIZER 1 - 50 LBS | LBS | %049 $24.50 1
' RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) | B 1 - 50 LBS | LBS | $059(LPA) | $0.56 | $29.50 2
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE i . 50 LBS | LBS | $0.59 $29.45
HARRELLSLLC. (LvV) | n - 8BS | LBS | REJECT, MINIMUM REQ 1 PALLET
OTHER BIDDERS: NO BID 1 - 1 s s |
22 ORTHENE “ |
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) | ACEPHATE 1 - 10 1BS | LBS | $5.95 $5.65 $59.50 1
WINFIELD SOLUTIONS | BRACKET 1 - 10 BS | LBS | $6.31 $63.10 2
 STEONELANDSCAPE | ACEPHATESOPRI 1 - 5 LBS | LBS | $7.00 $35.00 3
'HARRELL'S LLC. (LV) 1 . 10 LBS BS | $837 $7.95 $83.68 4
| DIAMOND R FERTILIZER ' 1 - 1 LBS LBS | $8.95 $8.95 5
HELENA CHEMICALCO. | 1 - 1 BS | LBS | $9.40 $9.40 6
UNIVAR USA | AcePHATE | 1 - 1 1BS | BS | $9.51 $9.51 7
CROP PRODUCTION ‘ B | noBID
23 TRIMEC CLASSIC
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BASE FOR AWARD

VENDOR'S i UNT/ | priceper | “OAt | ppice per
DESCRIPTION/BIDDER b5 ; PACKAGING BASEFOR | =~ PREFERE | - RANK
4 AWARD | | NCE
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $2380 $59.50 1
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) | TRIPLET 1 - 25 GAL | GALL | $27.30 $25.94 | $68.25 2
HARRELL'S LLC. (LV) T T a5 eal | GALL | $36.13(LPA) | $3432 | $90.32 4
HELENA CHEMICAL CO. 1 - 1 GAL | GAL | $3455 $34.55 3
WINFIELD SOLUTIONS 1 . 25 GALL | GALL | $38.46 $96.15 5
UNIVAR USA | PBIGORDON | 1 - 1 GAL | GAL $40.97 $40.97 6
SITEONELANDSCAPE | BROADLEAF | 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $42.08 $105.20 | 7
CROPPRODUCTION | ' j | NOBID
24  TRIBUTETOTAL i . e SO e
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) 1 . 6 oz oz $55.40 (LPA) | $52.63 | $332.40 | 1
HARRELL'SLLC. (LV) | - 1 - 6 0z | oz $55.40 (LPA) | $52.63 | $332.42 1
SITEONE LANDSCAPE 1 - 6 0z |0z | $5540 $33240 | 2
~ WINFIELD SOLUTIONS 1 - 6 o0z | oz | ss540 $33240 | 2
HELENA CHEMICALCO. 1 - 6 o0z |0z | $5540 $33242 | 2
UNIVARUSA o 1 - 6 oz | oz $55.40 $33242 | 2
OTHER BIDDERS: NO BID B i oz oz $0.00
25 TALSTAR , , :
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) | |1 . s0 BS | LBS | 021 $019 | $10.25 1
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE ‘ A 1 . 25 1BS | 1BS | $0.52 $12.88 2
HELENA CHEMICAL CO. 1 - 1 s s | s0es $0.65 3
WINFIELD SOLUTIONS 1 - 25 1BS | 1Bs | so72 $18.00 4
UNIVARUSA FMC 1 . 25 1BS | 1BS | $096 $24.00 5
DIAVOND R FERTILIZER ‘ ‘ | REJECT(ITEMBID IS A LIQUID)
OTHER BIDDERS: NO BID B I
26  CLIPPER (active ingredient flumloxazln) price in 5 Ib contamers. (NO SUBSTITUTES)
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) 1 . 5 1B | LBS $139.30 (LPA) $132.34 | $696.50
HELENA CHEMICAL CO. - 5 1BS | 1BS | $13930 $696.50 | 1
WINFIELD SOLUTIONS - 5 1BS | LBS | $139.30 $696.50 | 1
OTHERBIDDERS:NOBID | | (g5 | g5 $0.00
27  TRACKER DYE (BLUE) 16-OUNCE (PINT) BOTTLES
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE LESCOTRACKER | 1 - 16 0z | oz $6.29 $100.64 | 1
CROPPRODUCTION | TURFTRAXHC | 1 - 16 0z | 0z | $1560 $249.60 | 2
 UNIVARUSA | MILLKEN-BIAZON 1 - 32 0z 0Z | REJECT, BID ITEM IS NOT A QT BOTTLE
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LvV) | 1 - 32 0 | oz | REJECT, BID ITEM IS NOT A QT BOTTLE
i HELENA CHEMICAL CO. ] - oz | oz | REJECT, BID ITEM IS NOT A QT BOTTLE
HARRELL'SLLC. (LV) i : 0z | 0z | REJECT,BIDITEM IS NOT A QT BOTTLE
% WINFIELD SOLUTIONS - 0z | 0z | REJECT,BIDITEM IS NOT A QT BOTTLE
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER | - ) oz "0z | NOBID
28 BIFENTHRIN INSECTICIDE (LIQUID) GALLON JUG
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) | 1 - 1 GAL | GAW $26.85 $2551 | $26.85 1
 HELENACHEMICALCO. | 1 - 1 GAL | GALL | $2845 $28.45 2
| DIAMOND RFERTILIZER | UPSTARGOLD | 1 - 1 GALL | GALL | $29.40 $29.40 3
* WINFIELD SOLUTIONS ' 1 - 1 GAL | GALL | $29.50 $29.50 4
UNIVAR USA ~ MASTERUNE | 1 - 1 GALL | GALL | $29.69 $29.69 5
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE | CROSSCHECK | 1 - 1 GALL | GALL | $3005 $30.05 6
OTHER BIDDERS: NO BID - |
29 RESOLUTE OR EQUIVALENT-GRANULAR5LBIUG Fal e i
RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) | 1 - 5 1B | 1BS | $8.85 $8.41 | $44.25
HARRELL'S LLC. (LvV) | ‘1 - 5 i8S " Bs | $9.03 $8.58 $45.16
SITE ONE LANDSCAPE R 1 - 10 1BS | 1BS | $9.60 $96.00
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DESCRIPTION/BIDDER

HELENA CHEMICAL CO.

~ DIAMOND R FERTILIZER
WINFIELD SOLUTIONS
—oraen s 08D

! — i
—

DIAMOND R FERTILIZER
? SITE ONE LANDSCAPE
_ WINFIELD SOLUTIONS

| OTHER BIDDERS‘NOBID

; SITE ONE LANDSCAPE
" DIAMOND R FERTILIZER
. UNVARUSA
" HELENA CHEMICAL CO.

s WINFIELD SOLUTIONS

~ OTHER BIDDERS: NO BID

—

ACTIVATED SLUDGE)
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER

 HARRELL'S LLC. (LV)

30  REGIMAX PGR OR EQUIVALENT (LIQUID)
| RESEIDEX - TURFGRASS (LV) TRIN-PEC

31 SIMAZINE 4L (LIQUID) 2.5 GALLON JUGS
RESEIDEX -TURFGRASS 7(}LV) .

| RESEIDEX-TURFGRASS (LV) |

BASE FOR AWARD

— .
VENDOR'S e ; :ﬂ:ﬁ ORi PRICE PER :z::ElRE PRICEPER |
- e E R e
1 - 5 1BS LBS | $9.65 $48.25 4
PRODIAMINE | 1 - LBS | (8BS | $9.80 $49.00 5
PRODIAMINE | 1 - 1BS | 1BS | $10.99 $54.95 6
1. 1 GAL GALL | $121.80(LPA) $115.79 | $121.80 | 2
' GROOM 1 - 1 GAL | GALL | $116.90 $116.90 | 1
" T-NEXAQPGR |1 - 25 GALL | GAL | $13271 | $331.78 | 3
| PODIUM | 1 . 1 GALL | AL | 415543 | $155.43 4
PRINCE |1 - 25 GAL | GALL | $1585 $15.06 | $39.63 1
CPRINCEPSIMAZN 1 - 25 GALL | GALL | $17.72 $4430 | 2
SIMTOL4L 1 - 1 GAL | GALL | $1850 $18.50 3
| DREXEL 1 - 25 GAL GALL | $18.62 $46.55 4
- 1 - 1 GAL | GAL | $19.25 $19.25 | 5
| WFSIMAZINE | 1 - 25 GALL GALL 52000 $50.00 6

20-0-10 FERTILIZER WITH FOLLOWING BLEND FOR 2000 POUNDS (ONE PALLET) NO SUBSTITUTES TO THIS FORMULATION 925 LBS
32 AMMONIUM SULFATE (21-0-0) 526 LBS SULFUR COATED UREA (SCU) 333 LBS MURIATE OF POTASH (KCL) 189 LBS FILLER (BIO-SOLIDS-

1 50 LBS Bs | 024 ! $11.95 1
1 - 50 LBS LBS | 5034 | 5032 $17.00 2
) LBS LBS

| REJECT, MINIMUM REQUIREMENT
—1— :

i
| |

REMAINDER OF THIS PAGE WAS LEFT BLANK INTENTIONALLY
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VENDORS

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICES, INC.

2100 MOORES LANE

| MULBERRY, FL 33860

DIAMOND R FERTILIZER CO, INC.
4100 GLADES CUT-OFF RD
FT PIERCE, FL 34981

|

HARRELL'S INC. (LV)
5105 NEW TAMPA HWY
LAKELAND, FL 33815

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY
PO BOX. 1758
DADE CITY, FL 33526

RESIDEX - TURFGRASS (Lv)

| 7116 ROLLING HILLS RD.

SEBRING, FL 33876

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
2740 S COMBEE RD
LAKEPAND, FL 33803

| UNIVAR USA, INC.

3801 CORPOREX RK DR, STE 280
TAMPA, FL 33619

WINFIELD SOLUTIONS

| 2601 W ORANGE BLOSSUM TRAIL

|_APOPKA, FL 32712

PHONE #

~ 352-222-0655

~ 772-201-0099

 863-687-2774

1352-521-3538

 863-991-4099

800-321-5325

~ 813-621-3001

407-670-4094

E-VERIFY

836151

93188

183153

CONFIRMED

845115

MINIMUM ORDER

$300.00

$1.00

760915

176511

4061475

Local Vendors are indicated by the designation (LV). Award based off of Local Preference is indicated by the designation (LPA).

Minor discrepanices between the case price on the submitted bid and the award are due to roundings.

RECOMMEND AWARDING TO ALL VENDORS BASED ON PRICE AND AVAILABILITY FOR THE BID PERIOD 10/01/2016 - 09/30/2017.

Dol

Date

7-21-/¢

Date
RECOMMENDATION APPROVED BY:
/)L//??//ZO/Z&L ‘Z’éo///é__
June Flsher HCBCC County Administrator Date
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