Bid 4824, EMS Uniforms
e i

: P =
Vendor: A1 Tactical and Safety Inc., 1225 South Roane Street, Harriman, TN 37748 [Vendor: G T Distributors of Georgia, Inc., 100 McFarland Ave., Rossville, GA 30741 Vendor: Image Connection, LLC., 7117 Cross Roads Bivd., Brentwood, TN 37027 Vendor: Summit Uniforms, 2901 East Magnolia Ave., Knoxville, TN 37914
Quantimes of 10 - 50 Discount 1% Quantiies of 10 - 50 Discount No Bid Quantiies of 10 - 50 Discount 3% Mmimum $500 order [Quantiies of 10 - 50 Discount. No Discount
Quantities of 50 - 100 Discount 2% [Quantilies of 50 - 100 Discount. No Bid Quantites of 50 - 100 Discount 4% Mimimum 31,000 order [Quantities of 50 - 100 Discount. No Discount
CQuantities of 100 + Discount: 4% (Quantities of 100 + Discount: No Bid [Quantes of 100 + Discount 5% Mimmum 32,500 order (Quantities of 100 + Discounl: No Cliscount
Category 1 - Duty Dress Shirts Category 1 - Duty Dress Shirts Category 1 - Duty Dress Shirts Category 1 - Duty Dress Shirts
DESCRIPTIO DESCRIPTIO PRICE-
STYLE [COLOR N BRAND PRICE-MEN PRICE-WOMEN STYLE |COLOR T BRAND PRICE-MEN PRICE-WOMEN STYLE |COLOR DESCRIPTION BRAND PRICE-MEN | PRICE-WOMEN STYLE |COLOR DESCRIPTION BRAND PRICE-MEN WOMEN
65% Dacron i 65% Dacron " 85% Dacron Horace Small 65% Dacron .
Sh . F i I
Sle‘:“le Light Blue  |Polyester 35% |No Bid holBid No Bid g:;‘:’:e Light Blue  |Polyester 35% |No Bid No Bid No Bid :r‘e":e Light Blue  [Polyester 35%  |ALTERNATE :Ihe"e’:e LightBlue  |Polyester 35% ;2’;;%‘:2';’55
Rayon Blend Rayon Blend v Rayon Blend SP66 Rayon Blend
$ $ $ 15 $20.50 $20.50 3 436518 4365
65% Dacron . 3 65% Dacron . ; 65% Dacron Horace Small 65% Dacron .
;T:egve Light Blue  [Polyester 35% No Bid No Bid o Bid ;‘I’:f o |LiahtBlue  [Potyester 35% [No Bia NoBid No Bid ;‘I’e"f . |uontBlue  |Polvester3s%  |ALTERNATE ;’e”fve LightBlue  |Polyester 35% Elsy\llcgs?zrgss
Rayon Blend v Rayon Blend v Rayon Blend SPS6 Rayon Blend
$ |5 s $ $23.50 $2350 s 484418 4844
85% Dacron . . 65% Dacron . . 85% Dacron Horace Small 65% Dacron .
ot |wnite Polyester 35% |No Bid o Bid o/Bid Sont  [white Polyester 35% [No Bid o 8id hlo Bid Shon [wnite Polyester 35%  |ALTERNATE Short  {white Polyester 35%  [F)ng Cross
Rayon Blend V! Rayon Blend ve Rayon Blend SP66 Rayon Blend
$ 5 $ 3 $20.50 $20 50 3 436518 4365
65% Dacron . 55% Dacron 1 : 65% Dacron Horace Small 65% Dacron .
;‘I’e"fve White Polyester 35% [No Bid No Bld . Iéloenegve White Polyester 35% |No Bid No Bid No Bid ;‘I’:sve White Polyester 35%  |ALTERNATE _';f:egve White Polyester 35% ley\lzcge%gss
Rayon Blend Rayon Blend Rayon Blend SP56 Rayon Blend
3 $ ] $ 323.50 $23.50 5 4844 | $ 48 44
Costof Cost of Cost of Cost of
EMT/EMT- No Bid No Bid EMT/EMT- No Bid No Bid EMT/EMT- EMT/EMT- note: no charge
y 250 250
PlAdvanced peicld PiAdvanced No Bid PiAdvanced BLANK PiAdvanced |l palch supplies $
patch applied s s patch applied 5 5 patch applied 5150 patch applied
Cost of ) No Bid No Bid Cost of No Bid No Bid Cost of County Cost of County |note: no charge
Caumly pateh [No Bid County patch]fo Bid atch applied HLANK patch applied |if paich supplies ¥ 250] & z50
applied 5 $ applied £ $ P . $1.50
Category 2 - Duty Trousers Category 2 - Duty Trousers Category 2 - Duty Trousers Category 2 - Duty Trousers
DESCRIPTIO DESCRIPTIO PRICE-
STYLE |COLOR N BRAND PRICE-MEN PRICE-WOMEN STYLE |COLOR = N BRAND PRICE-MEN PRICE-WOMEN STYLE (COLOR DESCRIPTION BRAND PRICE-MEN [ PRICE-WOMEN STYLE |COLOR DESCRIPTION BRAND PRICE-MEN WOMEN
65% Polyesler 65% Polyester 55% Polyester Horace Small 55% Polyester Elbeco E2844R $5525
35% Cotion 35% Cotton . No Bid No Bid 35% Cotlon HS2360 HS362 35% Cotlon Propper F5292-50 $34 20 SAME
P - .
6 Pocket|LAPD Blue w/Waistband Horace Small & Pocke{|LAPD Blue | wWaistband No Bid & Pocket [LAPD Blue wiWaistband ALTERNATE 5 Pocket |LAPD Blue WwiWaistband Flying Cross $35.18
Shint Grip Shirt Grip Shirt Grip Shin Grip FX57300-86
5 36.00 |3 36,00 5 15 $41.50) $44 55 SAME
Carhartt Carhartt
washed Duck washed Duck Carharit washed Carhartt washed
Work Work : No Bid No Bid Duck Work No Bid No Bid Duck Work
Dungaree Carhartt Dungaree holBid Dungaree Pants el Dungaree Panls a1
Pants — all Panls - all ~all colors - all calors
colors 5 4199 |5 4199 |eolors b3 £ 5 £ $ 45.50 | SAME
g;ﬁg?r g:.’d::?r No Bid No Bid Propper Critical F5285 Fo86 Propper Critical
LAPD Blue Response Propper LAPD Blue Response No Bid o5 o B4 LAPD Blue Response EMS  |Propper LAPD Blue Response EMS  |Proper F5285-50
EMS pants s 3650 | 5 3650 EMS pants s s fans $36.95 $36.95 pants s 31.92 [sAME
S TTERDS TN ERES . No Bid No Bid 5:11 EMS Pants v 5:11 EMS Pants |74363 5311 Taclite
Pants — all 511 Pants - all No Bid No Bid I col Pant
colors H 5400 |5 54.00 olors 3 5 - all colors No Bid No Bid 5 allicolors ants 5 41.57 [SAME
T EMS
i No Bid No Bid Truspec EMS ) No Bid No Bid Truspec EMS ) Truspec EMS
Pants — all No Bid Panls - ail No Bid No Bid
Pants - all colors Pants — all colors
colors 5 s colors s Is Mo Bid No Bid Na Bid Ma Bid
Flying Cross -Cotton $44.25
EMS Poly/Cotton & EMS Poly/Cotton & EMS Poly/Cotton & EMS Poly/Cotton & F1-47280 Navy/Bk
Dress Wool-Navy No Bid No Bid No Bid Dress Wool-Navy No Bid No Bid No Bid Dress 'Wool-Navy Blue No Bid Dress Wool-Navy Biue SAME
Uniform Blue & Black - Uniform Blue & Black - Uniforms & Black - Without ! Uniforms & Black - Wilhout [Flying Cross - Poly/ $66.38
H Without Stripe s Without Stripe Stripe Stripe Wool F1-47280
$ 3 3 $ No Bid No Bid _ _ SAME
i No Bid No Bid ; No Bid No Bid Wit or without
‘:‘Vlm : No Bid With . No Bid ! With Hemming  |No Bid 'With Hemming  |hemming pricing is
emming 5 s Hemming 3 § No Bid No Bid same O]SAME
Without No Bid No Bid Wilhout i No Bid No Bid Without X Without with or wuho.ul
Hemmin iNo Bld H i No Bid H ; No Bid Hemmin hemming pricing is
g 5 N emming $ $ emming No Bid No Bid 9 same DjSAME
£ e E %@& T SR e S e [ Sl o T P P R, e
Category 3 - Miscellaneous Items Category 3 - Miscellanecus Items Category 3 - Miscellaneous Items Calegory 3 - Miscellaneous ltems
DESCRIPTIO DESCRIPTIO PRICE-
TYPE |COLOR e BRAND PRICE-MEN PRICE-WOMEN TYPE |COLOR N BRAND PRICE-MEN PRICE-WOMEN TYPE |COLOR DESCRIPTION BRAND PRICE-MEN [ PRICE-WOMEN TYPE [COLOR DESCRIPTION BRAND PRICE-MEN WOMEN
3in 1 - Parka ThT-Parka JIn1-Parka & InT-Parka& |519 $170.56
No Bid No Bid ¥
& Jacket ; & Jacket Jackel Suslem  |OCCUNOMIX . Jacket Svstem
5i Occunomix $ 4900 | $ 49.00 Ansi No Bid A Ansi Complianl  |LUXETJBJR $48.75|No Bid Ansi Compliant  oas SAME
Comoliant ormoliant SM s aaaxi SHAXLG Bortwest
Truspec N Rid hin Bt Wi Bied Truspec B Bidd No Bid No Bid TruspecJackels |1, .., 194172 a0 oslun mid Truspec Jackets M Biick SamE




FrirgEay Mat e

caanLn S s ke i " A ML e i e
Fleece Jacket $44 00 %44 00 Fl Jackel Fl Jacket Fleece Jacket
Mawy, Black . lsece Jacke sece Jacks! .
Puboer | B9EE Tr-Mountzin  |pie 200 sach [plus $2 00 each Pullover glavy. ] No Bid Ho Bid Pullover gf“”" Black, Lt ;g;:"’“"‘a'" $42.85{No Bid Pulover gi‘;’" Black, Litn Port Autharity 114 Zip 53119/ SAME
Emibroidering upsize upsize ue Embreidering . Embroidering Embroidering
No Bid $41 03
Mo Front No Front No Front Breast [Ultraclub Na Fronl Breast  {Port Aulhority
Pulovar [N P i
war [Navy |Brassi Pogiat [ProPPEr 3 3500 |3 3500 Pulicreer JMavy Breasl Pocket No Bid Na Bid Pullover |Navy o lassa $33 25{No Bid Pulover |Navy Pockel SAME
Pudigver [Navy ‘With Franl TiMountan  [39200 \us $2 00 :;ﬁm Bl N With Fronl g No & Pullaver I 'With Franl Hand |Uliraciub 333,25]No Bid Plover [N "Wiin Front Hand Sport Tek 18 10lsAME
Hana Focats pius 52 00 wach | e ey Hand Pockets [N & el No 8l e vy Pockets B480 L Cii i bl Pockats 2 ;
LANSID psize
Right Breas! Right Breasl Right Breast Right Breast
Embroidered 34400 $44.00 |Embroidered Embroidered with ), Embroidered wilfi
Pullorwer |Navy wilh First TriMourasn  [phis 52 00 wach [plus 52 00 each Pulowar |Navy wilh First No Bid No Bid No Bid Pullaves |Navy Firsl Letier of Mgg‘” 526 78| No Bid Eullaver |Navy Firsl Leller of | Port Autharity $14 28] SAME
Latiier af Mama upsize upsize Letter of Name Name & Last Name & Lasl
& Lasl Name & Last Nama Name Name
Lefl Breasl Lefl Breast
Lefl Breast
Embroidered $42 00 542 00 Embroidered Lefl Breast
d 16 8
Fullover |Wavy wilh Starof | Tn-Mountain  |plus 5200 each plus $2.00 each Fullrver |Navy wilh Star of No Bid No Bid Pubicwer |Navy Emboldayct il racho $26 10{No Bid Pulicar |Navy Ememidered Wi, o iharity 31590 s e
P Mo Bid Star of Life with  |3480 Star of Life with
Life with upsize upsize Lifa with
ACEMS | ACEMS ACEMS
EME
ACEMS & St CENG & ls s ACEMS & Slar o conard ki
IS nt | itA on f1 i an Iita on Front ichardsen | it o Fennt
ap Black/Navy NS raaTon Richardson $ 1500 | s 1500 Cap Black/Navy rP:lames s A Cap Black/Navy lJam[,e'; on Back, |R6S5 13 75N B Cap Black/Navy Names on Back Dutdoor Cap §11 Q5| SAME
Back 100% (o Be el 100% Cafton
Anth Siar of
Life mm Staral -y e gi ilh Starof Ule | Wilh Star of Life
Cap  |BlackiNavy [o% o g [Richardson $1300 s13c0|  |Cap  [BlackNavy E"?bmlde,ed $ $ Cap BlackiNavy  |embroidered on nlss ardsen $10 50No Bid Cap BlackiNavy  |embroidered on  [Dutdoor Cap 38 44 5AME
an Frent on Fronl Franl Front
Wilh Velcra 2
Cap  [BlackNayy [Z0 Richardson 95 50| 35 sui Cap  |BlackiNavy ;‘;’:ﬁ‘p“'"c"’ No Bid No Bid Cap  |BlackiNavy  |With Vebra Srap §:§;‘a’ds°" 55 28 No Bid Cap  |BlackiNavy  |With Visiero Srap |Dutdoar Cap 53 28{5AME
e Ne Bid
Cap  [BlackiNavy |Fiex Fit Richardson 875 s8 ?5I Cap  |BlackNavy [Flex Ft $ H Cap BlackNavy  |Flex Fil 2'7":“5"” 59 00Ne Bid Cap BlackNavy  |Flex Fit Blauer Cap 58 11|SAME
Rolhco 8460 $5.25] (ggl
Cap Black/Navy [Fleece Rothco 5475 54 75 Cap Black/Navy |[Fleece Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Cap |Black/Navy  [Fleece Port $5 06 Mo Bid ‘Cap Black/Navy  [Flesce Port Authority 13 B5SAME
Allemale-CI18
Ansi Class 3 Angi Class 3
2007 2007 |Ansi Class 3 Ansi Class 3
compliant compliant 2007 comphant 2007 compliant
Safely safaty vesl, $25 00 price $525.00 price Salety safety vesl, Safe safety vest, Satety safety vest,
vest braaka.way Radians includes EMS  [includes EMS vesl breakaway Mo Bid Mo Bid Ne Bid Veslw breakaway type |Viking 8135G $14 95{No Hid \est ‘breakaway type |Radiss Salaty Vel $19 50§ SAME
type with print prnt type with with zippar in 'with zipper in
Eipper in fron zipper in fronl, front, with front, with
with L wilh smbroidering zmbroidenng
pmbrnidsrinn ambroidering
Clig-Cn Tian — Pabynster Clip-Cn The — P Clip-Of Tie — Polyest Edward Clip-C Tie — Pajyester
Black HWC ™ [xd " e ELE Ip-Cn 1] olyester ards ip-On ye: 3 SAME
Tia Bland $4 ?JI §4.78 Tie Black Bland No Bid No Bid Na Bid Tie Black Blend SL100 55 35| No Bid Tie Black Blend 5 Boomne 532545,
e a— . ; Tl e A R EFEN T e R P Dt e e e SR o AR e R G
Category 4 - Miscalk Calsgory d - Miscallaneous Ibems Cont, Catugary 4 - MisceBanacus Ibema Cont, Cabegory 4 cellaneous isme Cont.
TYPE |coLor DEECRIPTIO DESCRIPTIO FRIGE.
IrPe |LOLOR N ERAND PRICE-MEN PRICE-WOMEN TYPE |COLOR _H — BRAMND PRICE-MEN PRICE-WOMEN TYPE |[COLOR DESCRIPTION HRAND PRICE-MEN | PRICE-WOMEN TYPE [COLCR CESCRIPTION BRAND PRICE-MEN WOMEN
Clip-On Tie = Polyeslar Clip-0 Tie — I Clig-01 Tie - Polyest Edward Clip-O1 Tie - Polyesiar
May: we p-On (] olyeatar ig-0On e olyesler ards ip-On I ye! $1 25l 5AME
Tie ¥ Blend H 475 54 75 Te Navy Blend Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid Tie Navy Blend CL100 $525|Na Bid Tie Mavy Blend S Boome 25
Foka Shin wilh Pala Shirt wilh No Bid No Bid No Bid Pala Shirt wilh Poio Shirt wilh performance Palo SM-2xL $36 58
Polo |Embrnidering Pola Embroidering Palo Embroidering Polo Embrodering XL 540.85
Al
Shit g1 $40.24 saozaf o e e No &id No Bl No Bid A 1 iy e M 250z |SAME
5:11 Style 5.11 Style No Bid No Bid No Bid 1511 Siyle 5:11 Style 3XL-5XLT $29 65
TPelo SRl vk Pl S walh FalG Shir with LS L ) B R U
A Frhmirinrne o Bl No B4 o B Pola | Fmbrairiernn |0 Bid fifI8 Na Bfd Paio - Fmbraiderinn gg’;”fésa‘:ge 2XL 53850  |2XL $37 50 o Folo Shitwith [Propper | C E XSM-SXL$32 85 |
Shin . J :
Truspec Shint Truspec Na Bid No Bid No Bid Shirt 511 i:]l'. 240 75 ::t :3? ;IE: ‘Smrl Embroiderng  |Propper Uniform XSM-SXL $23 70
o 1‘ T e Wl Pl SHIA with [ o Bld o el Pole Shir Wit SEEE I5%..'!5 Prale Shirt v
gill=] .
shit [ Frobenidnson |opper LG E s42.00) sazand  [520 ay Fromidaninn e O I uty il Pl (Y P Firbeoderon N giauer ASM-3XL 33715 [SAME
f No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Bhirt Lang Sleeve A '
ERAREL D]
Fic BRI veiin Polo Shid wilh et S vty Proper |IC E EI9 LW
Falo Fenhrrartarinn |5 5 Fmbroiderna Frmhroidering ] Fmarnidennn EEM-NLG 328
| Al pper Snag Folo Pola Fsa41 olo SM-XLG 32850
Shint Prool 544 00) 342 00 st ™M No Bid No Bid Mo Bid st 542 45 Ne Bid P ComerStane oxLaxis3 18 [PAME
Basket Baskel
ket Weave,
Weave, Inner Sh-HEL 51900 |SM-XXL $19 00 Weave. Innar Sm-Lg 51830 |Sm-Lo $158.30 Basket Weavs, Aas )
Beil Black jon Leath E e 9 . 3 18 33|SAME
Beli- |Bas BaNEr| o) 4% 222 00 |3XLAXL $22 00 Bell Black Balt. Duty Man 5121 XL4XL $21 18 |XL-4XL $21 18 Bell Black Ig;:;lgz\sts PM Bells 1401 $13 50{No Bid Bell Black :\::;I:.:\sts Boslon Lealher b
Buckleless Buckleless
ben Jat colors B o £ qq[5MxL 53499 fshxL 534 99 N gt Weoan Mo Bid . et Janco 541 TacTrainer [ | e Bl o o b e 511 Tac Trainer i SMXLS2TT2 [
2L-300 339,95 |2XL-3XL $30 99 el alors rainer Bel o Bi o Bi No Bl ) olars Bell Sm-4XL o Bi o Bi o Bi el alors Balt Srm-4XL 2XL-4XL $317 98 B
Sm-4XL Sm-4XL
et Weave,
Basket |Basket Bas ' No Bid No Bid No Bid IBaskel Weave, Up to 44 515 80
Balt ‘Weava, Duly -|Duty Man fm_’:;fz:z:in ;r\(.:j;fzszzggag Selt \Weave, Culy - | Duty Man 1521 il_m;'fl_""s‘f‘:; i?;‘fﬁ;f;; Bell ?:I'_”' man Sm- |gen Duty - man S |Duty Man 46-52 518,72 SAME
man Sm-4xL . man Sm-4XL - B ankad Visave PM Bells 1305 51350 NoBid XL 54-50 520 02
E Black Flai Ball Sme Cuty Man SM-XL 52180 |SM-XL $21.80 Benl Slack Plain Bell Sm- Duty Man 1511 Sm-Lg$14 94 |Sm-1g 514 54 Bell Black Plain Belt Sm- PM Belis 1410 31100 No Bid Belt Btack Plain Bejt Sm- Duty Man f;;;g;g” SAME
AL TNLAKL 52517 [2XL-4XL §25 17 « ae axL My Man 151 | axL 51800 |x1axt $18 90 e . XL 522850 st ol A XL




Emrargancy [Ememgency Emargoncy [Ermrgancy
Badge |Siver Tone |Sendce Badge |Heros Prde | 3 5% |5 18.99 Badge  |Siker Tone |Service Badge [Mo Bid M Bid Hi Biet Badge |SiverTone  [Service Badgs 3 |HWC 8111 518 50 He Bid Backys  |Silver Torm  |Sarvice Aadge 3 |Heros Price ST 11| SaNE
Ix2% Ixn2% B3 x2 %
i Smith &
Lsdifl || i Ha 3
Badge |Goi cary. Elndga]Smilh & 56400 ssaon|  |pacge |[goi Officers Badge,, , gy No Bid No Bi Bsdge  [Goid Oeficars Sacoe 3 Lvamen P T Badge  |old HMcars. Eacoe 2 1o i 4o Bid o Bid
3x2¥% Warren I Ix2¥ x Z W G155 x2 4
== o
: EMS Rank Smith & ; EMS Rank EMS Rank [EMS Rank :
bl | Gold?: No Bid No Bid
Badge |Gold/Silver insignia \Warren 36 50 36 5I:I| Badge |Gold/Silver \nsignla No Bid No Bid No Bid Badge Gl Siver isignia 5 50 Mo Bid |Badge Sold/Silver insignia No Bid o Bi o B
3loves- Gloves- Gloves- Machanix . Gloves-
) | I 523 24| SAME
8l Sizes Ranchworx Ironclad 5 2999 [ % 2999 All Sizos Ranchworx No Bid No Bid No Bid i aa Ranchaor |EMGEB1 30,55 Mo Bid Fratin Ranchworx iron Clad Glove 24
Gloves Gloves
i Mechanix Mechanix [Mechanix Magpul Gloves I 3 : Glored $17 97|SAME
5;\25 Style Wear il 1899 ;i»:ﬂs Sty B3 51560 LIEEY [ il Mutharix Stin  [Mechanix MFF $16.55] Mo Py haca Mechanix Style  [Mechanix Glove
oves \Gloves
General General i Gloves — ik — Gavaral Puipada Ings
— All o 12.47|SAME
K Purpose alea 516 Qﬂl 516 93 IE:L F“"Pﬂie No Bid No Bid No Bid Jrahic Ganaral Purpose Mo B Mo Bid AF Sizes Seneral Purposs chad $iz4
8" Taclcal 8" Tactcal & Tactical i 8" Tactical
\Waterproct Waterproof ‘Walarproal Resbok . Waterproof Rock $79.95|SAME
Zippered Duty Racky 5 moan s 10000 Zippered Duty Bales EO7110 388 12|35 BO.12 Zipared Outy [ $68.57 Zippered Duty ocky Boot .95
Shoe  [Black Boot Shoe  |Black Boot Shoa  |Black Boot Ho Bid Shoe  |Black Bool
Skech
Shoe Shp On Rocky $ 10000 | 5 100 ¢ Shoe Shp On No Bid No Bid No Bid Shoe Slip On ??I:HE“‘ 573 I:H:II Ho Bid Shoe Slip On 511 $101.40| SAME
Shoe Lace Up Linder Armour | § 10000 | S 100 00 Shoe Lace Up Bates E0Z260 567 G4 587 94 iz Lace p Reaton 3578 i!?.!EI Mo Bid Shoe Lace Up ‘Under Armor $60. 78| SAME
Shoe Zippered 511 ATAC 584 00 594 00 Snoe Zippered Bales E03140 584 41 584.41 Shie Zippered Propper F&623 565 25' Mo Bad Shoe Zippered No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hi-Gloss Hi-Glass
Shae Dress Oxford |Magnum 55000 S 55,00 Shoe Dress Oxford |Bales E22141 $47 25 §47 25 Shos b Giuas Cman Mo Bid M Bid o B Shoe s T ess Thorogood Shoe £52 D0 S AME
(Dictoird Shoe ‘Dxford Shoe
Shoo Shoe
Shoe Lirifarm Rock 580 ) ssaonf  [sn L] les £22233 556,75 s675)  [sn ot hafod EE‘:"S’E paz 7Sl w27S Shoe Undorm Oxferd Ly rogood Shoe 358 43| AME
Oxford Shoe ¥ o8 Oxford Shae | P21% b 356,75 o Shoe & R_E1.1 il i i Shoe 9




Category 3 - Color Block Performance
Polo Shirt with Graphics

A1 Tactical and Safety Inc

G T Distributors of Georgia

Image Cennection, LLC

Summit Uniforms

Bid 4824 1225 South Roane Street 100 McFarland Ave 7117 Cross Roads Blvd 2901 Easl Magnolia Ave
|Harriman, TN 37748 Rossville, GA 30741 Brentwood, TN 37027 Knoxville, TN 37914
Embroidery Colar Brand $/Men's $/Woman's Brand $/Men's $/Woman's Brand $/Men's $/Woman's Brand $/Men's $/Woman's
"é‘;:IBrea“ = ACEMS  \avyiHi Vis Yellow NB NE NB NB NE NB NB NB NB Blauer 64.23 64.22
Navy/White NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB Blauer 64.23 64.23
|Right Breast = Velcro
Strip Name/Back = Navy/Hi Vis Yellow NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB Blauer 64.23 64,23
ACEMS Seal
Navy/\White NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB Blauer 64,23 64,23




