
IFB #16-013 - Solar Shade Structure Project

TABULATION

Company S.P Projects, LLC 

d/b/a Shade-Guard

All Inclusive Rec, 

LLC

Base Bid (Shade Structure Material) $15,780.00 $19,189.00

Alternate 1 (Installation only) $4,475.00 $8,805.00

Alternate 2 (Umbrella) $6,745.00

$7798.00 

(materials) / 

$4,550. 

(installation)

Alternate 3 (Material for existing) $23,460.00 No Bid

Shade 1 $1,955.00 No Bid

Shade 2 $1,955.00 No Bid

Shade 3 $1,955.00 No Bid

Shade 4 $1,955.00 No Bid

Shade 5 $1,955.00 No Bid

Shade 6 $1,955.00 No Bid

Shade 7 $1,955.00 No Bid

Shade 8 $1,955.00 No Bid

Shade 9 $1,955.00 No Bid

Shade 10 $1,955.00 No Bid

Shade 11 $1,955.00 No Bid

Shade 12 $1,955.00 No Bid

Total $50,460.00 $40,342.00


