TABULATION OF BIDS

FOR

21-DES-ITBLW-373
Custodial Services

BIDS were opened by Tomeka D. Price, Procurement Officer at 1:05 P.M. on November 30, 2020.

Name of Bidder

Options A-D

Grand Total

L. T. Services, Inc.

Option A:
$499,128.84

Option B:
$638,846.64

Option C:
$1,007,420.57

Option D:
$239,890.92

$2,385,286.97

Associated Building Maintenance Co., Inc.

Option A:
$598,773.46

Option B:
$623,960.00

Option C:
$1,187,071.75

Option D:
$312,447.17

$2,722,252.38

Trust Consulting Services, Inc.

Option A:
$552,843.00

Option B:
$754,716.37

Option C:
$1,161,780.53

Option D:
$324,221.61

$2,793,561.51

3H Service System, Inc.

Option A:
$578,133.24

Option B:
$738,349.56

Option C:
$1,235,808.20

Option D:
$316,824.24

$2,869,115.24

Brooks & Brooks Services, Inc.

Option A:
$651,695.13

Option B:
$904,439.11

Option C:
$1,220,158.81

Option D:
$366,632.72

$3,142,925.77




1st Lady Janitorial Services, LLC

Option A:
$595,224.72

Option B:
$660,058.92

Option C:
No Bid

Option D:
No Bid

$1,255,283.64

Pritchard Industries, Inc.

Option A:
No Bid

Option B:
$725,401.60

Option C:
No Bid

Option D:
No Bid

$725,401.60




