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Liquid 

Hydrofluosilicic 

acid

Polyphosphate 

/ Silicate

Powder 

Activated 

Carbon

Polyacrylamide 

polymers

Liquid Sodium 

Hydroxide  3 

months

Liquid Sodium 

Hydroxide 1 

year

Liquid Ferric 

Sulfate 3 

months

Liquid Ferric 

Sulfate 1 year
Liquid Chlorine Comments

Kemira Companies, Inc. Y N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $520.00 $520.00 NO BID

CHEMRITE INC Y N/A NO BID $159.80 $3,280.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PENNCO CORP Y N/A $24.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $519.00 $508.00 NO BID

UNIVAR USA INC Y N/A $55.00 NO BID $2,179.00 $5,020.00 $846.00 $801.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

JCI JONES CHEMICALS INC Y N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,050.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $112.25

BRENNTAG SOUTHEAST INC Y N/A NO BID NO BID $2,498.00 $4,878.00 $857.00 $857.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

STERLING WATER TECHNOLOGIES Y N/A NO BID $259.33 NO BID
See Comments 

-->
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID DW225-$5,818.53/DW27-$4,629.95

COLONIAL CHEMICALS SOLUTIONS Y N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $837.00 $937.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

SHANNON CHEMICAL CORP Y N/A NO BID $211.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CHEMTRADE CHEMICALS US LLC Y N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,300.00 $1,300.00 NO BID

TR INTERNATIONAL TRADING Y N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $899.00 $899.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

OLTRIN SOLUTIONS/TRINITY MFG Y N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $831.00 $831.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

SNF POLYDYNE Y N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID
See Comments 

-->
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID A-3320 C-3223-$4,000.00

Comments: City of Wilson representatives present: David Staab, Mitch Vick, Maricela Woolard, Ricky Wilson. Vendor Representatives Present: Mary Lynn Baldwinn, Michelle Poulin, Sam Robinson. Apparent Lowest Bidders are highlighted. Water Treatment to review specifications and recommend 

award.

Ricky Wilson, Purchasing Manager

Signature:

            RFP: 2023-22 - Water Chemicals

I certify that bids were read aloud for this RFP on the due date and time above.

Bid Tabulation

Due Date: 5/16/23 @ 2 pm
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