

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 2333

Partial Roof Replacement for Anderson County Schools:
 LAKE CITY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
 402 Lindsay Avenue
 ROCKY TOP, TN 37769

BID DATE: Wednesday, December 14, 2022, @ 2:00 PM
 Anderson County Purchasing Department, 100 N. Main Street, Anderson County Courthouse, Clinton, TN 37716

CONTRACTOR	BID BOND	ADDEN	BASE BID	EPDM MANUFACTURER
Ridge Roofing	✓	1	215,000	Versico
Dixie Roofing, Inc.	✓	1	199,250	Firestone
B & B Roofing	✓	1	189,850	Versico
Aspen Contracting	✓	1	283,422.95	Versico
McMillan Roofing			No Bid	

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 2333

Partial Roof Replacement for Anderson County Schools:
 LAKE CITY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
 402 Lindsay Avenue
 ROCKY TOP, TN 37769

BID DATE: Wednesday, December 14, 2022, @ 2:00 PM
 Anderson County Purchasing Department, 100 N. Main Street, Anderson County Courthouse, Clinton, TN 37716

CONTRACTOR	UNIT PRICE TREATED WOOD NAILER (LF)	UNIT PRICE EQUIPMENT CURB REPLACEMENT (LF)	UNIT PRICE METAL DECK REPAIR (SF)	
Ridge Roofing	2X4 4.00 2X6 5.00 2X8 6.00 2X10 8.00	15.00	3.00	
Dixie Roofing, Inc.	2X4 4.00 2X6 5.00 2X8 6.00 2X10 7.00	25.00	15.00	
B & B Roofing	2X4 4.00 2X6 5.00 2X8 6.00 2X10 7.00	20.00	15.00	
Aspen Contracting	2X4 4.09 2X6 5.00 2X8 5.81 2X10 6.53	17.60	12.50	
McMillan Roofing	2X4 2X6 2X8 2X10			No Bid

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 2333

Partial Roof Replacement for Anderson County Schools:
 LAKE CITY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
 402 Lindsay Avenue
 ROCKY TOP, TN 37769

BID DATE: Wednesday, December 14, 2022, @ 2:00 PM
 Anderson County Purchasing Department, 100 N. Main Street, Anderson County Courthouse, Clinton, TN 37716

CONTRACTOR	EXTERIOR GRADE PLYWOOD SHEATHING (SF)	Not Used	INSULATION BOARD FILLER 1/2" HD POLYISO (SF)	
Ridge Roofing	1/2" 3.00 3/4" 5.00		2.50	
Dixie Roofing, Inc.	1/2" 5.00 3/4" 6.00		2.00	
B & B Roofing	1/2" 5.00 3/4" 6.50		2.50	
Aspen Contracting	1/2" 4.32 3/4" 5.94		3.97	
McMillan Roofing	1/2" <i>No Bid</i> 3/4" <i>No Bid</i>			

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 2333

Partial Roof Replacement for Anderson County Schools:
 LAKE CITY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
 402 Lindsay Avenue
 ROCKY TOP, TN 37769

BID DATE: Wednesday, December 14, 2022, @ 2:00 PM
 Anderson County Purchasing Department, 100 N. Main Street, Anderson County Courthouse, Clinton, TN 37716

CONTRACTOR	BID BOND	ADDEN	BASE BID	EPDM MANUFACTURER
Eskola Roofing	✓	1	280,450	Carlisle
Henley Roofing Company	✓	1	300,400	Johns Manville
Porter Roofing Company	✓	1	352,000	Multiple's
Foam-Crete, Inc.	✓	1	254,045	Carlisle

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 2333

Partial Roof Replacement for Anderson County Schools:
 LAKE CITY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
 402 Lindsay Avenue
 ROCKY TOP, TN 37769

BID DATE: Wednesday, December 14, 2022, @ 2:00 PM
 Anderson County Purchasing Department, 100 N. Main Street, Anderson County Courthouse, Clinton, TN 37716

CONTRACTOR	UNIT PRICE TREATED WOOD NAILER (LF)	UNIT PRICE EQUIPMENT CURB REPLACEMENT (LF)	UNIT PRICE METAL DECK REPAIR (SF)	
Eskela Roofing	2X4 2.06	6.11	10.00	
	2X6 3.37			
	2X8 4.62			
Henley Roofing Company	2X10 6.46	40.00	10.00	
	2X4 4.00			
	2X6 5.00			
Porter Roofing Company	2X8 6.00	75.00	20.00	
	2X10 7.00			
	2X4 5.00			
Foam-Crete, Inc.	2X6 8.00	25.00	18.75	
	2X8 10.00			
	2X10 12.00			
	2X4 14.00			
	2X6			
	2X8			
	2X10			

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 2333

Partial Roof Replacement for Anderson County Schools:
 LAKE CITY ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
 402 Lindsay Avenue
 ROCKY TOP, TN 37769

BID DATE: Wednesday, December 14, 2022, @ 2:00 PM
 Anderson County Purchasing Department, 100 N. Main Street, Anderson County Courthouse, Clinton, TN 37716

CONTRACTOR	EXTERIOR GRADE PLYWOOD SHEATHING (SF)	Not Used	INSULATION BOARD FILLER 1/2" HD POL YISO (SF)	
Eskola Roofing	1/2" 2.55 3/4" 4.52		2.95	
Henley Roofing Company	1/2" 4.00 3/4" 5.00		225.00	
Porter Roofing Company	1/2" 4.00 3/4" 5.00		4.00	
Foam-Crete, Inc.	1/2" 40.50 3/4" 55.50		102.00	
	1/2" 3/4"			