City of

Orange Beach

Life is better hera

UNIT PRICE BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Name: ATHLETIC UNIFORMS (PARKS & REC)
Requisition No. 2020-1113

Bid Date: November 13, 2020
Bid Opening Time: 9:00 AM

AD-WEAR & BILL FRITZ SPORTS PYRAMID
SPECIALTY OF TEXAS CORPORATION BSN SPORTS DEEP SOUTH APPAREL  SCHOOL PRODUCTS RIDDELL RIVERBEND ENTERPRISES UNIFORMS GALORE VISUAL EFFECTS
Sport Item Style and Description Qty Sizes Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Soccer Jersey: Champro Mark — SJ20 160 Youth $6.11 No Bid $16.00 $11.25 $19.00 $11.40 $13.50 $9.25 $13.65
Two color front chest logo, one color right sleeve logo, 20 Adult $6.89 No Bid $17.00 $11.95 $19.00 $11.90 $13.50 $9.25 $15.65
one color 6" back number
Shorts: Champro Mark — $520 160 Youth $5.09 $4.19 $4.50 $5.20 $3.59 $5.50 $6.55 $5.00 $4.76
20 Adult $5.67 $4.19 $5.25 $5.90 $4.25 $5.50 $6.55 $5.00 $7.25
Socks: Champro Multi-Sport Socks — AS2 180 Pairs All $2.03 $1.96 $2.55 $3.50 $1.95 $2.60 $3.95 $2.50 $3.00
"Soccer" Subtotal: $2,408.60 $1,107.00 $4,184.00 $3,619.00 $4,430.40 $3,520.00 $4,320.00 $3,015.00 $3,943.60
Basketball Jersey: Champro Reversible Pivot — BBJ14 150 Youth $10.07 No Bid $33.00 $16.50 $27.59 $19.10 $21.45 $15.00 $24.35
Two color front chest logo on both fronts, one color logo on both 20 Adult $11.11 No Bid $34.00 $17.50 $28.59 $20.30 $21.45 $15.00 $27.55
backs, one color 6" number on both backs
Shorts: Champro Reversible Pivot — BBS14 150 Youth $7.73 $8.12 $9.15 $9.15 $7.75 $11.20 $11.75 $12.00 $10.95
20 Adult $8.63 $8.12 $10.15 $10.15 $8.85 $11.60 $11.75 $12.00 $14.75
"Basketball" Subtotal: $3,064.80 $1,380.40 $7,205.50 $4,400.50 $6,049.80 $5,183.00 $5,644.00 $4,590.00 $6,141.00
Baseball Jersey: Champro Wildcard 2-Button — BS63 160 Youth $7.37 No Bid $19.50 $12.50 $29.99 $14.10 $14.40 $10.50 $14.99
Two color front chest logo, one color right sleeve logo, 20 Adult $7.61 No Bid $19.75 $12.75 $30.99 $14.40 $14.40 $10.50 $16.75
one color 6" back number
Pants: Champro MVP Open Bottom — BP4U 160 Youth $8.37 No Bid $10.35 $10.50 $8.75 $13.80 $13.55 $12.50 $11.35
20 Adult $9.57 No Bid $11.95 $11.70 $10.09 $14.50 $13.55 $12.50 $16.85
Belts: Champro MVP Baseball Belt — AO62 160 Youth $1.80 $2.19 $2.25 $3.50 $1.89 $2.60 $3.50 $2.50 $2.55
20 Adult $1.80 $2.19 $2.25 $3.50 $1.89 $2.60 $3.50 $2.50 $3.15
Hats: Richardson Pulse — 172 200 Youth $9.97 No Bid $12.85 $12.50 No Bid $14.40 $11.95 $10.00 $13.25
Two color logo embroidered on front Adult $9.97 No Bid $12.85 $12.50 No Bid $14.40 $11.95 $10.00 $13.25
"Baseball" Subtotal: $5,180.00 $394.20 $8,385.00 $7,299.00 $7,360.20 $8,390.00 $8,051.00 $6,590.00 $8,007.40
Softball Jersey: Champro Legacy 2-Button — BS28 60 Youth $8.93 No Bid $21.55 $14.00 $30.99 $14.90 $16.45 $12.75 $17.65
Two color front chest logo, one color logo on back, 15 Adult $9.19 No Bid $21.80 $14.20 $31.99 $15.40 $16.45 $12.75 $18.85
one color 6" number on back
Pants: Champro Tournament Low-Rise Fastpitch — BP11 60 Youth $8.99 $11.19 $11.30 $11.25 $8.79 $15.20 $14.80 $14.50 $14.26
15 Adult $10.49 $11.19 $13.30 $12.75 $11.20 $15.70 $14.80 $14.50 $18.65
Socks: Champro Multi-Sport — AS2 75 Pairs All $2.03 $1.96 $2.55 $3.50 $1.95 $2.60 $3.95 $2.50 $3.00
Visors: Richardson R-Active Lite — 160 75 All $10.49 No Bid $12.50 $12.00 No Bid $11.20 $11.75 $10.00 N/A
Two color logo embroidered on front $10.49 No Bid $12.50 $12.00 No Bid $11.20 $11.75 $10.00 $14.35
"Softball” Subtotal: $2,309.40 $986.25 $3,626.25 $3,081.75 $3,180.90 $3,307.50 $3,521.25 $2,981.25 $3,778.35
Sand Jersey: Holloway Space Dye Tank — 222733 50 Youth $10.79 No Bid $21.50 $14.00 $23.70 $14.20 $14.65 $15.00 $17.25
Volleyball Two color logo on front, one color logo on back 30 Adult $11.11 No Bid $22.10 $14.50 $23.70 $14.60 $14.65 $15.00 $17.65
"Softball" Subtotal: $872.80 $0.00 $1,738.00 $1,135.00 $1,896.00 $1,148.00 $1,172.00 $1,200.00 $1,392.00
GRAND TOTAL: $13,835.60 $3,867.85 $25,138.75 $19,535.25 $22,917.30 $21,548.50 $22,708.25 $18,376.25 $23,262.35
NOTES: Orders that are less than 36 PARTIAL BID PARTIAL BID Substitutions

Tabulated by R. Eberly 11/13/2020

pieces and/or less than $300
have $75 added to cover the
costs of freight. This does not
apply to "add on" team orders
received immediately after the
initial order.

Substitutions
Multiple, see bid form

Baseball Hats
Softball Visors




