[BID NO. 4365

ICS |

Bob Barker Company, Inc.

Robinson Textiles, Inc. |

Justin Trend

Charm-Tex |

Uniforms MFG

Carolina Textiles

MTJ American

Inmate Uniforms & Misc. ltems

P. 0. Box 21056

P. O. Box 429 |

152 W. Walnut St., Ste. 250

6900 Capitol View Ct

1618 Coney Island Ave

PO Box 12716

PO Box 11211

4276 Helena St

Opened March 13, 2012 Waco, TX 76702 Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526 | Gardena, CA 90248 Johnston, IW 50131 Brooklyn, NY 11230 Scottsdale, AR 85267 Charolette, NC 28220 Granite Falls, NC 28630
[ [ I
i o Contact: | J M. Bogan lil Allison wilmesmeier Sheila Hughes Lakshman Kalwani Stan Danzgel Emily Pelligreen Bob Jones Rick Detter
Phone:| (B00) 524-5427 (800) 334-9880 (800) 421-5582 515-707-1744 (718)252-8100 480-368-9316 704-525-1272 B28-396-1537
Fax:| (254) 751-0299 (800) 322-7537 (800) 370-7019 515-331-9072 (718)258-8303 480-368-8556 704-525-0607 828-313-0612
Email: skalwani@iustiolrend com
Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price| Total Price
Mattresses, 30" x 75" x 4" (100 ea.): $ 3600(S$ 36.00 $ 3320 (% 3,320.00 No Bid No Bid $ 36.90 [ $ 3,690.00 No Bid No Bid $ 4136 | % 4,136.00
|Mattress Covers, 30" x 75" x 4" (10 dz.): $ 14400 (S 144000 $§ 7438([% 74380 No Bid No Bid $ 6490 |$ 649.00 No Bid No Bid $ 1586 [% 158.60
Blankets, 72" x 90" (48 ea.) $ 525|§% 25.00 3 615|% 29520 No Bid No Bid $ 626 |% 30048 $ 460|% 220.80 $ 733|S% 35184 No Bid
Washcloths, 12" x 12" (20 dz.) $ 21018 42.00 $ 233 % 46.60 No Bid No Bid $ 1901 8% 38.00 $ 2131 3% 42.60 $ 417 | $ 83.40 No Bid
Bathtowels (per dz.) 22" x 44" 6.25 Ibs $ 2000|% 500.00 $ 1922[$% 48050 No Bid No Bid $ 1390 | $  347.50 $§ 17303 43250( |$ 2168($ 54200 No Bid
Shawer Curtains, Hookless, 36" x 82" (10 ea.): $ 1490[% 149.00 $ 823[($ 8230 No Bid No Bid $ 790|% 79.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
S..uwer Curtains (Grommet style), 36" x 82" (10 ea.): $ 2090]|%  209.00 $ 762(S$ 76.20 No Bid No Bid $ 790 |§ 79.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Night Shirts, one size fits all No bid $ 588 |5 70.56 No Bid No Bid $ 6.90 | § 82.80 $ 750 % 90.00 No Bid No Bid
Subtotal: $ 2,401.00 $ 5115.16 $ % $ - $ 5,265.78 $ 785.90 $ 977.24 $ 4,294.60
Inmate Uniforms (Female):
Blue Shirts, Small (12 ea.): $ 550 | 8% 66.00 $ 3.88 46.56 $ 375|% 45.00 $ 900(% 108.00 No Bid 3 549 | § 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Blue Shirts, Medium (12 ea.): $ 5508 66.00 § 4.08 48.96 $ 375|% 45.00 ] 900 )% 108.00 No Bid 5498 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Blue Shirts, Large (12 ea.): $ 550 (8% 66.00 $ 4.42 53.04 $ 425(%  51.00 $ 9.00[% 108.00 No Bid 549 | % 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Blue Shirts, X-Large (12 ¢a.): $ 550 | % 66.00 $ 4.61 | § 55,32 $ 425(|8% 51.00 $ 950|% 114.00 No Bid $ 549 | % 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Blue Shirts, 2X-Large (12 ea.): $ 550 |% 66.00 $ 4.72 | § 56.64 $ 4258 51.00 $ 950|% 114.00 No Bid $ 549 |8 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Blue Shirts, 3X-Large (24 ea.): $ 700|$ 168.00 $ 512|% 122.88 $ 42518 102.00 $ 1000]|$ 240.00 No Bid $ 549 |% 13176 No Bid No Bid
Blue Shirts, 4X-Large (24 ea.): $ 70018 168.00 548 |% 13152 $ 425|8% 102.00 $ 10.00|$ 240.00 No Bid $ 577]% 13848 No Bid No Bid
Blue Shirts, 5X-Large (24 ea.): $ 70018 168.00 588|% 14112 $ 42518 102.00 $ 11.00 | $ 264.00 No Bid $ 577|% 138.48 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, Small (12 ea.): $ 550|% 66.00 $ 388 (% 46.56 $ 400 | $ 48.00 $ 900]|% 108.00 No Bid $ 549 1% 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, Medium (12 ea.): $ 550|% 66.00 $ 408 | % 48.96 $ 400 |8 48.00 $ 900§ 108.00 No Bid $ 5491 % 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, Large (12 ea.): $ 5508 66.00 442 | % 53.04 $ 460 | % 55.20 $ 9.00| % 108.00 No Bid $ 549 | § 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, X-Large (12 ea.): $ 550|% 66.00 461[% 5532 $ 460§ 5520 $ 950 (% 114.00 No Bid $ 549|% 6588 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, 2X-Large (12 ea.): $ 550|% 66.00 4723  56.64 $ 460]|% 5520 $ 950 |$ 114.00 No Bid $ 549 |% 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, 3X-Large (12 ea.): $ 7008 84.00 51219 61.44 $ 460 )% 55.20 3 1000 | $ 120.00 No Bid 3 54918 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, 4X-Large (12 ea.): $ 7.00|% 84.00 $ 548 | § 65.76 $ 46018 55.20 $ 10.00 [ $§ 120.00 No Bid 57718 69.24 No Bid No Bid
lad Shirts, 5X-Lage (12 ea.): $ 7008 84.00 $ 588 |8% 70.56 $ 4601 % 55.20 S 11001 $§ 132.00 No Bid 577 | % 69.24 No Bid No Bid
L ¥ Subtotal: $ 1,416.00 $ 1,114.32 $ 976.20 $ 2,220.00 $ - $ 1,271.88 $ - $ =
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: ina Textiles MTJ American
BID NO. 4365 ICS Bob Barker Company, Inc. | Robinson Textiles, Inc. Just in Trend Charm-Tex Uniforms MFG Carolina T
Trouser Specs.: Elastic waist, sli -on, no pockets) - 8520 No Bid No Bid
Blue Trousers, Small (12 ea.): : $ 55018 66.00| [$ 501|s 6012| |[$  450|5 5400]| |$§ 950]35 114.00] | No Bid : ;'18 : 85.20 | | No Bid No Bid
Blus Trousers, Medium (12 ea.): 3 55 /% 6600] [$ 525|% 6300 [$  450|3 5400] |$ 9505 11400 | No Bid — T ol No Bid
Blue ifousers, Large (12 ea.): $ 550 66.00 [§ 582|% 6984] |3 540/$ 6480] 1S 950]5 114.00] | NoBid T Ra i No Bid
Blue Trousers, X-Large (12 ea.); $ 550 6600| |3 582[$ 6984 |3 540/$ 6480] 1S 1000]S 120.00] | NoBid T e No Bid
Blue Trousers, 2X-Large (12 ea.): $ 550|% 6600 [$ 582|3 6984| |$ 540]s 64801 ]S 1000[5 120.00] [NoBid : TR Y o Bid
Blue Trousers, 3X-Large (24 ea.): $ 700]|$% 16800| |[$ 602|5 14448| |$ 54015 12960] IS 1100]S 264.00 | | NoBid : T e P No Bid
Blue Trousers, 4X-Large (24 ea.): $ 700]$ 16800| [$ 628|5 15072 |% 540]$ 12960| IS 11.00[§ 264.00] [NoBid : LT L Mo Bid
Blue Trousers, 5X-Large (24 ea.): $ 700 168.00 [ [$  688|3 16512] |$ 5401$ 12960] IS 1200[S 288.00] [NoBid il st s Mo Bid
Red Trousers, Small (12 ea.): $ 550 66.00| |8 501|3 6012]| |$ 550/$ 6600] 1s 950[$ 114.00] [NoBid — 5T Rl s No Bid
Red Trousers, Medium (12 ea.); $ 550 6600| [$ 525|$ 6300] [$ 5508 66.00] |$ 950|8% 114.00] | No Bid — s as o No Bid
Red Trousers, Large (12 ea.); $ 550 66.00| [$ 582 6984 [s 675 81.00 950§ 11400 | NoBid - I T o Bid
Red Trousers, X-Large (12 ea.); $ 550]% 6600 |5 582 6984 [ 6753 81.00 1000[$ 12000 | | NoBid : e Eatee No Bid
Red Trousers, 2X-Large (12 ea.): $ 550 |8 66.00 $ 582($ 69.84 $ 675|%  81.00 10.00 [ $ 120.00 No B!d . 7-10 S 55 NG Bid No Bid
Red Trousers, 3X-Large (12 ea.): $ 700][s 8400 |3 602[$ 7224| |5 675|% 8100] |$ 1100|8% 13200] | No Bid $  7.10]s  8520] [NoBid No Bid
Red Trousers, 4X-Large (12 ea.): $ 700]s% 84.00| |s 628|S3 7536 | 675]/s 8100] 1S 1100]§ 13200 |NoBid T No Bid
Red Trousers, 5X-Large (12 ea.): $ 700]% 8400 [s 6885 8256 |$ 6758 8100 |$ 12005 144.00 | | NoBid e AT 3 - 5
Subtotal: $ 1,416.00 $ 1,355.76 $ 1,309.20 $ 2,388.00 $ - 4
Women's Cotton Panties (36 each): 096 | % 34.56 No Bid
( Size 5 : ) $ 075]8 27.00 $ 070[$ 25.20 No Bid No Bid 0.65 S 23.40 $ g.g: : g:-:: : S AE TR T e
ol & 3 973 2720118 o70ls 2520 el o 5t ol salt ant T el
Se v 3 978 2700148 07018 2620 No Bid e oot T ul ol EnhT els el
Size 8 § 0758 2700 |s 070]% 2520 No Bid No Bid 30 65 $ 2340 s oeels amlls 10115 sl hona
Size 9 $ 075]s 27.00| |8 070[3% 2520 No Bid No Bid 50.71 § 2556 sy e oo Sa
Sl 3 _083ls 20550 ]F 075]% 27.00 No Big e o sl e el hlr el e
Size 11 $§ 083|% 2988 [$ 0758 27.00 No Bid No Bid $0.71 § 2556 T ) Y T e
Size 12 3 08318 20880 1S 075(3 27.00 o Bie roDa na —-— S 068|3 2448] 5 1.11]$  39.95] [NoBid
Size 13 $ 0838 2988 | [§  075|s 27.00 No Bid No Bid $0.71 § 2556 T i s e
Size 14 $  083]% 2988 [s  075]s 27.00 No Bid No Bid $0.71 $§ 2556 013 s s i 5
Subtotal: $_ 284.40 $_261.00 s - ¥ 20 :
Women's Sports Bras (12 each); 202|% 2424 No Bid
: Small : , $  262[% 3144 [ 1893 2268 No Bid No Bid $ 1728 2064 : g.gg : ;:-:g 2 e S
Medium 5 262(% 3144 | [s 1893 2268 No Bid No Bid $ 172[$% 2064 T o s 2o S
Large $ 2623 3144 | |5 1893 2268 No Bid No Bid $ 172[$ 2064 T Y B T o ET T e
X-Large $ 262|5 3144 |5 189|s 2268 No Bid No Bid $ 1721$ 2064| |$ T e s e wal e
2X-Large $  390(s 4680 | [$ 1893 22868 No Bid No Bid B 172]$ 2064 $ N EE 1 B R o E T S
3X-Large 8 390[$ 4680| [$ 18985 2268 No Bid No Bid B 172]$ 2064 : o ) B ECRE o LT s
4X-Large $ 3903 4680 | [s 189|s 2268 No Bid No Bid 5 1728 2064 My e e 5
Subtotal: $_ 266.16 $_158.76 s - 3 16848 :




BID NO. 4365 ICs Bob Barker Company, Inc. [ Robinson Textiles, Inc. Justin Trend Charm-Tex Uniforms MFG Ca i
] rolina Textil i
Red Trousers, 2X-Large (12 ea.: $ 5505 6600 |5 582[5 6984] |5 675]% 8100] |S 1000]8 72000 [NoBid $  700]% 8400 A= 2 %ad American
Red Trousers, 3X-Large (12 ea.): $ 7.00($ 168.00 $ 6028 7224 ] 675|% 81.00 $ 11.00]8% 132.00 No Bid § 700($ 84.00 No Bid zo mmu
Red Trousers, 4X-Large (12 ea.): $ 7.00|% 168.00 $ 628|$ 7536 ] 675(% 81.00 $ 11.00)8% 132.00 No Bid $ 70018 84.00 No Bid ZM m"n
Re#! “vousers, 5X-Large (12 ea.): § 700|$ 168.00 $ 688|% 8256 g 675]|%  81.00 $ 12.00[$ 144.00 No Bid $ 7008 84.00 No Bid No Bid
Subtotal: $ 3,072.00 $ 2,653.56 $ 2,621.40 $ 4,728.00 $ = $ 2,809.92 $ - $
Men's White Brief's (48 ea):
Small $ 092153 44.16 $ 1050|3%$ 504.00 No Bid No Bid $ 899 |% 43152 $ 090 |3% 4320 $ i
: i : . g k 088 |35 42.24
Medium § 092|$ 4416 [$ 1050[$ 504.00 | |NoBid No Bid $ 899[% 43152] |$ 090[$ 4320 [$3  088|35 422a4 um wm
Large $  092]% 4416 | [$ 1050 |$% 504.00 No Bid No Bid 3 899§ 43152 S 090[s 4320 [ 088 |5 4224 No Bid
X-Large $ 092198 44.16 3 11.00($ 528.00 No Bid No Bid $ 889§ 431.52 § 09018 43.20 $ 088|$ Am.ma No Bid
2X-Large § 092[S 4416| |$ 1200|$ 576.00| |NoBid No Bid B 9995 47952 102§  4895] [$  098]8 47.04| |NoBid
3X-Large $ 1.50 | § 72.00 $ 1300|% 624.00 No Bid No Bid $ 1099 | § 527.52 i 114§ 54.72 $ 108 |§ mA_,mu No Bid
4X-Large $ 1.50 | § 72.00 $ 13.00[$ 624.00 No Bid No Bid $ 1199 [ § 575.52 124 |% 59.52 $ 118 | $ wm.ma No Bid
5X-Large $ 150 [ $ 72.00 $ 14.00 | $§ 672.00 No Bid No Bid $ 13.90 [ § 667.20 150§ 72.00 $ 128§ 61 .Aa No Bid
Subtotal: $  436.80 $ 4,536.00 s - $ 3,975.84 $  408.00 $  385.02 3 =
Inmate Shoes:
(Shoe Specs.: Ethyl Vinyl Acetate (EVA) Sandal
Small (36 ea.): $ 285|8% 102.60 $ 298 |$ 107.28 No Bid No Bid $ 326 (% 117.36 $ 285[§ 10260 $ 265|% i
L _ , : : E i 95.40
‘.um_ca (36 ea.): $ 285[3 10260] [S 298|$ 10728 |NoBid No Bid $ 326|% 11736 [S  285]S 10260| [$  265|$ 9540 nm MM
carge (36 ea.): 5 285|$% 10260 [$ 298[$ 107.28| | NoBid No Bid s 326|s 11736| |$  285|5 10260] |3 265]S 9540 | NoBid
X Large (36 ea.): 5 285]$ 10260 [$ 298|$% 10728 | [NoBid No Bid $ 326|% 11736 |[$ 285]|s 10260] | % 26515 9540 No Bid
2 X Large (36 ea.): 5 285|$% 10260| |[$ 298($ 10728 | |NoBid No Bid $ 3268 11736 [$  285|% 10260] [$  265]% 9540 |NoBid
3 X Large (36 ea.): $ 285]|% 10260 $ 298|% 107.28 No Bid No Bid $ 326|% 117.36 $ 285(% 10260 [$ 26518 mmxo No Bid
Subtotal: $  615.60 $ 643.68 $ - $ 704.16 $ 615.60 $ wqm_ao $ E
TOTAL: #REF! #REF! #REF! #REF! #REF! #REF! #REF!
Second Year:|5% $ 5.00 5.00% 10.00% 5.00% 5.00% 5.00% 10.00%
- - = ]
Third Year:|7% $ 500 5.00% 18.00% 5.00% 5.00% 5.00% 18.00%
B o
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Basis: low item low item All or None low item low item All or None All or None low item
Delivery Within: 3-5 days 5-30 days 7-45 days 70-80 days 7-30 days 30-45 days 30 days 21 days
Additional Purchases: yes yes yes yes Blank yes yes es L
Prices Stable: 90 days 90 days 30 days 30 day return 360 days 90 days 60 days w..mmq
Warranty: Blank see bid 1yr 1yr Blank Replacment .
.
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|BID NO. 4365 ICS Bob Barker Company, Inc. | Robinson Textiles, Inc. Justin Trend Charm-Tex Uniforms MFG Carolina Textiles MTJ American
Inmate Uniforms (Male): : .
(Shirt Specs.: Short sleeve, V-neck,
slip on, no breast pocket)
White Shirts, Medium (12 ea.): $ 5508 6600| |$ 388|% 4656 3 3755 4500 [$ 9003 108.00| | NoBid $ 433[$  51.96| | NoBid No Bid
White Shirts, Large (12 ea.): $ 550|% 6600| |$ 422|% 5064 S 425|%5 5100 | $ 9.00|$ 108.00| | NoBid $ 4338 5196 | NoBid No Bid
White Shirts, X-Large (12 ea.): $ 550 % 66.00 3 4.38 | § 52.56 $ 42518 51.00 $ 9.50 114.00 No Bid $ 433 | % 51.96 | | No Bid No Bid
White Shirts, 2X-Large (12 ea.): $ 5508 6600| |$ 438[$ 5256 S 425|s 5100 |$ 9.50 114.00 | | No Bid $ 433]$ 5196 | | NoBid No Bid
White Shirts, 3X-Large (24 ea.): $§ 700[$ 16800 [$ 472|$ 11328 $ 425]$% 10200 [$ 1000|$ 240.00 | | NoBid $ 433[$ 10392 | [ NoBid No Bid
White Shirts, 4X-Large (24 ea.): $ 700[$ 16800 [$ 508[$ 12192| |$  425($ 10200| |$ 10.00|$ 240.00| | NoBid $ 433]|$ 10392 | | NoBid No Bid
White Shirts, 5X-Large (24 ea.): $ 700[s 16800 [$ 540[$ 12960| |$  425|$ 10200 |$ 11.00|$ 264.00| | NoBid $ 476|$ 11424 | NoBid No Bid
Orange Shirts, Medium (12 ea.): $ 550 (8 66.00 $ 408 | % 48.96 $ 4.00 | $ 48.00 3 9.00|$ 108.00 No Bid $ 469 | $ 56.28 No Bid No Bid
Orange Shirts, Large (12 ea.): $ 550(s 6600 | |5 442(|% 5304 $ 460]% 5520] [$  900|$ 108.00] | NoBid $ 4698 5628 | NoBid No Bid
Orange Shirts, X-Large (12 ea.): $ 550 (% 66.00 3 4611 % 55.32 $ 460 | % 55.20 $ 950 (3% 114.00 No Bid $ 469 (% 56.28 No Bid No Bid
Orange Shirts, 2X-Large (12 ea.): $ 550 |$% 66.00 $ 4721 % 56.64 $ 460 | % 55.20 $ 9.50|% 114.00 No Bid $ 469 | $ 56.28 No Bid No Bid
Orange Shirts, 3X-Large (24 ea.): $ 7.00($% 168.00 $ 5121% 122.88 $ 460 |% 11040 $ 10.00 | $ 240.00 No Bid $ 4691% 11256 No Bid No Bid
Orange Shirts, 4X-Large (24 ea.): 3 7.00 % 168.00 $ 548 |% 13152 $ 460 (% 11040 $ 10.00 | $§ 240.00 No Bid $ 469|% 11256 No Bid No Bid
Orange Shirts, 5X-Large (24 ea.): 3 7003 168.00 § 588 [% 14112 $ 460 (% 11040 $ 11.00 | $§ 264.00 No Bid $ 485|% 118.80 No Bid No Bid
Green Shirts, Medium (12 ea.): 3 550 (% 66.00 $ 408 (% 48.96 $ 375|8§ 45.00 $ 9.00|$ 108.00 No Bid $ 469 | % 56.28 No Bid No Bid
Green Shirts, Large (12 ea.): $ 55018 66.00 $ 4421 3% 53.04 $ 425 % 51.00 $ 9.00|$ 108.00 No Bid $ 469 | $ 56.28 No Bid No Bid
| Green Shirts, XL-Large (12 ea.): $ 550 (% 66.00 $ 461]% 55.32 $ 42595 51.00 $ 950 (% 114.00 No Bid $ 469 |3 56.28 No Bid No Bid
. Jeen Shirts, 2X-Large (12 ea.): S 5503 66.00 $ 472|3 5664 3 425|S 5100 |$ 9.50 | $ 114.00 | | No Bid $ 469[S$ 5628 | | NoBid No Bid
Jreen Shirts, 3X-Large (24 ea.): $ 700|$ 168.00 $ 512|s 12288 $ 425[s 10200[ [$ 1000[$ 240.00]| | No Bid S 4698 11256 | | NoBid No Bid
Green Shirts, 4X-Large (24 ea.): $ 700|$ 16800 |$ 5485 13152 $ 425|% 10200] [$ 10.00]$ 24000 | NoBid $ 4698 11256 | | NoBid No Bid
Green Shirts, 5X-Large (24 ea.): $ 700|$ 16800| |$ 588 |5 14112 $ 425|8 10200 [$ 11.00|$ 264.00]| | NoBid $ 495|% 118.80 | | NoBid No Bid
Red Shirts, Medium (12 ea.): $ 550 % 66.00 $ 408 |8 48.96 $ 400 | % 48.00 $ 9.00]|% 108.00 No Bid $ 549 | % 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, Large (12 ea.): $ 550|% 66.00 $ 442 | § 53.04 $ 460 | $ 55.20 3 9.00|$ 108.00 No Bid $ 549 | % 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, XL-Large (12 ea.): $ 550 | % 66.00 $ 461§ 55.32 $ 460 ] 9% 55.20 $ 9501% 114.00 No Bid $ 549 | % 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, 2X-Large (12 ea.): $ 550 |8 66.00 $ 472§ 56.64 $ 460 | % 55.20 $ 9501% 114.00 No Bid $ 549 [ % 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, 3X-Large (12 ea.): $ 7.00(|$ 84.00 $ 512 [ $ 61.44 $ 460 % 55.20 $ 10.00 [ $ 120.00 No Bid $ 549 [ § 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, 4X-Large (12 ea.): $ 700]8 84.00 $ 548 [ § 65.76 $ 460 | $ 55.20 $ 10.00 | $ 120.00 No Bid $ 549 | % 65.88 No Bid No Bid
Red Shirts, 5X-Large (12 ea.): $ ‘ﬂ.oo $ 84.00 $ 588 |% 70.56 $ 460 | $ 55.20 $ 11.00 | $ 132.00 No Bid $ 6.00 | $ 72.00 No Bid No Bid
Subtotal: $ 2,820.00 $ 2,197.80 $ 1,932.00 $ 4,380.00 $ - $ 2,135.28 3 - $ N
(Trouser Specs.: Elastic waist, slip on, no pockets)
White Trousers, Medium (12 ea.): $ 550 (% 66.00 3 491 1% 58.92 $ 4.50 $ 9508 114.00 No Bid $ 530 (% 63.60 No Bid No Bid
White Trousers, Large (12 ea.): $ 550 (8% 66.00 $ 5411 % 64.92 $ 5.40 $ 9501% 114.00 No Bid $ 53089 63.60 No Bid No Bid
White Trousers, X-Large (12 ea.): 3 550|% 66.00 $ 5411% 6492 $ 5.40 $ 10,00 | $ 120.00 No Bid 3 530|% 63.60 No Bid No Bid
White Trousers, 2X-Large (12 ea.): 3 550 % 66.00 $ 541|% 6492 $ 5.40 $ 1000 ($ 120.00 No Bid 3 530 (% 6360 [ NoBid No Bid
White Trousers, 3X-Large (24 ea.): 3 7.00|$% 168.00 $ 562 |% 134.88 $ 5.40 $§ 1100[$ 264.00 No Bid 3 530|% 127.20 No Bid No Bid
White Trousers, 4X-Large (24 ea.): 3 7.00|$% 168.00 $ 588 |8 14112 $ 540 $ 11.00 | $ 264.00 No Bid $ 5308 127.20 No Bid No Bid
White Trousers, 5X-Large (24 ea.): 3 7.00 % 168.00 $ 648 | $ 15552 $ 5.40 $ 12.00 [ $ 288.00 No Bid $ 580[% 13920 No Bid No Bid
Orange Trousers, Medium (12 ea.): $ 550 (% 66.00 $ 525 % 63.00 $ 5.50 $ 9501% 114.00 No Bid $ 576 | $ 69.12 No Bid No Bid
range Trousers, Large (12 ea.): $ 550 |$% 66.00 $ 582|% 69.84 $ 6.75 $ 950]|% 114.00 No Bid $ 576 | % 69.12 No Bid No Bid
range Trousers, X-Large (12 ea.): $ 550 (% 66.00 $ 582|% 69.84 3 6.75 $ 10.00 | $ 120.00 No Bid $ 576 | % 69.12 No Bid No Bid
Orange Trousers, 2X-Large (12 ea.): 5 550§ 66.00 $ 582|% 6984 3 6.75 $ 10.00 | $ 120.00 No Bid $ 576 [ % 69.12 No Bid No Bid
Orange Trousers, 3X-Large (24 ea.): $ 700|3 16800| [$ 602[% 14448 3 6.75 $  1100]$ 264.00| | NoBid $ 576 |$ 138.24 | | No Bid No Bid
Orange Trousers, 4X-Large (24 ea.): $ 700[$ 16800| [$ 628|% 15072 3 6.75 S  1100]$ 264.00]| | NoBid $ 630 |$ 151.20 | | No Bid No Bid
Orange Trousers, 5X-Large (24 ea.): $ 700(% 168.00 $ 688 |3 165.12 3 6.75 $ 1200|$ 288.00 No Bid 3 630)% 151.20 No Bid No Bid
Green Trousers, Medium (12 ea.): $ 55018 66.00 $ 525|% 63.00 $ 4.50 $ 950 % 114.00 No Bid 3 7.00|% 84.00 No Bid No Bid
Green Trousers, Large (12 ea.): $ 550 |8 66.00 $ 5828 69.84 $ 5.40 $ 950|% 114.00 No Bid $ 7.00|8% 84.00 No Bid No Bid
Green Trousers, X-Large (12 ea.): $ 550 |% 66.00 $ 58218% 69.84 $ 5.40 $ 10.00 | § 120.00 No Bid 3 700 % 84.00 No Bid No Bid
Green Trousers, 2X-Large (12 ea.): $ 5508 66.00 $ 582|% 69.84 $ 5.40 $ 10.00 | § 120.00 No Bid $ 700 % 84.00 No Bid No Bid
Green Trousers, 3X-Large (24 ea.): $ 7008 168.00 $ 6.02 |5 144.48 $ 5.40 $ 11.00 | $ 264.00 No Bid $ 700|$% 168.00 No Bid No Bid
Green Trousers, 4X-Large (24 ea.): $ 7008 168.00 $ 628 |5 150.72 $ 5.40 $ 11.00 | $ 264.00 No Bid $ 700|$% 168.00 No Bid No Bid
Green Trousers, 5X-Large (24 ea.): $ 7.00|8 168.00 $ 688 |5 165.12 $ 5.40 3 12.00 | $ 288.00 No Bid $ 770|% 184.80 No Bid No Bid
Red Trousers, Medium (12 ea.): $ 550 (8% 66.00 $ 525[% 63.00 $ 5.50 3 950 (8% 114.00 No Bid b 700|$% 84.00 No Bid No Bid
Red Trousers, Large (12 ea.): % 550 | % 66.00 $ 582|% 69.84 $ 6.75 $ 950 (8% 114.00 No Bid 3 7.00 (% 84.00 No Bid No Bid
Red Trousers, X-Large (12 ea.): $ 5.50 | $ 66.00 3 5825 69.84 $ 6.75 3 10.00 [ $§ 120.00 No Bid b 7008 84.00 No Bid No Bid




