
Portage Public Schools

 #10668 - North Middle School Blackbox Theater Lighting Fixture Package
December 21, 2018 -- 1:30 pm

Vendor Name Pro Audio & Lighting Vincent Lighting Systmes John S. Hyatt & Associates Inc PROVIDEO SLS Production Services TPC Technologies, Inc. LED Lighting Wholesale Inc.
Address 2400 E 14 Mile Road, Warren, MI 48092 6161 Cochran Road, Ste. D, Solon, OH 44139 1765 Alpine Ave NW, Grand Rapids, MI 49504 26471 Southpoint Rd., Perrysburg, OH 43551 1711 Vanderbilt Ave, Portage, MI 49002 185 Bell Rd., Niles, MI 49120 400 E. Cork St., Kalamazoo, mI 49001

Contact Name Robert Kuron John Conley Jessi Nix Lara Kuhlman Brad Scott Marty Golob Cody O'Brien
Contact E Mail robk@proaal.com jconley@vls.com jessin@jshaa.com lara@provideosystems.com office@slsmi.com mgolob@tpctechnologies.com cody@ledlightingwholesaleinc.com

Familial X X X X X X X
Iran Econ Act X X X X X X X

Legal Status Form X X X X X X X
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price 

Qty Make/Model

60 Chauvet Colorado 1-Quad Zoom Tour $445.29 $26,717.40 $475.56 $28,533.60 $460.35 $27,621.00 $508.00 $30,480.00 $467.16 $28,029.60 $439.43 $26,365.80 $534.75 $32,085.00

8 ETC Source 4 ERS - 36 degree lens tube - 2P&G installed $357.25 $2,858.00 $338.18 $2,705.44 $345.00 $2,760.00 $415.00 $3,320.00 $388.85 $3,110.80 $439.52 $3,516.16 No Bid

4 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Wash $1,149.12 $4,596.48 $1,363.65 $5,454.60 $1,320.00 $5,280.00 $1,310.00 $5,240.00 $1,205.55 $4,822.20 $1,260.00 $5,040.00 $1,380.00 $5,520.00

6 ETC ColorSource LED w/Cyc attachment $1,213.06 $7,278.36 $1,302.27 $7,813.62 $1,383.00 $8,298.00 $1,306.00 $7,836.00 $1,556.50 $9,339.00 $1,174.95 $7,049.70 No Bid

2 Chauvet Rouge R-2 Spot $1,541.74 $3,083.48 $1,829.54 $3,659.08 $1,771.00 $3,542.00 $1,758.00 $3,516.00 $1,617.45 $3,234.90 $1,690.50 $3,381.00 $1,851.00 $3,702.00

1 ETC Ion XE 20 console - no monitors - 2048 Outputs $8,567.21 $8,567.21 $7,704.54 $7,704.54 $7,828.00 $7,828.00 $9,180.00 $9,180.00 $9,002.40 $9,002.40 $7,119.00 $7,119.00 No Bid

4 City Theatrical SHoW DMX SHoW Baby 6 $272.44 $1,089.76 $245.45 $981.80 $293.00 $1,172.00 $288.00 $1,152.00 $308.00 $1,232.00 $336.00 $1,344.00 No Bid

1 ATA Road case for ETC Ion XE 20 $682.34 $682.34 $613.63 $613.63 $594.00 $594.00 $784.00 $784.00 $625.00 $625.00 $567.00 $567.00 No Bid

70 10’ DMX cable $6.56 $459.20 $7.89 $552.30 $10.00 $700.00 $8.00 $560.00 $20.97 $1,467.90 $27.51 $1,925.70 $8.75 $612.50

12 25’ DMX cable $9.94 $119.28 $14.71 $176.52 $16.50 $198.00 $13.00 $156.00 $32.30 $387.60 $34.91 $418.92 $14.18 $170.16

1 50’ DMX cable $18.69 $18.69 $27.21 $27.21 $30.00 $30.00 $22.00 $22.00 $49.41 $49.41 $48.67 $48.67 $25.00 $25.00

8 25’ 12/3 SOOW w/2P&G plugs (25’ Stage Pin Extension) $48.75 $390.00 $38.14 $305.12 $45.00 $360.00 $39.00 $312.00 $43.13 $345.04 $43.16 $345.28 No Bid

70 10’ Powercon Male to Powercon Female jumper cables $16.25 $1,137.50 $28.36 $1,985.20 $30.00 $2,100.00 $32.00 $2,240.00 $19.92 $1,394.40 $28.98 $2,028.60 No Bid

24 25’ L5-20 Male / PowerCon Female extension cables $22.50 $540.00 $24.20 $580.80 $41.00 $984.00 $39.00 $936.00 $38.13 $915.12 $55.35 $1,328.40 No Bid

4 25’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison plugs (25’ Black Extension) $45.74 $182.96 $39.06 $156.24 $39.00 $156.00 $35.00 $140.00 $40.95 $163.80 $51.22 $204.88 No Bid

1 50’ 14/3 SOOW w/Edison Plugs (50’ Black Extension) $65.00 $65.00 $59.45 $59.45 $60.00 $60.00 $53.00 $53.00 $51.70 $51.70 $75.14 $75.14 No Bid

1 APC Back-UPS Pro 700VA UPS (Or equivalent) $105.99 $105.99 $110.61 $110.61 $165.00 $165.00 $124.00 $124.00 $109.00 $109.00 $120.74 $120.74 No Bid

6 Light Source TC Black Clamps $22.81 $136.86 $21.81 $130.86 $27.00 $162.00 $26.00 $156.00 $26.32 $157.92 $21.84 $131.04 No Bid

75 Light Source Mega Clamp - Black $8.70 $652.50 $8.53 $639.75 $11.00 $825.00 $9.00 $675.00 $10.28 $771.00 $8.54 $640.50 No Bid

80 Safety Cables $2.75 $220.00 $2.00 $160.00 $2.00 $160.00 $5.00 $400.00 $4.11 $328.80 $6.49 $519.20 $3.15 $252.00

4 Source 4 ERS Iris $109.93 $439.72 $68.18 $272.72 $70.00 $280.00 $87.00 $348.00 $111.00 $444.00 $91.35 $365.40 No Bid

8 Source 4 ERS Color Frame $4.98 $39.84 $0.00 $0.00 $5.00 $40.00 $6.00 $48.00 $7.85 $62.80 $4.03 $32.24 No Bid

8 Source 4 ERS Size “A” Gobo Holder $6.54 $52.32 $6.00 $48.00 $6.50 $52.00 $8.00 $64.00 $9.52 $76.16 $5.29 $42.32 No Bid
1 Freight $285.00 $285.00 $430.00 $430.00 $375.00 $375.00 $225.00 $225.00 $500.00 $500.00

Calculated Total $59,717.89 $62,671.09 $63,797.00 $68,117.00 $66,345.55 $63,109.69 $42,366.66
Stated Total $59,717.89 $62,671.09 $63,482.00 $68,741.00 $66,345.63 $63,108.97 $42,367.66


