_ Expirati rt R als
Name Description Contract# | Start Date wpiration Department/Contract Last Bid # en-ew Notes

Date Manager Available?
Bound Tree Medical LLC - Airway Airway Products for EMS 18-0087 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4733 No
Bound Tree Medical LLC - Bandaging Bandaging Praducts for EMS 18-0089 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4735 No
Bound Tree Medical LLC - Equipment Medical Equipment for EMS 18-0030 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4736 No
Bound Tree Medical LLC - IV 1V Supplies for EMS 18-0088 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4734 No
Bound Tree Medical LLC - Linens Disposable Linens for EMS 18-0086 7/1/2017 6/30/2018 EMS 4732 No
Bound Tree Medical LLC - Pharmaceuticals Pharmaceuticais for EMS 13-0085 T/1/2017 6/30/2018 EMS 4731 No




N L Contract# | Start Date Expiration Department/Contract Last Bid # Renewals Note
a i H
Name escription C Date Manager Available?

EMed Medical Pharmaceuticals for EMS 18-0081 | 7/1/2017 | &/30/2018 EMS 4731 No
Henry Schein Inc Medical Equipment for EMS 18-0097 7/1/2017 6/30/2018 EMS 4736 No
Life-Assist Inc - Airway Airway Products - EMS 18-0162 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4733 No
Life-Assist Inc - Bandaging Bandaging Products - EMS 18-0164 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4735 No
Life-Assist Inc - EQuipment Medical Fquipment - EMS 18-0165 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4736 No
Life-Assist Inc - IV IV Supplies - EM5 18-0163 7/1/2017 6/30/2018 EMS 4734 No




Expirati Department/Contract Renewals
Mame Description Contract# | Start Date xprration epa 4 Last Bid # . Notes

Date Manager Available?
Life-Assist Inc - Linens Disposable Linens - EMS 18-0161 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4732 No
Moore Medical LLC - Airway Airway Products for EMS 18-0141 7/1/2017 6/30/2018 EMS 4733 No
Moore Medical LLC - Bandaging Bandaging Products for EMS 18-0143 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4735 No
Moore Medical LLC - Equipment Medical Equipment for EMS 18-0144 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4736 No
Moore Medical LLC - IV IV Supplies for EMS 18-0142 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4734 No
Moore Medical LLC - Pharmaceuticals Pharmaceuticals for EMS 18-0140 7/1/2017 6/30/2018 EMS 4731 No




Expirati Depart t/Contract
Name Description Contract # | Start Date REHEHCS Gpartment/Contra Last Bid # Rerl_ewals Notes
Date Manager Available?

Penn Care Inc - Airway Airway Priducts for EMS 18-0148 7/1/2017 6/30/2018 EMS 4733 No
Penn Care Inc - Bandaging Bandaging Products for EMS 18-0150 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4735 No
Penn Care Inc - Equipment Medical Equipment for EMS 18-0151 7/1/2017 6/30/2018 EMS 4736 No
Penn Care Inc - IV IV Supplies for EMS 18-0149 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4734 No
Penn Care Inc - Linens Dispasable Linens - EMS 18-0147 7172017 6/30/2018 EMS 4732 No
QuadMed - Airway Airway Products for EMS 18-0091 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4733 No




Expirati Dy
Name Description Contract # | Start Date xpiration SRaKtmSnY/Contrace Last Bid # Ren_ewals Notes
Date Manager Available?
QuadMed - Bandaging Bandaging Products for EMS 18-0093 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4735 No
QuadMed - Equipment Medical Equipment for EMS 18-0094 7/1/2017 | 6/30/2018 EMS 4736 NG
QuadMed - IV IV Supplies for EMS 18-0052 7/1/2017 6/30/2018 EMS 4734 No




A B | ¢ | D E | F | G H | | | J K | L | M N 0 | P
1 |BID NO. 4732 Bound Tree Medical Life-Assist, Inc. Moore Medical, LLC Penn Care Inc. QuadMed
2 |Disposable Linen 5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd 11277 Sunrise Park Drive 1690 New Britain Ave. 1317 North Road 11210 Phillips Industrial Blvd
3 |Opened March 16,2017 Dublin, Ohio 43016 Rancho Cordova, CA 95742 Farmington, CT 06032 Niles, OH 44446 Jacksonville, FL 32256
4 Contact: |Chris Fyffe Michael Murray | Tia Lopez Scolt A. Drew Jackie Gieger
5. Phone:|800-533-0523 800-824-6016 800-234-1464 330-544-4709 ext 305 904-880-2323
6 Fax:|877-311-2437 800-290-9794 877-354-5916 330-544-0022 904-880-2302
7 Email: | submitbids@boundtree.com Quotes@L ife-Assst.com Tia.Lopez@mooremedical.com Fdrew@genncire.net |bids@guadmed.com
8 OPTION #1 Cost | Amount Brand Cost Amount Brand Cost Amount Brand Cost Amount Brand Cost | Amount | Brand
Pillow Case — Fluid Resistant \ TAYL_90- 21" x 30"
g |207 x29” $30.29 | 100 CS $42.00 i 100 CS WPC2130 $26.73 100 Case 60397 $20.30 100/ Case MD-MS44125 $27.60 | 100/ Case
Flat Sheet - Fluid Resistant TAYL_90- 84" x 40"
10 |85” x 417 $35.00| 50CS $55.00 50 CS WFS4084 $39.36 50 Case 22898 $17.20 50/Case MD-MS44100 $33.45 | 50/ Case
Flat Sheet Heavy Duty — Heavy TAYL_90-
11 |Duty Resistant 84” x 60" $129.57| 50CS $67.00 50 CS BPS6090 No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.14 25/ Case MD-MS42610 $92.30 | 50/ Case
Fitted Sheet Heavy Duty — Fluid TAYL_90-
12 |Resistant 74” x 30” x 227 $32.49 | 50CS $64.50 50CS BSS3484 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.72 50/ Case MD-MS001HS $40.30 | 50/ Case
Fitted Sheet Extra Heavy Duty, |
13 |Fluid Resistant 74” x 30” x 22” $59.00 | 50CS $79.00 | 50 CS BS3484H No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.77 25/ Case MD-MS42210 $85.84 | 50/ Case
Fitted Sheet Heavy Duty, Fluid TAYL_90-
14 [Resistant 74" x 30" x 227 $112.59| 100 CS $64.50 50 CS BSS3484 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.10 | 50/ Case MD-MS002FS $40.32 | 50/Case
Blanket — 72” x 90" Blue
15 | 100% Polyester $5.39 Each $100.00 10 CS BS6090-BLU $11.60 Each Gray 73721 $55.30 10/ Case MD-MS40530 $62.50 10/ Case
:’mst‘}’f” C°°;’°" - ! TAYL_60-
16 | YPOTETma Frevention $12.29 | Each $190.90 4cs TPW1000 $12.29 Each 22093 $16.29 Each MD-51700200 | $212.50 | 5/ Case
Patient Transfer Shect with 8 80" X 40"
handles, 73” x 44", 400 Ibs limit 1000Ibs
17 $65.87 Each $162,16 | 10 CS ! BS800 $17.38 Each 81254 $16.78 Each MD-MS95202 $196.30 | 10/ Case
Patient Transfer Sheet— 187 x 50" X 84" Mega Mover
18 |72, Herculite $49.83 | Each NoBid | No Bid | No Bid $2.40 Each 81330 $216.00 | 10/ Case MS-05200 $57.63 | 1icase
Cot Quilt ‘ TAYL_60-
19 $74.59 Each $190.90 i 4CS | TPW1000 $30.33 10 Case 20789 $61.90 Each FW-353 $54.90 10 Case
Economy Comfort One White 1 TAYL_60- 66" X 90"
20 |Blanket - 50” x 84”, 5-pack $1.49 | Each $47.00 10CS | FCB5084 $11.24 Each 73720 $79.95 | 10/ Case GRM-52038 $40.50 | 10/Case
Wypall X80 Shop Pro Brag
Box of Blue Wipers-Kimberly
21 [Clark Wypall $78.59 | 1260 CS $37.18 | 160 BX MEDP_41041 No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.07 Box MD41041 No Bid | No Bid
2 OPTION #2
Package Pricing $686.90
23 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A
24 | J
25 |Payment Terms: 30 Days 30 30 Days 30 Days 100 % Blank
26 |Bid Basis: Low Item Low item Low ltem Low Item Low Item
27 | Delivery Within: 2-3 business days ARO if in stock 5 days 2-4 Days 3 Business Days 2-3 Days
28 |Additional Purchases:  |Yes Yes | Yes Yes Yes
29 |Pricing Stable: 120 Days 180 days 90 Days 60 Days 365 Days




@ #4733 Quadmed 8 Penn Care, Inc. Moore Medical LLC Bound Tree . Life-Assist, Inc. Emed Medical
/Airway Product 11210-1 Phillips Industrial Blvd. 1317 North Road I 16940 New Britain Avenue _15000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd 11277 Sunnse Park Dr i {11551 Adic Rd
Opened March 16, 2017 Tacksonville, FL 32236 | Niles, OH 44446 | Farmington. CT 06032 | Dublin, OH 43016 | | [ Rancho Cordova, CA 95742 Maryland Heights, MO 63043
Cantact: |_|Jackie Greger [ Scott Drew |Tia Fopez Chris Fyfie Chris Nelson_ Satonya Booker
Phona:| |903-880-2323 330-5444709 Ext. 308 §00-234-1963 A00-533-0523 A00-824-6016 314-T39-6813
Fas:| | 904-8RO-2303 330-343-0022 877-354-5916 A77-311-2437 AN0-290-5794 [314-344-4303
E-Mail Address| |Bids@ gqudadmed com 3 Vi are el ‘amooremedical. com submitbids @ boundirec com |quotesg@ife-assist com 3
Description Brand Oty per Cs S Per Cs Brand Qty per Cy S Per Cs Brand  per Cs S Per Cs Brand Quy per Cy S Per Cs Brand Oty per Cs S Per Cs Brand QuvperCs | S PerCs
[Airtraq Device - Adult NO BID Teleflex ca $73.00 | Rusch 2 SER 87 No Bid Rusch 30 $_ 9v0.00 Ainrag 3 68447
Auttraq Device - Ped NO BID Teleflex ca $75.10 1 Rusch ] S8Y 87 No Bid Rusch 50 $ 990.00 Airtraq ] $720.51
Bougic
Dynarex 10 bx $28.50 Sunmed 10 $4520 | G 90 $716.40 Sun Med ca $421 Greenficld 10 $81.70 Med 10 $45 40
(CPAP 6" Oxygen Hose Westmed I cs $3320 Precision Medical 1 £27.70 Respironics 66805 Each St i Precision Medical I/cach 26.19/ca 8 NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CPAP Procedure Pack O Two 10 cs $339.00 O-Two Systemns 10 $31330 | NO BID NO BID NO BID i Philips Medical HSG ca $2297 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CPAP Resg. System 3 set 02 NO BID NO BID | NO BID 3 Pulmodyne ca $37.44 3 NO BID NQO BID NO BID i NO BID NO BID NO BID
CPAP Quick Connect Oxygen Il | ; :
Adapter QuadMed | $42.69 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NO BID NO BID NO BID i Pulmodyne L/cach 5 297 NO BID NO BID NO BID Allicd L $1681
(CPAP Valve 5.0cm H20 Filter | i 4
02 L $129.98 NO BID Pulmodyne 96485 CS10; cach $H0.00 i Pulmodynie 1ivbx 5 759 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(Combitube 4 1 fr - Soft Pack Covidien 4 $172.75 Kendall 4 $167.12 | Covidien 63525 CS4; each $160.20 Covidien ca $39.69 Tyco +es $164.36 Covidicn MAS- 18441 4 $208 21
Combitube 4 | fr - Hard Pack i Covidien 4 $208 8S NO BID Covidien 53665 CS4; cach $203.72 Covidien ca $39 69 : Tyco A/es $199.06 Amb 12 1214
Disposable BVM Adult-Spur Il | 2 - 3 | Ambu
: Dvnarex 3 $48.90 ; AMBU 12 $10992 | Ambu 81050 CS12: cach $113.04 | Ambu, nc ca $997 12 $105.0i Amb 12 $128.77
Disposable BVM Child-Spur Il | Dynarcx 6 $48.90 3 Ambu 12 $145.68 Ambu B1825 CS12: cach $150.48 Ambu, Inc ca $997 Ambu 12 $131.400 Amb 12 $12061
Disposable BVM Infant-Spur 11 | g
5 Dynarex 6 $4%.90 / Ambu 12 $145.68 Ambu K1048 CS12; cach $150.48 Ambu. Inc ca $12.54 Ambu 12 $131.40 ; Cov 24 $274.49
| Disposable CO2 Detector Wesimed 10 $74.25 ] Sunmed 10 $59.80 B Nellcor 56338 CS6: cach $53 64 i Covidicn ca $9 64 i Wesimed 10 $76.70 i Mad 50 $118.33
Disposable Medi Mask Dynarex 50 $32.75 B Medsource 50 $47.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID i Westmed, Inc ca $037 Medsource S0/cs $sso0 | Mck Stics $46. 08
Disposable Medication Nebulizer| i i i
Adult Dynarcx Su $41.25 Hudson S0 $34 50 : Hudson 52532 CS50; cach $30.50 Westmed, [nc ca sugl - Medsource S0/cs $40.95 : NB
Dsposable Medication Nebulizer ': it | |
Ped 3 Dynarex 50 $44.75 i Hudson 50 $7400 || Allicd Healthcare 49657 | CS50: each lo Westmed, Inc ca $0.89 . Medsource 50/cs $5%.00 NB
Disposable Onygen Humidifier Hudson S0 $94.15 Hudson S $81.50 z Hudson 51742 CS50; cach $59.50 i Teleflex Mcd ca $145 g Hudson 50/cs $70.00 NB
Disposible Suction Tubing & Commed S0 $65.13 : Medlinc 50 $36.00 || Amsino 82303 CS50; cach $19.00 ADI Medical ca 3061 i Conmed 50/cs $45.00 NB
Endotracheal Tubes-Cuffed : Dynarex 10 3895 i Sunmed 10 $9.60 Smiths Medical 88130 Each only $0.92 Fz Med Inter ca $1.62 Medsource 10/bx Sioon | NB
Entdotracheal Tubes-Uncuffed i i
Smiths 10 $7.95 NO BID | Smiths Medical 88162 Each only 081 Med ol ca $162 Mi e 10/bx $9.50 NB
[ET Siylctic-Adult " Dynarex 20 $31.400 Medsource 20 $30.60 i Rusch 20W) $562.00 ACS ca $1.19 Rusch 25/cs 575 00 NB
ET Stylene-Child : Dynarex 0 $31.40 Medsource 20 $30.600 Rusch 2001 $544 .00 ACS ca $1.19 Rusch 25/cs $69.00 NB
ET Stylette-Infant :
Dynarex 20 $31.40 Medsource 20 $30.60 Ruisch 10H) $272.00 ACS ca $1.19 Rusch 25/cs $69.1H) NB
King LT Various Sizes
: King 1 $284.00 King 1 Kit $26.11 King 10 $244.40 Ambu. Inc. ca $32.14 Ambu 10/cs $245 00 Amb I $31397
King LTS-D
; King 10 $284.00 King 1 Kit $27.35 King 10 $283 30 Ambu, Inc ca $32.14 Ambu 10/cs $267.00 Amb s $216 60
King Airway Airtraq Intubation
Device - Adull
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID Anibu, [nc ca $32.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID
King Airway Airtraq Intubation i
Device - Ped NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Large Suction Canisters |2¢00cc
Amsino 32 $80.64 Dynarcx 40 $111.60 Allied =] $8.31 Amerivac USA ca $2.41 Bemis 48/cs $ 130,00 i Der 40 $123.43
Laryngoscope Blades-Maciniosh ! i i
Maco | $3.65 A 1 $7.12 Sun-Med 20 $103.20 Sun Mcd ca $3.54 | Meds ca $9.26 NB
Laryngoscope Blades-Miller Maco | $3.65 medsource [ $7.12 | Sun-Med 20 $103.20 Sun Med ca $3.54 | Mecdsource ca $9.26 NB
Laryngoscope Bulbs-Large i
Maco 1 $1.65 Med 6 $12.60 Rusch 67955 Each only $1.71 i Teleflex Medical ca $1.89 i ADC ca $2.50 NB
Laryngoscope Bulbs-Small i Maco 1 $1.65 Medsource 6 $2184 | Rusch 67954 Each only S1L.79 Teleflex Medical ca $197 ADC ca $2.50 g NB
Larygoscope Handle Zulco 1 $9.95 Medsource 1 $9.17 Rusch Each only $2223 Zulco Intl 1/cach $799 Mcdsource ca $10.62 ADC Each $1748
Magill Forceps - Small Zuleo 1 $3 60 EMI ! se06 | ADC 12972 Each only $2.94 : Zuleo Intl a $3139 Maco 10/cs $3750 | NB
Magill Forceps - Large ! Zulco | $3.60 ; EMI ] $606 | ADC 12971 Each only $321 Zuloo lnl a $359 Maco 10%es $3750 | NB
Medium Concentration Mask-
Infant Ventiab 50 $44.60 A S $39.00 Rusch 50795 CS50: cach $36.50 i Teleflex ca $0.99 Medsource St/cs $36.0H Mck 50/cs $54.51
[Merconium Aspiraier Neotech 40 $149 75 Nco-Tech 40 $162.40 Neotech 51409 CS40, cach sissan | Neotech Pris.Inc ca $4.19 : Neotech L0/es s43.00 | Neo 40/bx $202.17
Masal Airvapil6 Medsource 10 SIR.10 Med: 10 $21.10 Rusch ca $2.07 lii- Well Lead ca $1.06 Rusch 10/cs s200 | Sun 10 $36.01
Basal Airway 18 Rusch 10 $24.50 Medsource 10 $21.10 Rusch o $2.07 - Well Lead ca SLi6 : Rusch 10/es s200 | Sun 10 56,01
Nasal Airways 207360 Dynarex 10 $16.20 Medsource 10 518,30 Rusch Each only 5207 Well Lead ca $1.06 Medsource 10/cs si700 | Sun 10 $56.01
tasal Cannula Adult Ventiab 50 51450 Medsource 50 $16.00 Allied Healthcare 49661 | CS50: cach $14.00 . ACS ca $0.26 | Medsauree 50/cs 51350 | Mek Sics 52471
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BID #4734

IV Supplies

Opened Maarch 17-2017

Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Life-Assist, Inc.

Moore Medical

Penn Care Inc.

QuadMed, Inc

5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd.

11277 Sunrise Park Drive

1690 New Britain Ave.

1317 North Road

1210 Phillips Industrial Blvd

Dublin, OH 43016

Rancho Cordova, CA 95742

Farmington, CT 06032

Niles. Ohio 44446

Jacksonville, FL 32255-0773

Contact:|Chris Fyffe Chris Nelson, Contract Administrator Tia Zarnetske Scott A. Drew Jackie Gieger
Phone:|800-533-0523 B00-824-6016 800-234-1464 330-544-4709 EXT. 305 904-880-2323
Fax:|877-311-2437 800-290-9794 B877-354-5916 330-544-0022 904-880-2303
E-Mail Address: |submilbids@boundtree.com quotes@life-assist.com Tia.Lopeze@moaremed@‘com sdrew@penncare.net bids@quadmed.com
Description Brand Qty per Cs $ PerCs Brand Qty per Cs $PerCs Brand Qty perCs| $PerCs Brand Qty perCs [ $ PerCs Brand Qty per Cs $ PerCs
$45,16/C5 of 400
Sold: $11.29/BX of 100/BX;
10cc Syringe-Leur Lock Becton Dickson 400/CS 100 B.Braun Case-1200 $135.60 Excel-79557 8BX/CS | $100.00/ CS | Becton Dickson | 100 EA $11.70 Dynarex BBX/CS $58.40
1 cc 25 ga X 5/8” TB Syringe $90.00/Cs OF 1000 Excell 100/bx
Exel Intl. inc 1000/CS Sold: $0.09 /EA B Braun Case-1600 $182.56 #79548 10bx/case | $103.90/ CS | Becton Dickson 100 EA $25.00 Covidien BBX/CS $89.20
2 Gallon Sharps Container fioore Medical Each
Medegen 24/CS 62.49/CS of 24 Kendall Case-20 $77.00 #33268 24/CS 36264/ C3 Kendall 20 EA $83.80 Covidien 20/CS $73.00
3cc 21 ga X 1™ Syringe $112.00/C5 of 1600 Excell T00/bx
B. Braun 1600/CS Sold: $0.07/EA Exel Case-1000 $85.00 #79554 10bsicase | $61.10/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID Covidien §BXCS 58560
Alcohol Prep Pads $16.70/Csof 2000 Moore Medical | 200/bx
Dynarex 2000/CS | Sold: $1.67/BX of 200 Kendall Case-4000 $31.00 #98721 20bx/case $24 20 Kendall 200 Boxes | $1.56 Dynarex 10 BX/ CS $14.60
Angiocath 12 ga $823.50/C5 10/bx;
Becton Dickson 50/CS Sold: $16.47/EA BD Case-50 $728.70 B-D #71942 bx/case $771.10 Becton Dickson 50 EA $270.50 BD 5 BX/CS $307.50
Buretrol 1V Set-Up 60 gnt 5547 6B/CS
Baxter 48/CS Sold: $11.41/EA Baxter Cvase-48 $470.88 Baxter #86722 | 48 casejea| 338.88/CS Baxter 48 EA $619.20 Baxter 48/CS $611,52
Butlerfly Needles $240.00/CS of 500 50/bx;
Terumo 500/CS Sold: $0.48/EA Exel Case-500 $130.30 Excel #79592 |10 bx /case | $107 80/ CS | Becton Dicksan 50 EA $44 .50 Excel 50/BX $12.60
DSW 250¢c 1V Fluid S161T.64/CS of 36
Baxter 36/CS Sold: 4 4HEA Hospira Case-24 3150.00 Bbraun #69401 | 24 caseea | $52 48/ CS NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
D3sw 130cc IV Fluid
Hospira 24/CS $169.00/CS of 24 Hospira Case-32 $200.00 No Bid Nao Bid No Bid NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Disposable Non-Latex Tech Med TUFPRS
Tourniquets Briggs Healthcare 250/PK $29.99/PK of 250 Dynarex Case-250 $30.00 #65324 400PK/CS | 531200 CS Dynarex 250 EA | $2750 | Elastomer | 4-PK/250-CS | 5$85.60
Disposable Needles (18,20,25 $8510/CS
ga) Covidien 1000/CS Sold: $8.51/BX of 100 Exel Case-2000 $90.00 No Bid No Bid Na Bid Bectan Dickson 100 £EA $4.00 Dynarex 10BX/CS $55.00
EZ IA0 Needles - 15MM This item must be purchased direcily
PerSys Medical 1/EA $103.29/EA from the Manufacture No Bid Mo Bid No Bid NC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EZ VO Needles - 25MM This tem must be purchased direcily
PerSys Medical 1/EA $103.29/EA from the Manufacture No Bid No Bid No Bid NC BID NG BID NO BID NQ 8ID NO BID NO BID
EZ 1/0 Needles — 45mm This item must be purchased direcily
NO BID NO BID NO BID from the Manufacture No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EZ I/0 Stabilizer This item must be purchased directly
PerSys Medical 1/EA 34 99/EA from the Manufacture No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
INT Cap-Male Adapters-Lalex AMSINGg
Free (needleless)Amsafe PRN Owens & Minor 1/EA $0.54/EA Amsino Case-1000 $110.00 #70426 100case:ea| $106.00/ CS Amsino 100 EA $94.00 Amsino 100/ BX $116.50
[niraosseous Needle-15 ga $8590/C5of 10 Care Fusion Medical
Medical Invs 10/ CS Sold: $8 59/EA Carefuston Case-1000 $82.00 #53950 10 case;ea | $187.60/CS | Allegiance 10 EA $84 .40 | Innavations 10/BX $81.70
Intraosseous Needle-18 ga $106.90/CS Care Fusion Medical
Medical Innovations, Inc 10/CS Sold: $10.69/EA Carefusion Case-1000 $82.00 #68513 EA/10/CS | $187.60/CS |  Allegiance 10 EA $84 40 | Innovations 10/BX $81.70
1V Catheters-Protecti Cath(14- $388.00/C5 of 200 sUiBX
24pa) Smiths Medical 200/C5 Sold:$1,94/EA Smith Case-2000 $297 94 Smiths 4BX/CS5 | 8338.76/CS | Medsourcce 200 EA | $268.00 Smiths 4BX/ICS $289.00
IV Extension Set with Y-site 3 T39.500f 100
Amsiino Intl 100/CS Sold:$1.39/EA Amsino Case-50 374 .44 No Bid No Bid No Bid Amsino 100 EA $84.00 Amsino 50/CS $75.00
IV Extension Set Needleless 370U S 0T 00 BTEG
[Svstem Amsiino Intl 50 CS Sold: §1.44/EA Amsino Case-100 $118.52 #70444 ea, 100/CS | $125,00/ CS Medsource 50 EA %94 .50 Dynarex 100/ CS $50,00




Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Life-Assist, Inc.

Moore Medical

Penn Care Inc.

QuadMed, Inc

BID #4734

IV Supplies

5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd.

11277 Sunrise Park Drive

1690 New Britain Ave.

1317 North Road

1210 Phillips Industrial Blvd

Opened Maarch 17-2017

Dublin, OH 43016

Rancho Cordova, CA 95742

Farmington, CT 06032

Niles, Ohio 44446

Jacksonville, FL 32255-0773

Contact:

Chris Fyffe

Chris Nelson, Contract Administrator

Tia Zarnetske

Scott A. Drew

Jackie Gieger

Phone:

800-533-0523

800-824-6016

800-234-1464

904-880-2323

Fax:

877-311-2437

800-290-9794

877-354-5916 |

330-544-0022

330-544-4709 EXT. 305

904-880-2303

E-Mail Address:|submitbids@boundtree.com quotes@life-assist.com Tia.L opeze@mooremedical.com |sdrew@genncarm bids@quadmed.com
IV Set-up 10gtt with Y-site $33.00/CS o1 5U
Amsino Int 50/ CS Sold: $0.67/ EA Amsino Case-50 $85.04 Baxter #64546 | Ea; 48/CS | $114.72/CS Medsource 50 EA $64.00 Amsino 50/ CS $37.50
IV Set-up 10gtt needless system-
Amsine Amsino Int 1/EA $1.04/EA Amsino Case-50 $85.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid Amsino 50 EA $87.50 Dynarex 50/ CS $53.50
TV Set-up 60gtt with Y-site $37.50ICS 0T 50
Amsino Int 50/ CS Sold: $0.74/EA Amsino Case-50 $90.76 Hospira #95832 | Ea; 48/CS | $208.32/ CS Medsource 50 EA $64.00 Medsource 50/ CS $97.50

JV Set-up 60 gtt needless $94.50/CS of 50
system-Amsino Amsino Int 50/ CS Seold: $1.89/EA Amsino Case-50 $90.76 Baxter #51842 | Ea; 48/CS | $120.96 CS Amsino 50 EA $91.00 Dynarex 50/ CS $50.00
Lactated Ringers 1000cc IV $34.68/CS of 12
Fluid B. Braun 12/ CS Sold: $2.89/EA Hospira Case-12 $90.00 B Braun #69405 | Ea; 12/CS | $28.80/CS NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Normal Saline 1000cc IV Fluid $83.86/CS of 14

Baxter 14/ CS Sold: $5.99/EA Hospira Case-12 $90.00 B Braun #69411 | Ea; 12/CS | $28.80/CS NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Normal Saline 500cc IV Fluid $124.56/CS ot 24

Baxter 24/ CS Sold: $5.19/EA Hospira Case-24 $150.00 B Braun #69412 | Ea; 24/CS | $55.92/CS Baxter 24 EA $113.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Q-Port with Latex Free Gloves

NO BID NO BID NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sodium Chloride 30 m1 Vial

Hospira 1/EA $1.19/EA Hospira Case-25 $21.00 Hospiia #52965 | Ea; 100/CS| $100.00/ CS NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sodium Chloride prefilled 10
me Aquabilit 1/EA $0.99/EA BD Case-30 $264.16 B Barun 69606 |100/BX only $46.28 Kendall 60 EA $25.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Payment Terms: 30 Days 30 Days | 30 Days 30 Days Blank |
Bidding on: Low Item Low ltem | _|Low ltem Low Item Low ftem
Delivery Within: 2-3 Days ARO 5 days ‘ 2-4 Days 3 Days 2-3 Days
Additional Purchases: Yes |Yes Yes Yes Yes
Prices Stable: 120 Days from Bid 180 Days 90 Days |60 Days 365 Days




BID #4735

Bound Tree Medical, LLC eMed Healthcare Life-Assist, Inc. Medline Industries Inc. Mcore Medical, LLC Penncare, Inc
Bandaging Products 5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd 610 President Clinlon Ave, Ste 140 11277 Sunrise Park Or Three Lakes Drive 1690 New Britain Ave 1317 North Road
Opened March 16, 2017 Dublin, OH 43016 Little Rock, AR 72201 Rancho Cordova, CA 95742 Northfield, IL 60093 Farmington, CT 06032-3112 Niles, OH 44448
Contact: |Christopher Fyffe |Melody Gately Della Lane Jodi Standorf Lisa Hunt Scolt A Drew
Phone: |{B00) 533-0523 866-327-3633 B00-824-6016 B00-845-0581 800-234-1464 330-544-0777 Ext 305
Fax:[877-311-2437 B77-3293633 B00-290-9794 HEE-014-2751 877-354-5916 330-544-0022
E-Mail Address: |aubmithids@iboundtree com msledy gately@axpmsupply.com Quotesi@Life-Assist.com istand medline com tia.lopez@mooremedical.com |sdrew@genncare‘net
Description Brand Qty per Cs $ Per Cs Brand |Qty per Cs| $PerCs Brand Cty Par Cs| § PerCs Brand | QtyPerCs | § PorCs Brand Qty Per Cs f§PercCs | Brand Per Cs| 5 PerCs
$26.00/CS of 8000 200/ PK 40/ Bags
2 X 2 Non-Sterile Covidien 8000/CS | Sold; $0.85/BG of 200 Dukal 5000 $20.55 Dukal 4,000 51275 Medline |5000 EA/CS| $34.04 Moore 25 PK/ICS | $28 50/CS Kendall of 200 $39 60
$64.32/CS ol 600 100/ PK 128/ Trays
4 X 4 Sterile Medline 800/CS Sold: $2.68/BX of 25 Dukal 600 $37.00 Dukal 1,200 $25 50 Medline |1200 EA/CS| $4365 Moore 12/PKICS | $68 52/CS Dynarex of 10 $81 92
$23.50/C5 of 2000 200/ BX 20/ Bags
4 X 4 Non-Sterile Dynarex 2000/CS | Sold: $2.35/BG of 200 Dukal 2000 $41,50 Dukal 2,000 $17 .50 Medline |4000 EA/CS| $8182 Moore 20 BX/CS | $64 BO/CS Kendall of 200 £45 80
$79 20/CS of 880 25/ BX
5 x 9 Combine Dressing Covidien 8BL/CS Sold: $0.09/EA Dynarex 400 $48.00 Dukal 400 $32.50 Medline | 400 EA/CS $31.47 Moaore 16 BX/CS | $26.40/CS | Medsource 25 $2.67
$17.50/CS of 50 Surewrap/ 10/ BX
3" Ace Wrap ADI Medical 50/C5 Sold: $0.35/EA ProAdvantage 50 £20.75 Dukal 50 $23.75 | Medine | 20EA/CS | $2338 Maore 5BX/CS | $1610/CS | Dynarex 50 $23 .00
$22 50/CS of 50 Surewrap/ 10/ BX
4” Ace Wrap ADI| Medical 50/CS Sold: 50.45/RL ProAdvantage 50 $27.50 Dukal 50 $26.25 | Medine | 20 EA/CS | §28.57 Moore 5BX/CS |$1926/CS| Dynarex 50 $28.50
$35.50/CS of 50 Surewrap/ 10/ BX
6” Ace Wrap ADI Medical 50/CS Sold: $0.71/EA ProAdvantage 50 $41.50 Dukal 50 $41.25 Medline 20 EA/CS $29 87 Moore 5 BX/CS $27 20/ CS Dynarex 50 $42.00
$43.20/CS of 432 20/ BX 16/ BX of
8 X 10 Combine Dressing Covidien 432/CS Sold: $0.10/EA Dynarex 360 $62.00 Dukal 320 $51.50 Mediine | 360 EA/CS | 538 82 Moore 16 BX/CS | $32 64/ CS | Medsource 20 $57.12
Derma
$1548/CS of 1200 Curad/ Science 100/ BX 12¢ Bx of
Band Aids EMP 1200/CS | Sold: $1.29/BX of 100 Dukal 2400 $31.25 Dynarex 2,400 $30.00 Medline |1200 EA/CS| $1883 1X3 36 BX/CS |3$3492/CS| Medline 100 $21.84
24 EA/CS $9.71
$5.76/CS of 24 Heavy Cypress
Cold Packs Dynarex 24/CS Sold: $0 24/EA Dynarex 24 $16.50 Naorlech 50 $23.75 Mediine | 24 EA/CS | $15.84 Med EA: 50/ CS | $10.50/CS| Halyarg 24 $9 25
$98.00/CS of 50
Disposable Bum Sheets Medsource 50/CS Sold: $1 96/EA Medsource 50 $61.00 Dukal 12 $22.50 Medline | 25EA/CS | $5572 | Med-Tech | EA;50/CS | $9350/CS| Medsource 50 $135 50
$51.60/CS of 600 507 BX
Disposable Eye Pads Dynarex 600/CS Sold: $4 30/PK of 50 Dynharex 600 $47 74 Dukal 600 $63.00 |Allcare INC| 50 EA/BX $3.43 Dukat 12 BX/ CS | $68 52/ CS Dukal 50 $564
Disposable O.B. Kits with $48.90/CS of 10
Hooded Blanket-Latex Fre Motion Medical 10/CS Sold: 84 89/EA Dynarex 10 $52 .50 | Life-Assist Kit 1 $£9.50 Medline 9 EA/CS $74.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid Dynarex 10 $58 .60
$27.32/CS of 96 Cypress 3 PK
Hot Packs Curaplex 96/CS | Sold: 36 83/BX of 24 Dynarex 24 $11.75 Dynarex 24 31025 | Medine | 24 EA/CS | $14.15 Med BPK/CS | $504/CS | DuroMed 24 $11.10
In‘igation—SOOcc Sterile $42 30/CS of 18 EA
Bottled Water Baxter 18/CS Sold. $2.35/EA No Bid Blank, Blank Baxter 18 34125 Medline 18 EA/CS $34 .08 B. Braun 168/ CS $22 56/ CS Medline 18 $54 36
$9.76/CS of 96 12 BX 8/ Bags of
Kling (non-sterile) 3" Cukal Corp 95/CS Sold: $1.22/BG of 12 Dynarex 95 81175 Cukal 96 39,75 Medline 30 EA/CS $11.69 Dukal 8BX/ CS5 $31.76/CS Dukal 12 $13.04
§12 16/CS of 96 Caring/ 12 BX 8/ Bags of
Kling (non-sterile) 4” Dynarex 96/CS | Sold: $1.52/BX of 12 Dynarex 96 $13.75 Dukal 96 31275 | Medline | 18EACS | 2045 Dukal 8BX/ CS | $3992/(CS Dukal 12 $15.92
$12.16/CS of 48 Caring/ 6/ BX 8/ Bags of
Kling (non-sterile) 6~ Dynarex 48/CS | Sold: $1.52/BX of 6 Dynarex 48 $13.25 Dukal 48 $1400 | Medline | 12ZEACS | $1948 Dukal 8BX/CS |$3024/CS|  Dukal 6 $19.76
$99.36/CS of 144 Caring/ 12/ BX 12/ Bx of
Silk Tape —1” Dukal Corp 1441CS Sold: 30.69/EA Dukal 144 | $108.00 Dukal 144 $9500 | Medline | 120 RL/CS | 80740 | Covidien | 10BX/ CS [$108 80/ CS| Medsource 12 $89.52
$99.36/C5 0f 72 Curad/ 6/ BX 12/ Bx of
Silk Tape - 27 Dukal Corp. 72/CS Sold: $1,38/EA Dukal 72 £108,00 Dukal 72 $95.00 Medfine | 60RL/CS | 9740 Covidien 10BX/CS |$108.80/ S| Medsource & $89.52
$99 36/CS of 43 Curag/ 4/ BX 12/ Bx of
Silk Tape — 37 Dukal Corp 48/CS Sold: $2.07/EA Dukal LE] $108,00 Dukal 4B $39500 Medline | 40RL/CS | 39740 Covidien 10 BX/CS [313550/ CS| Medsource 4 $98.88
Medical Derformance
Soft Tactical Tourniquers Tactica! Med 1/EA $23.87/EA Tac Med Each $23.50 Solutions 1 $22 00 Medliine | 100 EA/Cs | $13.16 Sys Fach Only | $21.99/ EA | Tactical Med 1EA $23.45
$28 25/CS of 25
Trauma Dressing Dukal Corp 25/05 Sold: $1.13/EA Dukal 25 $20.00 Dukal 25 $16.75 Medline | 100 EA/CS | $13.16 Moore EA/ 25/ CS | $8.75/CS Oynarex 50 341.00




BID #4735 Bound Tree Medical, LLC eMed Healthcare Life-Assist, Inc. Medline Industries Inc. Moore Medical, LLC Penncare. Inc
Bandaging Products 5000 Tutlle Crossing Bivd, 610 President Clinton Ave, Sle 140 11277 Sunrise Park Dr Three Lakes Drive 1690 New Britain Ave 1317 North Road
Opened March 16, 2017 Dublin, OH 43016 Little Rock, AR 72201 Rancho Cordova, CA 95742 Norhfield, IL 60093 Farmington, CT 06032-3112 Niles, OH 44446
Contact:|Christopher Fyfle |Melody Gately Della Lane Jodi Standorf Lisa Hunt Scott A Drew
Phone:|(BC0) 533-0523 866-327-3633 B00-B24-B016 800-845-0581 BO0-234-1464 330-544-0777 Ext 305
Fax:|B77-311-2437 877-3293633 B00-290-3794 866-914-2751 BT7-354-5916 330-544-0022
E-Mail Address: submuhu:ls_@pounﬂree com melody gately@axpmsupply.com Qupj;:_g@ Ife-Assist com |;§1andu;f@m=a'ﬂne.com tia loper@imooremedical com 4 nmcare ned
$6.60
12
$52.80/CS of 240 EA/BAG 12{ BX
Tria.ngular Bandagcs Medscurce 240/CS Sold: $0.22/EA Dukal 240 $82.95 Dukal 240 568 75 Medline | 240 EA/CS | $116.87 Moore 20 BX/CS [$54 20/ CS | Medsource 240 $50.40
$130.00/CS of 200 Derma Curad/ 507/ BX 4/ Bx of
Vaseline Gauze Pads Covidien 200/CS Sold: $0.65/EA Covidien 200 $130.00 Sciences 72 $51.00 Medling | 50 EAVBX | $3777 Covidien 4BX/CS 811540/ CS  Kendall 50 £121 16
Payment Terms: Net 30 2-3 Days Net 30 Met 30 Net 30 IMdet 30
Bidding on: Low Item Low llem Low Item |Low item Low ltem, Low ltem
2 Days on
slocked
Delivery Within: 2-3 days ARD 2-3 Days 5 days items 2-4 days 3 days
Additional Purchases Yes Yes Yes fes Yes Yes
Prices Stable: 120 days 90 days 180 days 365 days 90 days 60 days




Precision Disposable Products QuadMed
2217 Plaza Dr 11210 Phillips Industrial Blvd
Rocklin, CA 95765 Jacksonville, FL 32256
Nicholas Pointer Jackie Gieger
916-771-1538 904-880-2323
|888-842-6197 904-880-2303
nick@precisiondisposables.com Bids@quadmed.com
[
Brand QtyperCs| $PerCs Brand Qty per Cs| § PerCs
AMD-RITMED PREMIUM GAUZE 200/pk/25
SPONGES, 5000 $25.71 Shield Line pk-CS | $15.50
AMD-RITMED PREMIUM GAUZE 25/bx/24
SPONGES 1200 $60.18 Shield Line bx-CS $31.00
AMD-RITMED PREMIUM GAUZE 200/pk/20
SPONGES 2000 $52.72 Shield Line pk-CS | $38.50
20/bx/20
ABD PADS, SEALED ENDS 400 $51.20 Dynarex bx-CS $44.96
10 ris/bx/5
No Bid No Bid No Bid Shield Line bx-CS $15.95
ELASTIC BANDS WITH CLIPS 10 ris/bx/5
SHRINK WRAPPED 50 $29.31 Shield Line bx-CS $19.45
ELASTIC BANDS WITH CLIPS 10 rls/bx/5
SHRINK WRAPPED 50 $41.87 Shield Line bx-CS $42.10
24/bx/15
ABD PADS, SEALED ENDS 360 $69.46 Dynarex bx-CS $59.85
PRECISION FABRIC ADHESIVE 100/bx/24
BANDAGES 10000 $232.96 Shield Line bx-CS $27.60
PRECISION INSTANT COLD PACK 36 $10.80 Shield Line 24/cs $9.50
No Bid No Bid No Bid Dynarex 12/cs $24.00
AMD-RITMED OVAL EYE PADS 50/bx/12
LARGE OVAL EYE PAD 600 $46.24 Dynarex bx-CS $50.40
QuadMed
No Bid No Bid No Bid Assembly 1/cs $7.75
PRECISION INSTANT HOT PACK 36 $16.88 Dynarex 24/cs $13.90
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid
AMD CONFORMING STRETCH 12 rls/bx
BANDAGES 96 $12.20 Shield Line 8 bx-CS | $10.40
AMD CONFORMING STRETCH 12 ris/bx
BANDAGES 96 $14.20 Shield Line 8bx-CS | $11.92
AMD CONFORMING STRETCH 6 ris/bx
BANDAGES 48 $13.24 Shield Line 8bx-CS | $12.00
12/bx/12
PRECISION SILK TAPE 432 $352.35 Shield Line bx-CS $89.28
6/bx/12 bx
PRECISION SILK TAPE 216 $348.44 Shield Line CS $89.28
4/bx/12 bx
No Bid No Bid No Bid Shield Line CS $89.28
No Bid No Bid No Bid Tactical 1/cs $23.54
No Bid No Bid No Bid Shield Line 50/cs $36.00




Precision Disposable Products

QuadMed

2217 Plaza Dr

11210 Phillips Industrial Bivd

Rocklin, CA 95765

Jacksonville, FL 32256

Nicholas Pointer

Jackie Gieger

916-771-1538

504-880-2323

888-842-6197

904-880-2303

nick@precisiondisposables.com Bids@gquadmed.com
TRIANGULAR BANDAGES 12/pk/20
W/ SAFETY PINS STRONG MUSLIN 240 $89.92 Dynarex pk-CS $55.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid Integrity 12/bx $5.68
Blank Blank
Low Item Low item
2-3 days
depends on
5 days items
Yes Yes
365 days 365 days
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