
Tulare City School District USDA AND COMMERCIAL
2019-2020 RFP USDA Foods USDA  GOLDSTAR SYSCO VALLEY FOOD SERVICE SCHOOL LUNCH PRODUCTS

Proposal Worksheet LF = Low Fat    RF = Reduced Fat     WG = Whole Grain   IW = Individually Wrapped Processed USDA Foods Processed USDA Foods Processed USDA Foods Processed USDA Foods

Instructions: Indicate  Delivered Cost per case in yellow highlighted columns for each item or group.Indicate whether item meets Buy American Provision in 
marked columns.

Net Off Invoice Fee for Service Net Off Invoice Fee for Service Net Off Invoice Fee for Service Net Off Invoice Fee for Service 

Manufacturer Line No.Item Description                                                                                                                                    Manufacturer Code Pack
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Commodity Yes/No Yes/No Yes/No Yes/No

Column1 Column2 Column3 Column4 Column5 Column6       Did not submit a USB stick - submitted a CDR Did not submit a USB stick- submitted a CDR

20TH CENTURY 1 BROWNIE WG IW 772A20W 144/2OZ 240 YES $49.48 NO BID NO BID $49.20 yes $51.28
20TH CENTURY 2 APPLE CIN MUFFIN WG IW 217130W 60/3OZ 80 YES $27.20 NO BID NO BID $26.82 yes $27.84
20TH CENTURY 3 BLUEBERRY MUFFIN WG IW 217230W 60/3OZ 80 YES $27.00 NO BID NO BID $26.61 yes $27.65
20TH CENTURY 4 BANANA MUFFIN WG IW 217730W 60/3OZ 80 YES $27.90 NO BID NO BID $27.58 yes $28.54
20TH CENTURY 5 CHOC CHIP MUFFIN WG IW 217S30W 60/3OZ 80 YES $27.53 NO BID NO BID $27.17 yes $28.17
ADVANCE PIERRE 6 BEEF MEATBALLS 1-17-505-0 960/.5OZ 134 YES $23.69 YES $26.05 N/B No Bid
ADVANCE PIERRE 7 PHILLY STEAK MEAT 69141 10/3LB 48 YES $63.37 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid
ADVANCE PIERRE 8 PORK SAUSAGE PATTY 9467 250/1.2 OZ 40 YES $21.82 YES $21.69 N/B No Bid
ADVANCE PIERRE 9 PORK RIBBQ HONEY BBQ GRLD 3717 100/3.25 102 YES $28.39 YES $28.08 N/B No Bid
ADVANCE PIERRE 10 PORK SAUSAGE LINK 3755 250/1.2 OZ 78 YES $26.59 YES $26.66 N/B No Bid
ADVANCE PIERRE 11 SMKY GRILLED BEEF PATTY 9617 100/3OZ 100 YES $21.20 YES $22.22 N/B No Bid
ALBIES FOODS 12 PIZZA PEPP CALZONE WG 813 48/4.5OZ 125 YES $34.21 YES $35.87 N/B No Bid
ALBIES FOODS 13 PIZZA JAMMER STICK 701 72/3OZ 85 YES $25.76 YES $27.16 N/B No Bid
ALBIES FOODS 14 CHEESE JAMMER STICK 703 72/3OZ 85 YES $22.85 YES $24.25 N/B No Bid
ARDELLAS 15 CHEESE BREADSTICK 4 1/2 WG IW 90135 108/2 OZ 36 YES $31.47 NO BID NO BID N/B yes $31.08
ARDELLAS 16 PILLOW PULL APARTS WRAP 90129 108/4.10OZ 24 YES $57.08 YES $59.45 N/B yes $60.56
ARDELLAS 17 SPICY CHICKEN LONGBREAD 3X7 IW 90412 80/5.08OZ 32 DISCONTINUED YES $66.53 N/B No Bid
ARIZONA GOLD 18 BURRITO EGG CHEESE CHORIZO WG 3710320B 54/3.2 OZ 72 YES $26.92 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid
ASIAN FOOD SOLUTIONS 19 VEG RFD BROWN RICE LS WG 78001 8/5LB 80 YES $69.57 YES $67.24 N/B No Bid
ASIAN FOOD SOLUTIONS 20 YAKISOBA NOODLES 22001WG 4/5.15LB 70 YES $33.68 YES $32.58 N/B No Bid
ASIAN FOOD SOLUTIONS 21 CHOW MEIN W/VEGETABLES WG 22101WG 6/5LB 40 YES $80.80 YES $78.23 N/B No Bid
ASIAN FOOD SOLUTIONS 22 TERIYAKI CHICKEN WG 73001 6/7.15LBS 32 YES $96.40 YES $92.69 N/B No Bid

BAKE CRAFTERS 23 STUFFD CRSSNT TURK HAM, EGG CH WG IW 4707 48/3.65OZ 100
YES $41.00 YES $38.68 N/B yes $44.27

BAKE CRAFTERS 24 STUFFD CRSSNT CHIC SAUSAGE EGG CH 4709 48/4.52 OZ 216 YES $46.93 YES $44.06 N/B yes $50.24

BAKE CRAFTERS 25 CROISSANT, TURKEY, CHEESE SAND WG IW 6649 72/4.8OZ 100 YES $80.51 YES $81.07 N/B No Bid

BAKE CRAFTERS 26 CROISSANT, TURKEY HAM & CH WG IW 6631 72/5.2OZ 100 YES $63.79 YES $65.68 N/B No Bid

BAKE CRAFTERS 27 CROISSANT, TURKEY PEPP PIZZA WG IW 4703 48/5.2OZ 32 YES $46.61 YES $44.42 N/B No Bid

BAKE CRAFTERS 28 CROISSANT, TURKEY BACON, EGG, CH WG IW 4708 48/3.4OZ 32
YES $46.34 YES $43.33 N/B No Bid

BAKE CRAFTERS 29 EGG, CHEESE SLIDER IW 6633 144/2.35OZ 21 YES $75.18 YES $76.17 N/B No Bid

BAKE CRAFTERS 30 HOAGIE, TURKEY HAM TURK PEPP CH WG IW 6653 80/4.5OZ 100
YES $82.11 YES $77.26 N/B yes $92.86

BAKE CRAFTERS 31 HOAGIE, TURKEY HAM & CHEESE IW 6654 80/5OZ 100 YES $65.51 YES $61.98 N/B yes $81.44

BAKE CRAFTERS 32 HOAGIE, TURKEY & CHEESE  WG IW 6648 80/4.6OZ 100 YES $82.92 YES $78.00 N/B yes $100.81

BAKE CRAFTERS 33 MAPLE CHICKEN SAUS PANCAKE SAND WG IW 9125 168/2.5OZ 28
YES $92.06 YES $83.19 N/B No Bid

BAKE CRAFTERS 34 EGG, CHEESE ENGLISH MUFFIN WG IW 6604 96/3.25OZ 20 YES $53.23 YES $50.88 N/B No Bid

BAKE CRAFTERS 35 SANDWICH ENG MUFF TURKEY HAM CH 4613 96/3.5OZ 20 YES $49.56 YES $45.92 N/B No Bid

BASIC AMERICAN 36 POTATO PEARLS 76468 12/28OZ 28 YES $34.27 YES $51.36 N/B No Bid

BIG DADDY'S 37 PIZZA 4 CHEESE 16"PRIMO WG 78637 9/41.5OZ 70 YES $50.90 YES $49.37 N/B yes $49.79

BIG DADDY'S 38
PIZZA FOUR MEAT 16" PRIMO WG 78640 72/5.3OZ 70 YES $57.88 YES $55.57 N/B yes $56.81

BIG DADDY'S 39
PIZZA PEPPERONI TRKY 16" PRIMO WG 78638 9/41.5OZ 360 YES $56.68 YES $54.98 N/B yes $55.61



BONGARDS 40 CHEDDAR CUP 48120 192/30Z 240
DISCONTINUED YES $85.88 N/B No Bid

BONGARDS 41 JALAPENO CHEESE SAUCE 48130 192/3OZ 240
DISCONTINUED YES $85.88 N/B No Bid

BONGARDS 42 PEPPERJACK SLICE 10341 4/5LB-160 SL 6
YES $22.92 YES $47.33 N/B No Bid

BOSCOS 43 BREADSTICK CHEESE MOZZ 6" WG RF 702011-1120 144CT 180
YES $36.42 YES $36.00 N/B No Bid

BOSCOS 44 TURKEY HAM CHEESE STICK 6" WG 10205-1120 72/2.43OZ 26 YES $25.73 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid

BOSCOS 45 EGG, TURKEY BACON STICK 6" WG 10201-1120 72/2.43OZ 26 YES $27.08 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid

BOSCOS 46 EGG, CHEESE W/MAPLE CHEDDAR 10200-1120 72/2.43OZ 26 YES $26.43 YES $62.91 N/B No Bid

BOSCOS 47 TURKEY HAM CHEESE 6" WG IW 008736-1120 72/2.72 OZ 4 YES $32.74 YES $36.74 N/B No Bid
BROOK WOOD FARMS 48 PULLED PORK CARNITA STYLE COOKED 15006 2/5LB 72 YES $51.18 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid

BUENA VISTA 49 TURKEY PEPPERONI CHS CALZONE WG IW 50721 80/5.5OZ 100
YES $63.71 YES $68.13 $61.40 yes $64.07

BUENA VISTA 50 BLUEBERRY CRUMBLE IW 90060 72/3.60 OZ 34 YES $36.27 YES $42.54 $39.63 yes $37.95
BUENA VISTA 51 CHOCOLATE CHIP CRUMBLE IW 90070 72/3.6OZ 34 YES $38.83 YES $41.93 $39.58 yes $39.43
BUENA VISTA 52 FRUIT PANCAKE BOWL APPLE WG IW 94010 72/3.8OZ 34 YES $48.40 YES $53.33 $49.90 yes $49.96
BUENA VISTA 53 FRUIT PANCAKE BOWL BLUEBERRY WG IW 94020 72/3.8OZ 34 YES $48.40 YES $52.07 $49.90 yes $49.96
BUENA VISTA 54 FRUIT PANCAKE BOWL PEACH WG IW 94030 72/3.8OZ 34 YES $48.40 YES $52.00 $49.90 yes $49.96

BUENA VISTA 55 FRUIT PANCAKE BOWL STRAWBERRY WG IW 94040 72/3.8OZ 34
YES $48.40 YES $52.07 $49.90 yes $49.96

COMIDA VIDA 56 CHICKEN SHREDS 470490 5/7.4 #BAGS 36
YES $115.16 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid

COMIDA VIDA 57 BEEF SHREDS 470495 5/7.2 #BAGS 36
YES $66.92 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid

COMIDA VIDA 58 PORK SHREDS 470505 5/6.7 #BAGS 36
YES $64.45 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid

COMIDA VIDA 59 SHREDDED CHICKEN & CHEESE TAMALE 471005 192/2.5OZ 24
YES $151.27 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid

COMIDA VIDA 60 SHREDDED BEEF & CHEESE TAMALE 471025 180/3.0OZ 24
YES $110.32 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid

THE MAX 61 TWISTED STIX W/ CHEDDAR & MOZZ 77387-12612 96/2.20 oz 60
YES $31.90 YES $30.58 $30.86 yes $32.73

THE MAX 62 QUESADILLA PIZZA WITH CHICKEN 77387-12700 96/5.00 OZ 12
YES $50.69 YES $49.00 $50.42 yes $51.75

GILARDI 63 FLATBREAD BBQ CHICKENN WG 16272-20125 72/4.65OZ 80
YES $42.50 YES $40.81 N/B yes $43.56

DEL MONTE 64 PEARS DICED EXTRA LS 2004529 48/4.4OZ 200
YES $18.77 YES $12.13 N/B No Bid

DEL MONTE 65 PEACHES DICED EXTRA LS 2004531 48/4.40Z 400
YES $18.42 YES $11.78 N/B No Bid

DON LEE FARMS 66 BEEF BBQ RIB SHAPED PATTY PRCKD CNQ512403 201/2.4OZ 84 YES $46.91 YES $44.46 $44.02 yes $43.79

DON LEE FARMS 67 HAMBURGER CLASSIC IW QHB425 75/4.25 30
YES $47.03 YES $45.06 $45.04 yes $44.83

DON LEE FARMS 68 CHEESEBURGER CLASSIC IW QCB475 75/4.2 OZ 30
YES $54.57 YES $52.62 $53.26 yes $54.95

DON LEE FARMS 69 PORK SAUSAGE BREAKFAST BISCUIT SAND QSC295P 144/2.45OZ 42 YES $61.01 YES $48.36 $60.04 yes $62.09

DON LEE FARMS 70 MEATBALLS CNQ19053 31.25LBS 64
YES $50.94 YES $48.77 $48.30 yes $50.93

DON LEE FARMS 71 MINI CHEESEBURGER SLIDERS QCB655 72/4.55OZ 32 YES $50.15 YES $48.64 $48.38 yes $48.23
DON LEE FARMS 72 PROTEIN VEGGIE PATTIES CN10325 72/3.2OZ 12 YES $70.81 YES $60.42 $65.26 yes $65.45
DON LEE FARMS 73 BACKYARD GRILLER 100% BEEF STEAK CNQ093003 160/3.0OZ 325 YES $40.50 YES $36.47 $37.61 yes $37.24
DON LEE FARMS 74 BEEF STEAK BURGER  100% PRCKD CNQ163003 180/3.0OZ 100 YES $40.58 YES $38.42 $37.37 yes $37.00
EASTSIDE ENTREES 75 PEPPERONI PINWHEEL RF WG 25404 96/3.68OZ 236 YES $60.57 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid
EASTSIDE ENTREES 76 PHILLY STEAK & CHEESE PINWHEEL 25405 96/4.00 OZ 236 YES $64.69 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid
EASTSIDE ENTREES 77 THAW&SERVE TURKEY & CHEZ SAND MEAL 16944 30 COUNT 90 YES $63.63 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid
EASTSIDE ENTREES 78 COMBO SANDWICH WG 61920S 30/4.5 OZ 90 DISCONTINUED NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid
ELEMENTS 79 3 LAYER DIP 3LAYDIP 48/6.6OZ 24 DISCONTINUED DISC DISC N/B No Bid
ELEMENTS 80 BANANA MUFFIN BANMN4 60/4OZ 20 YES $28.20 YES $29.23 N/B No Bid
ELEMENTS 81 BLUEBERRY MUFFIN BM4 60/4OZ 20 YES $28.20 YES $28.51 $29.10 yes $25.49
ELEMENTS 82 CHOCOLATE MUFFIN CCM4 60/4OZ 20 YES $32.69 YES $28.51 $29.10 yes $25.49
ELEMENTS 83 CHEESE ENCHILADA IW CHSENC 48/6.5OZ 48 YES $49.64 YES $19.07 $57.63 yes $49.56



FATHERS TABLE 84 NACHO LIL BITES 77044 8/2.25 LB 160 YES $38.37 YES $40.61 N/B No Bid

FATHERS TABLE 85 CHEESE & PEPPERONI LIL BITES 77046 8/2.25 LB 160
YES $43.77 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid

FERNANDOS 86 EGG, BEAN & CHEESE BREAFAST BURRITO 5220 90/3.5OZ 12
YES $41.90 YES $40.06 $42.67 No Bid

FERNANDOS 87 EGG, PORK SAUS, BEAN & CHEESE BURRITO 5221 90/3.5OZ 12
YES $42.63 YES $39.75 $42.95 No Bid

FERNANDOS 88 EGG, TURKEY SAUS, BEAN & CHEESE BURRITO 5228 90/3.5OZ 12
YES $42.46 YES $39.75 N/B No Bid

FRESH INNOVATIONS 89 APPLE SLICES RED 130220 100/2 OZ 1,200
YES $17.39 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid

FRESH INNOVATIONS 90 APPLE SLICES GREEN 130101.00 100/2 OZ 1,200 YES $16.05 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid
FRESH INNOVATIONS 91 ORANGES SLICES 130006.00 100/4.7 OZ 1,200 YES $23.75 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid
HEINZ 92 KETCHUP PACKET LOW SODIUM 130005650000.00 1000/9GM 350 YES $15.28 YES $15.00 N/B No Bid
HEINZ 93 SALSA DIPPING CUPS LS 130005284000.00 60/2OZ 250 YES $12.64 YES $27.86 N/B No Bid
HORIZON SNACK FOODS 94 APPLE FRUIT POCKET 1402-1 80/3.95OZ 225 YES $32.51 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid
HORIZON SNACK FOODS 95 CHERRY FRUIT POCKET 1402-3 80/3.95OZ 225 YES $41.61 NO BID NO BID N/B No Bid
INTEGRATED 96 BEEF & CHEESE CHALUPA IW C82651 72/3.11OZ 312 YES $44.35 YES $44.35 $43.04 yes $42.32
INTEGRATED 97 CHEESE QUESADILLA TWICE GRILLED IW C36200 100/4.11OZ 24 YES $61.68 YES $62.94 $59.64 yes $60.46
INTEGRATED 98 CHEESE GRILLED RF WG IW C13400 72/4.19OZ 600 YES $39.77 YES $40.94 $38.24 yes $37.37
INTEGRATED 99 CHEESE ITALIAN MELT SANDWICH IW C70605 72/4.53OZ 48 YES $48.21 YES $49.16 $46.70 yes $46.08

INTEGRATED 100 CHEESE W/TURK BACON GRLD SOUR DOUGH   
IW C10300 72/4.31OZ 48 YES $49.11 YES $49.94 $47.64 yes $48.06

INTEGRATED 101 BEEF BBQ RIB SANDWICH IW C46007 75/4.36OZ 160 YES 53.05 YES $54.74 $51.96 yes 52.52
INTEGRATED 102 BEEF TACO STICK IW C45019 50/4.6OZ 600 YES 35.15 YES $34.47 $33.04 yes 32.27

INTEGRATED 103 SANDWICH SUNRISE (TURKEY HAM, EGG, 
CHEESE) C95140 100/3.3OZ 50

YES 65.87 YES $68.60 $65.89 yes 66.91

INTEGRATED 104 BREAKFAST GRILLED CHEESE IW C13100 72/3.19OZ 50
YES $36.55 YES $36.16 $35.65 yes 35.69

INTEGRATED 105 CHORIZO & CHEESE BREAKFAST SOPE C80865 75/2.96OZ 26
YES 47.14 YES $36.95 $45.53 yes 46.41

INTEGRATED 106 MAPLE BEEF SAUSAGE SANDWICH IW C99118 100/3.10 OZ 40 YES 51.15 YES $52.14 $49.89 yes 50.39
INTEGRATED 107 PANCAKE SANDWICH IW C99120 100/2.61OZ 40 YES 52.35 YES $52.57 $51.20 yes 51.51
INTEGRATED 108 CHORIZO SUNRISE STICK C180021 100/2.4OZ 20 YES 46.26 YES $46.18 $44.58 yes 44.69
INTEGRATED 109 BEEF TERIYAKI BLASTERS BULK C16070GLZ 6/3.5LBS 24 YES 40.13 YES $41.33 $38.46 yes 38.58
INTEGRATED 110 TULARE CITY CHICKEN PATTY ON WW BUN 400003 50/5.35OZ 40 YES $26.28 YES $27.17 $24.87 yes 26.88
JENNIE O 111 TURKEY SLI COMBO ITALIAN PACK 2096-12 12/1LB 80 YES $31.78 YES $32.02 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 112 ALL NTRL OVN RST TRKY BRST SLC 2318-12 6/2LB 32 YES $36.99 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 113 ALL NTRL SMOKEHOUSE TURKEY STICKS 2071-30 400/1.2OZ 200 YES $201.53 YES $195.24 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 114 PRE COOKED SAUSAGE LINK 6140 160CT 24 YES $26.53 YES $26.75 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 115 PRE COOKED SAUSAGE PATTY 6132 160CT 12 YES $26.53 YES $26.75 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 116 SL OVEN ROAST TURKEY BREAST.5 FZ 2099 12/1LB 32 YES $26.40 YES $24.77 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 117 ALL NTRL SMOKED TKY BREAST-COIN 2574-12 LB 32 YES $42.76 YES $40.70 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 118 ALL NTRL UNCUR. TKY HAM-COIN 2320-12 LB 32 YES $40.00 YES $39.86 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 119 ALL NTRL SMOKED TKY BREAST 2319-18 6/2LB 32 YES $42.76 YES $51.50 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 120 1/2 DICED TURKEY HAM 6409 2/5LB 20 YES $21.94 YES $22.14 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 121 TURKEY BACON PRE-CKD SLICED 2711-06 12/50CT 24 YES $80.33 YES $80.81 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 122 SLICED PEPP STYLE TURKEY 2130-08 8/2-2.5 LB 24 NO BID YES $65.35 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 123 SLICED 3/4OZ CANADIAN HAM 2031-35 8/3.1 LB 32 YES $51.40 YES $48.29 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 124 TURKEY HAM EXTRA LEAN SLICED FRZ 2565 12/1LB 32 YES $26.93 YES $25.33 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 125 TURKEY & GRAVY PRE-CKD SHRED 2847-28 4/7LB 200 YES $55.76 YES $52.83 N/B  No Bid 
JENNIE O 126 TURKEY CHILI PRECOOKED WHT/DRK 2854-28 4/7LB 60 YES $44.89 YES $45.26 N/B  No Bid 
JTM 127 BEEF TACO FILLING RF CP5250 6/5LB 413 YES 29.83 YES $26.96 $28.13 yes 28.69
JTM 128 CHILI CON CARNE BEEF W/BEANS CP5337 6/5LB 134 YES 33.49 YES $30.77 $32.11 yes 32.74
JTM 129 BEEF/SPAGETTI SAUCE/PASTA CP5590 6/5LB 176 YES 35.08 YES $31.85 $33.24 yes 33.9
JTM 130 BEEF CHILI W/BEANS RF CP579 6/5LB 36 YES 33.15 YES $30.42 $31.74 No Bid
JTM 131 MEATLOAF FULLY COOKED CP5631 150/3.2 OZ 60 YES 32.55 YES $29.79 $31.09 No Bid
JTM 132 SOUP BROCCOLI CHEESE 5114 6/5LB 12 YES $49.78 YES $47.36 $49.07 No Bid
JTM 133 ALFREDO PENNE PASTA 5764 6/5LB 80 YES $40.30 YES $38.28 $39.59 yes 40.87
JTM 134 THREE CHEESE CAVATAPPI 5773 6/5LB 80 YES $35.92 YES $33.95 $34.92 yes 36.06



JTM 135 BRD PORK CHOP SHPD PATTY CP5694 6/5LB 36 YES 43.42 YES $40.54 $42.30 No Bid
JTM 136 BBQ SAUCE W/SHRED PORK CP5416 6/5LB 94 DISCONTINUED YES $37.19 $38.40 yes 39.65
JTM 137 BEEF SLOPPY JOE RF CP545 6/5LB 48 YES 29.96 YES $27.38 $28.27 No Bid
JTM 138 BREAKFAST SCRAMBLER 5164 6/5LB 36 YES $51.20 YES $58.03 $64.96 $59.54 No Bid
JTM 139 ROTINI W/MEAT SAUCE WG CP5591 6/5LB 88 YES 35.87 YES $33.02 $34.10 yes 35.05
JTM 140 QUESO BLANCO SAUCE 5718 6/5LB 10 YES $31.23 YES $29.49 $29.14 No Bid
LAMB WESTON 141 SUPREME POTATO TRI PATTY B03 6/5LB 50 YES $25.19 YES $39.44 N/B No Bid
LAMB WESTON 142 SEASONED WEDGE CUT C27 6/5LB 72 YES $15.91 YES $40.02 N/B No Bid
LAMB WESTON 143 TATER PUFFS H30 6/5LB 80 YES $13.33 YES $38.15 N/B No Bid
LAMB WESTON 144 POTATO DICED BKFST PRIVATE RESERVE 32N 6/6LBS 10 YES $15.91 YES $49.50 N/B No Bid
LAND O LAKES 145 CHEESE WHITE AMERICAN 160 SL 46219 6/5# PCH 16 YES $25.86 YES $30.69 N/B No Bid
LAND O LAKES 146 CHEESE CHEDDAR MILD SHRED 41749 4/5# PCH 16 YES $12.57 YES $16.85 N/B No Bid
LAND O LAKES 147 CHEESE AMERICAN 160 SL 46255 6/5# PCH 12 YES $22.28 YES $29.29 N/B No Bid
LAND O LAKES 148 CHEESE MILD CHEDDAR STICK IW 44879 168/1OZ 300 YES $16.78 YES $21.06 N/B No Bid
LAND O LAKES 149 CHEESE STRING MOZZ 59701 168/1OZ 600 YES $13.35 YES $15.76 N/B No Bid
LAND O LAKES 150 CO-JACK CHEESE STICK IW 44877 168/1OZ 400 YES $16.78 YES $19.87 N/B No Bid
LAND O LAKES 151 CHEESE CHEDDAR CUBES RF 44113 200/1OZ 60 YES $36.26 YES $38.97 N/B No Bid
LAND O LAKES 152 CHEESE COLBY JACK CUBES 44115 200/1OZ 60 YES $36.26 YES $37.11 N/B No Bid
LAND O LAKES 153 MAC & CHEESE W/WG RF 43277 6/5LB 225 YES $46.69 YES $49.95 N/B No Bid
MCI (LOS CABOS) 154 BEAN & CHEESE BURRITO XTREME WG IW 71662 96/5.20 OZ 800 YES $54.71 YES $57.00 $53.89 yes ($ 54.39)                         
MCI (LOS CABOS) 155 EGG/CHEESE/BACON BURRITO 98336 120/3.4OZ 20 YES $66.63 YES $67.56 $65.99 yes ($ 66.81)                         
MCI (LOS CABOS) 156 EGG/CHEESE/SALSA BRKST BURRITO 98334 120/3.75OZ 20 YES $64.82 YES $66.10 $64.03 yes ($ 64.85)                         
MCI (LOS CABOS) 157 SHREDDED BEEF CHILE COLORADO BURRITO 71686 36/6.45OZ 100 YES $53.65 YES $77.90 $53.73 yes ($ 54.08)                         
MCI (LOS CABOS) 158 GRILLED CHICKEN & CHEESE BURRITO 71261 80/5.7OZ 48 YES $78.79 YES $79.73 $78.15 yes ($ 79.05)                         
MCI (LOS CABOS) 159 BEAN & CHEESE DE CHILE RELLENO BURRITO 71683 36/7.66OZ 100 YES $50.85 YES $51.33 $50.82 yes ($ 51.11)                         
MCI (LOS CABOS) 160 BEAN & TWO CHEESES DIP 73342 48/3.35OZ 150 YES $28.40 YES $29.91 $28.58 yes ($ 29.84)                         
MCI (LOS CABOS) 161 BEAN & CHEESE BURRITO BRKST WG IW 61300 120/3.95OZ 42 YES $57.64 YES $59.26 $56.90 yes ($ 57.48)                         
MCI (LOS CABOS) 162 EN FUGO BEAN & CHEESE BURRITO 71471 80/6.05OZ 36 YES $52.92 YES $54.86 $52.12 yes ($ 53.32)                         
MCCAIN 163 POTATO MASHED OIF03613 6/4LB 80 YES $17.47 YES $17.57 N/B  No Bid 
MCCAIN 164 RED SODIUM SEASONED POT STIX MCX04717 6/5LB 200 YES $20.15 YES $19.91 N/B  No Bid 
MCCAIN 165 POTATOES SMILES SHAPED OIF03456 6/4lb 45 YES $20.50 YES $23.97 N/B  No Bid 
MCCAIN 166 POTATOES ROASTED REDSKINS MCF04851 4/4LB 160 YES $18.24 YES $23.16 N/B  No Bid 
MCCAIN 167 POTATOES SKINS MCX03602 4/4.25LB 24 YES $22.56 YES $30.49 N/B  No Bid 
MCCAIN 168 POTATOES HASHBROWN ROUND 1000006188 6/5LB 100 YES $25.19 YES $2.96 N/B  No Bid 
MCCAIN 169 POTATOES CRISPY SEASONED SPIRALS 1000004108 6/4LB 24 YES $17.56 YES $17.11 N/B  No Bid 
MCCAIN 170 TATER TOTS REDUCED SODIUM 1000002789 6/5LB 70 YES $19.99 YES $21.41 N/B  No Bid 
MICHAEL B'S 171 BEEF CHEESE LASAGNA IW BL672 35/7.38OZ 90 YES $44.25 YES $39.85 $34.65 yes ($ 34.42)                         
MICHAEL B'S 172 PENNE  W/MEAT SAUCE PPM45 35/8.56OZ 90 YES $33.73 YES $29.91 $26.82 yes ($ 26.97)                         
MICHAEL B'S 173 CHICKEN & CHEESE TAMALE IN FOIL NOI TAC32F 72/5.5OZ 500 YES $96.03 YES $85.15 $77.17 yes ($ 78.36)                         
MICHAEL B'S 174 EGG & CHEESE BREAKFAST TACO ECT23 100/2.4OZ 24 YES $70.19 YES $60.38 $54.26 yes ($ 55.62)                         
MICHAEL B'S 175 BEEF & CHEESE FLAUQUITO IW FBT54 80/5.16OZ 78 YES $96.81 NO BID NO BID N/B yes ($ 77.64)                         
MICHAEL B'S 176 PORK & CHEESE TAMALE TAP76 72/5.5OZ 84 YES $92.53 YES $83.12 $74.73 yes ($ 75.74)                         
MICHAEL B'S 177 TURKEY SAUSAGE & CH ENGLISH MUFFIN TSCE49 72/4.6OZ 70 YES $12.71 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
MICHAEL B'S 178 CHIMICHANGA BEEF BEAN AND CHEESE BTC40W 80/5.16OZ 80 YES $75.54 YES $67.54 $60.32 yes ($ 61.28)                         
MICHAEL FOODS 179 EGG PATTY ROUND 85017 300/1.25OZ 30 YES $31.31 YES $33.42 N/B  No Bid 
MICHAEL FOODS 180 CHEDDAR CHEESE OMELET 85037 144/2OZ 32 YES $35.89 YES $34.58 N/B  No Bid 
MINH 181 CHICKEN ORANGE STIR FRY KIT 69020 6/7LB 26 YES $135.94 YES $131.94 N/B yes ($ 136.00)                      

MINH 182 CHICKEN SWT & SOUR STIR FRY KIT 69016 6/7LB 26 YES $135.94 YES $131.94 N/B yes ($ 136.00)                      
MINH 183 CHICKEN TERIYAKI STIR FRY KIT 69018 6/7LB 26 YES $105.06 YES $102.03 N/B yes ($ 104.69)                      
MUFFIN TOWN 184 SUNWISE SANDWICH STRAWBERRY 12258 96/2.8 150 YES $53.10 YES $51.01 N/B  No Bid 
NATIONAL FOOD 185 FRUIT CUP DICED PEARS 1780 72/4.5OZ 148 YES $26.31 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
NATIONAL FOOD 186 FRUIT CUP DICED PEACHES 1740 72/4.5OZ 722 YES $25.62 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
OLD TOWN BAKERY 187 CINNAMON ROLLS WG IW NOI CIN3.5 72/3.5OZ 6 YES $35.98 YES $31.77 N/B  No Bid 



PETERSON FARMS 188 APPLE SAUCE ORIGINAL ASA10001 96/4.5OZ 100 YES $20.93 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
PETERSON FARMS 189 APPLE SAUCE CINNAMON ASA10013 96/4.5OZ 200 YES $20.93 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
PETERSON FARMS 190 APPLE SAUCE STRAWBERRY BANANA ASA10015 96/4.5OZ 300 YES $16.28 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
PETERSON FARMS 191 APPLE SAUCE MIXED BERRIES ASA10020 96/4.5OZ 300 YES $16.28 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
RED GOLD 192 MARINARA NUTRITIONALLY ENHANCED RPKNA9E 6/#10 40 YES $28.47 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
RED GOLD 193 MARINARA DIPPING 2.5 OZ CUPS REDNA2ZC84 84/2.5OZ 200 YES $22.24 YES $21.89 N/B  No Bid 
RED GOLD 194 SALSA DIPPING CUPS LS REDSC2ZC84 84/3OZ 50 YES $26.85 YES $27.86 N/B  No Bid 
RICHS 195 CHEESE PIZZA CRUNCHER WW 65225 8/3.12LB 200 YES $47.69 YES $44.04 N/B  No Bid 
RICHS 196 PANCAKE BITES WG 8066 384/.51OZ 45 YES $26.22 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
RICHS 197 FRENCH TOAST BITES 8061 384/.51OZ 45 YES $26.22 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
RICHS 198 MOZZARELLA CHEESE STICKS IW 65220 8/3LB 45 YES $38.53 YES $35.17 N/B  No Bid 
ROSE & SHORE 199 MACARONI & CHEESE IN TRAYS 850-TRAY 45/7OZ 68 YES $39.92 YES $46.00 $40.22 yes ($ 41.39)                         
ROSE & SHORE 200 TURKEY HAM SUN SIDE SND IW SSU248WC 48/4.25OZ 8 YES 43.86 YES $41.71 $43.87 yes ($ 44.32)                         
ROSE & SHORE 201 5" BREAKFAST PIZZA IW BSTR500B 48/3.6 OZ 64 YES $43.90 YES $36.82 N/B  No Bid 
ROSE & SHORE 202 PORK SHREDDED CARNITAS 790 4/10LB 42 YES 62 YES $65.82 $63.04 yes ($ 64.14)                         
ROSE & SHORE 203 TURKEY HAM & CH FRCH ROLL IW SST10WC 48/4.5OZ 600 YES 36.66 YES $36.19 $36.04 yes ($ 35.40)                         
ROSE & SHORE 204 TURKEY DELI/CHS FRCH ROLL IW TDC248WC 48/4.7OZ 204 YES 37.14 YES $35.54 $36.57 yes ($ 35.94)                         
SUNNY FRESH 205 PRE COOKED SCRAMBLED EGGS 40927 4/5LB 44 YES $30.07 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
SUNNY FRESH 206 BASIC EGG PATTY 30345 60 COUNT 36 DISCONTINUED NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
SUNNY FRESH 207 BACON & CHEESE EGG STRAVAGANZA 40928 4/5LB 60 YES $47.02 YES $50.76 N/B  No Bid 
SUNNY FRESH 208 BRKFST WRAP FLVRD W/CHS IW 40275 75/3.10 OZ 6 YES $38.89 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
SUNNY FRESH 209 TAC GO W EGG CHS HAM WW IW 40263 96/3.35OZ 6 YES $54.52 YES $57.04 N/B  No Bid 
SUNNY FRESH 210 TAC GO EGG CHS TKY SAUS WG IW 40274 96/3.20OZ 6 YES $53.31 YES $57.31 N/B  No Bid 
SUNNY FRESH 211 COLBY CHEESE OMELET PRE COOKED 40176 225/2.1OZ 25 YES $67.03 YES $60.07 N/B  No Bid 
SUNNY FRESH 212 HARD COOKED EGGS PILLOW PACK 50038 8/18CT 120 YES $26.98 YES $21.27 N/B  No Bid 

SUNNY FRESH 213 FIESTA CHEESE OMELET 40187 210/2.2OZ 12 YES $65.15 YES $69.58 N/B  No Bid 
SUNNY FRESH 214 CHORIZO FRITTATA WG IW 40262 75/3.45OZ 64 YES $54.52 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 

SUNNY FRESH 215 SINGLE PACK EGG 50045 197 COUNT 180 YES $42.72 YES $44.58 N/B  No Bid 

SUNNY FRESH 216 EGGS ASAP 50074 16/2 COUNT 75 YES $9.07 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 

SUNNY FRESH 217 EGGSTRAVAGANZA TURKEY SAUS CHEESE 40936 4/5LBS 30 YES $47.74 YES $49.55 N/B  No Bid 

TABATCHNICK 218 CHERRY TOPPER 405449 96/4.2OZ 80 YES $54.26 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 
TOOLS FOR SCHOOLS 219 CHEESE FILLED RAVIOLI WG 129GS 138/1.5OZ 6 YES $20.13 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 

TOOLS FOR SCHOOLS 220 PIZZA RIPPERS 91B 105/4OZ 32 YES $77.73 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 

TOOLS FOR SCHOOLS 221 PIZZA STUFFWICH GLUTEN FREE IW 800M 4OZ 4 YES $59.92 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 

TONY'S 222 PEP GALAXY PIZZA 4" RND 51% WG IW 78367 72/4.56OZ 52 YES $41.12 YES $39.96 N/B yes ($ 40.70)                         

TONY'S 223 CHS GALAXY PIZZA 4" RND 51% WG IW 78366 72/4.56OZ 1000
YES $40.04 YES $38.77 N/B yes ($ 39.50)                         

TONY'S 224 TURKEY SAUAGE BREAKFAST PIZZA WG IW 63913 100/3.67OZ 36 YES $61.47 YES $52.05 N/B yes ($ 51.84)                         

TONY ROBERTS 225 PIZZA PEPP COIN FRENCH BREAD 82015 60/5.20OZ 780
YES $52.29 NO BID NO BID N/B yes ($ 47.64)                         

TRIDENT 226 FISH STICK BAJA WG CN 418304 1/10LB 56 YES $19.65 YES $17.81 N/B  No Bid 

TRIDENT 227 BREADED POLLOCK PORTIONS WG 418302 1/10LB 36 YES $16.55 YES $15.27 N/B  No Bid 

TYSON 228 CHICKEN POPCORN BITES WG 2940-0928 30LB 20 YES $44.85 YES $31.57 N/B  No Bid 

 TYSON 229 1/2" LS PULLED 65/35 CHICKEN 46021-0928 2/5LB 200 YES $19.75 YES $33.72 N/B  No Bid 

TYSON 230 CHICKEN FAJITA 0033522-0928 8/4.99LB 12 YES $84.75 YES $79.08 N/B  No Bid 

TYSON 231 CHICKEN BRD CHUNKS WG 2155-0928 28.35LB 400
YES $39.00 YES $36.84 N/B  No Bid 

TYSON 232 BRD SPICY CHIC PATTIES WG 70314-0928 148/3.53OZ 225
YES $44.99 YES $41.77 N/B  No Bid 

TYSON 233 KRISPY KRUNCHY PATTY 3857-0928 140/3.53OZ 450 YES $40.38 YES $41.27 N/B  No Bid 

TYSON 234 KRISPY KRUNCHY TENDERS WG 3859-0928 31.86LB 36 YES $41.03 YES $39.13 N/B  No Bid 

TYSON 235 CHICKEN BRST FILET CRISPY BRD WG 70302-0928 6/5.15LB 225 YES $66.64 YES $64.56 N/B  No Bid 

TYSON 236 CHICKEN BREAST CHUNKS H&S WG 70372-0928 6/5LB 120 YES $69.51 YES $69.51 N/B  No Bid 



TYSON 237 BRD GLDN CHICKEN CRISPY TNDRLNS WG 703322-0928 110/4.5OZ 201 YES $74.64 YES $76.85 N/B  No Bid 

TYSON 238 DK FC RST GLZ CHICKEN DRMST 026435-0928 30LB 32 YES $57.39 YES $56.51 N/B  No Bid 

TYSON 239 DK WG BRD TRAD DRUMSTICKS 666010-0928 108/4.4OZ 350 YES $61.85 YES $58.35 N/B  No Bid 

TYSON 240 CHICKEN RINGS CSPY WG 70366-0928 6/5.875 0 80 YES $47.66 YES $46.82 N/B  No Bid 

TYSON 241 BRD WAFFLE CHICKEN CHUNKS 029494-0928 .54OZ 80 YES $85.25 YES $80.72 N/B  No Bid 

WAWONA 242 TROPICAL BLEND 2126 2/5LB 24 YES 19.23 YES $18.10 N/B  No Bid 

WAWONA 243 4 BERRY BLEND 044535-77 2/5LB 180 YES 14.91 YES $17.56 N/B  No Bid 

WILD MIKE'S 244 PIZZA PEPP WEDGE 51% WG IW 90500 90/5.5OZ 75 YES $65.39 YES $61.46 N/B yes ($ 66.86)                         

WILD MIKE'S 245 MAPLE BREAD STICK 11004 112/1.4OZ 110 YES $29.11 NO BID NO BID N/B  No Bid 

YANGS 246 BBQ TERIYAKI CHICKEN 15554-8 6/5LB 26 YES $98.12 YES $98.94 N/B yes ($ 95.45)                         

YANGS 247 SWEET CHILI THAI CHICKEN 15550-0 6/5LBS 12 YES $114.03 YES $114.42 N/B yes ($ 111.27)                      

YANGS 248 MANDARIN ORANGE CHICKEN JR 15555-5 6/5LBS 26 YES $102.39 YES $101.54 N/B yes ($ 99.71)                         


