
Tulare City School District USDA AND COMMERCIAL
2019-2020 RFP Commercial COMMERCIAL
Proposal Worksheet LF = Low Fat    RF = Reduced Fat     WG = Whole Grain   IW = Individually Wrapped

Instructions: Indicate  Delivered Cost per case in yellow highlighted column (H) for each item or group. Indicate whether item 
meets Buy American Provision in column G. Quote manufacturer, item code, and pack 
ONLY if not as specified in columns I, J, & K.

GOLDSTAR SYSCO VALLEY FOOD SERVICE SCHOOL LUNCH PRODUCTS

Manufacturer Line No.Item Description                                                                                                                                    Manufacturer Code Pack
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Commercial Products Yes/No
Quote manufacturer, item code, and pack 

ONLY if not as specified Yes/No
Quote manufacturer, item code, and pack 

ONLY if not as specified Yes/No

Quote manufacturer, item code, and 
pack 

ONLY if not as specified Yes/No

Quote manufacturer, item 
code, and pack 

ONLY if not as specified

ALBIES 1 SOY BUTTER & JELLY SANDW WG IW 607 72/2.4OZ 60 YES $49.40 YES $46.40 N/B No Bid
ALBIES 2 SOY BUTTER & JELLY SANDW WG IW 608 40/4.6OZ 120 YES $39.63 YES $37.63 N/B No Bid
ALBIES 3 BREAKFAST CALZONE WG 815 48/4.5OZ 40 YES $39.07 NO BID N/B No Bid
ALBIES 4 SUNRISE CALZONE 823 48/4.5OZ 40 YES $39.07 NO BID N/B No Bid
AMERICANA 5 BBQ SAUCE POLY 71603700244 200/12OZ 20 YES $5.13 YES $5.05 716037002442 7748718 200/12 GM $5.69 #71603700222 No Bid
AMERICANA 6 MAYONNAISE PACKETS 00716037002343 200/9GM 280 YES $7.66 YES $7.42 00716037002343 7688526 200/9GM $8.50 #71603700234 No Bid
AMERICANA 7 MUSTARD YELLOW PACKETS 71603700539 500/5.5GM 60 YES $6.01 YES $5.88 716037760533 2965424 500/5.5 GM $5.10 #71603700529 No Bid
AMERICANA 8 TACO SAUCE MILD PACKET 71603700248 500/9GM 220 YES $10.54 YES $11.18 716037415808 4671525 500/9 GM $11.98 No Bid
AMERICANA 9 BUTTERMILK RANCH DRESSING 71603700238 200/12GM 750 YES $6.05 YES $6.08 7160370023800 7743909 200/12 GM $6.31 No Bid
AMERICANA 10 MAPLE SYRUP PACKETS 71603700224 100/1OZ 350 YES $4.99 YES $6.97 7160370022800 7688567 100/1.5 OZ $5.11 No Bid
AMERICANA 11 ASSORTED JELLY PACKET IW 71603760651 200/0.50OZ 52 YES $6.87 YES $6.73 $7.63 No Bid
AMERICANA ROLAND 12 MANDARIN ORANGE WHOLE 64052 6/#10 20 YES $26.70 NEMCO FOOD TRADING, INC 248587 6/#10 YES $33.01 210574865N 3548385 6/#10 N/B No Bid
AREZZIO 13 MARINARA SAUCE CUP 410028 72/2.5OZ 16 YES $23.75 RED GOLD INC 404036 84/2.5OZ YES $18.32 N/B No Bid
AREZZIO 14 CHEESE MOZZ STRING 982118 168/1OZ 28 YES $30.20 LAND O'LAKES, INC 401172 168/1OZ YES $30.81 N/B No Bid
AREZZIO 15 MARINARA SAUCE DIPPING CUPS 79545 96/2.3OZ 10 YES $23.75 RED GOLD INC 404036 84/2.5OZ NO BID N/B No Bid
ASIAN FOOD 
SOLUTIONS

16 CRISPY CHOW MEIN NOODLES WG IW 79201 140/08OZ 24 YES $36.36 YES $33.68 $37.50 No Bid
ASIAN FOOD 
SOLUTIONS

17 FORTUNE COOKIES WG 79203 400/0.17OZ 30 YES $9.77 C. PACIFIC FOODS INC. 209840 350CT YES $26.32 $29.55 No Bid
AUNTJEM 18 PANCAKE WG HT&SRV 1960043582 12/12CT 20 YES $24.27 YES $22.84 N/B No Bid
AUNTJEM 19 WAFFLE WG 1960043577 144/1.4OZ 112 YES $18.55 BAKE CRAFTERS FOOD COMPANY141047 144/1.3OZ NO BID N/B No Bid
AVO 20 DISTILLED WHITE VINEGAR V20001 4/1GAL 1 YES $7.95 YES $12.25 10074865106976 4113049 4/1 GAL N/B No Bid
AZAR NUT COMPANY 21 SUNFLOWER KERNELS SPICY LIME 7220200 150/1OZ 80 YES $24.89 NO BID N/B No Bid
BACK TO BASICS 22 CRACKER MINI WAFER VANILLA 920WG80 80/1.1OZ 52 YES $14.11 NO BID N/B yes $14.63
BACK TO BASICS 23 CRACKER WHEAT WG 37501 150/0.8OZ 19 YES $29.02 NO BID N/B yes $28.78
BACK TO BASICS 24 CRACKER WHEAT WG 37401 100/1.6OZ 35 YES $31.91 NO BID N/B yes $31.86
BACK TO BASICS 25 NO-NUT BUTTER CREAMY 1020 72/1OZ 96 YES $92.83 NO BID N/B yes $91.30
BACK TO BASICS 26 NO-NUT BUTTER CHOCOLATE 1016 72/1OZ 96 YES $92.83 NO BID N/B yes $91.30
BACK TO BASICS 27 BITES WAFERS VANILLA WW 920WG150 150/1.1OZ 45 YES $14.11 JNS FOODS, LLC (BACK TO BASICS)248665 80/1.1OZ NO BID N/B yes $14.63
BACK TO BASICS 28 BITES STRAWBERRY YOGURT 

SHORTBREAD WW
928WG150 150/1.1OZ 45 YES $14.11 JNS FOODS, LLC (BACK TO BASICS)248674 80/1.1OZ NO BID N/B yes $14.63

BACK TO BASICS 29 GRAHAMS ANIMAL WW 925WG150 150/1.1OZ 45 YES $14.11 JNS FOODS, LLC (BACK TO BASICS)NEW ITEM 80/1.1OZ NO BID N/B yes $14.63
BAGELFULS 30 STRAW JELLY BAGEL & CRM CHS IW 21270 76/2.5OZ 24 YES $35.98 YES $30.35 138413000 3282809 72/2.43OZ N/B No Bid
BAKE CRAFTERS 31 DONUT MINI CHOCOLATE 1929 72/6PK 3 YES $38.44 YES $35.71 N/B No Bid
BAKE CRAFTERS 32 DONUT MINI POWDERED 1931 72/6PK 3 YES $36.89 YES $33.98 N/B No Bid
BAKE CRAFTERS 33 FRENCH TOAST STICK IW 449 88/3OZ 122 YES $43.91 YES $38.64 N/B yes $44.84
BAKE CRAFTERS 34 SANDWICH ENG MUFF TKY HAM CHES 4613 96/3.5OZ 38 YES $53.05 YES $49.40 N/B No Bid
BAKE CRAFTERS 35 FRENCH TOAST STICK WW BULK 442 144/1OZ 240 YES $18.78 YES $17.40 N/B yes $22.09
BAKE CRAFTERS 36 WG TRKY HAM SNDWCH IW 6643 84/5OZ 10 YES $65.92 YES $58.27 N/B No Bid
BAKE CRAFTERS 37 WG TURKEY & CHEESE HOAGIE IW 6648 80/4.6OZ 75 YES $88.73 YES $83.81 N/B No Bid
BAKE CRAFTERS 38 MAPLE CHICKEN SAUSAGE BISCUIT SAND 

IW
4621 96/3.51OZ 40 DISCONTINUED NO BID N/B No Bid

BAKE CRAFTERS 39 WG MAPLE WAFFLE BRD CHICKEN IW 6656 126/3OZ 48 YES $84.38 YES $76.43 N/B No Bid
BAKE CRAFTERS 40 WG CHICKEN BRD BISCUIT SAND IW 6625 96/3.2OZ 50 YES $65.53 YES $57.95 N/B No Bid
BAKE CRAFTERS 41 WG HONEY BISCUIT CHICKEN SAUSAGE 

IW
4602 200/2.15OZ 36 YES $104.74 YES $91.23 N/B No Bid

BELL TASTY 42 CHIMI NADA CHIMINA2B 60/5.5OZ 665 YES $43.30 YES $41.39 N/B yes $40.56
BELL TASTY 43 CHIMI NADA CHIMINADAQCB 60/4.5OZ 48 YES $34.66 YES $33.22 N/B yes $32.65
BELL TASTY 44 TACO NADA BITES TNB2015B 150/4.50OZ 26 YES $36.93 YES $34.02 N/B yes $34.90
BRAKEBUSH 45 CHICKEN STRIP GLUTEN FREE 5810 2/5LBS 12 YES $35.80 YES $33.16 $34.24 No Bid
BRAKEBUSH 46 CHICKEN STRIPS WG 5843 145/1.10OZ 120 YES $29.15 YES $27.00 $27.88 No Bid
BRAKEBUSH 47 CHICKEN BRD BONELESS DRUMMIES 5866 200/.8OZ 106 YES $29.77 YES $27.58 $28.48 No Bid
BRAKEBUSH 48 CHICKEN BURGER FLAME-GRILLED 5702 2/5LB 250 YES $37.05 YES $34.32 $35.43 No Bid



BUENA VISTA 49 WG HOLIDAY STAR CKY IW 71421 150/1OZ 80 YES $36.36 YES $35.24 $33.70 yes $34.04
BUSH 50 BEANS BLACK LS 1885 6/#10 CAN 12 YES $26.70 YES $24.76 $26.54 No Bid
CALIFORNIA GIRL 51 SLICED OLIVES 83246000067 6/#10 CAN 2 YES $33.52 C. PACIFIC FOODS INC. 209849 6/#10 YES $48.28 55206-687 1194109 6/#10 N/B No Bid
CATTLEMANS 52 BBQ SAUCE  5316 4/1GAL 20 YES $41.77 YES $43.62 N/B No Bid
CAKERIE 53 CAKE SHEET LEMON & CRM SHORTCAKE 6204 2/185OZ 1 YES $93.48 YES $93.51 6161640 2/185 OZ N/B No Bid
CAKERIE 54 CAKE SHEET STRAWBRY SHORTCAKE 6200 2/185OZ 1 YES $92.20 YES $92.27 N/B No Bid
CAMPBELLS 55 SOUP CLAM CHOWDER 8170 3/4LBS 49 YES $40.20 YES $32.78 35566 2582104 3/4 LB $38.46 No Bid
CAMPBELLS 56 SOUP VEGETABLE BEEF 8163 3/4LBS 49 YES $37.17 YES $30.89 35575 2582195 3/4 LB $35.55 No Bid
CRISCO 57 PURE CANOLA OIL 510025479 9/32 oz 2 YES $26.52 NO BID N/B No Bid
CASASOL 58 TACO SHELL JUMBO 21201 200/6.5OZ 232 YES $15.40 ROMERO'S FOOD PRODUCTS 300445 200CT YES $16.56 9292657 200/6.5 N/B No Bid
CHAMPOIN FOOD 59 RAISEL FIESTA CHILI RAISINS CSR500 200/1.5OZ 380 YES $74.19 YES $73.39 $73.90 yes $73.50
CHAMPOIN FOOD 60 RAISEL FRUIT SPLASH RAISINS CSR400 200/1.5OZ 600 YES $72.04 YES $68.04 5233 4064826 200/1.5 OZ $73.90 yes $71.25
CHAMPOIN FOOD 61 RAISEL SOUR LEMON RAISINS CLR100 200/1.5OZ 380 YES $72.04 YES $68.04 5283 2086029 200/1.5OZ $73.90 yes $71.25
CHAMPOIN FOOD 62 RAISEL WATERMELON RAISINS CWR300 200/1.5OZ 600 YES $74.19 YES $70.10 000527-9 2754456 200/1.5OZ $73.90 yes $73.50
CHAMPOIN FOOD 63 RAISEL SOUR ORANGE RAISINS COR200 200/1.5OZ 380 YES $72.04 YES $68.04 5290 2086013 200/1.5OZ $73.90 yes $71.25
CHEF BOYARDES 64 RAVIOLI-BEEF 64144-81080 6/#10 4 YES $60.83 YES $57.31 N/B No Bid
CHEFMATE 65 COUNTRY SAUSAGE GRAVY 340872/52285 6/#10 20 YES $52.90 YES $59.88 5000005228 4958542 6/#10 N/B No Bid
CHEFS CORNER 66 CHERRY BLOSSOM SAUCE DFC-2177 15/2LBS 8 YES $55.61 NO BID N/B No Bid
CHEFS CORNER 67 VEGGIE SPRING ROLL WG KYWG-068 200/1.5 OZ 10 YES $67.18 NO BID N/B No Bid
CHEFS CORNER 68 LS TERIYAKI SAUCE OFC-2165 15/2LBS 8 YES $54.82 NO BID N/B No Bid
DAVES 69 BROWNIE CUP WG 126 90/1.5OZ 344 YES $25.30 YES $22.09 N/B yes $22.72
DAVE'S 70 BROWNIE CHOC RF IW 225 72/2.2OZ 80 YES $28.06 YES $25.93 N/B yes $25.65
DE WAFFLEBAKERS 71 PANCAKE MAPLE MINI 625 72/3OZ 32 YES $30.00 NO BID $28.70 yes $29.29
DE WAFFLEBAKERS 72 PANCAKE MINI WG STRAWBERRY 631 72/3OZ 32 YES $30.00 NO BID $28.70 No Bid
DE WAFFLEBAKERS 73 PANCAKE MINI WG BLUEBERRY 626 72/3OZ 32 YES $30.00 NO BID $28.70 No Bid
DE WAFFLEBAKERS 74 PANCAKE MINI WG CHOCALOT CHIP 633 72/3OZ 32 YES $30.00 NO BID $28.70 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 75 TAMALE CHICKEN GREEN 783 48/6OZ 97 YES $56.11 YES $52.52 $50.73 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 76 TAMALE CHICKEN GREEN 124 48/5OZ 42 YES $44.83 YES $42.43 $40.55 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 77 TAMALE CHEESE & GREEN CHILI 766 48/5OZ 14 YES $45.88 YES $42.95 $41.55 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 78 TAMALE CHICKEN RED SAUCE 767 48/5OZ 35 YES $45.88 YES $42.95 $41.55 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 79 PORK CHILE VERDE 111 4/5LBS 48 YES $74.51 YES $70.24 $67.91 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 80 SHREDDED  PORK CARNITAS 101 4/5LBS 48 YES $97.18 YES $96.95 $89.60 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 81 CHICKEN TINGA 303 4/5LBS 48 YES $67.48 NO BID $61.18 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 82 DICED GRILLED CHICKEN 340 10/2LB 48 YES $81.45 NO BID $74.55 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 83 MEXICAN BROWN RICE 421 6/5LB 48 DISCONTINUED NO BID N/B No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 84 BEAN & CHEESE PUPUSAS 705 8/5CT 60 YES $41.63 YES $38.93 $37.70 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 85 SALSA DE MOLCAJETE VERDE 503-5 3/4LB 24 YES $22.32 YES $21.69 $19.64 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 86 VEGETARIAN REFRIED BEANS 406 4/5LB 30 YES $27.27 YES $25.85 $22.73 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 87 SALSA DE MOLCAJETE ROJA 504-5 3/4LB 24 YES $22.32 YES $21.69 $19.64 No Bid
DEL REAL FOODS 88 SOPES 6055 120/2OZ 24 DISCONTINUED NO BID N/B No Bid
DOLE 89 PEAR DICED CUP IN JUICE 3019 36/4OZ 10 YES $27.22DEL MONTE FOODS (SAGER CRK/ALLENS)248546 48/4.4OZ NO $18.35 N/B No Bid
DOLE 90 PEACHES DICED CUP IN JUICE 3073 36/4OZ 10 YES $20.36 NO $19.05 N/B No Bid
DOLE 91 PINEAPPLE TIDBITS JUICE 38900-00553 6/#10 10 YES $19.89 C. PACIFIC FOODS INC. 209856 6/#10 NO $18.35 419 4714598 36/4 OZ N/B No Bid
DON LEE FARMS 92 FARMERS MARKET BLEND VEGGIE 

PATTIES
769471FS 80/3OZ 10 YES $64.54 YES $59.88 $60.82 yes $61.35

DORITOS 93 CHIP TORTILLA COOL RANCH RF 36096 72/1OZ 485 YES $21.40 YES $19.65 N/B No Bid
DORITOS 94 CHIP TORTILLA FLAMAS RF 62829 72/1OZ 485 YES $21.40 YES $19.65 N/B No Bid
DORITOS 95 CHIP SPICY SWEET CHILI RF 49093 72/1OZ 224 YES $21.40 YES $19.71 N/B No Bid
DORITOS 96 CHIP TORTILLA NACHO RF 31748 72/1OZ 1,774 YES $21.40 YES $19.65 N/B No Bid
ELEMENTS 97 APPLE ROLL APLROLL 72/3.5OZ 32 YES $37.59 NO BID $35.41 AROLL yes $35.88
ELEMENTS 98 MINI CHEESE GARLIC ROLL CHSGARROLL 168/1.5OZ 12 YES $70.13 NO BID $66.53 CHSWIRL yes $68.25
ELMENTS 99 CHEESE ENCHILADA IW CHSENC 48/6.5OZ 49 YES $59.80 YES $29.23 $57.63 CCHSENC yes $58.98
FELBRO 100 TERIYAKI SAUCE LS 270144 4/1GAL 10 YES $32.27 NO BID N/B No Bid
FIELDSTONE 101 GRANOLA ORIGINAL BULK 547610/09799 4/50OZ 89 YES $30.18 NO BID $28.87 yes $32.32
FIELDSTONE 102 GRANOLA IW 547608/09796 100/2OZ 6 YES $36.32 NO BID $34.74 yes $38.50
FRESH GOURMENT 103 TRI-COLOR TORTILLA STRIPS 488016/43169 100/.5OZ 16 YES $14.33 $27.17 55649 5238148 10/1 LB N/B yes $16.17
FRITO LAY 104 CHEETOS FLAMIN HOT BKD WG SNACK 62984 104/.875OZ 220 YES $32.84 YES $29.95 N/B No Bid
FRITO LAY 105 CHEETOS OVEN BAKED CRUNCHY 62933 104/.875OZ 220 YES $32.84 YES $29.44 N/B No Bid
FRITO LAY 106 CHEESE PUFF RF WG 21910 72/.75OZ 216 YES $21.40 YES $20.38 N/B No Bid



FRITO LAY 107 CHEETOS FANTASTIX CHILI CHEESE 36098 104/1OZ 162 YES $32.84 YES $29.44 N/B No Bid
FRITO LAY 108 TOSTITOS SCOOPS OVEN BAKED 42537 72/.875OZ 216 YES $21.40 YES $20.38 N/B No Bid
FRITO LAY 109 TOP N GO RF NACHO CHEESE 66007 21/1.4OZ 300 YES $21.20 FRITO-LAY/PEPSICO 248602 44/1.4OZ YES $19.02 28400205184 7074490 44/1.4 OZ N/B No Bid
FRITO LAY 110 TOP N GO RF CRISPY ROUNDS 66006 21/1.4OZ 600 YES $21.20 FRITO-LAY/PEPSICO 248603 44/1.4OZ YES $19.23 28400205108 7074930 44/1.4 OZ N/B No Bid
FRITO LAY 111 CHIP CORN REGULAR 19852 120/.75OZ 200 YES $19.72 YES $18.07 N/B No Bid
FRITO LAY 112 SUN CHIP ORIGINAL MULTIGRAIN 11151 104/1OZ 220 YES $32.84 YES $29.78 N/B No Bid
FRITO LAY 113 SUN CHIP FRENCH ONION MULTIGRAIN 11153 104/1OZ 76 YES $32.84 YES $31.58 N/B No Bid
FRITO LAY 114 CHEETOS FANTASTIX FLAMIN' HOT 43578 104/1OZ 220 YES $32.84 YES $29.81 N/B No Bid
FRITO LAY 115 CHEETOS PUFFS FLAMIN' HOT 21912 72/.7OZ 72 YES $21.40 YES $20.62 N/B No Bid
GOLDEN STATE 116 YELLOW MUSTARD 73120 4/1 GL 1 YES $14.08 YES $18.11 81938 7048836 4/105 OZ N/B No Bid
GENERAL MILLS 117 BREAKFAST BAR CINN TST CRUNCH 16000-45576 96/1.42OZ 10 YES $25.97 YES $25.97 $27.49 No Bid
GENERAL MILLS 118 BREAKFAST BAR COCOA PUFFS 16000-45577 96/1.42OZ 10 YES $25.97 YES $25.97 $27.49 No Bid
GENERAL MILLS 119 BREAKFAST BAR TRIX 16000-31915 96/1.42OZ 10 YES $25.97 YES $25.97 $27.49 No Bid
GENERAL MILLS 120 BREAKFAST BAR FRUITY CHEERIOS 16000-31912 96/1.42OZ 10 YES $25.97 YES $25.66 $27.49 No Bid
GENERAL MILLS 121 BREAKFAST BAR GOLDEN GRAHAMS 1600-31913 96/1.42OZ 10 YES $25.97 YES $26.66 $27.49 No Bid
GENERAL MILLS 122 CEREAL CINN TST RED SUGAR BWLPK 16000-148826 60/2.0OZ 480 YES $25.57 YES $24.53 16000-14886 7072170 60/2 OZ $25.16 No Bid

GENERAL MILLS 123 CEREAL CHEERIOS BOWL PK 16000-32262 96/1OZ 480 YES $19.97 YES $20.57 $21.21 No Bid

GENERAL MILLS 124 CEREAL CINN TST RED SUGAR BWLPK 29444000 96/1OZ 232 YES $19.97 YES $20.57 $21.21 No Bid

GENERAL MILLS 125 CEREAL COCOA PUFFS 25% LS BOWLPK 16000-31888 96/1.63OZ 8 YES $19.97 YES $20.57 $21.21 No Bid

GENERAL MILLS 126 CEREAL LUCK CHARMS 16000-148840 60/2.0OZ 480 YES $25.57 YES $24.53 $25.16 No Bid

GENERAL MILLS 127 CEREAL LUCKY CHARMS GLUTEN FR 16000-31917 96/1OZ 200 YES $19.97 YES $20.57 $21.21 No Bid

GENERAL MILLS 128 CEREAL RICE CHEX BOWLPAK 16000-31921 96/1OZ 200 YES $19.97 YES $20.18 31921000 1974942  96/1 OZ $21.21 No Bid

GENERAL MILLS 129 CEREAL TRIX 25% LS BOWLPK 16000-31922 96/1OZ 200 YES $19.97 YES $20.57 31922000 1913047  96/1 OZ $21.21 No Bid

GENERAL MILLS 130 CEREAL TOTAL RAISIN BRAN 16000-12392 96CT 200 YES $19.97 YES $20.18 $21.21 No Bid

GENERAL MILLS 131 CEREAL KIX 16000-11942 96CT 2 YES $19.97 YES $20.18 11942000 4375408  96/.625OZ $21.21 No Bid

GENERAL MILLS 132 CEREAL CINNAMON CHEX 16000-148833 60/2.0OZ 480 YES $25.57 YES $24.53 $25.16 No Bid

GREEN BELLIES 133 SPAGHETTI SCRUMPTIOUS P-801-01 4/5LB 80 YES $38.75 NO BID N/B No Bid

GREEN BELLIES 134 VEGGIELICIOUS CHILI GLUTEN FREE P-203-01 4/6LBS 120 YES $57.50 NO BID N/B No Bid

HEINZ 135 KETCHUP PACKET LOW SODIUM 10013000565001 1000/9GR 497 YES $17.09 YES $16.81 130005650000 2495329  1000/9 GM N/B No Bid

HEINZ 136 SIMPLY HEINZ KETCHUP 130005155600 12/20oz 2 YES $20.43 NO BID N/B No Bid

HEINZ 137 CRINKLE CUT HAMBURGER PICKLES 130006582000 6/5.75 LB 2 YES $23.77 YES $21.63 674BB 4368153  4/1 GAL N/B No Bid

HEINZ 138 CAESAR DRESSING 001F961 60/1.5OZ 12 YES $12.26 NO BID N/B No Bid

HORMEL 139 ROAST BEEF 15834 6/2 LB 8 YES $64.70 NO BID N/B No Bid

INNOVASIAN 140 WHITE STICKY RICE 29901 12/2 lb 4 YES $47.67 NO BID N/B No Bid

J&J SNACK 141 COCOA CHIP BAR 40406 48/2.5OZ 50 YES $18.18 YES $17.11 $17.66 No Bid

J&J SNACK 142 BREAKFAST BAR OAT CHOC CHIP BNFT 40401 48/2.5OZ 1,233 YES $18.18 YES $21.26 $17.35 No Bid

JOHN SOULES FOODS 143 CHICKEN POPCORN BREAST PATTIES  43057-WG 4/5LBS 120 YES $43.98 NO BID $41.52 yes $42.10

JOHN SOULES FOODS 144 CHICKEN TENDER LIGHT BREADED 63330-WG 4/5LBS 120 YES $63.30 NO BID $60.00 yes $60.70

JOHN SOULES FOODS 145 CHICKEN FILLETS SPICY BREADED 60425-WG 4/5LBS 120 YES $67.84 NO BID $64.35 yes $65.20

JOHN SOULES FOODS 146 CHICKEN GRILLED BREAST STRIPS 13308 116/20 LBS 48 YES $72.39 NO BID $68.70 yes $69.20

JTM 147 OATMEAL STEEL CUT W/BROWN SUGAR 5950 6/5LBS 2 YES $55.98 YES $51.85 N/B No Bid

KEEBLER 148 GRAHAM ORIGINAL 30100-91829 150/1OZ 160 YES $16.33 YES $16.93 3010091822 2093213  150/3 CT $17.76 No Bid

KEEBLER 149 GRAHAM CRACKER JURASSIC 30100-12027 210/1.09OZ 15 YES $44.01 YES $41.35 $48.17 No Bid

KELLOGG 150 CEREAL APPLE JCK RED SUGAR BWLPK 38000/78787 96/1OZ 750 YES $26.26 YES $26.35 $30.67 No Bid

KELLOGG 151 CEREAL CORN FLAKES 38000-00196 96/.75 OZ 10 YES $26.26 YES $26.55 $29.67 No Bid

KELLOGG 152 CEREAL FROOT LOOPS RED SUG 38000/78788 96/1OZ 132 YES $26.26 YES $26.55 $30.67 No Bid

KELLOGG 153 CEREAL FROSTED FLAKES RED SUG 38000/54998 96/1OZ 181 YES $26.26 YES $26.28 444606  96/1 OZ. $29.67 No Bid

KELLOGG 154 RICE KRISPIES MINI SNACK BAR 38000/51109 600 30 YES $79.79 YES $80.24 $84.73 No Bid

KELLOGG 155 RICE KRISPIES MINI SNACK BAR WG 38000/11052 80/1.41OZ 74 YES $33.15 YES $33.14 $35.15 No Bid

KELLOGG 156 POP TART CHOC 1439116 72/3.52OZ 48 YES $34.28 YES $33.47 3800012073 3491034  72/3.52OZ N/B No Bid

KELLOGG 157 POP TART STRAWBERRY FRSTD 38000-55130 120/1.76OZ 40 YES $40.20 YES $39.95 $42.87 No Bid

KELLOGG 158 CRACKERS ZESTA SALTINE 30100-01446 300/4 PK 2 YES $16.59 NO BID $18.55 No Bid

KELLOGG 159 CEREAL RAISIN BRAN 38000-00896 96/1OZ 120 YES $26.26 YES $27.33 19.33 Alt. Malt-O-Meal #0715  96/1oz No Bid student-approved

KELLOGG 160 CEREAL RICE KRISPIES WG BOWL PK 38000-78789 96/1OZ 154 YES $26.26 YES $26.85 N/B No Bid



KELLOGG 161 CEREAL FROSTED MINI WHEATS 38000-04996 96/1OZ 700 YES $26.26 YES $26.85 17.37 Alt. Malt-O-Meal #27177  96/1oz No Bid student-approved

KELLOGG 162 WG CHEEZ-IT CRACKERS IW 24100-79263 175/.75OZ 210 YES $33.95 YES $33.68 N/B No Bid

KENS 163 DRESS ASIAN SEMANE IW 1145B3 60/1.5OZ 17 YES $15.78 YES $14.62 N/B No Bid

KENS 164 DRESS HONEY MUSTARD 0634A1 100/1OZ 13 YES $16.14 YES $14.95 N/B No Bid

KIDS KOOKIE 165 COOKIE SPRING EGG ASSORTED IW 9012 144/.7OZ 40 YES $27.39 YES $26.68 $26.20 yes $28.00

KIDS KOOKIE 166 COOKIE JACK O' LANTERN IW 9030 160/.7OZ 40 YES $30.23 YES $29.21 $28.90 yes $31.00

KIDS KOOKIE 167 COOKIE VALENTINE IW 9050 160/.7OZ 40 YES $30.23 YES $29.21 $28.90 yes $31.00

KIDS KOOKIE 168 COOKIE HOLIDAY WREATH IW 9082 168/.7OZ 40 YES $31.59 YES $30.80 $30.22 yes $33.00

KIDS KOOKIE 169 COOKIE SHAMROCK IW 9045 152/.7OZ 40 YES $28.98 YES $27.95 $27.72 yes $30.00

KIDS KOOKIE 170 COOKIE RED APPLE IW 9110 140/0.7OZ 40 YES $26.93 YES $31.44 $25.76 yes $28.00

KRUSTEAZ 171 WAFFLES BELGIAN 10368/382162 72/2.5OZ 143 YES $31.61 NO BID N/B No Bid

LA BREA 172 BREAD SLICED GLUTEN FREE 
MULTIGRAIN

827305/636839 8/13OZ 6 YES $86.60 NO BID N/B No Bid

LA VENCEDORA 173 CHIPS EL RANCHO TORTILLA ELR-150 150/2OZ 380 YES $25.57 NO BID N/B No Bid

LA VICTORIA 174 SALSA PICANTE MILD 7808 4/1 GL 2 YES $38.14 NO BID N/B No Bid

LAYS 175 BAKED POTATO CHIPS 44396 64/1.125 oz 6 YES $29.93 YES $27.12 N/B No Bid

LAWRYS 176 SEASONING MIX TACO NO MSG 2150080110 6/9OZ 8 YES $16.90 KENT PRECISION FOOD GROUP 202875  6/9OZ YES $1.04 N/B No Bid

LEGOUT 177 GRAVY BROWN HEAT & SERVE 3750060063 12/#5 CAN 6 YES $39.92 YES $36.98 N/B No Bid

LAND OF LAKES 178 CHEESE STRING MOZZ 59701 168/1OZ 320 YES $30.20 YES $32.61 59701000034500 5274891  168/1 OZ N/B No Bid

LOS CABOS/MCI 179 BURRITO BEEF BEAN TVP WG 63540 48/5.2OZ 4 YES $33.20 NO BID $32.12 No Bid

MARZETTI 180 RANCH DRESSING 81903 120/1OZ 24 YES $15.06 NO BID N/B No Bid

MARZETTI 181 ITALIAN DRESSING IW 81979 60/1.5 oz 2 YES $9.69 NO BID N/B No Bid

MARZETTI 182 CREAMY CAESAR DRESSING IW 82000 60/1.5 oz 12 YES $12.23 YES $14.64 N/B No Bid

MARZETTI 183 ROTINI GLUTEN FREE WG 4130831400 24/4OZ 4 YES $26.43 NO BID N/B No Bid

MCI LOS CABOS 184 CHICKEN & WAFFLE SANDWICH 41800 52/5.70OZ 327 YES $69.63 YES $66.73 $66.80 yes $66.26

MICHAEL B'S 185 TAQUITOS WG CHICKEN IW CTB43W 50/4.4OZ 342 YES $59.58 YES $53.31 $49.53 yes $48.87

MICHAEL B'S 186 TAQUITOS WG BEEF IW BTB61W 50/4.4OZ 228 YES $59.58 YES $53.31 $49.53 yes $48.87

MICHAEL B'S 187 BEAN AND CHILE TAMALE (VEGAN) VBC11 72/6.36OZ 4 YES $73.64 YES $66.59 $60.96 yes $62.98

MINH 188 WG 100% VEG FRIED RICE 69074 6/5LBS BAGS 188 YES $54.14 YES $51.09 N/B yes $53.14

MJM 189 GRAHAM CRACKER APLCIN BEAR OZ 403001 300/2CT 160 YES $36.58 YES $37.11 N/B No Bid

MJM 190 GRAHAM CRACKER CHOC BEAR IW 1OZ 402001 300/2CT 60 YES $36.58 YES $37.11 N/B No Bid

MJM 191 GRAHAM CRACKER BERRY BEAR 401001 300/2CT 80 YES $36.58 NO BID N/B No Bid

MJM 192 GRAHAM CRACKER CHOC SPORTS BITE 512150 150/1OZ 64 YES $25.27 YES $27.53 N/B No Bid

MJM 193 GRAHAM CRACKER CINNAMON 308151 150/3CT 80 YES $16.30 YES $18.47 N/B No Bid

MJM 194 GRAHAM CRACKER HONEY W/ FIBER 300151 150/3CT 80 YES $16.14 YES $17.84 N/B No Bid

MJM 195 GRAHAM CRACKER MAPLE WFFL 1OZ 408001 300/2CT 80 YES $36.58 YES $37.05 N/B No Bid

MJM 196 GRAHAM CRACKER STRBY WFFL 1OZ 405001 300/2CT 80 YES $36.58 YES $37.05 N/B No Bid

MJM 197 GRAHAM CRACKER VAN BEAR 2CT 404001 300/1OZ 80 YES $36.58 YES $37.11 N/B No Bid

MJM 198 GRAHAM CRACKER SUNRISE BITE 570150 150/1OZ 2 YES $23.10 YES $26.21 N/B No Bid

MR SIPPS 199 BREAD SLICED GLUTEN FREE 300156/544552 24/1.5OZ 4 YES $11.13 YES $10.29 N/B yes $11.79

MR SIPPS 200 PIZZA CHZ GLUTEN FREE 300151/542958 24/6.7OZ 6 YES $46.33 YES $42.37 N/B yes $46.77

MR SIPPS 201 PIZZA PEPP GLUTEN FREE 300153/545658 24/7.1OZ 6 YES $50.68 NO BID N/B yes $50.60

MR SIPPS 202  CHICKEN CHUNKS GLUTEN FREE 300152/542934 12/5.5OZ 12 YES $32.97 NO BID N/B yes $32.90

MR SIPPS 203 HAMBURGER BUN IW GLUTEN FREE 300155/544551 24/3.6OZ 6 YES $29.03 YES $22.37 N/B yes $25.00

MR SIPPS 204  BREAD SLICE IW GLUTEN FREE 300156/544552 24/1.5OZ 8 YES $11.13 YES $10.29 N/B yes $11.79

NIAGARA 205 SPRING WATER RTD NDW80Z2X2PSPC 48/8OZ 24 YES $9.94 + CRVNESTLE WATERS (ARROWHEAD)201666  48/8OZ YES $9.35 N/B No Bid

NWMNOWN 206 DRESSING RANCH DIP CUP 18521-SYS 128/1.5OZ 12 YES $19.65 KEN'S FOODS 240075  100/1.5OZ YES $22.06 N/B No Bid

OCEAN SPRAY 207 CRAISINS DRIED WATERMELON 22044 200/1.6OZ 360 YES $45.45 YES $45.79 $47.28 yes $47.20

OCEAN SPRAY 208 CRAISINS DRIED STRAWBERRY 23445 200/1.16OZ 326 YES $45.45 YES $45.31 $47.28 yes $47.20

OLD TOWN BAKERY 209 CINNAMON ROLL CIN3.5 72/3.5OZ 6
YES $35.98 YES $33.85 $33.87 yes $34.46

OLD TOWN BAKERY 210 FRENCH TOAST STICK BULK 138009 5/2LBS 272
YES $18.78 NO BID N/B No Bid

OVENFRESH 211 BUN HAMBURGER 100% WH 4" FRZN 61009 6/12CT 72 YES $38.55 FREUND BAKING COMPANY 112952  144CT YES $19.34 N/B No Bid



PACIFIC 212 MILK SOY PLAIN W/STRAW 8311 24/8OZ 300 NO BID YES $16.38 N/B No Bid

PACIFIC SPICE 213 GROUND CINNAMON CIG12I 1 LB 2 YES $6.30 YES $61.39 974254 5228606  6/15 OZ N/B No Bid

PACIFIC SPICE 214 GROUND ITALIAN SEASONING ITG12I 1 LB 2 YES $5.45 YES $23.31 901216567 3492784  6/6 OZ N/B No Bid

PACIFIC SPICE 215 GARLIC SALT GAS12I 19 OZ 2 YES $4.01 YES $54.06 900010350 9806456  6/41.25Z N/B No Bid

PACIFIC SPICE 216 SEASONING SALT SEAS12I 1 LB 2 YES $3.92 YES $25.77 900018590 6920326  2/4.5 LB N/B No Bid

PACIFIC SPICE 217 SESAME SEEDS SESH121 24OZ 10 YES $4.49 YES $33.06 900950261 2473132  6/16 OZ N/B No Bid

PEPPERIDGE FARM 218 CRACKER GOLDFISH WG 18105 300/.75OZ 240 YES $50.71 YES $50.42 $54.08 yes $54.50

PEPPERIDGE FARM 219 CRACKER GOLDFISH HOT 'N SPICY 
CHEDDAR WG

17330 300/.75OZ 240 YES $46.95 YES $46.57 $50.27 yes $50.25

PEPPERIDGE FARM 220 CRACKER GOLDFISH COLORS WG 4788 300/.75OZ 240 YES $50.71 YES $50.13 $54.08 yes $54.50

PEPPERIDGE FARM 221 CRACKER GOLDFISH FRENCH TOAST 25082 300/1 OZ 24 YES $59.78 YES $60.27 $64.60 yes $65.43

PEPPERIDGE FARM 222 CRACKER GOLDFISH HONEY BUN WG 25083 300/1 OZ 24 YES $59.78 YES $60.27 $64.60 yes $65.43

P.K. KINDER CO. 223 BBQ SAUCE MILD 15911 4/1GL 20 YES $31.53 YES $28.16 N/B No Bid

KRAFT 224 CREAM CHEESE POUCHES IW 377728/61120 100/1OZ 46 YES $23.35 NO BID N/B No Bid

PILLSBURY 225 MINI WAFFLE BLUEBERRY SPLSH 32264 72/2.47OZ 44 YES $28.85 YES $28.31 $28.79 No Bid

POSADA 226 TAQUITO CHICKEN SHR 46580011 140/1.74OZ 44 YES $42.76 YES $38.91 N/B No Bid

QUAKER 227 LS RICE CAKES 395847 12/4.47 oz 24 YES $25.27 NO BID N/B No Bid

QUAKER 228 CEREAL HOT OAT ROLLED BUCKEYE 20124 50 LBS 1 YES $25.98 YES $22.09 N/B No Bid

QUAKER 229 OATMEAL INSTANT OATS LOOSE PK 43661/345729 168/.98 oz 10 YES $8.36 YES $7.85 N/B No Bid

QUAKER 230 OATMEAL OLD FASHION 43293 12/42OZ 12 YES $32.36 YES $32.53 23527621425 8563280  12/42 OZ N/B No Bid

ROSATI 231 ICE CUP CHILL BAT ORANGE 77222-35473 90/4.4OZ 90 YES $30.68 YES $31.82 $30.43 yes $29.95

ROSATI 232 ICE CUP EMOJI 77222-35488 90/4.4OZ 90 YES $30.68 YES $30.23 $30.43 yes $29.95

ROSATI 233 ICE GIVIN' THANKS 77222-35486 90/4.4OZ 90 YES $30.68 YES $30.23 $30.43 yes $29.95

ROSATI 234 ICE HAPPY NEW YEAR 77222-35478 90/4.40OZ 90 YES $30.68 YES $32.25 $30.43 yes $29.95

ROSATI 235 ICE SWEET HEART CHERRY 77222-35470 90/4.4OZ 90 YES $30.68 YES $30.91 $30.43 yes $29.95

ROSATI 236 ICE LUCK O' 77222-35475 90/4.4OZ 90 YES $30.68 YES $31.15 $30.43 yes $29.95

ROSATI 237 ICE HIP HOPPIN TROPICAL FRUIT 77222-35474 90/4.4OZ 90 YES $30.68 YES $28.84 $30.43 yes $29.95

ROSATI 238 SNO JOE WILD BERRY 77222-35468 90/4.4OZ 90 YES $30.68 YES $32.33 $30.43 yes $29.95

ROSATI 239 ICE WATERMELON FRUIT FREEZE 448-WM-FJ 90/4.4OZ 90 YES $30.68 NO BID $30.43 No Bid

RUFFLES 240 CHIP POTATO CRISPS CHDR SO/CRM 56882 60/.08OZ 3 YES $18.12 YES $17.18 N/B No Bid

RUIZ 241 ROLLED TACO EGG & CHS CN 1096 50/2.5OZ 24 YES $23.86 YES $23.96 $21.20 No Bid

RUIZ 242 ROLLED TACO EGG CHS SAUS 1525 50/2.5OZ 24 YES $23.86 YES $20.95 $21.20 No Bid

RUIZ 243 TACO SOFT CHKN RED 45/5.12OZ 1468 24 YES $41.76 YES $39.40 $39.32 No Bid

RUIZ 244 TORNADO EGG TKY SAUS CHEESE 144/3OZ 6969 24 YES $81.82 YES $78.06 $76.63 No Bid

RUIZ 245 TORNADO MAPLE SAUS & EGG 144/3OZ 6830 24 YES $81.82 YES $78.06 $76.63 No Bid

SABRA 246 CLASSIC HUMMUS SINGLES 01111/524936 48/2OZ 75 YES $24.00 NO BID N/B No Bid

SABRA 247 TACO HUMMUS 34474 48/2.1OZ 75 YES $24.00 YES $27.28 N/B No Bid

SHANNONS 248 APPLE BEAR PAW SB-70055 72/3oz 12 YES $38.64 YES $32.22 $36.41 yes $35.90

SHANNONS 249 STRAWBERRY BEAR PAW SB-70060 72/3OZ 12 YES $40.16 YES $33.73 $37.87 yes $37.54

SIMPLOT 250 GREEN BEANS (FROZEN) 10071179180395 12/2 LB 6 YES $22.66 YES $20.84 N/B No Bid

SIMPLOT 251 PEAS AND DICED CARROTS (FROZEN) 1007117918855 12/40 oz 6 YES $27.27 YES $25.08 N/B No Bid

SIMPLOT 252 DAIL PICK CALIFORNIA BLEND 10071179034391 1/20 LB 6 YES $19.16 NO BID N/B No Bid

SKY BLUE FOODS 253 PUMPKIN BREAD WBSPK270 96/2.5OZ 12 YES $36.70 YES $35.53 $34.57 yes $36.35

SKY BLUE FOODS 254 WG CORN BREAD LOAF IW CBLD296 96/2.5OZ 60 YES $31.82 YES $30.97 $29.89 yes $30.90

SMART CHOICE 255 SUN WISE SANDWICH STRAWBERRY 12258 96/2.8OZ 288 YES $66.13 NO BID $66.13 yes $66.84

SMART FOODS 256 CHICKEN NUGGET WINTER 
WONDERLAND

63355-9 213/.75OZ 120 YES $28.07 NO BID N/B yes $33.45

SMART FOODS 257 CHICKEN NUGGET ABC 63354-9 213/.75OZ 240 YES $28.07 NO BID N/B yes $33.45

SMART FOODS 258 CHICKEN NUGGET SOUTHWEST SHAPED 63359-9 213/.75OZ 120 YES $28.07 NO BID N/B yes $33.45

SMART FOODS 259 CHICKEN NUGGET TURKEY SHAPED 63309-9 213/.75OZ 120 YES $28.07 NO BID N/B yes $33.45

SMART FOODS 260 CHICKEN NUGGET BAT 63307-9 213/.75OZ 120 YES $28.07 NO BID N/B yes $33.45

SMART FOODS 261 CHICKEN NUGGET HEART 63356-9 213/.75OZ 120 YES $28.07 NO BID N/B yes $33.45

SMART FOODS 262 CHICKEN NUGGET STAR 63357-9 213/.75OZ 120 YES $28.07 NO BID N/B yes $33.45

SMART FOODS 263 HUG NOT DRUGS 51% WG CINN SNACK 57077 200/1OZ 64 YES $28.07 NO BID N/B No Bid



SMART FOODS 264 WG 51% WINTER CINN SNACK 57073 200/1OZ 112 YES $28.07 NO BID N/B No Bid

SMART FOODS 265 WG CINNGRAHAM TROLL SNACK 57070 200/1OZ 6 YES $28.07 NO BID N/B No Bid

SUNBUTTER 266 SUNBUTTER CREAMY CUPS 612556/19426 140/2.2OZ 128 YES $70.00 YES $64.84 $66.96 No Bid

SUNBUTTER 267 SUNBUTTER CREAMY CUPS 598196/19368 200/1.1OZ 128 YES $56.36 YES $56.84 $58.70 No Bid

SUNCHIP 268 CHIP SUN GARDEN SALSA 36445 104/1OZ 250 YES $32.84 YES $29.78 N/B No Bid

SUNCHIP 269 CHIP SUN HARVST CHDR MULTIGRAIN 11152 104/1OZ 222 YES $32.84 YES $29.78 N/B No Bid

SUNOPTA 270 SUNFLOWER KERNEL HONEY ROSTED 1231780 150/1.2OZ 64 YES $27.97 YES $26.80 N/B yes $28.26

SUNOPTA 271 SUNFLOWER KERNAL BLAZIN HOT 1231781 150/1.2OZ 64 YES $34.13 NO BID N/B yes $34.28

SUNOPTA 272 SUNFLOWER KERNAL ROASTED & 
SALTED

1105050 150/1.0OZ 64 YES $24.99 YES $23.89 N/B yes $25.20

SYS CLS 273 POTATO PEARL EXCEL 76468 12/28OZ 120 YES $43.88 YES $53.40 3327848 3327848  12/28 OZ N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 274 APPLESAUCE FCY UNSWEETENED 4062030 6/#10 CAN 12 YES $25.28 SENECA FOODS/CHIQUITA 248437  6/#10 YES $23.30 N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 275 FRUIT MIX DICE CH JUICE 4587432 6/#10 CAN 12 YES $33.52 BUONA FORTUNA FOODS 210241  6/#10 YES $43.78 N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 276 PEACH DICED CH EXTRA LS 2181705 6/#10 CAN 12 YES $39.88DEL MONTE FOODS (SAGER CRK/ALLENS)248372  6/#10 YES $37.89 N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 277 THICKENER FOOD 3327 25LBS 4 YES $41.92 KENT PRECISION FOOD GROUP 208223  12/10OZ YES $63.89 N/B No Bid Not interested in alternate

SYS CLS 278 SOUP CHICK TORTILLA 2880755 4/4LBS 18 YES $47.15 CAMPBELL'S 141107  4/4LB YES $46.94 748656051300 2880755  4/4 LB N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 279 SOUP CREAM OF POTATO CONC 35556 3/4LBS 18 YES $28.07 CAMPBELL'S 100250  3/4LB YES $23.01 N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 280 APPLESAUCE IN JUICE CUP FCASU8000SYS 72/4OZ 200 YES $20.95 MOTT'S U.S.A. 209163  72/4.5OZ YES $21.38 N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 281 GREEN BEAN CUT 4062378 6/ #10 CAN 12 YES $21.59 SENECA FOODS/CHIQUITA 239232  6/#10 YES $22.40 N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 282 PUREE BEEF W/ BROTH 815PB-SIM 12/15OZ 6 YES $32.23KENT PRECISION FOODS/FOOTHILL209217  12/16OZ YES $56.57 N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 283 BROTH CHICKEN 2906028 12/49OZ 6 YES $36.42 CAMPBELL FOODSERVICE CO. 209230  12/49OZ YES $36.73 550EC-SYS 5568241  12/49 OZ N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 284 CARROT DICED FCY 11548 6/#10 12 YES $22.99 SENECA FOODS/CHIQUITA 200314  6/#10 YES $22.99 F4109724 4109724  6/#10 N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 285 PEAR DICED CH EXTRA LS 9153300904 6/#10 CAN 12 YES $40.47DEL MONTE FOODS (SAGER CRK/ALLENS)248501  6/#10 YES $39.14 734730425290 2182091  6/#10 N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 286 PORK CHOP BONELESS CENTER CUT-4 OZ 5741580 40/4 oz 6 NO BID YES $34.92 N/B No Bid

SYS CLS 287 PAN COATING ARSL CONC 3473055810 6/17OZ 4 YES $15.73 CONAGRA FOODS 209378  6/17OZ YES $19.17 N/B No Bid

TAJIN 288 TAJIAN PACKETS 28805 1000/0.035OZ 500 YES $42.31 $41.84 N/B No Bid

TAPATIO 289 TAPATIO HOT SAUCE PACKET 77885001934 500/7GR 500 YES $24.76 YES $29.80 5032149  500/7 GR N/B No Bid

TASTE PLEASER GOURMET 290 DRESSING BUTTERMILK RANCH IW 7160372298400 100/1.5OZ 60 YES $14.67 NO BID N/B No Bid

TEASDALE 291 GARBANZO BEANS TEA-FB-1230 12/15OZ 8 YES $13.06 YES $12.08 N/B No Bid

TEASDALE 292 VEGETARIAN REFRIED BEANS TEA-RGV-0610 6/#10 16 YES $20.30 YES $26.57 F5882311 5882311  6/#10 N/B No Bid

THE MAX 293 PANCAKES W/BLUEBERRY GLAZE IW 94643-04443 80/3OZ 45 YES $31.14 YES $28.84 $29.78 yes $29.94

THE MAX 294 PANCAKE W/ GLAZE IW 94643-04442 80/3OZ 135 YES $29.77 YES $27.58 $28.48 yes $28.64

TYSON 295 CHICKEN DICED 3/8 CKD SEL 46012-0928 2/5LBS 4 YES $32.86 YES $32.42 N/B No Bid

UDIS 296 PLAIN 8' TORTILLA GLUTEN FREE 576689/UGF807171 60/2.5OZ 2 YES $43.00 NO BID N/B No Bid

UDIS 297 MUFFIN BLUEBERRY GLUTEN FREE IW 80660/565431 36/3OZ 3 YES $29.22 NO BID N/B No Bid

UNCLE BENS 298 RICE CHICKEN FLAVOR 543835-45532 6/24OZ 44 YES $34.89 YES $31.59 $33.52 No Bid

VANEE 299 PUREE CHICKEN W/ BROTH 815PC-SIM 12/12OZ 3 NO BID YES $27.75 N/B No Bid

WARNOCK 300 TOSTADA SHELL BOWL 5.5 RECT 21303 200/EA 261 YES $28.18 ROMERO'S FOOD PRODUCTS 203170  8/25 CT YES $20.08 $20.25 yes $21.30

WARNOCK 301 TOSTADA BOWL SMALL ROUND 6" WG 21305R 144/36G 24 YES $28.18 ROMERO'S FOOD PRODUCTS 203170  8/25 CT YES $35.80 $33.34 yes $35.05

WAWONA 302 FRUIT MIX BRY BLEND IQF 4453 2/5LBS 85 YES $21.07 YES $20.63 N/B No Bid

WHLFCLS 303 BUTTER SOLID UNSLTD AA 310522 30/1LBS 2 YES $111.34 R. W. ZANT CO. 305674  36/1LB YES $145.40 N/B No Bid

WILD MIKES 304 MAPLE STICK PIZZA IW 11005 112/1.4OZ 188 YES $32.61 YES NO BID N/B No Bid

YOPLAIT 305 YOGURT RASPBERRY RNBOW TRIX 70470-17725 48/4OZ 100 YES $12.86 YES $12.56 $13.32 No Bid

YOPLAIT 306 YOGURT STRAW/BAN BLAST TRIX 70470-17726 48/4OZ 100 YES $12.86 YES $12.56 $13.32 No Bid

YOPLAIT 307 YOGURT CHERRY TRIX TRIPLE 70470-31077 48/4OZ 100 YES $12.30 YES $12.56 $13.32 No Bid

YOPLAIT 308 YOGURT VANILLA PARFAIT POUCH 70470-16632 6/64OZ 106 YES $25.86 YES $25.78 $26.87 No Bid

YOPLAIT 309 GO BIG YOGURT STRAWBERRY 47402 48/4OZ 1,000 YES $16.76 YES $17.52 $17.77 No Bid

YOPLAIT 310 GO BIG YOGURT BLUEBERRY 70470-14914 48/4OZ 400 YES $16.76 YES $16.38 $17.77 No Bid

YOPLAIT 311 YOGURT STRAWBERRY POUCH 70470-16631 6/64OZ 300 YES $25.86 YES $25.46 $26.87 No Bid


