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1 1000 EA CAN LINER, 10 GALLON, 15" X 9" X 23" 1.5 MIL., CLEAR OR WHITE EA EA 2423L 1000 8.85 0.00885 EA 2423XH-
AAP

500  $           27.30 EA NB EA INT-2424-R, 1,000/Case $14.82 $14.82  0.0148 No Bid EA N/B EA CP1592
3NXH

1000 $23.00 $0.02300 EA

2 500 EA CAN LINER, 12‐16 GALLON, 23" X 33", HEAVY DUTY, 1.5 MIL., CLEAR OR WHITE EA EA
2433H 500 11.8

0.0236 EA 2333XH-
AAP 500  $           39.18 

EA NB EA
INT-2433-R, 500/Case $13.48 

$13.48  0.0269
No Bid

EA N/B EA CP2333
NXH 500 $29.10

$0.05820 EA

3 20 / 50/ROLL CAN LINER, 12‐16 GALLON, 24" X 33", 8 MIC, NATURAL, CLEAR OR WHITE EA EA 24332 1000 12.2 0.0122 EA 243308-
AAP

1000  $           24.33 EA NB EA INT-2433-R, 1,000/Case $15.84 $15.84  0.0158 No Bid EA N/B EA CP2433
N8

1000 $18.00 $0.01800 EA

4 CAN LINER, 20‐30 GALL, 30" X 37", 16 MIC, NATURAL CLEAR EA EA 37M 500 16.8 0.0336 EA 303716-
AAP

500  $           32.61 EA NB EA INT-3037-Med 500/Case $20.84 $20.84  0.0416 No Bid EA N/B EA CP3037
N16

500 $25.10 $0.05020 EA

5 20 / 25 EA /ROLL CAN LINER, 33 GALLON, 33" X 40", 13 MIC, HEAVY DUTY, CLEAR OR WHITE EA EA 40H 500 17.25 0.0345 EA 334013-
AAP

500  $           31.46 EA NB EA INT-3340-H 500/Case $23.84 $23.84  0.0476 No Bid EA 103949 500 32.53 0.65 EA CP3340
N13

500 $21.80 $0.04360 EA

6 100 EA CAN LINER, 45‐55 GALLON, 43" X 47" HEAVY DUTY 1.5 MIL., ANY COLOR EA EA 4347XH 100 12.9 0.129 EA 4347XH-
AAP

100  $           14.34 EA NB EA INT-4347-X-Hvy 100/Case $17.82 $17.82  0.1782 No Bid EA N/B EA CP4347
KXH

100 $17.10 $0.17100 EA

7 5 / 20 EA /ROLL CAN LINER, JADCORE, 40‐45 GALL, 40" X 46", 2.0 MIL EA EA UPC 462 100 16.5 0.165 EA 4046XXH-
AAP

100  $           17.58 EA NB EA INT-4046-
Exh 100/Case $23.32 $23.32  0.2332 No Bid EA N/B EA CP4046

K2
100 $22.80 $0.22800 EA

8 100 EA CAN LINER, JADCORE, 46" X 50", 62 GALL, BLACK, 1.5 MIL EA EA UPC 502 100 15.75 0.1575 EA 4650XH-
AAP

100  $           16.33 EA NB EA INT-4650-
Exh 100/Case $23.48 $23.48  0.2348 No Bid EA N/B EA CP4650

KXH
100 $22.10 $0.22100 EA

9 250 EA CAN LINER, WAXED PAPER FEMININE HYGIENE EA HOSPECO #KL260 500/CS 14.08 0.02816 EA EA EA NB EA EA No Bid EA 100407 250 18.4 0.0736 EA EA

10 12 / 17 OZ AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL OZ CHASE #433-4113 *12 CANS/CS 28.99 0.16105 OZ OZ OZ NB OZ OZ No Bid OZ 100182 12 33.7 0.1404 OZ OZ

11 12 / 8 OZ. AIR FRESHNER REFILL, NON‐AEROSOL PUMP, ANY SCENT OZ OZ OZ OZ NB OZ OZ No Bid OZ 103049 12 84.4 0.8791 OZ OZ

12 6 / 1 GALLON BLEACH, GENERAL PURPOSE (5.25%) GAL GAL GAL GAL NB GAL GAL No Bid GAL 101353 6 13.67 2.2791 GAL GAL

13 12 / 1 QT CARPET SSE PRESPRAY & SPOTTER QT QT QT QT NB QT QT No Bid QT 100168 12 22.02 1.8352 QT QT

14 4 / 1 GALLON CLEAR SHINE RTU *no substitutions* Pride Enterprises 64400600 GAL GAL GAL GAL NB GAL GAL 64400600 4x1 Gal $10.84 $2.71 GAL N/B GAL GAL

15 4 / 1 GALLON BLUE ALL PURPOSE CLEANER *no substitutions* Victoria Bay D01013 GAL GAL GAL GAL NB GAL GAL No Bid GAL N/B GAL GAL

16 24 / 21 OZ COMET BATHROOM CLEANER POWDER OZ BABO #P752088 24 CANS/CS 22.15 0.04394 OZ OZ OZ NB OZ OZ No Bid OZ 100544 24 33.03 0.0655 OZ OZ

17 4 / 2 L DISINFECTANT, hdqC2 NEUTRAL CONCENTRATE FOR CLEAN ON THE GO SYSTEM LITER LITER LITER LITER NB LITER LITER
No Bid

LITER
103760 4 32.21

4.0264 LITER LITER

18 12 / 1 QT. DISINFECTANT, NABC, FLORAL SCENT QT     QT QT QT NB QT QT No Bid QT 100173 12 21.31 1.7764 QT QT

19 12 / 24 OZ DISINFECTANT LYSOL I.C. , FOAMING OZ LYSOL #RAC02775 12 CANS/CS 37.98 0.131875 OZ OZ OZ NB OZ OZ No Bid OZ 103578 12 40.16 0.1394 OZ OZ

20 12 / 32 OZ DISINFECTANT, OXIVIR AHP (SPRAY BOTTLE) OZ DIVERSEY (OXIVIR12 BOTTLES/CS 63.36 0.165 OZ OZ OZ NB OZ OZ No Bid OZ 104577 12 47.44 3.9533 OZ OZ

21 12 / 32 OZ DRAIN & SEWER, BLOC‐AID LIQUID OZ ZEP #MR1041423 12 BOTTLES/CS 69.5 0.1809 OZ OZ OZ NB OZ OZ 64404600 12x1 Qt $14.88 $1.24 OZ 100180 12 28.9 0.0747 OZ OZ

22 5 GALLON FLOOR STRIPPER GAL GAL GAL GAL NB GAL GAL 64600400 5 Gal $23.50 $4.70 GAL 100023 1 43.36 8.672 GAL GAL

23 5 GALLON FLOOR WAX WITH 36% SOLIDS GAL GAL GAL GAL NB GAL GAL 64602000 5 Gal $84.65 $16.93 GAL 100139 1 59 11.8 GAL GAL

24 12 / 15 OZ FURNITURE CLEANER, FOAMING OZ CHASE #433-4109 *12 CANS/CS 28.8 0.12 OZ OZ OZ NB OZ OZ No Bid OZ 100186 12 32.92 0.1371 OZ OZ

25 4 / 1 GALLON GLASS CLEANER WITH AMMONIA GAL GAL GAL GAL NB GAL GAL 64400600 4x1 Gal $10.84 $2.71 GAL 100104 4 21.85 5.4625 GAL GAL

26 GUM AND WAX REMOVER OZ CHASE #433-4107 *12 CANS/CS 24.48 0.34 OZ OZ OZ NB OZ OZ No Bid OZ 100188 12 48.87 0.3702 OZ OZ

27 QT HARD SURFACE AND GLASS, FAST AND EASY *no substitutions, IN QUARTS ONLY* 
SPARTAN 326204

QT QT QT QT NB QT QT No Bid QT 100163 12 21.49 1.79 QT QT

28 4 / 1 GALLON HEAVY DUTY LIME FREE DELIMING SOLUTION GAL GAL GAL GAL NB GAL GAL 64100300 4x1 Gal $20.36 $5.09 GAL 100294 4 37.37 9.3441 GAL GAL

29 4 / 1 GALLON LIQUID OVEN AND GRILL, RTU GAL GAL GAL GAL NB GAL GAL 64403600 4x1 Gal $10.44 $2.61 GAL 100087 4 38.15 9.5382 GAL GAL

30 4 / 1 GALLON CLEANER, MULTI SURFACE, SHINELINE GAL GAL GAL GAL NB GAL GAL 64404800 4x1 Gal $4.92 $1.23 GAL 101454 4 27.54 6.8852 GAL GAL

31 4 / 1 GALLON NON‐BUFF METAL INTERLOCK FLOOR FINISH, ON AN' ON GAL GAL GAL GAL NB GAL GAL No Bid GAL 100140 4 51.14 12.785 GAL GAL

32 12 / 1 QT FLOOR SOLUTION, SPRAY BUFF PRO QT QT QT QT NB QT QT 64600500 12x1 Qt $18.25 $1.5208 QT 102885 12 24.27 2.0225 QT QT

33 12 / 20 OZ STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER, SUPERIOR HIGH SHINE OZ CHASE #433-4111 *12 CANS/CS 28.29 0.1309 OZ OZ OZ NB OZ OZ 64402900 12x1 Qt $43.40 $3.6166 OZ 100475 12 48.49 0.202 OZ OZ

34 18 / 56 EA WYPALL ALL PURPOSE WIPES, POP‐UP CANISTER *no substitutions* EA WYPALL #KCC057 18 BX/CS 80.04 0.0794 EA EA EA NB EA EA No Bid EA 100423 1008 63.2 0.0626 EA EA

35 6 / 70 EA CLEANER, WIPES, BLEACH BASED (NON‐ALCOHOL) GERMICIDAL PURPOSE WIPES, 
POP‐UP CANISTER

EA CLOROX #CLO15946 CANS/CS 35.55 0.079 EA EA EA NB EA EA
No Bid

EA
104220 12 32.97

2.748 EA EA

36 12 / 15 OZ DISINFECTANT AEROSOL, END BAC II OZ END BAC II #DVO012 CANS/CS 70.2 0.39 OZ OZ OZ NB OZ OZ No Bid OZ 100248 12 66.21 0.3678 OZ OZ

37 12 / 20 OZ DISINFECTANT AEROSOL, STERIPHENE II., SPRING BREEZE SCENT OZ CHASE #433-4104 12 CANS/CS 28.71 0.145 OZ OZ OZ NB OZ OZ No Bid OZ 105004 12 37.96 0.1581 OZ OZ

38 12 EA TOILET BOWL BLOCK WITH HANGER, CHERRY SCENT EA FRESH #3BBP 12 EA/CS 7.42 0.6183 EA EA EA NB EA EA No Bid EA 102839 12 7.12 0.5931 EA EA

39 12 EA URINAL BLOCK, CHERRY SCENT, PARA DICHLOROBENZENE, TO BE USED IN 
URINALS WITH STANDING WATER

EA FRESH #4PBPS-PKG12 EA/CS 4.92 0.41 EA EA EA NB EA EA
No Bid

EA
101242 12 4.63

0.3862 EA EA

40 72 EA URINAL SCREEN W/NABC BLOCK EA CONTINENTAL #1672 EA/CS 69.84 0.97 EA EA EA NB EA EA No Bid EA 108086 72 144.24 2.0033 EA EA

41 12 / 20 OZ CLEANER, AEROSOL DUST MOP TREATMENT OZ CHASE #438-5152 *12 CANS/CS 36.94 0.171 OZ OZ OZ NB OZ OZ No Bid OZ 100185 12 44.04 0.1835 OZ OZ

42 12 / 32 OZ CLEANER, SPITFIRE GRAFFITI REMOVER OZ OZ OZ OZ OZ OZ No Bid OZ 103106 12 46.7 0.1216 OZ OZ

43 12 / 20 OZ CLEANER, BASEBOARD STRIPPER, HEAVY DUTY, AEROSOL OZ CHASE #433-4112 *12 CANS/CS 32.15 0.141 OZ OZ OZ OZ OZ No Bid OZ 100184 12 34.65 0.1443 OZ OZ

44 1 EA DISPENSER FOR 800' ROLL PAPER TOWEL EA EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 103364 1 31.88 31.88 EA EA

45 1 EA DISPENSER FOR JUMBO ROLL BATH TISSUE EA EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 102987 1 15 15 EA EA

46 DISPENSER FOR DOUBLE ROLL TOILET TISSUE EA EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 103721 1 18.5 18.5 EA EA

47 10 / 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, LATEX, 5 MIL, SMALL, ANY COLOR 100/EA TRADEX #LSM520 10 BX/CS 31.9 0.0319 100/EA 100/EA 100/EA 100/EA First 
Care/JobGuard-
LPFG-S

100/box 10 
boxes/case $33.40 

$33.40 $3.34
No Bid

100/EA
104031 1000 32.47

3.247 100/EA 100/EA

48 10 / 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, LATEX, 5 MIL, MEDIUM, ANY COLOR 100/EA TRADEX #LMD520 10 BX/CS 31.9 0.0319 100/EA 100/EA 100/EA 100/EA First 
Care/JobGuard-
LPFG-M

100/box 10 
boxes/case $33.40 

$33.40 $3.34
No Bid

100/EA
104032 1000 32.47

3.247 100/EA 100/EA

49 10 / 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, LATEX, 5 MIL, LARGE, ANY COLOR 100/EA TRADEX #LLG520110 BX/CS 31.9 0.0319 100/EA 100/EA 100/EA 100/EA
Aurelia-
LPFG-L

100/box 10 
boxes/case $33.40 

$33.40 $3.34
No Bid

100/EA
104033 1000 32.47

3.247 100/EA 100/EA

50 10 / 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, LATEX, 5 MIL, X-LARGE, ANY COLOR 100/EA TRADEX #LXL520110 BX/CS 31.9 0.0319 100/EA 100/EA 100/EA 100/EA First 
Care/JobGuard-
LPFG-XL

100/box 10 
boxes/case $33.40 

$33.40 $3.34
No Bid

100/EA
104117 1000 32.57

3.257 100/EA 100/EA

51 10 / 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, NIRTLE MEDICAL EXAM, SMALL, ANY COLOR 100/EA TRADEX #NSM400 10 BX/CS 36.9 0.0369 100/EA
NS 10/100 35.9

0.0359 100/EA 100/EA 100/EA First 
Care/JobGuard-
NPFG-E-S

100/box 10 
boxes/case $33.40 

$33.40  $3.34
No Bid

100/EA
108098 1000 38.25

3.825 100/EA 100/EA

52 10 / 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, NIRTLE MEDICAL EXAM, MEDIUM, ANY 
COLOR

100/EA TRADEX #NMD40010 BX/CS 36.9 0.0369 100/EA
NM 10/100 35.9 0.0359 100/EA 100/EA 100/EA Aurelia-

NPFG-E-M
100/box 10 
boxes/case $33.40 $33.40  $3.34 No Bid 100/EA 108099 1000 38.25 3.825 100/EA 100/EA

53 10 / 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, NIRTLE MEDICAL EXAM, LARGE, ANY COLOR 100/EA TRADEX #NLG400 10 BX/CS 36.9 0.0369 100/EA
NL 10/100 35.9

0.0359 100/EA 100/EA 100/EA Aurelia-
NPFG-E-L

100/box 10 
boxes/case $33.40 

$33.40  $3.34
No Bid

100/EA
108100 1000 38.25

3.825 100/EA 100/EA

54 10 / 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, NIRTLE MEDICAL EXAM, X‐LARGE, ANY 
COLOR

100 EA TRADEX #NXL400 10 BX/CS 36.9 0.0369 100 EA
NXL 10/100 25.9

0.0359 100 EA 100 EA 100 EA Aurelia-
NPFG-E-XL

100/box 10 
boxes/case $33.40 

$33.40  $3.34 
No Bid

100 EA
109101 1000 38.25

3.825 100 EA 100 EA

55 10 /100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, VINYL, 3 MIL, SMALL, ANY COLOR 100 EA TRADEX #VSM520 10 BX/CS 23.9 0.0239 100 EA SM 10/100 19 0.019 100 EA 100 EA 100 EA Med Pride-
VPFG-S

100/box 10 
boxes/case $21.30 $21.30  $2.13  No Bid 100 EA 104120 1000 25.25 2.525 100 EA 100 EA

56 10 /100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, VINYL, 3 MIL, MEDIUM, ANY COLOR 100 EA TRADEX #VMD52010 BX/CS 23.9 0.0239 100 EA
M 10/100 19 0.019 100 EA 100 EA 100 EA Med Pride-

VPFG-M
100/box 10 
boxes/case $21.30 $21.30  $2.13  No Bid 100 EA 104121 1000 25.25 2.525 100 EA 100 EA

57 10 /100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, VINYL, 3 MIL, LARGE, ANY COLOR 100 EA TRADEX #VLG520 10 BX/CS 23.9 0.0239 100 EA L 10/100 19 0.019 100 EA 100 EA 100 EA Med Pride-
VPFG-L

100/box 10 
boxes/case $21.30 $21.30  $2.13  No Bid 100 EA 104122 1000 25.25 2.525 100 EA 100 EA
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58 10 /100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, VINYL, 3 MIL, X‐LARGE, ANY COLOR 100 EA TRADEX #VXL520 10 BX/CS 23.9 0.0239 100 EA XL 10/100 19 0.019 100 EA 100 EA 100 EA Med Pride-
VPFG-XL

100/box 10 
boxes/case $21.30 $21.30  $2.13  No Bid 100 EA 104123 1000 25.25 2.525 100 EA 100 EA

59 8 OZ DISINFECTANT FOR CLIPPER BLADE, CLINI‐CLIP OZ OZ OZ OZ 3701 C12  $             82.00 6.8333 .85416 
OZ

OZ No Bid OZ N/B OZ OZ

60 96 ROLLS BATH TISSUE, 2‐PLY STANDARD TOILET PAPER, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED  500 
SHEETS/ROLL

ROLL BOARDWALK #BW96 ROLLS/CS 40.98 0.426 ROLL ROLL ROLL ROLL ROLL
No Bid

ROLL
104963 96 30.27

0.3153 ROLL
235 96 $34.66

$0.36100 ROLL

61 6 / 2000' BATH TISSUE, JUMBO ROLL FT FT FT FT FT FT No Bid FT 103636 6 24.29 0.002 FT 730 6 $22.00 $0.00183 FT

62 6 / 800' PAPER TOWEL, ROLL TOWEL, 8" X 800', NATURAL FT FT FT FT FT FT No Bid FT 104678 6 18.88 0.0039 FT P728N 6 $24.00 $0.00500 FT

63 6 / 800' PAPER TOWEL, ROLL TOWEL, 8" X 800', WHITE FT FT FT FT FT FT No Bid FT 103939 6 21.76 0.0045 FT P708B 6 $26.50 $0.00550 FT

64 24 / 4 FL. OZ. HAND SANITIZER, PURELL, FLIP TOP, 4 OZ BOTTLE OZ DERMAGEL #5025-24 BOTTLES/CS 39.36 0.41 OZ OZ OZ 9651 C24  $             50.00 2.0833 0.5208 
OZ

OZ No Bid OZ 104019 24 46.35 0.4828 OZ OZ

65 4 / 1 GALLON LIQUID SOAP, ANTIMICROBAL GALL INOPAK #5031-420-4 GAL/CS 25.28 6.32 GALL GALL GALL LB10038 C6  $             37.50 37.5 6.25 
GAL

GALL No Bid GALL 103343 4 46.01 11.5 GALL GALL

66 6 / 1000 ML LIQUID SOAP, FOAMCLEAN LOTION SKIN CLEANSER REFILL  (FITS DUOCLEAN AND 
FOAMCLEAN DISPENSERS)

1000 ML 1000 ML 1000 
ML

1000 
ML

1000 
ML

1000 
ML

No Bid
1000 
ML

104248 6 37.13
6.1883 1000 

ML
1000 
ML

67 2 / 2000 ML LIQUID SOAP, LUXURY FOAM ANTIMICROBAL, FRESH FRUIT  (FITS LFC‐20 
DISPENSER)

2000 ML 2000 ML 2000 
ML

2000 
ML

2000 
ML

2000 
ML

No Bid 2000 
ML

N/B 2000 
ML

2000 
ML

68 24 / 2 OZ LICEALL, LICE‐CONTROL SHAMPOO OZ OZ OZ OZ LCS-2           
LC2-128       

C24        
1 GAL.

 $35.00           
$41.50 

1.458333 
$41.50

0.72916        
.6484

OZ No Bid OZ N/B OZ OZ

69 500/CASE SANITARY NAPKIN, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, TRI‐FOLDED, SUPER‐MAXI WITH 
WINGS

EA HOSPECO #MT200 200/CS 28.99 0.14495 EA EA EA
SNWR C576  $             40.32 

40.32 0.07 EA
No Bid

EA
104832 936 87.56

0.09 EA EA

70 500 EA /  CASE TAMPONS, CARDBOARD APPLICATOR EA TAMPAX #T500 500/CS 53 0.106 EA EA EA TPX500 C500  $             42.50 42.5 0.085 EA No Bid EA 100410 500 64.67 0.1293 EA EA

71 12 TUBS/CASE BARBICIDE WIPES (IN CANISTER) EA EA EA EA 11364 C12  $           115.95 9.6625 0.0604 EA No Bid EA N/B EA EA

72 6 / 72/BUCKET HAND CLEANING WIPES, INDUSTRIAL EA WYPALL #KCC913 6 BUCKETS/CS 70.99 0.15775 EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 42230 6/30 37.85 0.2102 EA EA

73 200 EA BOTTLE SPAYER TRIGGER, 9 7/8" LEHGTH, GREEN/WHITE, 28 MM/400 THREAD 
FINISH

EA IMPACT #4902 12/CS 5.76 0.48 EA EA EA EA EA CT0922H
L EA $1.00

$1.00 EA
101002 200 132.5

0.6625 EA EA

74 200 EA BOTTLE FOR SPAYER, QUART EA IMPACT #5032WG 12/CS 5.88 0.49 EA EA EA EA EA CT0923 EA $0.73 $0.73 EA 101004 200 197.5 0.9875 EA EA

75 BROOM, 24" WITH WOOD HANDLE EA ABCO #BH12007 + 12/CS 71.88 5.99 EA EA EA EA EA BH-11008 EA $8.45 $8.45 EA 100593 
108010

1 12.4 12.4 EA EA

76 6 EA BROOM, CORN BRISTLE EA ABCO #BR28SE 12/CS 59.4 4.95 EA EA EA EA EA BR-
1012VB

6 Ea $29.50 $4.9166 EA 100595 1 4.57 4.5764 EA EA

77 12 EA BRUSH, 10" DUAL SURFACE FLOOR SCRUB, BLUE EA EA EA EA EA EA 00049 6 Ea $36.50 $6.0833 EA 100609 12 48.71 4.0588 EA EA

78 1 EA DUSTER, RAINBOW WITH EXTENSION HANDLE EA LAMBSKIN #350EX6/CS 25.62 4.27 EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 100623 1 7.9 7.9058 EA EA

79 12 EA HANDLE, 60" FIBERGLASS W/THREADED TIP, YELLOW EA WILEN #M106060 12/CS 83.76 6.98 EA EA EA EA EA T08115 DZ $60.65 $5.0541 EA 143660 12 123.77 10.314 EA EA

80 1 EA MOP BUCKET WITH RINGER, 35 QT EA CONTINENTAL #331/CS 43.98 43.98 EA EA EA EA EA T01007 EA $42.00 $42.00 EA 102852 1 68.23 68.235 EA EA

81 12 EA MOP HEAD, DUST MOP REFILL , HOSPITAL GRADE, PRE‐SHRUNK, LOOP‐END, 36", 
BLUE, 5" WIDTH

EA GREENWOOD #60712/CS 129.48 10.79 EA EA EA EA EA SDM-
45536L DZ $107.50

$8.9583 EA
100677 12 259.2

21.6 EA EA

82 12 EA MOP HEAD FRAME, 36" EA ABCO #BH24536 12/CS 35.76 2.98 EA EA EA EA EA BH-
24536WF DZ $30.90 $2.5750 EA 100691 12 67.2 5.6 EA EA

83 12 EA MOP HANDLE, 60", METAL (FOR F365 FRAME) EA ABCO #01406NB **12/CS 53.16 4.43 EA EA EA EA EA 01406-NB DZ $59.50 $4.9583 EA 100662 12 190.44 15.871 EA EA

84 12 EA MOP HEAD, GREEN, LOOP‐END, WASHABLE EA GREENWOOD #43312/CS 50.52 4.21 EA EA EA EA EA CLM-
303MWG DZ $34.40 $2.8666 EA 100667 12 56.61 4.7175 EA EA

85 12 EA MOP HEAD, BLUE, LOOP‐END, WASHABLE EA GREENWOOD #41312/CS 50.52 4.21 EA EA EA EA EA CLM-
303MWB DZ $34.40 $2.8666 EA 103241 12 56.61 4.7175 EA EA

86 10 EA PAD, FLOOR PREP PAD, 20" DIAMETER, MAROON, NYLON EA TRELEONI #01901210/CS 31.4 3.14 EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA SPP20 10 86.99 8.699 EA EA

87 5 EA PAD, HOG'S HAIR BRUSHING FLOOR PAD, 20" DIAMETER, 1500‐3000 RMP, 
NATURAL COLOR

EA TRELEONI #0050125/CS 14.65 2.93 EA EA EA EA EA
No Bid

EA
101277 5 14.91

2.9882 EA EA

88 24 EA PAD, MR. CLEAN MAGIC ERASER FOAM PAD *no substitutions* EA MR CLEAN #PGC8224/CS 23.52 0.98 EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 104330 24 22.8 0.95 EA EA

89 3 / 20 EA PAD, SCOTCH‐BRITE GENERAL PURPOSE SCOURING PAD 6"X9" EA TRELEONI #0160203 PKG/CS 12.6 0.21 EA EA EA EA EA SC-N2000 72 $20.65 $0.2868 EA 100633 20 10.45 0.5223 EA EA

90 6 EA PAD, FINISH PAD WHITE/BLUE EA EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 105189 6 89.71 14.953 EA EA

91 5 EA PAD, STIPING FLOOR PAD, 20" DIAMETER, BLACK, 175‐600 RPM, NYLON / 
POLYESTER BLEND

EA TRELEONI #0010125/CS 14.85 2.97 EA EA EA EA EA
No Bid

EA
101274 5 87.88

17.516 EA EA

92 RAG, HOTEL CLEANING HUCK TOWEL, BLUE, 25# BOX POUND POUND POUND POUND POUND POUND No Bid POUND 103574 25 67.35 2.6941 POUND POUND

93 RAG, HOTEL CLEANING HUCK TOWEL, GREEN, 25# BOX POUND POUND POUND POUND POUND POUND No Bid POUND N/B POUND POUND

94 10 EA VACUUM BAG, REPLACEMENT FOR WINDSOR SENSOR S‐12 EA EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 102633 10 11.25 1.125 EA EA

95 1 EA VACUUM BOTTOM PLATE FOR S‐12 EA EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 104371 1 13.24 13.24 EA EA

96 VACUUM EXHAUST FILTER, FOR WINDSOR SENSOR S‐12 EA EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 104111 1 9.45 9.45 EA EA

97 1 EA VACUUM ROLLER BRUSH, 12" REPLACEMENT FOR WINDSOR SENSOR S‐12 EA EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 103020 1 13.69 13.688 EA EA

98 1 EA VACUUM SUPPLY, GROMMET CORD FOR WINDSON SENSOR EA EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 103256 1 1.65 1.65 EA EA

99 1 EA VACUUM SWITCH FOR WINDSOR SENSOR S‐12 EA EA EA EA EA EA No Bid EA 102292 1 16.41 16.412 EA EA

100 1 EA DUST/SPILL PAN, LOBBY PRO, WITH 39" HANDLE EA CONTINENTAL #916/CS 42.54 7.09 EA EA EA EA EA DP-
00204E

EA $8.65 $8.65 EA 105150 1 8.06 8.0588 EA EA
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