COMMISSIONERS

Purchasing Division

HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

ITB 21-013

Janitorial Supplies

Highlands County intends to award based on the lowest bidder for each item as shown on the Bid Tabulation form
attached. Purchases will be made on an as needed basis. This bid is awarded for a one-year period and may be
extended upon agreement of each party. If product is not available from lowest bidder, the County can purchase

from next lowest bidder.

VENDORS PHONE # DELIVERY DAYS MIN. ORDER
5-10 CALENDAR
ACUNITY SPECIALTY PRODUCTS, INC 877-428-9937 DAYS N/A
DBA Zep Sales & Service EXT. 37677
3330 CUMBERLAND BLVD., SUITE 700 ATTN: MAUREENA FABIEN-WATSON
ATLANTA, GA 30339
zepbids@zep.com
AGRI ENTERPRISES LLC 305-712-6653 5-7 BUSSINESS DAYS  $250.00 PER LOCATION
HEAD TO HEELS SAFETY SUPPLIES
7950 NW 155 ST. SUITE 103 ATTN: SUBBARAYAN POCHI
MIAMI LAKES, FL
cservice@headstoheels.net
ALL FLORIDA PAPER LLC 305-755-4820 15 CALENDARDAYS  $300 PER ORDER
SEE OTHER NOTES ON
9150 NW 105TH WAY BID
MIAMI, FL 33178 ATTN: MARIO VALE
MVALE@ALLFLORIDAPAPER.COM
BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC. 919-753-1654 g.:SSCALENDAR N/A
7925 PURFQY RD.
FUKUAY-VARINA, NC 27526 ATTN: BETSY COPELAND
betsycopeland@bobbarker.com
INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP. 845-782-6800 7S10/CALENDAR N/A

114 BRAKEN RD

DAYS
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MONTGOMERY, NY 12549 ATTN: FRADY FRIED
Abraham@Interboropackaging.com

PRIDE ENTERPRISES 813-890-6616 5-7 CALENDAR DAYS  $450.00

223 MORRISON RD
BRANDON, FL 33511 ATTN: JAMES BROWN

bids@pride-enterprises.org

PYRAMID SCHOOL PRIODUCTS 800-792-2644 10-14 DAYS
6510 N. 54TH STREET EXT. 225
TAMPA, FL 33647 ATTN: KENNETH MILLER

BIDDEPT@PYRAMIDSP.COM

$25
SEE OTHER NOTES ON
BID
+ 5% FOR P-CARD

SOUTHERN JANITOR SUPPLY 321-427-0388
34 EAST COURT ST.
MELBOURNE, FL 32904 ATTN: MICHAEL JENKINS

MICHAELJENKINS1156@GMAIL.COM

1 CASE MINIMUM

NO DELIVERY FEE
NO FUEL CHARGE
NO FEE FOR P-CARD

UNIPAK CORP. 888-808-5120 1-14 DAYS
2766 East 63 ST (PO .Box 300027)
BROOKLYN, NY 11234 ATTN: BRIAN MARCUS

customercare@unipakcorp.nat

N/A

** MCKESSON Bid submittal deemed Non-Responsive

Local Preference was not used to award this project.

Notice of Intent to Award is posted to highlandsfl.gov at AM./P.M.on

End of Protest Period:

FAILURE TO FOLLOW THE PURCHASING PROTEST PROCEDURE REQUIREMENTS WITHIN THE TIME

FRAMES PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 24 OF THE HIGHLANDS COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
PURCHASING MANUAL SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF YOUR PROTEST AND ANY RESULTING CLAIMS.
THAT PURCHASING MANUAL IS AVAILABLE FOR PUBLIC INSPECTION IN THE PURCHASING DIVISION
ANDON THE HIGHLANDS COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS’ WEBSITE
{(www.highlandsfi.gov) AND MAY BE OBTAINED FROM THE HIGHLANDS COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS PURCHASING DIVISION.

Digitally signed by Chyistine Davis

Ch riStin e Dav!,‘si-\Date: 2021.04.28 15:33:20 -04'00°

J LR o
Christine Davis, Purchasing Manager Date Ricard Fleeéer, HCBCC Parks ities Super. Date
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ITB 21-013  PRICE LIST (ITEMS 1-104) TO ATTACH TO BID FORM Acunity Angi Enterprises, LLC All Florida Paper McKesson *
Item# |CASE PACK DESCRIPTION VENDOR'S ITEM # CASE PRICE/ [UNIT PRICE| UNIT |VENDOR'S ITEM # |CASE PACK | PRICE/CASE UNIT[ UNIT VENDOR'S CASEPACK | PRICE/CASE UNIT[ UNIT VENDOR'S ITEM # CASE PACKSIZE | PRICE/CASE UNIT[ UNIT
PACK CASE size PRIC ITEM # size PRIC Comments PRIC
1 1000 EA CAN LINER, 10 GALLON, 15" X 9" X 23" 1.5 MIL,, CLEAR OR WHITE No bid|EA $0.13[EA #DIV/0![EA Mc(#1137670, MCKESSON CORPORATION #EC2424N | CS/1000 $11.70 $0.0117 EA
Laddawn 1485 500/Cs $64.38 NO BID
2 500 EA CAN LINER, 12-16 GALLON, 23" X 33", HEAVY DUTY, 1.5 MIL, CLEAR OR No bid|EA $0.26|EA #DIV/0![EA M 1137656, MCKESSON CORPORATION #BR2432MDC | CS/500) $21.80 $0.0436 EA
WHITE Laddawn 1617 250/Cs $ 64.54 NO BID
3 20/50/ROLL  |CAN LINER, 12-16 GALLON, 24" X 33", 8 MIC, NATURAL, CLEAR OR WHITE No bid|EA $0.03[EA #DIV/0![EA MK #1137675, MCKESSON CORPORATION #5243308N-1 | CS/1000 $19.10 $0.0191 EA
Laddawn 18005 |1000/Cs  |$27.88 NO BID
1 CAN LINER, 20-30 GALL, 30" X 37", 16 MIC, NATURAL CLEAR No bid|EA $0.07[EA #DIV/0I[EA McK 71137636, MCKESSON CORPORATION #5303708N | EA/] $0.03 $0.0300 EA
Laddawn 18020  |500/Cs $36.35 NO BID
5 20/ 25 EA /ROLL |CAN LINER, 33 GALLON, 33" X 40", 13 MIC, HEAVY DUTY, CLEAR OR WHITE No bid|EA $0.09[EA #DIV/O![EA WIck #1137652, MCKESSON CORPORATION #$3340125N | CS/100) $20.30 $0.2030 EA
Laddawn 5820 500/Cs $45.38 NO BID
6 100 EA CAN LINER, 45-55 GALLON, 43" X 47" HEAVY DUTY 1.5 MIL., ANY COLOR No bid|EA $0.29[EA #DIV/0![EA MK #1137659, MCKESSON CORPORATION #5L4347150K | CS/100 $23.63 $0.2363 EA
Laddawn 18275 |100/Cs $29.49 NO BID
7 5/20EA/ROLL |CAN LINER, JADCORE, 40-45 GALL, 40" X 46", 2.0 MIL No bid|EA $0.52[EA #DIV/0![EA MK HITSTE33, MCKESSON CS/125 $11.98 $0.0958 EA
Laddawn 1639R  |200/Cs $103.99 NO BID
s 100 EA CAN LINER, JADCORE, 46" X 50", 62 GALL, BLACK, 1.5 MIL No bid|EA $0.30[EA #DIV/O0![EA NO BID NO BID EA
Laddawn 18270 [100/Cs $29.85 NO BID
9 250 EA CAN LINER, WAXED PAPER FEMININE HYGIENE No bid|EA $0.07[EA 0.05[EA um order |1 PSS W SCHINNER CO L CS/500 $18.20 $0.0364 EA
HOS260 500/Ct $35.81 HS-6141 250 |8 12.77 minium order
4 case
10 12/1702 AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL 0 0.463|0z $0.34]0z 0.15|0z McK 7846105, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO #RAC82314 [EA /] $6.17 $1.0475 0z
Zep Micro Mist 24301 201\%0 55.56 CL-165 12 Cans/Cs |$ 80.93 4334113 12/150z | $ 27.03 minium order
1 case
11 12/80z AIR FRESHNER REFILL, NON-AEROSOL PUMP, ANY SCENT oz $0.75[0z #DIV/0![0z MK #8175, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO #RAC-82291 | C'T/ ] $35.35 $4.3968 0z
No bid CL110 12 Cans/Cs |$ 62.81 NO BID
o ] . i ini McK #898752, THE CLOROX COMPANY #35420CT 36.62 9.1550
12 6/1GALLON  |BLEACH, GENERAL PURPOSE (5.25%) — GAL el | S $5.36/GAL — 6/1 gallons | $ - 1.45|GAL zﬁé:w;r;” CS/4 $ $ GAL
12 @ 32 ini McK #414219, LAGASSE INC #DVO904266 102.81 6.4256
3 12/10a1 CARPET SSE PRESPRAY & SPOTTER Zep Breakaway 128601 [ > @32 |6336 B (e 55200-12DADE  [12Bt/Cs  |$77.21 se43Qr C-4251200 123202 |$ 2572 2L e o Cs/a s § ar
& ituti * Pri i | NO BID NO BID
14 4/1GALLON _ |CLEAR SHINE RTU *no substitutions* Pride Enterprises 64400600 No bid GAL GAL NP #DIV/0!|GAL GAL
15 4/1GALLON  |BLUE ALL PURPOSE CLEANER *no substitutions* Victoria Bay D01013 GAL $20.81[GAL #DIV/0!|GAL NO BID NO BID GAL
No bid D01013 4Bt/Cs  [$83.25 NO BID
16 24/2107 COMET BATHROOM CLEANER POWDER i 0z $0.11|0z #DIV/01|0z McK 7737608, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO#PGC |EA/] $2.65 $0.1262 0z
No bid PGC32987CT 24 Cans/Cs |$ 57.36 s2087EA
5 | NO BID NO BID
17 4/2L DISINFECTANT, hdqC2 NEUTRAL CONCENTRATE FOR CLEAN ON THE GO |Zep DZ-7 S2Dand GO |4 @ = 7[UTER {0 WALTR Casels 8111 $ 40.55|LITER NP #DIV/O0!|LITER LITER
SYSTEM 30301 1200 ml
18 12/1QT. DISINFECTANT, NABC, FLORAL SCENT . 2.8Qr $5.48/QT 157[ar McK #909774, THE CLOROX COMPANY #68970 CS/6 $69.02 $11.5033 QT
P REASC o] S| [ @ 2 ||y 711603 NABC 12Bottles /| o5 77 B-0701200 12/320Z | $ 18.88 minium order
#120401 bottles Case .
19 12/2407 DISINFECTANT LYSOL I.C., FOAMING 12 0.16667|0Z 0.19/07 0.12|0z = NO BID NO BID 0z
/ ’ Zep Venture IT #000601 201% e |6 RAC02775CT 12/Ct $53.54 $ C-4334103 12/170z |$ 25.11 T'cr;'s“em ey
20 12/3202 DISINFECTANT, OXIVIR AHP (SPRAY BOTTLE) - 0.171]0z $0.220z 0.09|0z WK 4728022, PARKER LASS NC.#42 BX/6 $45.20 $0.2354 0z
EpRIUIEedtl || 66 DV04277285 12/Ct $85.07 B-3111200 12/320Z | $ 38.00 »
Disinfectant #356101 minium order
bottles
1 case
21 12/3202 DRAIN & SEWER, BLOC-AID LIQUID . 2@3 4.93[0z $0.12|0z 0.08|0z i order |V Fe21084, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CORCo— A/ $11.94 $0.1493 0z
Zep Drain Aid 167801 59.16 BWK4823 12/Ct $45.06 B-0701200 12/320Z | $ 30.79 minium order |ss2geea
oz bottles 1 case
2 5 GALLON FLOOR STRIPPER 8.6|GAL $14.80|GAL 4.64|GAL MIck 7838835, CANBERRA CORPORATION AHSK-704-05 | CS/4 $66.26 $16.5650  |GAL
Zep Heavy Duty Floor .. |43.00
B 5 gal pail [T FKLF218026 Each $74.00 S-FS10 5 GAL PAIL| $ 2320
23 5 GALLON FLOOR WAX WITH 36% SOLIDS Zep Ovation 25% solids[, gl pail [69.35 13.87|GAL GAL B-6050500 5 GAL PAIL| $ 39.13 7.82|GAL McK #1007264, LAGASSE INC #DVS100830768 CS/4 $281.27 $70.3175 GAL
Low maintenance finish
24 12/1502 FURNITURE CLEANER, FOAMING ] 0.275/0z $0.590z 0.14|0z NO BID NO BID 0z
Y Zep Sheen Furniture 12@ 12 Cans / -
e hoNts 528 904390 e $107.10 (C-4334109 12170z |'$ 28.10 T.cr:suem order
25 4/1GALLON  |GLASS CLEANER WITH AMMONIA ix 1 5.82|GAL $6.27|GAL 2.67|GAL MK 71046303, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO #AMR— | C'T/] $37.98 $213221  |GAL
Zep Vue RTU#101024 [ 1, 12328 BWKA4714AEA  [Each $25.07 $-21020 4/1GAL | $ 10.67 1001447
26 GUM AND WAX REMOVER o0z 12 Cans / $0.52/0z #DIV/01[0z McK #931828, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CORBWK- | EA/] $6.11 $1.0183 oz
No bid $37.20 NO BID 353AEA
BWK353ACT Case
27 ar HARD SURFACE AND GLASS, FAST AND EASY *no substitutions, IN QUARTS ar 12 Cans / $5.68|QT #DIV/0!|QT NO BID NO BID ar
ONLY* SPARTAN 326204 No bid Spartan 3260 Case $68.18 NO BID
28 4/1GALLON _ |HEAVY DUTY LIME FREE DELIMING SOLUTION . 13.77|GAL GAL 5.08|GAL LY NO BID NO BID GAL
el |90 o 34540041DADE [ BOMES/ g og o5 G-10000172 | 4/1GAL |8 2035
and Scale #157924 gallon : : Case : : : (?:EEER a
29 4/1GALLON  |LIQUID OVEN AND GRILL, RTU ] 9.07|GAL GAL 2.21|GAL MINTMOM ™| Vick 7872841, LAGASSE INC #DV0943049 cs/12 $84.43 $28.1433  |GAL
EpOGnliE Ax1 o a608 MLB25000041  |*BOMIES/ g gq 04 G-19000017 41GAL |$ 11.04 ORDER 1
#104824 gallon Case CASE
30 4/1GALLON  |CLEANER, MULTI SURFACE, SHINELINE 11.57|GAL GAL 2.99|GAL Ve Fa57290 ONITED STATONERS SUPPLY COAT- [ EA/T $16.62 $16.6200  |GAL
Zep Aprizall 4125124 |*X1 468 SIN311930 4 Bottles /¢ 41673 P-014717 4/1GAL |$ 11.97
gallon Case




31 4/1GALLON  |NON-BUFF METAL INTERLOCK FLOOR FINISH, ON AN' ON i 13.19[GAL 4 Botles GAL 10.00]GAL NO BID NO BID GAL
. Bottles
Zep Shield #197124 X 52.76 60604-00 Oes T s 119.61 B-6050400 4/1GAL |$ 40.00
gallon Case
32 12/1QT1 FLOOR SOLUTION, SPRAY BUFF PRO 12 @32 4.15|QT T 2.05QT MK 1097241, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CORDVO- — |EA/] 4271 13347 T
/1a ’ Zep Buff Up 190901 [ ~ @32 1408 Q Q SP-304003 12/1QT |$ 24.61 Q capsa0ass s $ Q
33 12/200z STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER, SUPERIOR HIGH SHINE ; @ 0.32750Z 0z 0.12(0Z N MK #9512, GRAINGER INC, W.W. #24Y898 EA/1 $2.57 $0.1285 0oz
Zep Stainless Steel  12@ |, g0 BWK347ACT 12/Carton ~ |$ 49.96 C-4334111 12/180z | $ 26.54 minium order
Cleaner #14301 20N16 il GEE
34 18/ 56 EA WYPALL ALL PURPOSE WIPES, POP-UP CANISTER * bstitutions* EA AR A EA #VALUE![EA NO BID NO BID EA
/ d no substitutions No bid KCC34790CT Boxes/Carto |$ 102.59 NO BID NO BID
35 6/70EA CLEANER, WIPES, BLEACH BASED (NON-ALCOHOL) GERMICIDAL PURPOSE  |Zep Spirit I1 6@ 80 # |EA 75 EA #DIV/0![EA NO BID NO BID EA
WIPES, POP-UP CANISTER Disinfectant Towels  |wipes/ |36 # BWK4736 Wipes/Canis |$ 30.42 NO BID
#650880 canister # ter, 6/Carton
36 12/1502Z DISINFECTANT AEROSOL, END BAC II ] 0oz 0oZ 0.13|0Z —— NO BID NO BID 0z
No bid ITW35720 12/Cs $89.21 C-4334104 12/16.50z |$ 26.72 ;”'”“”" QL
case
37 12/2002 DISINFECTANT AEROSOL, STERIPHENE 1., SPRING BREEZE SCENT 7en 30 Disinfectant |12 0.2945(0Z 0oz 0.13{0Z N MK #872863, LAGASSE INC #DV095401786 CS/12 $62.71 $0.2613 0z
°p =5 Disinfectan @ 7068 TOL2660 12/Cs $80.09 C-4334104 12/16.50z | $ 26.72 minium order
Foam 20N20 1 case
38 12 EA TOILET BOWL BLOCK WITH HANGER, CHERRY SCENT EA EA 1.09|EA | PR NO BID NO BID EA
No bid BWKB04BX 12/Bx $ 14.67 H-02901 12 $ 13.04 ORDER 12
UNITS
39 12EA URINAL BLOCK, CHERRY SCENT, PARA DICHLOROBENZENE, TO BE USED IN EA EA 0.77|EA e~ MK #1152350, RI SCHINNER CO #9400C-BX CS/12 $12.98 $1.0817 EA
URINALS WITH STANDING WATER No bid HOS06411 144/Carton |$ 126.85 H-08411 144 $ 110.87 ORDER 1
CASE
40 72EA URINAL SCREEN W/NABC BLOCK EA EA 1.07|EA TS TMick #1123049, R3 RELIABLE REDISTRIBUTION RESOURCE — [BX/12 $17.72 $1.4767 EA
No bid BWKNUS 12/Cs $16.98 H-019202 12 $ 12.82 orderis2 #14s01905
case
41 12/2002 CLEANER, AEROSOL DUST MOP TREATMENT L@ 0.28/0Z oz 0.16|/0Z MINIUM McK #868346, CANBERRA CORPORATION #HSK-120567 | (CS/]2 $62.06 $0.3694 oz
Zep Magnet #8001 b |6 AMR1038049 12/Carton  |$ 61.44 C-4385152 12/180z |$ 34.17 ORDER 1
CASE
McK #852953, LAGASSE INC #DV095891789
42 12/3202 CLEANER, SPITFIRE GRAFFITI REMOVER Zep Write Away 32401 ;(2)1\(1@14 65.16 0.3878|0Z MTS 40903 / 40903 gfsf:tles/ $127.56 oz NO BID #DIV/0!|0Z c CS/12 $48.96 $0.1275 oz
43 12/200z CLEANER, BASEBOARD STRIPPER, HEAVY DUTY, AEROSOL @ 0.2255(0Z 12 Cans / [eY2 0.13[0Z MINIUM MK #1152405, RI SCHINNER CO #5156 CS/12 $38.35 $0.1682 0oz
Zep Perimeter #501 48.72 09923-00 ° $71.51 C-4334112 12/190z |$ 29.89 ORDER 1
20N18 Case CASE
f | NO BID NO BID
44 1EA DISPENSER FOR 800' ROLL PAPER TOWEL N EA [E—— i o EA N— #DIV/0![EA EA
45 1EA DISPENSER FOR JUMBO ROLL BATH TISSUE . EA EA #DIV/0!|EA MeK #1155795, ULINE #H-1127 EA/l $25.56 $25.5600 EA
No bid SIMR2000TBK ~ [Each $25.32 NO BID /
46 DISPENSER FOR DOUBLE ROLL TOILET TISSUE EA EA #DIV/0![EA MK #618321, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO#SIM-—— [EA/] $27.02 $27.0200  |EA
No bid GPC59210 Each $46.63 NO BID Ras0XC
47 10/ 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, LATEX, 5 MIL, SMALL, ANY COLOR 100/EA 100/Bx $10.45 [100/EA #DIV/0![100/EA NO BID NO BID 100/EA
No bid MG100 - S ’ $ 104.50 NO BID
10Bx/Cs
48 10/ 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, LATEX, 5 MIL, MEDIUM, ANY COLOR 100/EA 100/Bx, $10.45 [100/EA #DIV/0![100/EA NO BID NO BID 100/EA
No bid MG100 - M $104.50 NO BID
10Bx/Cs
49 10/ 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, LATEX, 5 MIL, LARGE, ANY COLOR 100/EA 100/Bx $10.45 [100/EA #DIV/0![100/EA NO BID NO BID 100/EA
No bid MG100 - L ’ $104.50 NO BID
10Bx/Cs
50 10/ 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, LATEX, 5 MIL, X-LARGE, ANY COLOR 100/EA 100/Bx, $10.45 [100/EA #DIV/0![100/EA NO BID NO BID 100/EA
No bid MG100 - XL $ 104.50 NO BID
10Bx/Cs
51 10/ 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, NIRTLE MEDICAL EXAM, SMALL, ANY 100/EA $19.05 [100/EA #DIV/0![100/EA NO BID NO BID 100/EA
COLOR
) 100/Bx,
No bid X342100 108x/Cs $190.52 NO BID
52 10/ 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, NIRTLE MEDICAL EXAM, MEDIUM, 100/EA $19.05 [100/EA #DIV/0![100/EA NO BID NO BID 100/EA
ANY COLOR
) 100/Bx,
No bid X344100 e $190.52 NO BID
53 10/ 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, NIRTLE MEDICAL EXAM, LARGE, ANY 100/EA $19.05 |100/EA #DIV/0![100/EA NO BID NO BID 100/EA
COLOR
) 100/Bx,
No bid X346100 108x/Cs $190.52 NO BID
54 10/ 100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, NIRTLE MEDICAL EXAM, X-LARGE, 100 EA $19.05[100 EA #DIV/01{100 EA NO BID NO BID 100 EA
ANY COLOR
) 100/Bx,
No bid X348100 loBwcs |3 19052 NO BID
55 10 /100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, VINYL, 3 MIL, SMALL, ANY COLOR 100 EA — $7.96/100 EA #DIV/0!{100 EA NO BID NO BID 100 EA
No bid MG300 - S l0By/Cs  |379:64 NO BID
56 10 /100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, VINYL, 3 MIL, MEDIUM, ANY COLOR 100 EA - $7.96/100 EA #DIV/0![{100 EA NO BID NO BID 100 EA
. X,
No bid MG300 - M loByCs  [379:64 NO BID
57 10 /100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, VINYL, 3 MIL, LARGE, ANY COLOR 100 EA — $7.96/100 EA #DIV/0!{100 EA NO BID NO BID 100 EA
No bid MG300 - L loByCs  |379:64 NO BID
58 10 /100 EA GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, POWDER FREE, VINYL, 3 MIL, X-LARGE, ANY COLOR 100 EA L00B $7.96/100 EA #DIV/01{100 EA NO BID NO BID 100 EA
No bid MG300 - XL £ $79.64 NO BID

10Bx/Cs




59 80z DISINFECTANT FOR CLIPPER BLADE, CLINI-CLIP oz oz #DIV/0!|0Z NO BID NO BID oz
No bid NO BID
60 96 ROLLS BATH TISSUE, 2-PLY STANDARD TOILET PAPER, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED ROLL 500 $0.47|ROLL 0.34(ROLL ;?3‘2';22?"5“' UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO #GPC- CT/1 $69.35 $0.7881 ROLL
500 SHEETS/ROLL No bid PSCST296 Sheets/Roll, |$45.18 ES-TM1616S 96/CS $ 32.88
96/Carton
61 6/2000' BATH TISSUE, JUMBO ROLL No bid FT BWK6102B Rolls/Carton $37.05 $6.18|FT ES-TJ1222A 6/CS $ 2333 0.002(FT NOBID NO BID FT
62 6/800" PAPER TOWEL, ROLL TOWEL, 8" X 800', NATURAL ] FT GENSX800HWTK |6 $3.78[FT 0.004(FT MK #1152373, R) SCHINNER CO #RT 680021 CS/6 $22.56 $0.0047 FT
No bid $22.65 ES-RK8002 6/CS $ 17.60
F Rolls/Carton
63 6 /800" PAPER TOWEL, ROLL TOWEL, 8" X 800', WHITE FT S 4.40|FT 0.004(FT McK #449750, KIMBERLY CLARK PROFESSIONAL & CS/12 $58.65 $0.0115 FT
No bid MORW6800 $26.43 ES-218004 6/CS $ 21.38 CONSUMER #01080
Rolls/Carton
64 24 /4 FL. OZ. HAND SANITIZER, PURELL, FLIP TOP, 4 OZ BOTTLE 0.375(0Z 0.91|0Z 1.64|0Z McK #281327, GOJO INDUSTRIES INC. #9651-24 CS/24 $43.68 $0.4550 oz
! IR 2#@4 N5 Purcll-9651-24 |24 BOMES/ |5 g7 17 ; G-08000171 24/40Z |$ 3935
Santizier #87814 oz bottles Case : :
65 4/1GALLON LIQUID SOAP, ANTIMICROBAL ix1 12.51|GALL $ 17.61|{GALL 5.95(GALL MK #262766, METREX RESEARCH #10-1500 CS/4 $122.80 $30.7000 GALL
Zep Acclaim #314924 ga);lon 50.04 DIA88047CT 4/Ct $70.43 P-16114 4/1GAL ($ 23.82
66 6 /1000 ML LIQUID SOAP, FOAMCLEAN LOTION SKIN CLEANSER REFILL (FITS DUOCLEAN|Zep Fuzion Lotion 8.33125(1000 ML $10.49(1000 ML #DIV/0!|1000 ML PMRC(;F’:;‘;ZZ‘:LE:%SECTS 46040575 CS/6 $71.18 $15.8178 1000 ML
AND FOAMCLEAN DISPENSERS) Hfinq Soap #127216, |4 @ 39.99 5062-FL 1000 6 Bags / $62.92 NO BID
will include nc manual {1200 ml Case
dispenser
67 2 /2000 ML LIQUID SOAP, LUXURY FOAM ANTIMICROBAL, FRESH FRUIT (FITS LFC-20 Zep Fuzion AB Foam 152000 ML $ 22.64(2000 ML #DIV/0!|2000 ML McK #411547, GOJO INDUSTRIES INC. #2218-04 CS/4 $56.85 $14.2125 2000 ML
DISPENSER) B SR EEEe | B@IA) G0I7255 4/Ct $90.57 NO BID
will include NC manual |ml
dispenser
| I McK #648759, MCKESSON  *
68 24 /202 LICEALL, LICE-CONTROL SHAMPOO No bid oz oz NO BID #DIV/0!|0Z CSRPORMION 1938004334 EA/1 $5.29 $1.3225 oz
69 500/CASE SANITARY NAPKIN, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, TRI-FOLDED, SUPER-MAXI No bid EA EA 500im 500 s 33.00 0.07(EA minium order |McK #1116221, R SCHINNER CO #MT- 200 EA/1 $0.21 $0.2100 EA
WITH WINGS ) 1 case
70 500 EA/ CASE TAMPONS, CARDBOARD APPLICATOR X EA EA 58.80(EA . d McK #783577, MCKESSON EA/1 $0.15 $0.1500 EA
No bid t500 1 $ 58.80 MInium Order (pyaRMACEUTICALS #07301022110
a4
71 12 TUBS/CASE BARBICIDE WIPES (IN CANISTER) Zep Spirit IT 6|EA $9.78|EA #DIV/0!|EA NO BID NO BID EA
Disinfectant Towels i]f ig 36 MSI M60034 160/ct, 12/cs |$ 117.41 INO BID
#650880 H
72 6/ 72/BUCKET HAND CLEANING WIPES, INDUSTRIAL - EA 6 Buckets / $ 20.62|EA #DIV/O!|EA McK #316285, GOIO INDUSTRIES INC. #6298-04 CS/520 $74.26 $0.1428 EA
No bid 42272 $123.71
Case i
" . . | McK #1179933, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO #IMP- CT/24 20.39 0.8496
73 200 EA BOTTLE SPAYER TRIGGER, 9 7/8" LEHGTH, GREEN/WHITE, 28 MM/400 No bid EA BWK58109 24/Ct $139.29 $ 5.80|EA NO BID #DIV/0!|EA S0060401 $ $ EA
THREAD FINISH
. b ! NO BID NO BID
74 200 EA BOTTLE FOR SPAYER, QUART No bid EA BWK00032 24/Ct $198.99 S 8.29|EA NO BID #DIV/O!|EA EA
75 BROOM, 24" WITH WOOD HANDLE . EA 21.91|EA - 5.50(EA McK #554456, LAGASSE INC #BWK951TCT * EA/1 $3.21 $3.2100 EA
No bid RCP2039998 Each $21.91 3 ! 12 $ 66.00 MINIMUM
12007/01104 ORDER 12
76 6 EA BROOM, CORN BRISTLE EA $ 13.83|EA 5.79(EA MK #1022163, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO #BWK- EA/1 $4.82 $4.8200 EA
No bid BWKBR10003 6/Ct $ 83.00 BR-28SE 6 $ 34.76 WININUY |
ORDER 6
" MINIMUM
77 12 EA BRUSH, 10" DUAL SURFACE FLOOR SCRUB, BLUE No bid EA Flo-Pac -3619714  |12/Cs $348.73 $29.06(EA 00049 6 $ 3631 6.05(EA ORDER & NO BID NO BID EA
78 1EA DUSTER, RAINBOW WITH EXTENSION HANDLE EA $ 7.50(EA #DIV/0!|EA McK #708601, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO #RCP-T120 | EA /] $35.22 $35.2200 EA
No bid S52EPPD Each $7.50 INO BID
79 12EA HANDLE, 60" FIBERGLASS W/THREADED TIP, YELLOW No bid EA BWK636 12/Cs $ 134.79 $11.23[EA TO8115 12 s 60.28 5.02[EA Mk 41022685, UNITED STATIONERS EA/l $16.20 $16.2000  [EA
80 1EA MOP BUCKET WITH RINGER, 35 QT X EA S 116.44(EA 37.58(EA MINIMUM McK #931334, R SCHINNER CO #FG758088YEL EA/1 $92.83 $92.8300 EA
No bid MNL60353 Each $116.44 T01007 1 $ 37.58
ORDER 12
X X K | McK #872583, LAGASSE INC #BWK1124 10.43 10.4300
81 12 EA MOP HEAD, DUST MOP REFILL , HOSPITAL GRADE, PRE-SHRUNK, LOOP-END, No bid EA BWK1136 12/Cs $229.87 $19.16(EA #DIV/0!|EA EA/1 $ $ EA
36", BLUE, 5" WIDTH
82 12 EA MOP HEAD FRAME, 36" EA $ 7.00(EA 2.62|EA MINIMUM McK #1083133, FOAMTECINTL CO LLC #FT416D EA/1 $71.49 $71.4900 EA
No bid BWK 1436 12/Cs $83.95 BH-24536WF 12 $ 31.42
ORDER 12
83 12EA MOP HANDLE, 60", METAL (FOR F365 FRAME) ) EA $12.80[EA 4.34[EA MiNIMOM NO BID NO BID EA
No bid BWK 1490 12/Cs $153.64 01406-NB 12 $ 52.09
ORDER 12
N i I McK #963807, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO #BWK- 9.19 9.1900
84 12 EA MOP HEAD, GREEN, LOOP-END, WASHABLE No bid EA BWKMWTMG 12/Cs $ 12425 $ 10.35(EA CLM-303MWG 12 s 3333 2.78|EA '(;A,L,;IEMRL:{';A MWIMG EA/1 $ $ EA
- | MINIMUM McK #872819, ODELL CORP #900L/BLUE
85 12 EA MOP HEAD, BLUE, LOOP-END, WASHABLE No bid EA BWKMWTMB 12/Cs $124.25 $ 10.35(EA CLM-303MWB 12 $ 3333 2.78|EA ORDER 19 EA/1 $11.04 $11.0400 EA
86 10 EA PAD, FLOOR PREP PAD, 20" DIAMETER, MAROON, NYLON No bid EA MMMSPPP20 10/Ct $ 166.88 $ 16.69(EA INO BID #DIV/0!|EA NO BID NO BID EA
. n R ] | McK #850904, LAGASSE INC #BWK4020NHE 17.16 3.4320
87 5EA PAD, HOG'S HAIR BRUSHING FLOOR PAD, 20" DIAMETER, 1500-3000 RMP, No bid EA BWK4020NHE 10/Ct $42.18 $ 4.22|EA NO BID #DIV/0!|EA CS/5 $ S EA
NATURAL COLOR
38 24 EA PAD, MR. CLEAN MAGIC ERASER FOAM PAD *no substitutions* . EA 6/Pack, 6 S 1.49|EA 0.84(EA MK #1135554, RJ SCHINNER CO #79009 CS/36 $34.99 $0.9719 EA
No bid PGC79009 $53.60 MR CLEAN 6/6CT $ 30.28
Pack/Carton
89 3/20EA PAD, SCOTCH-BRITE GENERAL PURPOSE SCOURING PAD 6"X9" EA $ 0.90|EA 0.29(EA MK #1123023, R3 RELIABLE REDISTRIBUTION RESOURCE | CS/60 $12.40 $0.2067 EA
No bid BWK196 20/Ct $ 18.08 SC-N2000 72 $ 20.65 B #5096
ORDER 72
90 6 EA PAD, FINISH PAD WHITE/BLUE No bid EA RCPQSOOWHI 6/Bx $122.16 $20.36(EA SC-MP002 24 $ 13.47 0.56(EA NO BID NO BID EA
" N ] | McK #934003, LAGASSE INC #BWK4020BLA 14.67 2.9340
91 5 EA PAD, STIPING FLOOR PAD, 20" DIAMETER, BLACK, 175-600 RPM, NYLON / N EA BWKA020BLA <t $19.75 $3.95[EA N #DIV/0![EA CS/5 $ 3 EA
POLYESTER BLEND
92 RAG, HOTEL CLEANING HUCK TOWEL, BLUE, 25# BOX POUND $ 5.10|POUND #DIV/0!|POUND NO BID NO BID POUND
No bid WCA40-55 40LB CASE ($ 204.00 539-25
93 RAG, HOTEL CLEANING HUCK TOWEL, GREEN, 25# BOX POUND $ 5.10{POUND #DIV/0!|POUND NO BID NO BID POUND
No bid 'WCA40-55GRN 40LB CASE [$ 204.00 NO BID
94 10 EA VACUUM BAG, REPLACEMENT FOR WINDSOR SENSOR S-12 . EA EA ® #DIV/0!|EA NO BID NO BID EA
No bi NO BID




95 1EA VACUUM BOTTOM PLATE FOR S-12 X EA EA #DIV/0!|EA NO BID NO BID EA
No bid INO BID
96 VACUUM EXHAUST FILTER, FOR WINDSOR SENSOR S-12 EA EA #DIV/0!|EA NOBID NO BID EA
No bid INO BID
" - ! NO BID NO BID
97 1EA VACUUM ROLLER BRUSH, 12" REPLACEMENT FOR WINDSOR SENSOR S-12 No bid EA EA NO BID #DIV/0!|EA EA
98 1EA VACUUM SUPPLY, GROMMET CORD FOR WINDSON SENSOR EA EA #DIV/0!|EA NO BID NO BID EA
No bid INO BID
- . ! NO BID NO BID
99 1EA VACUUM SWITCH FOR WINDSOR SENSOR S-12 No bid EA EA NO BID #DIV/0!|EA EA
" J | e McK #708781, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO #RCP- 10.93 10.9300
100 1EA DUST/SPILL PAN, LOBBY PRO, WITH 39" HANDLE No bid EA Lobbymaster - 2600 [Each $21.65 $ 21.65(EA DP-00204E 20 119.53 5.98(EA (rjr;z:r:\;r;o 43740081 EA/1 $ S EA
101 1EA WET FLOOR SIGN - YELLOW No bid EA IMP9152W Each $7.09 $7.09 EA WS-0001 10 56.24 5.62|EA LRl L) McK #1038201, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO#BWK- | EA/1 $13.36 $13.3600 EA
orderis 10  |26FLOORSIGN
102 1EA TOILET BOWL BRUSH - HARD BRISTLE No bid EA BWK6217 Each $3.65 $3.65 EA 00017 12 8.95 0.75|EA MINUMUM  [McK #708778, UNITED STATIONERS SUPPLY CO #RCP- EA/1 $3.04 $3.0400 EA
ORDER 12 631100WE
KITCHEN TOWEL ROLLS 0.56 McK #532823, KIMBERLY CLARK PROFESSIONAL & RL/]. 31.36 51.3600
103 1EA No bid EA GEN1797 Each $22.03 $0.73 EA 50-196152 30 16.75 EA CONSUMER #41482 EA
FOAMCLEAN SOAP DISPENSERS #DIV/0! MCK #773145, MAC MEDICAL SUPPLY INC #MM3000 EA/1 $8.84 $8.8400
EA
104 1EA Zep Fuzion Select Manual |Each No Charge|No Charge [EA Tork 571508 Each $7.96 $7.96 EA no bid EA

* lowest bid but changes to solicitation are not acceptable




Pride Enterprises Pyramid School Products Southern Janitor Unipak Corp. Introboro Bob Barker
VENDOR'S| CASE PACK| PRICE/CASE[ UNIT PRICE UNIT[VENDOR'S ITEM # |CASE PACK | PRICE/CASE UNIT | UNIT VENDOR'S |CASE PACK | PRICE/CASE UNIT| UNIT VENDOR'S |CASE PACK | PRICE/CASE UNIT | UNIT VENDOR'S CASE PACK | PRICE/ UNIT | UNIT |VENDOR'S |CASE PRICE/ UNIT | UNIT
ITEM # SIZE SIZE PRICE ITEM # SIZE PRIC ITEM # SIZE PRICE ITEM # SIZE CASE PRICE ITEM # PACK CASE PRICE
No Bid EAlBOARDWALK 0.02898|EA EA 0.0776(EA TR A 0.0108[EA EA
#BWK242306 **6 1000/CS 29.98 No Bid 242315 250 19.40 i AL 1,000/case  |$10.82 NB
mic** Per Sample # 1
No Bid EA EA EA 0.0816(EA 0.0167[EA EA
No Bid 233315 250 20.40 [INI2ERHR A 500/Case $8.34 INB
Per Sample # 2
No Bid EAJHERITAGE 0.05399|EA 0.0198|EA 0.0182|EA INT-2433-R As| 0.0139|EA EA
#HERZ4833LKRO1 20/50/ROLL |53.99 104540 1000 $19.75 243308 1000 18.20 1,000/Case |$13.94 NB
+*BLACK** Per Sample # 3
No Bid EA EA 0.0470(EA 0.0496(EA I —— 0.0387|EA EA
100386 500 $23.51 303716 500 24.80 B - § 500/Case $19.34 NB
Per Sample # 4
No Bid EA 0.07998|EA 0.0734[EA 0.0484(EA 0.0407|EA EA
INTEPLAST INT-3340-H As|
41BSS334016N 20/25/ROLL |39.99 103949 500 $36.68 334013 500 24.20 Per Sample # 5 500/Case $20.34 NB
No Bid EA 0.4599(EA 0.3355[EA 0.169|EA INT-4347-X- 0.1882[EA EA
HERITAGE
YHERX8647AK 100/CS 45.99 103234 100 $33.55 4347C15 100 16.90 Hvy As Per 100/Case $18.82 NB
Sample # 6
No Bid EAlINTEPLAST 0.359|EA EA 0.194|EA INT-4046-Exh 0.2132[EA EA
#IBSSL4046XHW2 100/CS 359 No Bid 46C2 100.00 19.40 As Per Sample |100/Case $21.32
No Bid EA EA 0.3631[EA 0.224|EA INT-4650-Exh 0.1848|EA EA
105102 100 $36.31 4650C2 100.00 22.40 As Per Sample |100/Case $18.48 INB
# 8
No Bid EA 0.05156|EA 0.0400(EA EA NB|[EA EA
HOSPECO #HS6141 250 EA/CS [12.89 100407 500 $20.01 NB NB NB NB
No Bid OZ| CHASE #4113 **150z, 2.748|**CAN** 0.1858|0Z oz NB|OZ oz
FRESH LINEN 12/150z/CS [32.98 100142 12 $37.90 NB NB NB INB
SCENT**
No Bid 07 oz 0.9550(0Z oz NB|OZ oz
103049 12 $91.68 NB NB NB NB
64400200 - $2.25 GAL|PURE BRIGHT 6/1 3.665|GAL 2.3967|GAL GAL NB|GAL GAL
Generall 4x1 Gal $8.99 KIKBLEACHG GALLON/C 21.99 101353 6 $14.38 NB NB NB INB
i qTl
MBEHE kDY ALK 12/1 QT/CS [39.98 s.3syar 100168 [12 $25.33 22108 0 ar NB NB NB 3ew NB ar
- GAL|
64400600 4l Gal $16.05 $4.01 GAL Nio B GAL GAL N N N NB|GAL - GAL
Clearshine|
No Bid GALJ GAL GAL GAL NB|GAL GAL
No Bid NB NB NB NB
No Bid 07 0.081329|02Z 0.0472|0Z oz NB|OZ oz
(COMET #PGC32987CT |24/210z/CS [40.99 100544 24 $23.81 NB NB NB NB
i LITER]
No Bid LITER 103760 A $35.59 8.8975|LITER LITER N N N NBILTER [ o LITER
No Bid QT Qr 1.8208|QT Qr NB|QT Qr
100173 12 $21.85 NB NB NB INB
i 0z
goled LYSOL #RAC02569CT |12/240z/CS |49.98 0.17354/02 103578 12 $42.68 Rtez|o 0z NB NB NB 3 fers NB oz
No Bid 07 oz 0.1313|0Z oz NB|OZ oz
104577 18 $50.40 NB NB NB INB
| $0.11 07 oz 0.0859|0Z oz NB|OZ oz
6440223212 12x1 Quart $43.82 100180 12 $32.99 NB NB NB NB
64600900 - $8.60) GAL GAL 10.7580(GAL GAL NB|GAL GAL
Heavy Duty] 5 Gallon $42.99 100030 5 $53.79 NB NB NB NB
Pro Waxx|
No Bid GALJ GAL 100139 5 $65.20 13.0400|GAL GAL NB NB NB NB|GAL NB GAL
No Bid 07 oz 0.2106|0Z oz NB|OZ oz
100186 12 $37.90 NB NB NB INB
7T
64400600 - $4.01 GALlL D ARDWALK 9.98(GAL 6.0350|GAL GAL NB|GAL GAL
Clearshine 4x1 Gal $16.05 A BWK4714ACT SALLON/C 39.92 100104 4 $24.14 NB NB NB NB
No Bid 07 0.20819|0z 4.4525(0Z oz NB|OZ 0z
CHASE #433-4107 12/120z
gl cans/ics |2998 100188 12 $53.43 NB NB NB NB
No Bid QT Qr 2.1275(QT Qr NB|QT Qr
100163 12 $25.53 NB NB NB NB
64100300 -| $7.30 GAL GAL 10.3250|GAL GAL GAL GAL
Heavy Duty] 4x1 Gal $29.20 100294 4 $41.30 NB NB NB INB
Lime Free
64403600 - $6.74 GAL 4/1 20.99|GAL 10.5375|GAL GAL GAL GAL
Oven & Grilll 4x1 Gal $26.97 MISTY #AMR1038695 |GALLON/C (83.96 100087 4 $42.15 NB NB NB NB
Cleaner S
64404800 - $3.77 GAL 41 11.55|GAL 7.6075|GAL GAL GAL GAL
WRE | $15.08 [ANIASTIES GALLON/C |46.2 101454 4 $30.43 NB NB NB NB
Purpose #SIN311930 3
Cleaner




No Bid GAL GAL 14.0950|GAL GAL GAL GAL
100140 4 $56.38 NB NB NB NB
d J QT .
e o $23.99 2200 @ 102885 12 $28.49 zS2 O @ NB NB NB Qr NB Qr
Buff Pro
No Bid OZ] piasE #433.4111 12/2007 0.13329(0Z 0.4465|0Z oz oz 0oz
o ABROSOL ™ canscs 3199 100475 12 $53.58 NB NB NB NB
No Bid EA 0.06745|EA 0.0677|EA EA EA EA
OB XI(;ALL HRCCOSTOL fy0/56/c5  |67.99 100423 1008 $68.25 NB NB NB NB
No Bid EA 9.831[EA EA EA EA EA
(CLOROX .
o LO35309CT 6/70/CS 58.99 No Bid NB NB NB NB
No Bid OZ|CHASE #433-4104 12/16.50z 0.1615/0Z ] 0oz oz 0z 0oz
*16.50z* **KILLS CANS/CS 31.98 No Bid NB NB NB INB
(COVID-19. HIN1. HIV1 AN
No Bid 07 oz 0.1775[0z oz oz oz
105004 12 $42.59 NB NB NB NB
No Bid EA 0.77|EA 0.6367|EA EA EA EA
FRESH #3BBP 12 EA/CS  |9.24 102839 12 $7.64 NB NB NB NB
No Bid EA 0.5825(EA 0.4108[EA EA EA EA
FRESH#4BP-PKG |12 EA/CS  [6.99 101242 12 $4.93 NB NB NB NB
No Bid EA 0.999(EA 2.1285|EA EA EA EA
IMPACT #9480S 12 EA/CS 11.99 108086 72 $153.25 NB NB NB NB
No Bid 07 — 0.13325(0Z 0.1873[0z oz oz oz
(CHASE #438-5152
HASE #438-515 s |PLEE 100185 12 $44.96 NB NB NB NB
No Bid o oz 103106 12 $36.81 0.0959|0Z 0z NB NB NB oz NB oz
No Bid 0z 122002 0.1415{0Z 0.1533[0Z oz oz 0oz
cnasesszaiz | D00 o (3396 100184 12 $36.80 NB NB NB NB
i EA|
No Bid EA — " —— 37.7500(EA EA - - - EA - EA
No Bid EA EA 23.7500(EA EA EA EA
OB 102987 1 $23.75 NB NB NB NB
No Bid EA 18.98(EA 27.5000|EA EA EA EA
(CONTINENTAL #RT23 |1 EA/CS 18.98 103721 1 $27.50 NB NB NB NB
No Bid 100/EA 100/EA 100/EA 0.183 [100/EA JobGuard-Sm- 10.9 [100/EA 100/EA
No Bid LPF-S 10/100 183.00 LPFG AsPer  |1,000/Case |$109 NB
S&Snole #47
No Bid 100/EA| 100/BX, 10 13.99 [100/EA 100/EA 0.183 |100/EA Pl eRise 10.9 [100/EA 100/EA
HOSPECO #GLL105F-M BX/CS 139.9 No Bid LPF-M 10/100 183.00 LPFG As Per 1,000/Case [$109 NB
< la # AQ
No Bid 100/€A 100/8X, 10 13.99 [100/€A 100/EA 0.183 [100/EA JobGuard-Lrg- 10.9 [100/EA 100/EA
HOSPECO #GLL105F-L BX/CS ! 139.9 No Bid LPF-L 10/100 183.00 LPFG As Per 1,000/Case |$109 NB
Sample # 49
No Bid 100/EA 100/BX, 10 13.99 [100/EA 100/EA 0.183 [100/EA TOBSHE K 10.9 [100/EA 100/EA
HOSPECO HGLLIOSFXL | 0o 139.9 No Bid LPF-XL 10/100 183.00 LPFG AsPer  |1,000/Case |$109 NB
(S lo # 50
No Bid 100/€A 15.99 |100/EA 0.1955[100/EA 0.178 |100/EA 29.8 [100/EA 100/EA
T INT-Sm-NPFG-E
HOSPECO #GLN1O3ESM |0 ™ 159.9 108098 1000 $195.50 NPF-S 10/100 178.00 As Per Sample [1,000/Case [$109 NB
451
No Bid 100/€A 15.99 |100/EA 0.1955[100/EA 0.178 |100/EA 29.8 [100/EA 100/EA
INT-Med-NPFG-
o AOUIRE ég%zx’ 10 11509 108099 1000 $195.50 NPF-M 10/100 178.00 E As Per 1,000/Case |$298 NB
Sample # 52
No Bid 100/€A 15.99 |100/EA 0.1955[100/EA 0.178 |100/EA 29.8 [100/EA 100/EA
HOSPECO #GLN103F 100/BX, 10 INT-Lrg-NPFG-E
s B e 159.9 108100 1000 $195.50 NPF-L 10/100 178.00 As Per Sample [1,000/Case [$298 NB
453
No Bid 100 EA 15.99(100 EA 0.1955[100 EA 0.178[100 EA 29.8(100 EA 100 EA
INT-XL-NPFG
[HOSPECO 100/BX, 10
e s 159.9 108101 1000 $195.50 NPF-XL  [10/100 178.00 E As Per 1,000/Case  |$298 NB
Sample # 54
No Bid 100 EA L00/BX. 10 11.99[100 EA 0.0864[100 EA 0.081{100 EA Med Pride-Sm- 9.8[100 EA 100 EA
HOSPECOAGLVIOAE- > 11199 104120 1000 $86.43 VPF-S 10/100 81.00 VPFG As Per |1,000/Case  |$298 NB
BX/CS
Sample # 55
No Bid 100 EA L00/BX. 10 11.99(100 EA 0.0864[100 EA 0.081{100 EA Med Pride-Med 9.8[100 EA 100 EA
[ECRRHEELYINT > 11199 104121 1000 $86.43 VPE-M 10/100 81.00 VPFG As Per |1,000/Case |$98 NB
MED BX/CS
Sample # 56
No Bid 0Bl prco saLvioar- N00/BX. 10 11.99[100 EA 0.0864[100 EA 0.081{100 EA Med Pride-Lrg- 9.8[100 EA 100 EA
LARGE . * 7 |119.9 104122 1000 $86.43 VPF-L 10/100 81.00 'VPFG As Per [1,000/Case |$98 NB
3 BX/CS
Sample # 57
No Bid 100 EA LOU/BX. 10 11.99(100 EA 0.0864[100 EA 0.081{100 EA Med Pride-XL- 9.8(100 EA 100 EA
BRI axics 199 104195 1000 $86.43 VPE-XL  |10/100 81.00 VPFG As Per |1,000/Case |$98 NB

Sample # 58




No Bid o oz oz oz NB|oz oz
No Bid NB NB NB NB
No Bid RoLL ROLL 0.3484ROLL ROLL NB|ROLL ROLL
104963 96 $33.45 NB NB NB NB
No Bid G T ——— S2a1 0.0021[FT T - - o NB[FT B FT
No Bid G FT 0.0039]FT FT NB[FT FT
104678 |6 $18.70 NB NB NB NB
No Bid FT] FT 0.0050|FT FT NB|FT FT
103939 |6 $24.06 NB NB NB NB
No Bid of 2440z 0.3225/0Z 0.5443|0Z oz NB|oz oz
BAY #03821 BOTTLES/C|30.96 104019 24 $52.25 NB NB NB NB
s
No Bid GALL /1 9.99|GALL 12.5950|GALL GALL GALL GALL
INOPAK #5031-420-02 |GALLON/C [39.96 108304 |4 $50.38 NB NB NB NB NB
s
No Bid 1000 M 1000 ML 0.0068]1000 ML 1000 ML 1000 ML 1000 ML
104248 |6 $40.78 NB NB NB NB NB
No Bid 2000 M 2000 ML 2000 ML 2000 ML 2000 ML 2000 ML
No Bid NB NB NB NB NB
i 0z
goled oz No Bid oz oz NB NB NB NB o LCs-2 24 |43.92 LH P
i EA|
Mol HoSPECO #s00M  |500/CS  [37.99 0.075981EA 104833 [936 $87.56 EEER [ EA NB NB NB NB 2 SN2sg-C  |c2ss  [20.16 clilg el
No Bid EA 0.11998|EA 0.1415[EA EA EA 48.5/0.097
TAMPAX #T500 500/CS 59.99 100410 500 $70.76 NB NB NB NB TPX500 C500 48.5
No Bid EA|[DIAMOND WIPES 0.09283(EA EA EA EA EA
#F5927CAN35 12
*35/CAN* **SURFACE| . 38.99 No Bid NB
WIPE, EPA APPROVED)] CANS/CS
KILL CLAIM**
i EA|
Mo EE A 108305 450 $47.75 peoet(Le A NB NB NB NB = NB =
i EA|
Mot IMPACT #4902 200/CS 138 0.69|EA 101002 1 $146.00 Sy [ EA NB NB NB NB 2 NB EA
i EA|
Mot IMPACT #5032WG  |200/CS 118 0.59|EA 101004 1 $198.00 EEEDD [ B NB NB NB NB 2 NB 2
No Bid EAIBETTER BRUSH 8.99(EA 15.3300|EA EA EA EA
e 6EA 64 100593 1 $15.33 NB NB NB NB NB
No Bid EA 6.59[EA 5.1500|EA EA EA EA
ABCO #BR2SSE 6EA 39.54 100595 |6 $30.90 NB NB NB NB NB
NoEfE T BRUSH 12 EA 70.68 5.89|EA 12 $55.56 AEEITY (2R EA NB NB NB NB EQ NB EA
No Bid EA|LAMBSKIN SPEC 4.59EA 9.0400|EA EA EA EA
3sSESH *+3044° |12 EA 55.08 100623 1 $9.04 NB NB NB NB NB
[EXT**
No Bid AT e BRUSH 12 EA 71.88 5.99|EA 143660 12 $124.56 10.3800|EA EA NB NB NB NB EA NB EA
No Bid EA 47.98|EA 91.3100|EA EA EA EA
ABCO #T01007 1EA 47.98 102852 1 $91.31 NB NB NB NB NB
No Bid eAlanco 4.59EA 12.1000|EA EA EA EA
o asxpp. |I2ZEA/CS [55.08 104629 12 $145.20 NB NB NB NB NB
No Bid EA 2.59[EA 5.9500|EA EA EA EA
e 12EA/CS  [31.08 100691 12 $71.40 NB NB NB NB NB
No Bid EA[ABCO #01406NB 4.98[EA 16.9000(EA EA EA EA
**FOR DUST MOP 12 EA/CS  [59.76 100662 12 $202.80 NB NB NB NB NB
FRAME**
i EA|
goled ABCO #CLM303LWG [12/CS 47.88 3.99|EA 100667 |12 $63.75 S3125 B £ NB NB NB NB £ NB £
i EA|
No Bid ABCO #CLM303LWB | 12/CS 47.88 3.99|EA 103241 12 $63.95 SRR [ EA NB NB NB NB e NB EA
No Bid FAJACS 70190120 10/CS 289 2.89[EA 58820 10 $115.24 11.5240]EA EA NB NB NB NB EA NB EA
i EA|
goled ACS #35-20 5/CS 12.15 283 e 101277 |5 $16.51 220201 E4 EA NB NB NB NB £ NB EA
No Bid EA[MR CLEAN 1.027[EA 0.8939[EA EA EA EA
#PGC79009 **MUST  |36/CS 36.98 104330 36 $32.18 NB NB NB NB NB
IORDER IN
No Bid EA 0.19983[EA 0.6115|EA EA EA EA
Acs#016020120  [320cS  [11.99 100633 |60 $36.69 NB NB NB NB NB
i EA|
No Bid ABCO #LM203LCSNB 6/CS 29.88 LR 105189 |6 $15.89 AR = NB NB NB NB e NB e
i EA|
goled ACS #7220 5/CS 12.15 283 e 101274 |5 $16.19 32350/ E4 EA NB NB NB NB £ NB EA
No Bid POUND) 25t 2.7992|POUND 3.0000|POUND POUND POUND POUND
[HOSPECO #540-25 A A
soxcs |69 103574 |25 $75.00 NB NB NB NB NB
No Bid POUND) POUND POUND POUND POUND POUND
No Bid NB NB NB NB NB
No Bid EA EA 1.0200|EA EA EA EA
102633 10 $10.20 NB NB NB NB NB




No Bid & EA 15.7500]EA EA EA A
104391 $15.75 NB NB NB  [NB NB
No Bid A EA 9.1000[EA EA EA EA
104111 $9.10 NB NB NB  [NB NB
i EA|
ok EA 103020 $16.90 2620001 S8 EA NB NB NB NB £ NB EA
No Bid A EA 6.5600|EA EA EA EA
103256 $6.56 NB NB NB  [NB NB
i EA|
No Bid EA 10229 S16a1 16.4100(EA EA 5 . e EA B EA
i EA|
goled IMPACT #2600 6EA/CS  |41.94 6.99|EA 100780 $22.53 225300/ S8 £ NB NB NB NB £ NB £
No Bid EA|ABCO #WS0001 6 EA/CS 29.88 4.98 EA 100942 $14.39 14.3900|EA EA NB NB NB NB EA NB EA
i EAJABCO #00017 N . .
No Bid 12 EA/CS 13.68 1.14 EA 104344 $2.63 2.6300|EA EA NB NB NB NB EA NB EA
0.7560
No Bid EA| EA 103387 30 $22.68| EA EA NB NB NB NB EA NB EA
0.0000
NB NB NB [NB
No Bid EA| EA 108122 1 $0.00 EA EA EA NB EA
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