Finance & Budget Department
Procurement Division

11465 W. Civic Center Drive
Avondale, AZ 85323

Ph 623-333-2000

Request for Quotation 21-049 The First Book Project 1 2
Department Vendor Scholastic Literacy Iniatives Superior Text LLC
Neighborhood and Family Services Contact Jessica Arendarczyk Paula M. Craig
Division Telephone No 800-387-1437 #6275 (866) 482-8762 x118
Library Address 2315 Dean Street, Suite 600 151 Airport Industrial Drive
Requested By Name and Date City/State/Zip St. Charles, IL 60175 Ypsilanti, Ml 48198
Email Jarendarczyk@scholastic.com pcraig@superiortext.com

Description Qty Unit Price Extended Price Qty Unit Price Extended Price

e Boy Who Dared, A Novel Based on the True Story of a Hitler Youtn,
Paperback, 0-545-11879-4 5 $ 3.96| $ 19.80 5 $ 452 $ 22.60
Code of Honor, Paperback, 0-545-91044-7 4 $ 4.55| $ 18.20 4 $ 519 $ 20.76
Eight Tales of Terror, Paperback, 0-590-41136-5 6 $ 210 $ 12.60 6 $ 454 $ 27.24
Freak the Mighty, Paperback, 0-439-28606-9 6 $ 210 $ 12.60 6 $ 5.15 $ 30.90
Nothing But the Truth, A Documentary Novel, Paperback, 0-545-17415-5 6 $ 2.05| $ 12.30 6 $ 519 $§ 31.14
Prisoner B-3087, Based on the True Story by Ruth and Jack Gruener,
Paperback, 0-545-68844-2 6 $ 341 $ 20.46 6 $ 3.89 $ 23.34
Same But Different, Teen Lite on the Aufism Express, Paperback, 1-338-
15137-1 6 $ 341 § 20.46 6 $ 3.89] § 23.34
Touching Spirit Bear, Paperback, 0-439-40184-4 4 $ 453 $ 18.12 4 $ 517 $ 20.68
Bomb, The Race fo Build—and Steal—the World's Most Dangerous
Weapon, Paperback, 0-545-59597-5 4 $ 4.53] $ 18.12 4 $ 517 $ 20.68
Chasing Lincoln's Killer, Paperback, 0-545-22091-2 6 $ 268 $ 16.08| 6 $ 582 $ 34.92
Samurai Rising, The Epic Life of Minamoto Yoshitsune, Paperback, 1-338-
13378-0 5 $ 3.96| $§ 19.80 5 $ 452 $ 22.60
The Best Ghost Stories Ever, Paperback, 0-439-57426-9 3 $ 2.84 $ 8.52 3 $ 324 $ 9.72
The Raven, And Other Poems, Paperback, 0-439-22406-3 3 $ 2.84| $ 8.52 3 $ 324 § 9.72)
The Tiger Rising, Paperback, 0-439-38995-X 5 $ 2.09] $ 10.45] 5 $ 452 $ 22.60
Patina, Paperback, 1-5344-1785-0 3 $ 341 § 10.23 3 $ 3.89] § 11.67
Bound by Ice, A True North Pole Survival Story, Paperback, 1-338-33177-
9 4 $ 339 $ 13.56] 4 $ 3.87| $ 15.48
Chasing Space (Young Readers' Edition), An Astronauf's Story of Grit,
Grace, and Second Chances, Paperback, 1-338-54639-2 4 $ 341 $ 13.64 4 $ 3.89 § 15.56
In the City, Board Book, 1-338-17000-7 6 $ 339 $ 20.34 6 $ 3.87| $ 23.22
In the Garden, Board Book, 1-338-17001-5 6 $ 339 § 20.34 6 $ 3.87] § 23.22
Inside, Outside...All Around!, Board Book, 1-338-28380-4 6 $ 3.39 $ 20.34 6 $ 3.87| $ 23.22
Bear Shadow, Paperback, 0-590-44054-3 4 $ 1.78] $ 7.12 4 $ 3.87[ $§ 15.48
Giggle, Giggle, Quack, Paperback, 0-439-52153-X 4 $ 1.98[ $ 7.92 4 $ 517 $ 20.68
Frog on a Log?, Paperback, 1-338-13637-2 4 $ 1.20| $ 4.80 4 $ 324 § 12.96
Head, Shoulders, Knees, and Toes, Paperback, 0-545-15604-1 4 $ 1.80] $ 7.20 4 $ 260 $ 10.40|
| Am Not a Chair!, Paperback, 1-338-28320-0 4 $ 1.98] $ 7.92 4 $ 3.89] § 15.56
The Best Job Ever!, Paperback, 1-338-22700-9 4 $ 1.50] $ 6.00 4 $ 322 $ 12.88|
Pete the Cat and the Surprise Teacher, My First, Paperback, 1-338-32337-
7 4 $ 228 $ 9.12 4 $ 2.60] § 10.40
A Whale of a Tale, Level 1, Paperback, 1-338-13285-7 4 $ 119 $ 4.76 4 $ 322 $ 12.88]
Peppa Goes Swimming, Paperback, 0-545-83491-0 4 $ 227 $ 9.08| 4 $ 3.99 § 15.96
Princess Truly in | Am Truly, Paperback, 1-338-22785-8 4 $ 2.84| $ 11.36 4 $ 324 $ 12.96
The Unexpected Adventure of Fluffen the Bear, Paperback, 1-338-28419-
3 4 $ 282 $ 11.28 4 $ 3.22] § 12.88
What Will We Build Today?, Paperback, 1-338-10489-6 4 $ 2.35| $ 9.40 4 $ 322 $ 12.88|
Bugs! Bugs! Bugs!, Paperback, 0-439-17208-X 4 $ 1.55| $ 6.20 4 $ 322 § 12.88
Hoot, Owl!, Pre-Reader, Paperback, 0-545-89013-6 4 $ 1.20] $ 4.80 4 $ 322 $ 12.88|
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Safari, Pre-Reader, Paperback, 0-545-34266-X 4 $ 1.20] $ 4.80 4 $ 322 $ 12.88|
Tigers, Paperback, 0-545-85373-7 4 $ 1.35| $ 5.40 4 $ 322 § 12.88
Endling: The Last, Paperback, 1-338-61274-3 3 $ 567 $ 17.01 3 $ 647 $ 19.41
The Storm Runner, Paperback, 1-338-60394-9 3 $ 510 $ 15.30 3 $ 582 $§ 17.46
Spin, Paperback, 1-338-58218-6 6 $ 3.98| $ 23.88| 6 $ 7.14| $ 42.84]
Pleasure Reading Grade 6, a collection of 50, 0-545-63566-7 1 $ 99.00[ $ 99.00 1 NoBid| $ -
Bargain Book Box Grades 7-9, a collection of 100, 0-439-57414-5 1 $ 141.00| $ 141.00 1 No Bid| $ -
Best New Board Books Grade PreK 2020-2021, a collection of 10, 1-338-
71305-1 4 $ 35.00[ $ 140.00 4 No Bid| § -
Grow on Steam Board Books, a collection of 5, 1-338-71323-X 4 $ 15.00( $ 60.00 4 No Bid| $ -
Clifford The Small Red Puppy Grade PreK <BOARD BOOKS>, a
collection of 6, 1-338-31245-6 4 $ 14.50| $ 58.00| 4 No Bid| § -
Sing Along Grades PreK-K <BOARD BOOKS>, a collection of 4, 0-545-
38614-4 4 $ 13.00| $ 52.00| 4 NoBid| $ -
Babies on the Move PreK-K'<BOARD BOOKS>, a collection of 4, 0-545-
62695-1 4 $ 13.50| $ 54.00| 4 No Bid| § -
Board Books Galore Grade PreK, a collection of 10, 0-439-34037-3 4 $ 32.00[ $ 128.00 4 No Bid| $ -
Favorite Board Books Grade PreK, a collection of 10, 0-590-51806-2 4 $ 35.00[ $ 140.00| 4 NoBid| $ -
NT: Early Childhood Board Books, a collection of 40, 1-338-72399-5 4 $ 140.00| $ 560.00 4 No Bid| $ -
Best New Books Grade PreK 2020-2021, a collection of 20, 1-338-71316-
7 4 $ 61.00[ $ 244.00 4 No Bid| § -
Best New Books Grade K 2020-2021, a collection of 20, 1-338-71315-9 4 $ 69.00[ $ 276.00 4 No Bid| $ -
Best New Books Grade 1 2020-2021, a collection of 20, 1-338-71306-X 4 $ 65.00( $ 260.00 4 NoBid| $ -
Best New Books Grade 2 2020-2021, a collection of 20, 1-338-71307-8 4 $ 65.00[ $ 260.00 4 No Bid| $ -
PreK Concepts Collection Grade PreK, a collection of 20, 1-338-32636-8 4 $ 59.00[ $ 236.00 4 NoBid| $ -
Laugh Out Loud PreK, a collection of 25, 0-545-20589-1 4 $ 81.00[ $ 324.00 4 No Bid| $ -
123's Collection Grades PreK-K, a collection of 15, 0-439-13811-6 4 $ 4750 $ 190.00 4 NoBid| $ -
ABC's Grades PreK-K, a collection of 15, 0-439-13812-4 4 $ 49.00| $ 196.00 4 No Bid| $ -
Classroom Favorites Grades 1-2, a collection of 20, 1-338-22323-2 4 $ 65.00( $ 260.00 4 NoBid| $ -
NT: Kindergarten Read Aloud, a collection of 20, 1-338-72413-4 4 $ 66.00[ $ 264.00 4 No Bid| $ -
NT: Best Sellers Grades K-2, a collection of 25, 1-338-72385-5 4 $ 86.00| $ 344.00 4 NoBid| $ -
Laugh Out Loud! Grades K-2, a collection of 20, 0-439-80967-3 4 $ 67.50[ $ 270.00 4 No Bid| $ -
Favorite Books Grades K-1, a collection of 25, 0-590-64335-5 4 $ 79.00[ $ 316.00 4 NoBid| $ -
Favorite Books Grade 2, a collection of 25, 0-590-64336-2 4 $ 76.00[ $ 304.00, 4 No Bid| $ -
NT: Best of Scholastic Grades K-1, a collection of 20, 1-338-72383-9 4 $ 69.00[ $ 276.00 4 NoBid| $ -
NT: Best of Scholastic Grades 2-3, a collection of 20, 1-338-72381-2 4 $ 67.00[ $ 268.00 4 No Bid| $ -
Favorite First Graphics Grades 1-3, a collection of 8, 1-338-60212-8 4 $ 28.00[ $ 112.00, 4 NoBid| $ -
Fantasy Grades 1-3, a collection of 10, 1-338-22247-3 4 $ 32.00[ $ 128.00 4 No Bid| $ -
Acorn Books Grades PreK-2, a collection of 8, 1-338-59446-X 4 $ 20.00[ $ 80.00 4 NoBid| $ -
Branches Chapter Books Collection Grades 1-3, a collection of 20, 1-338-
32641-4 4 $ 51.00] $ 204.00 4 NoBid| $ -
Beginning Chapter Books Grades 1-2, a collection of 10, 0-439-57505-2 4 $ 28.00[ $ 112.00] 4 NoBid| $ -
Early Chapter Books Grades 1-2, a collection of 12, 0-545-39321-3 3 $ 33.00[ $ 99.00 3 No Bid| $ -
NT: Best New Books Grade 3 2020-2027, a collection of 20, 1-338-72378-
2 4 $ 73.00[ $ 292.00 4 No Bid| § -
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Best New Books Grade 4 2020-2021, a collection of 20, 1-338-71309-4 4 $ 85.00[ $ 340.00, 4 No Bid| $ -
NT: Best New Books Grade 5 2020-2027, a collection of 20, 1-338-72379-
0 4 $ 77.00] $ 308.00 4 NoBid| §$ -
Best of Scholastic Grades 3-5, a collection of 25, 0-439-23272-4 6 $ 89.00[ $ 534.00 6 No Bid| $ -
NT: Best Sellers Grades 3-5, a collection of 25, 1-338-72384-7 6 $ 82.00] $ 492.00] 6 No Bid| § -
Boys' Pick 20 Grades 3-5, a collection of 20, 0-439-80965-7 6 $ 71.00[ $ 426.00 6 No Bid| $ -
Girls' Pick 20 Grades 3-5, a collection of 20, 0-439-80963-0 6 $ 73.00] $ 438.00 6 No Bid| § -
Favorite Books Grade 3, a collection of 25, 0-590-64337-1 4 $ 84.00[ $ 336.00, 4 No Bid| $ -
Favorite Books Grade 4, a collection of 25, 0-590-64341-X 4 $ 85.00] $ 340.00 4 No Bid| § -
Favorite Books Grade 5, a collection of 25, 0-590-64342-8 4 $ 92.00[ $ 368.00 4 No Bid| $ -
NT: Favorite Authors Grades 3-5, a collection of 40, 1-338-72403-7 3 $ 150.00{ $ 450.00| 3 No Bid| § -
NT: Favorite Characters Grades 3-5, a collection of 15, 1-338-72407-X 6 $ 52.00[ $ 312.00, 6 No Bid| $ -
Fantasy, Mystery and Adventure Grades 3-5, a collecfion of 30, 0-590-
14878-8 6 $ 106.00( $ 636.00| 6 NoBid| §$ -
Amazing Animals Grades 3-5, a collection of 15, 0-545-28485-6 6 $ 47.00] $ 282.00 6 No Bid| $ -
NT: Best New Books Grade 6 2020-2027, a collection of 20, 1-338-72380-
4 3 $ 90.00] $ 270.00| 3 NoBid| § -
Best New Books Grade 7 2020-2021, a collection of 20, 1-338-71312-4 3 $ 85.00[ $ 255.00 3 No Bid| $ -
Best New Books Grade 8 2020-2021, a collection of 20, 1-338-71313-2 3 $ 105.00( $ 315.00 3 No Bid| § -
Favorite Books Grade 6, a collection of 25, 0-590-64343-6 4 $ 95.00[ $ 380.00, 4 No Bid| $ -
Favorite Books Grade 7, a collection of 20, 0-590-64347-9 4 $ 79.00] $ 316.00 4 No Bid| § -
NT: Favorite Books Grade 8, a collection of 15, 1-338-72406-1 3 $ 63.00[ $ 189.00 3 No Bid| $ -
NT: Award Winners Grades 6-8, a collection of 10, 1-338-72377-4 7 $ 38.00] $ 266.00| 7 No Bid| § -
NT: Treasury of Books Grades 6-9, a collection of 40, 1-338-72427-4 4 $ 169.00| $ 676.00 4 No Bid| $ -
NT: Best of Scholastic Grades 6-8, a collection of 15, 1-338-72382-0 6 $ 72.00] $ 432.00 6 No Bid| § -
NT: Laugh Out Loud! Grades 6-9, a collection of 10, 1-338-72414-2 6 $ 43.00[ $ 258.00 6 No Bid| $ -
Thrillers & Chillers Grades 6-9, a collection of 10, 0-439-23308-9 7 $ 38.00] $ 266.00 7 No Bid| § -
Best of Scholastic Grades 9-12, a collection of 30, 0-545-20578-6 4 $ 136.00| $ 544.00 4 No Bid| $ -
Award Winners Grades 9-12, a collection of 10, 0-545-20577-8 4 $ 48.50[ $ 194.00 4 No Bid| § -
Boys' Pick 20 Grades 9-12, a collection of 20, 0-545-20576-X 4 $ 91.00] $ 364.00 4 No Bid| $ -
Girls' Pick 20 Grades 9-12, a collection of 20, 0-545-20006-7 4 $ 103.00( $ 412.00] 4 NoBid| § -
Favorite Books Grades 9-12, a collection of 20, 1-338-33890-0 4 $ 99.00[ $ 396.00 4 No Bid| $ -
Young Adult Grades 9-12, a collection of 10, 0-439-90160-X 5 $ 46.00] $ 230.00 5 NoBid| $ -
Shapes, Board Book, 0-439-91108-7 6 $ 2.00[ $ 12.00 6 No Bid| $ -
Baby Eats, Board Book, 0-545-37195-3 6 $ 1.85] $ 11.10 6 $ 3.87] § 23.22
Baby Feels, Board Book, 0-545-37196-1 6 $ 2.00[ $ 12.00 6 $ 3.87| § 23.22
Baby Loves, Board Book, 0-545-37197-X 6 $ 1.78] $ 10.68 6 $ 3.87[ $§ 23.22
Baby Moves, Board Book, 0-545-37198-8 6 $ 1.78] § 10.68 6 $ 3.87| § 23.22
Baby Plays, Board Book, 0-545-37200-3 6 $ 1.50[ $ 9.00 6 $ 3.87] § 23.22
The More We Get Together, Board Book, 0-545-37204-6 6 $ 1.78| $ 10.68| 6 $ 454 $ 27.24
Five Sci-Fi Thrillers, Paperback, 0-545-74734-1 6 $ 1.63] $ 9.78| 6 $ 3.87| $§ 23.22
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Baa-Choo!, Paperback, 0-439-86964-1 4 $ 1.35] $ 5.40 4 $ 293 $ 11.72
If You Give a Pig a Party, Paperback, 0-545-21763-6 4 $ 1.50| $ 6.00 4 $ 387 $§ 15.48
There Was an Old Lady Who Swallowed Fly Guy, Paperback, 0-545-
10437-8 4 $ 149 $ 5.96] 4 $ 322 $ 12.88
Scout, Paperback, 0-439-87412-2 4 $ 1.50[ $ 6.00 4 $ 3.24] § 12.96
El abuson del pantano negro, Spanish, 0-545-34277-5 3 $ 1.00[ $ 3.00 3 $ 259 $ 7.77
Gus hace un regalo, Spanish, 0-545-49851-1 3 $ 1.00| $ 3.00 3 $ 259 § 7.77|
The Emperor's New Clothes 7 El traje nuevo del emperador, Bilingual, O-
545-02995-3 3 $ 1.00[ $ 3.00 3 NoBid| $ -
Now, What? / ;Ahora qué?, Bilingual, 0-439-78372-0 4 $ 1.00[ $ 4.00 4 $ 259 § 10.36
Quotations Taken By: Subtotal| $ 18,382.11 $ 975.26
Jill Lin, Senior Buyer Freight'| $ i $ i
Date: 05/04/2021 Tax (8.8%)| $ 1,617.63 $ 85.82
Note: 2 bidders responded to this RFQ. Bidder 1 offers all line items and Bidder .
2 offers only 45% of all line items. For the total price on items both bidders can Total on All Line Items| $ 19,999.74 $ 1,061.08
offer, Bidder 1's price is the lowest. It's the City's best interest to award a ltems Of‘fering 100% 45%
purchase order to Bidder 1 because they can offer all line items and Bidder 1
offers the lowest prices comparing to Bidder 2 Total on Items Both Bidders Offer| $ 595.11 $ 975.26
1. Pricing should be F.O.B. destination with freight included.
Delivery (Calendar Days)
2. Payment Terms should be Net 30 days. Payment Terms
Recommended Award:
Procurement Review/Approval: gl Lon Printed Name Jill Lin




