Portage Public Schools
RFP #10630
February 2, 2017 --- 1:00 PM

Vendor Name
Address
Contact Name

Contact E Mail
Familial
Iran Econ Act
Legal Status Form

Unit Cost per Chromebook

Unit Cost per G Suite for license

Total for 420 Chromebks &
licenses

Vendor Name
Address
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Iran Econ Act
Legal Status Form

Unit Cost per Chromebook

Unit Cost per G Suite for license

Total for 420 Chromebks &
licenses

Vendor Name
Address
Contact Name

Contact E Mail
Familial
Iran Econ Act
Legal Status Form

Unit Cost per Chromebook

Unit Cost per G Suite for license

Total for 420 Chromebks &
licenses
Vendor Name
Address
Contact Name

Contact E Mail

Familial

Riverside Technologies

Mobile Advance

Taza Supplies

Hypertec Direct

tmccabe@1rti.com

Presidio Worth Ave Group OM Office Supply
Sioux City, SD Walnut, CA Willowbrook, IL Tempe, AZ Wixom, Ml Stillwater, OK Mechanicsburg, PA
Ron Cheng Farhan Khan Mike Marracino Jeff Seelenbinder Lonna Freshley

Manish Agarwal

Burlington, KY.

Moorhead, MN

Tempe, AZ

St. Paul, MN

Laurel, MS

rcheng@mobileadvance.com fkhan@tazasupplies.com bidsus@hypertec.com iseelenbinder@presidio.com LonnaM@worthavegroup.com mani@omos.com
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
$ 142.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 767.86 | $ 14499 | $ 227.99 No Bid $ 165.00
$ 2550 | $ 24.00 not offered $ 76.00 | $ 24.72 No Bid $ 24.40
$ 76,650.00 | $ 98,280.00 | $ 322,501.20 | $ 92,815.80 | $ 106,138.20 No Bid $ 79,548.00
Cbw ELB US Inc SuperBiiz SHI CDI PCMG System Solutions
Vernon Hills, IL Pleasanton, CA San Jose, CA Somerset, NJ Markham, ON Dayton, OH Northbrook, IL
Wes Farrell John Zajac Yumei Tang Jason Dehaan Jesse Fiore Pam Shamblin Keith Williams
wesfar@cdw.com i.zajac@elbalobal.com no email Jason_Dehaan@shi.com ifiore@cdicomputers.com pamela.shamblin@pcmg.com keith.williams@thessi.com
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
$ 189.00 | $ 317.00 | $ 276.40 $187.84 / $177.32 229.00 | $ 256.69 | $ 226.94
$ 24.00 | $ 30.00| $ 2499 | $ 23.79 $0 $ 23.98 $0
$ 89,460.00 | $ 145,740.00 | $ 126,583.80 $88,884.60 / $84,466.20 $ 96,180.00 | $ 117,881.40 | $ 95,314.80
Promevo ByteSpeed Insight Public Sector Firefly Computers Howard Technologies Office Depot Sehi Computer

Meredith Molony

Nate Sundby

Randy Walls

Ryan Lapadat

Boca Raton, FL

Rochester Hills, Ml

meredith.molony@promevo.com

nsundby@bytespeed.com

Randy.Walls@insight.com

flycomputers.com

bids@howardcomputers.com

Jessica Haves

Carlos Guzman

Craig Sehi

carlos.guzman@officedepot.com

cr:

Iran Econ Act

Legal Status Form

Unit Cost per Chromebook

Unit Cost per G Suite for license

Total for 420 Chromebks &

licenses

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
$ 15372 | $ 194.00 | $ 200.96 | $ 192.00 | $ 260.00 | $ 193.12 $179.08 / $177.10
$ 2325 | $ 26.00 | $ 2437 | $ 2400 | $ 25.00 $0 $ 24.10
$ 7432740 | $ 142,800.00 | $ 94,638.60 | $ 90,720.00 | $ 119,700.00 | $ 81,110.40 $85,335.60 / $84,504.00
Ritmo Investments Chrome Pilot Allegiant Tek Aprisa Technology Apple Trinity 3 Technology
Las Vegas, NV. New York, NY Comstock Park, Ml Roslyn, NY Austin, TX St. Paul, MN
Subhash Chadha Andrew Hatam Edwin Grullon-Perez Barry Weinstein Matt Baker Jonathan Worre
subhash@tmmsi ahatam@chromepi m egpcontacts@allegiantteku: m sales@eap! m bids@appl m worre@trini
Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes
$ 196.00 | $ 166.00 | $ 230.00 | $ 244.00 No Bid $ 219.00
$ 2425 | $ 2350 | $ 299 | $ 25.00 No Bid $0
*$259.99 *Filled *$269.00
out incorrectly, total should have been| *Filled out incorrectly, total should
$ 92,505.00 79,590.00 $109,195.80 have been $112,980.00 No Bid $ 91,980.00
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