
WATERLINE PARTS, IFB #16-125

BID TABULATION

Line 

Item Description Unit

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price
Unit Price

Extended 

Price
Unit Price

Extended 

Price

ALL PIPE IS PRICE PER FOOT

1 4" HDPE 13.5 IPS PIPE BLUE STRIPE FT 500 1.55$           $775.00 2.50$          $1,250.00 2.35$          $1,175.00 1.89$          $945.00 1.96$          $980.00 1.53$          $765.00

2
6" HDPE 13.5 IPS PIPE BLUE STRIPE FT 500 3.34$           $1,670.00 5.19$          $2,595.00 4.20$          $2,100.00 3.93$          $1,965.00 3.88$          $1,940.00 3.38$          $1,690.00

3 8" HDPE 13.5 IPS PIPE BLUE STRIPE FT 3000 5.67$           $17,010.00 9.75$          $29,250.00 6.10$          $18,300.00 6.69$          $20,070.00 6.99$          $20,970.00 5.66$          $16,980.00

4 12" HDPE 13.5 DIPS PIPE BLUE STRIPE FT 3000 13.28$         $39,840.00 21.80$        $65,400.00 14.25$        $42,750.00 15.59$        $46,770.00 15.11$        $45,330.00 12.40$        $37,200.00

5 4" IPS HDPE MJ ADAPTER WITH ACC KIT EA 10 92.51$         $925.10 73.00$        $730.00 69.25$        $692.50 108.79$      $1,087.90 77.69$        $776.90 70.80$        $708.00

6 6" IPS HDPE MJ ADAPTER WITH ACC KIT EA 20 117.02$       $2,340.40 90.00$        $1,800.00 88.75$        $1,775.00 137.69$      $2,753.80 89.68$        $1,793.60 86.20$        $1,724.00

7 8" IPS HDPE MJ ADAPTER WITH ACC KIT EA 60 139.00$       $8,340.00 97.00$        $5,820.00 102.75$      $6,165.00 163.49$      $9,809.40 102.75$      $6,165.00 99.10$        $5,946.00

8 12" DIPS HDPE MJ ADAPTER WITH ACC KIT EA 60 228.19$       $13,691.40 152.00$      $9,120.00 138.00$      $8,280.00 268.49$      $16,109.40 156.45$      $9,387.00 147.25$      $8,835.00

9 4" IPS HDPE MOLDED 45 BEND EA 10 38.76$         $387.60 13.00$        $130.00 12.00$        $120.00 45.59$        $455.90 11.52$        $115.20 12.90$        $129.00

10 6" IPS HDPE MOLDED 45 BEND EA 10 64.25$         $642.50 38.00$        $380.00 30.00$        $300.00 75.59$        $755.90 33.87$        $338.70 30.50$        $305.00

11 8" IPS HDPE MOLDED 45 BEND EA 20 129.95$       $2,599.00 91.00$        $1,820.00 82.00$        $1,640.00 152.89$      $3,057.80 86.13$        $1,722.60 74.50$        $1,490.00

12 12" DIPS HDPE MOLDED 45 BEND EA 20 779.94$       $15,598.80 672.00$      $13,440.00 110.00$      $2,200.00 917.59$      $18,351.80 127.27$      $2,545.40 327.70$      $6,554.00

13 4" IPS HDPE MOLDED TEE EA 5 52.65$         $263.25 18.00$        $90.00 16.00$        $80.00 73.69$        $368.45 16.58$        $82.90 15.80$        $79.00

14 6" IPS HDPE MOLDED TEE EA 5 86.16$         $430.80 45.00$        $225.00 41.00$        $205.00 101.39$      $506.95 41.14$        $205.70 39.10$        $195.50

15 8" IPS HDPE MOLDED TEE EA 10 168.43$       $1,684.30 114.00$      $1,140.00 98.00$        $980.00 198.19$      $1,981.90 112.53$      $1,125.30 94.60$        $946.00

16 12" DIPS HDPE MOLDED TEE EA 10 1,071.89$    $10,718.90 981.00$      $9,810.00 250.00$      $2,500.00 1,261.09$   $12,610.90 302.10$      $3,021.00 708.00$      $7,080.00

17 8" X 6" IPS HDPE MOLDED TEE EA 10 125.00$       $1,250.00 197.00$      $1,970.00 171.00$      $1,710.00 147.09$      $1,470.90 155.95$      $1,559.50 149.36$      $1,493.60

18 12" DIPS X 8" IPS HDPE TEE EA 10 279.99$       $2,799.90 382.00$      $3,820.00 205.00$      $2,050.00 329.39$      $3,293.90 391.60$      $3,916.00 373.76$      $3,737.60

19 12" DIPS X 6" IPS HDPE TEE EA 10 221.74$       $2,217.40 285.00$      $2,850.00 194.00$      $1,940.00 260.89$      $2,608.90 253.74$      $2,537.40 276.28$      $2,762.80

20 2" CENTRAL ELECTRO FUSION COUPLING EA 10 6.96$           $69.60 11.00$        $110.00 7.00$          $70.00 12.09$        $120.90 7.41$          $74.10 7.21$          $72.10

SECTION 1 - HDPE
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WATERLINE PARTS, IFB #16-125

BID TABULATION

Line 

Item Description Unit

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price
Unit Price

Extended 

Price
Unit Price

Extended 

Price

ISCO Industries CES Industrial Piping Supply Industrial Sales Schulte Supply IMCO Utility Supply Co. HD Supply Waterworks

21 4" CENTRAL ELECTRO FUSION COUPLING EA 10 20.39$         $203.90 30.00$        $300.00 21.00$        $210.00 38.89$        $388.90 20.60$        $206.00 23.17$        $231.70

22 8" CENTRAL ELECTRO FUSION COUPLING EA 20 73.48$         $1,469.60 110.00$      $2,200.00 76.00$        $1,520.00 134.49$      $2,689.80 68.46$        $1,369.20 80.22$        $1,604.40

 TOTAL 

SECTION 1: 
$124,927.45

 TOTAL 

SECTION 1: 
$154,250.00

 TOTAL 

SECTION 1: 
$96,762.50

 TOTAL 

SECTION 1: 
$148,173.40

 TOTAL 

SECTION 1: 
$106,161.50

 TOTAL 

SECTION 1: 
$100,528.70

Non-Responsive

ALL PIPE IS PRICE PER FOOT

23 2" SDR 21 PVC PIPE FT 100 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0.43$          $43.00 0.48$          $48.00 0.35$          $35.00

24 4" SDR 21 PVC PIPE FT 100 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1.39$          $139.00 1.68$          $168.00 1.41$          $141.00

25 6" SDR 21 PVC PIPE FT 200 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 2.95$          $590.00 2.69$          $538.00 2.42$          $484.00

26 8" SDR 21 PVC PIPE FT 100 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 5.00$          $500.00 4.41$          $441.00 4.16$          $416.00

27 12" C900 DR 14 PVC PIPE FT 100 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 17.40$        $1,740.00 15.66$        $1,566.00 16.18$        $1,618.00

28 3/4" Ford Corp Stop CC threads x CC CTS PJ EA 50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 24.59$        $1,229.50 32.75$        $1,637.50 23.77$        $1,188.50

29 1/2" CTS X 3/4" CTS PJ COUPLING EA 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 14.01$        $280.20 N/A N/A 14.44$        $288.80

30 3/4" CTS X 3/4" PVC PJ COUPLING EA 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 18.59$        $371.80 21.98$        $439.60 13.13$        $262.60

31 1" CTS X 3/4" CTS PJ COUPLING EA 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 15.89$        $158.90 14.85$        $148.50 16.40$        $164.00

32 1" CTS X 1" CTS PJ COUPLING EA 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 15.69$        $156.90 14.68$        $146.80 16.15$        $161.50

33 2" CTS X 2" CTS PJ COUPLING EA 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 70.79$        $353.95 68.50$        $342.50 72.96$        $364.80

34 MUELLER 5 1/4" X 3.5' BURY HYDRANT EA 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1,356.00$   $13,560.00 1,575.99$   $15,759.90 1,524.00$   $15,240.00

35 MUELLER 5 1/4" X 4' BURY HYDRANT EA 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1,389.00$   $13,890.00 1,613.59$   $16,135.90 1,561.50$   $15,615.00

36 8" X 6" MJ REDUCER EA 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 42.09$        $210.45 47.26$        $236.30 40.08$        $200.40

37 8" X 4" MJ REDUCER EA 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 39.59$        $197.95 45.25$        $226.25 42.06$        $210.30

38 12" X 8" MJ REDUCER EA 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 73.79$        $368.95 88.24$        $441.20 62.74$        $313.70

39 12" X 6" MJ REDUCER EA 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 71.79$        $358.95 84.40$        $422.00 60.99$        $304.95

END OF SECTION 1

NO BID

SECTION 2  - OTHER

NO BID NO BID Schulte Supply IMCO Utility Supply Co. HD Supply Waterworks
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Line 

Item Description Unit
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Annual 

Quantity

Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price
Unit Price

Extended 

Price
Unit Price

Extended 

Price

ISCO Industries CES Industrial Piping Supply Industrial Sales Schulte Supply IMCO Utility Supply Co. HD Supply Waterworks

40 12" X 4" MJ REDUCER EA 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 82.49$        $412.45 59.84$        $299.20 70.83$        $354.15

41 4" MJ 45 BEND EA 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 25.19$        $251.90 28.40$        $284.00 23.60$        $236.00

42 6" MJ 45 BEND EA 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 40.39$        $403.90 46.10$        $461.00 38.95$        $389.50

43 8" MJ 45 BEND EA 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 58.89$        $588.90 67.80$        $678.00 57.00$        $570.00

44 12" MJ 45 BEND EA 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 128.69$      $1,286.90 146.72$      $1,467.20 123.50$      $1,235.00

45 MUELLER 4" MJ GATE VALVE EA 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 323.00$      $3,230.00 391.48$      $3,914.78 375.60$      $3,756.00

46 MUELLER 8" MJ GATE VALVE EA 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 656.00$      $13,120.00 783.88$      $15,677.60 762.50$      $15,250.00

47 MUELLER 12" MJ GATE VALVE EA 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1,293.00$   $25,860.00 1,569.91$   $31,398.20 1,502.51$   $30,050.20

48 4" MJ PLUG EA 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 13.59$        $67.95 16.04$        $80.20 13.60$        $68.00

49 6" MJ PLUG EA 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 26.39$        $131.95 31.05$        $155.25 25.60$        $128.00

50 8" MJ PLUG EA 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 39.59$        $197.95 43.70$        $218.50 41.50$        $207.50

51 12" MJ PLUG EA 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 68.49$        $342.45 74.75$        $373.75 72.25$        $361.25

 TOTAL 

SECTION 2: 
$0.00

 TOTAL 

SECTION 2: 
$0.00

 TOTAL 

SECTION 2: 
$0.00

 TOTAL 

SECTION 2: 
$80,043.90

 TOTAL 

SECTION 2: 
$93,705.13

 TOTAL 

SECTION 2: 
$89,614.15

Did not bid all 

items in this 

section.

ALL COPPER IS IS PRICE PER FOOT

52 3/4" CTS ROLL COPPER PIPE TYPE K FT 1000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 2.49$          $2,490.00 3.48$          $3,480.00 2.25$          $2,250.00

53 1" CTS ROLL COPPER PIPE TYPE K FT 700 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 3.20$          $2,240.00 4.53$          $3,171.00 2.93$          $2,051.00

54 2" CTS ROLL COPPER PIPE TYPE K FT 200 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 8.49$          $1,698.00 10.45$        $2,090.00 7.70$          $1,540.00

 TOTAL 

SECTION 3: 
$0.00

 TOTAL 

SECTION 3: 
$0.00

 TOTAL 

SECTION 3: 
$0.00

 TOTAL 

SECTION 3: 
$6,428.00

 TOTAL 

SECTION 3: 
$8,741.00

 TOTAL 

SECTION 3: 
$5,841.00

Bid prices are firm through December 31, 2016.

END OF SECTION 3

END OF SECTION 2

NO BID

SECTION 3  - COPPER

NO BID NO BID Schulte Supply IMCO Utility Supply Co. HD Supply Waterworks
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