
CONCRETE PRICE PER ITEM REQUESTED PRICE: PER CUBIC YARD PRICE PER ITEM 
REQUESTED

PRICE: PER CUBIC YARD

6 Bag Mix
7 Bag Mix $98.00 $95.00
8 Pea Gravel Mix $101.60 $101.00
Calcium Chloride Additive, per cubic yard $104.40 $111.00
Hot Water Winter Mix, per gallon/cubic yard (please specify) $2.25 $2.25
Fibers, per cubic yard $6.00 $6.00
Rebar #4 21 Foot Length $6.00 $5.00
Rebar#5 21 Foot Length no bid 
Rebar #6 21 Foot Length no bid 
Rebar #7 21 Foot Length no bid 
Concrete Blocks: 2 1/2' x 2 1/2' X 5' no bid $35.00
Concrete Blocks: 2 1/2' X 2 1/2' X 2 1/2' no bid $20.00
Concrete Blocks: 2' X 2' X 2' $45.00
Concrete Blocks: 2' X 2' X 4' $45.00
Flowable Fill-CY $107.00 $85.00
Short Load Fee (if applicable, must define when applied) Less than 4 yrds Extra $55 fee 3 yards and under $100 per load

202005 Concrete Materials Tab Sheet

Havin Material Service 527 East Independence Union, 
Mo 63084

Eastern Missouri Concrete po box 440187 St. Louis, 
Mo 63144

Vendor Name and Address


