HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
Purchasing Department

AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED BIDS

ITB 17-023
ADVANCED LIFE SUPPORT DRUGS AND SUPPLIES

Bid opening: 3/15/17

BASE FOR
T _ __AWARD
UNIT/
INUM DESCRIPTION ITEM # BASE FOR | E':ff A f:ii Z":'f: s RANK
| _ AWARD | 1 ]
1 Adenocard; 6 mg /2 mi - Vial 3oy |
 Bound Tree Medical | 30102 Each | $41000 | 10 | $41.00 1
- Henry Schein, Inc. | 1238882 Each  $114600 10 | $114.60 2
~ Midwest Medical Supply 63323-065102 Each $16.5800 | 10 $165.80 3
| Moore Medical, LLC. | 68442 fach  $423%00 1 | $42.39 4
[ Nashville Med. & EMS '  Nobid |
2 Adenocard; 12 mg / 4 ml - Vl$| —:'{ﬂ
~ Bound Tree Medical | 301-04 Each | $119500 | 10 | $119.50 1
| Midwest Medical Supply | 25021-030104 Each $149700 10 | $149.70 2
" HenrySchein,Inc. | 25021030104 Each  $40.0100 | 10 $400.10 3
' Moore Medical, LLC. 73724 Each $80.4000 1 $80.40 4
.~ NashvilleMed. &EMS _ | Nobid | |
3 Albuterol;2.5mg/3mi- mm T e
~ Midwest Medical Supply | 00487-950125 Each | $0.1500 | 25 $3.75 1
= ~ Moore Medical, LLC. 88283 Each | $0.1616 | 25 $4.04 2
Bound Tree Medical | 9501-01 Each $0.1930 30 $5.79 3
_ Henry Schein, Inc. | 487950125 Each  $0.6400 | 25 | $16.00 4
I Nashville Med. & EMS . _Nobid '
4 Amiodarone; 150 mg / 3 mi - Vial SR
' Moore Medical, LLC. | 22579 ach  $1.0600 10 $10.60 1
Midwest Medical Supply | 00143-987510 Each  $1.7200 | 10 $17.20 2
~ BoundTree Medical | 63323-061603  Each | $18500 | 1 $1.85 3
| _ Henry Schein, Inc. : | 4082483 Each | $6.2300 | 10 $62.30 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | . Nobid
5 Atropine; 1 mg/ 10 ml - Luer .—gﬂ
Midwest Medical Supply ~ 00409-163010  Each $6.3300 10 $63.30 1
Moore Medical, LLC. 15811 Each  $9.7100 1 $9.71 2
e Bound Tree Medical | 33391 Each  $114500 10 $114.50 3
~ Henry Schein, Inc. 409491134 Each $36.7700 1 $36.77 4
Nashville Med. & EMS ] | Nobid |
6  Benadryl;50mg-Vial i
HenrySchein,Inc. 614037625  FEach  $0.7500 25 $18.75 1
Moore Medical, LLC. 81644 ~ Each  $09488 25 $23.71 2
Bound Tree Medical | 0641037625 Each $11300 | 25 $28.25 3
~ Midwest Medical Supply 00641-037625  Each © $1.2000 25 $30.00 a
Nashville Med. & EMS  Nobid |
7 Brethine; 1 mg- Vial ._ ERE
_ ~ Moore Medical, LLC. | 20203 Each $4.7100 10 $47.10 1
[ Bound Tree Medical '  $51000 | 10 $51.00 2
| Midwest Medical Supply | 00143-974610 Each  $60600 10 $60.60 3
Henry Schein, Inc. 63323066501 Each $71.9800 | 25 1 s1,79950 4
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DESCRIPTION

Nashville Med. & EMS

8 Dextrose; 50 % 25 gm - Luer

~ Bound Tree Medical 1 '
‘Midwest Medical Supplv !

___Henry Schein, Inc.

‘Moore Medical, LLC.

Nashvllle Med. & EMS

9 Diazepam; 10 mg / 2 mi - Luer locking

Midwest Medical Supply

Bound Tree Medical

Henry Schein, Inc.
Moore Medical, LLC.

Nashville Med & EMS

Dlltbum ZSmngmg Iml) Vlal

. Bound Tree Medical
Midwest Medical Supply

~ Moore Medical, LLC.

__Henry Schein, Inc.

Nashville Med. & EMS

11 wmuf_sm - Vial

Moore Medical, LLC.

Bound Tree Medical

Midwest Medical Supply _i

'Henry Schein, Inc.
Nashville Med. & EMS

Epinephrine 1:1,000 ; anu'faoml Vial

Moore Medical, I.LC.

_Bound Tree Medical

Midwest Medical Supply

13

~ Henry Schein, nc.
Nashville Med. & EMS

Epinephrine 1:10,000 ; 1mg)1om| Luar

Moore Medical, LLC.

Bound Tree Medical

Mtdwest Medical Supply

_Henry Schein, Inc. N
Nashville Med. & EMS

1

mmrwu{zom \!ld

e——a—

Moore Medical, LLC.
Bound Tree Medical

Midwest Medical Supply

Henry 5chein, Inc.

Nashville Med. & EMS

15  Fentanyl;0.25mg/5miVial

Bound Tree Medical
Henry Schein, Inc.
Moore Meducal LLC.

Nashville Med & EMS

Midwest Medlcal Supp!v

16 Glucagon; lmg{:ll.mlt]_

~ Moore Medical, LLC.

BASE FOR

__AWARD
UNIT/
ITEM # BASE FOR E:'ff ¥l E:fx ﬁm RANK
. AWARD | Sy
| Nobid
.:.:' By
07517-16  Each | $9.2500 | 10 $92.50 1
00409-741716  Each  $11.5600 10 $115.60 2
| 01775-10  Each  $29.1300 10 | $291.30 3
| Nobid
_No bid
e
: s RN
00409127332  Each  $38.4300 10 | $384.30 1
11704-600-01  Each  $38.7500 15 | $581.25 2
| 01273-32  Each  $95.2300 10 $952.30 3
| No bid
~ No bid
| 641601310  Each  $2.3300 | 10 | $23.30 1
| 00641-601310  Each  $3.3500 10 | $3350 2
| 17945 Each  $6.8240 10 $68.24 3
| 641601310 Each  $22.0000 10 $220.00 4
' Nobid
5820-01 Each $2.7200 25 | $68.00 1
05820-01  Each $2.7800 | 25 | $69.50 2
00409-582001  Each | $3.6800 [ 25 | $92.00 3
| 409582001 Each | $10.9200 1 | $10.92 4
_ Nobid_ '
15814 ~ Each $69.4100 1 | $69.41 1
9061-0 ~ Each $72.2700 1 $72.27 2
| 76329-906100  Each $90.7400 1 | $90.74 3
| 763299061 Each $236.0800 1 | $236.08 4
No bid |
) N
112536  Each $5.8800 1 $5.88 1
9061-0 Each  $6.1000 10 $61.00 2
| 76329331601  Each  $9.2200 10 | $92.20 3
| 409492134 Each $189200 1 $18.92 4
~ No bid
e
| 6695-02 Each  $7.5200 10 | $75.20 1
| 06695-02  Each  $83%00 | 10 | $83.90 2
| 00069-000603  Each  $165000 | 10 | $165.00 3
| 08060-29 | Each | $21.6000 | 10 $216.00 4
_ No bid l
L astd e
i - — — — - -
| 09094-25  Each  $1.8580 25 $46.45 1
| 09094-25  Each  $5.6000 25 $140.00 2
| No bid
No bid
No bid
3442738 Each  $209.2700 1 | $209.27 [ 1
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e — _ ____AWARD
UNIT / '
NUM DESCRIPTION TEM # e | 2T | | e T | e
= : — 4 AWARD _l L
| Bound Tree Medical 702601 Each | $226.7500 1 $226.75 2
' Midwest Medical Supply | 00597-026010  Each $230.9600 | 1 $230.96 3
Henry Schein, Inc. 285809 | Each | $_1_ 015.3400 1 $1,015.34 4
Nashville Med. & EMS o I | No bid
17 Haloperidol; 5 mg /1 ml - Vial 1
Bound Tree Medical | 0806-01 | Each | $3.2900 10 | $32.90 1
| 'Moore Medical, LLC. | 24706 Each | $7.0500 25 | $176.25 2
 HenrySchein, Inc. | 233934  Each  $25.7600 10 | $257.60 3
Nashville Med. & EMS | 1 | Nobid |
Midwest Medical Supply . Nobid |
18 Insta-Glucose;31g-Tube B L
 NashvilleMed. & EMS | TD6838 [ | $1.9900 | 100 $199.00 1
Moore Medical, LLC | 13138 | Each | $2.9800 12 $35.76 2
Bound Tree Medi_cﬂ - — B _0_146:31 ~ Each | 834900 1 $3.49 3
Henry Schein, Inc. | 1758689 ~ Each | $4.5400 3 | $13.62 4
' Midwest Medical Supply | 00187-074633  Each $5.0200 3 | $15.06 5
19 Lasix 40mg /4 mi- Luer sy
Bound Tree Medical | 09631-04 _Each  $10.1500 10 | $101.50 1
! Henry Schein,inc. | 09631-04 _ Each | $31.2500 10 $312.50 2
[ Moore Medical, LLC. | Nobid
I Nashville Med. & EMS. ) | No bid
Midwest Medical Supply . Nobid |
20 Lidocaine; 100 mg /5 mi - Luer ;m
Bound Tree Medical _— 04903-34 ~ Each | $3.2500 10 $32.50 1
‘Midwest Medical Supply | 00409-132305 Each $4.0900 10 $40.90 2
Moore Medical, LLC. 15810 _ Each | 544100 1 $4.41 3
Henry Schein, Inc. | 0132305  Each  $9.6400 10 | $96.40 4
i Nashville Med. & EMS | Nobid |
21 Lidocaine w/Dextrose; zwmsxfsmm m-nudrlphg rﬁ
. Bound Tree Medical 280973 | Each $6.7900 |18 $122.22 1
’. Midwest Medical Supply | 280973  Each | $6.8600 . 18 $123.48 2
Henry Schein, Inc. - 280973  Each | $21.0400 | 1 $21.04 3
Moore Medical, LLC. ~ Nobid '
Nashville Med. &EMS _ i | Nobid
22 Lopressor (Metoprolol); 5 mg /5 mi - Vial m
Moore Medical, LIC. 177805 _ Each | $1.1760 10 | 81176 1
' Bound Tree Medical | 303-05 _Each  $1.2900 10 | $12.90 2
:' Henry Schein, inc. | 0143987310  Each $2.3700 10 | $23.70 3
~ Midwest Medical Supply | 55390-007310  Each $3.0300 10 | $30.30 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Nobid -
23 Magnesium Sulfate ; 5 gm / 10mi - Luer i
Moore Medical, LLC. | 1754-10  Each | $18.5400 ‘ 10 | $185.40 1
__B_qqndlee Medical ) | 01754-10 ~ Each $21.4800 10 | $214.80 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 00409-175410  Each $250600 | 10 | $250.60 3
Henry Schein, Inc. 1754-10 Each $63.0600 10 | $630.60 4
' Nashville Med. & EMS No bid '
24 Magnesium Sulfate ; 5 gm / 10ml - Vial o
! Bound Tree Medical | 064-10 ~ Each | $2.3900 25 | $59.75 1
| Midwest Medical Supply | 63323-006410  Each  $2.6200 25 | $65.50 2
; Henry Schein, Inc. | 63323006410  Each $9.6200 25 $240.50 3
Moore Medical, LLC. No bid
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—— ' ___ AWARD
UNIT/ ' pricEpER | CASE PRICE PER
NUM DESCRIPTION ITEM # BASE FOR RANK
UNIT PACK CASE
5 E ~ AwaRD _
Nashville Med. & EMS | No bid | _
25 Midazolam; 10 mg / 2 mi - Vial e BT |
Bound Tree Medical | 0230802 Each  $143%0 | 10 $14.39 1
~ Midwest Medical Supply | 00409-230802  Each  $1.7800 10 $17.80 2
Henry Schein, Inc. ] | 02305-05 Each . 536800 | 10 $36.80 3
_ Moore Medical, LLC. ~ No bid '
|' Nashville Med. & EMS | Nobid
26 Morphine Sulfate; mm;.uml Pne-!ﬂkd
Bound Tree | Medical  — | 01893-01  Each | $2.4580 | 10 $24.58 1
Midwest Medical Supply | 00409-189301  Each . $3.0100 10 $30.10 2
f Henry Schein, Inc. 189301  Each | $6.9600 10 $69.60 3
; Moore Medical, LLC. l . No bid
‘ Nashville Med. & EMS ~ Nobid
27  Narcan;2mg/2ml-Luer
Bound Tree Medi cal B | 3369-00  Each | $36.1500 10 $361.90 1
Moore Medical, LLC. B | 1131093 Each | $388200 1 $38.82 2
~ Midwest Medical Supply | 76329336901 Each  $52.9100 10 $529.10 3
_ Henry Schein, Inc. | 76329146901 Each $132.0400 | 10 $1,320.40 4
Nashville Med. & EMS ~ Nobid
28 Narcan; 2 mg / 2 ml - Vial ~a
Bound Tree Medical | Each $19.8500 10 $198.50 1
Henry Schein, Inc. Each | $132.0400 10 $1,320.40 2
" ~ Moore Medical, LLC. i i | No bid
Nashville Med. & EMS I B | Nobid !
Midwest Medical Supply | | Nobid |
29 Nitroglycerin; 50 mg / 250 ml 200 mcg / ml - Pre-mix drip
| Bound TreeMedical  1A06%4 Each  $21.3900 12 $256.68 1
| Midwest Medical Supply | 1A0694  Each  $22.2500 12 $267.00 2
’ Henry Schein, Inc. N  Each  $40.0100 25 $1,000.25 3
Moore Medical, LIC. = | Nobid
Nashville Med. & EMS _ No bid
30 Nitrolingual; 8.5 gm spray A
Midwest Medical Supply | 76299-0430-04  Each | $132100 | 12 $158.52 1
__ MooreMedical, LLC. | 23713 Bach | $1239400 | 1 $123.94 2
' Bound Tree Medical | 24090-0410-04  Each $189.4500 1 $189.45 3
Henry Schein,inc. B Each | $572.2100 1 $572.21 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | No bid
31 mwmu&.am}-znunsni Vial =
Bound Tree Medical - ~ Each | $9.0800 | 10 $90.80 1
~ Henry §_c_r_:gln, Inc. i i Each | §50.7700 10 $507.70 2
Moore Medical, LLC. ~ Nobid
| Nashville Med. & EMS ~ No bid
' Midwest Medical Supply _ No bid |
32 Odansetron; 4 mg /2 ml-Vial E
Moore Medical, LLC. B | 4755-03 _Each  $0.5400 25 $13.50 1
Bound Tree Medical B | 04755-03 ~ Each  $0.6800 | 25 $17.00 2
Midwest Medical Supplv [ 36000-001225 . Each | $1.5100 [ 25 $37.75 3
Henry Schein, Inc. B  Each | $1.6600 | 10 $16.60 4
Nashville Med. & EMS 3 | No  bid
33 Procainamide; 1000 mg fznh \nal ¥
Moore Medical, LLC. 1903-01  Each  $73.3900 25 $1,834.75 1
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BASE FOR

e L _ : AWARD
. UNIT /
INUM DESCRIPTION TEM # BASE FOR ::f’m | ;::‘s:( ?&ﬁm
' _ kg _ AWARD _
] Bound Tree Medical | 01503-01  Each $820300 | 25 | $2,050.75 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 00409-190301  Each _299 9.1700 | 25 $2,479.25 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Each $249.6100 | 1 $249.61 4
. Nashville Med. & EMS _ . | Nobid
34 mm{zmmmj.so:knm \nal‘ ,
Bound Tree Medical | 09558-05 _ Each  $5.3900 | 10 | $53.90 1
, ~ Moore Medical, LLC. | 30609 _ Each | $5.6500 10 | $56.50 2
f ~ Henry Schein, Inc. I ~ Each $260000 | 10 | $260.00 3
~ Nashville Med. & EMS _ Nobid
Midwest Medical Supply No bid _
35 Sodium Bicarbonate; 50 MEQ - Luer A e A 2
Bound Tree Medical | 06637-34 | Each ~ $10.2500 10 $102.50 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 2005965 | Each . $10.8800 | 1 $10.88 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 76329335201  Each  $15.3900 | 10 $153.90 3
: Henry Schein, Inc. Each  $33.8700 10 $338.70 4
|' Nashville Med. & EMS | | Nobid '
|36 Sodium Chloride Flush; 10 mi - Luer m
Midwest Medical Supply | 1210-8P  Each  $0.2890 100 | $28.90 1
~ Henry Schein, Inc. _  Each $0.3200 100 | $32.00 2
Bound Tree Medical | 210806 _ Each $03600 | 100 | $36.00 3
Moore Medical, LLC. | 513576 ~ Each $0.4323 1200 $518.76 4
Nashville Med. & EMS No bid i
37 Solu-Medrol; 125 mg /2 ml- Vial g
Moore Medical, LLC. ) | 11762 ~ Each | $100500 | 25 $251.25 1
Bound Tree Medical | 4282117  Each | $11.4900 25 $287.25 2
| Midwest Medical Supply | 00009-004722  Each $11.5000 25 | $287.50 3
Henry Schein, Inc. B ~ Each | $36.0100 1 | $36.01 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | No bid
38 Succinyicholine; (200 mg / mi) 10 mi - Vial M
_ Bound Tree Medical 06629-02  Each  $26.0200 25 | $650.50 1
 Moore Medical, LLC. | 6629-02  Each | $27.2900 | 25 $682.25 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 00409-662902  Each | $29.5000 | 25 $737.50 3
Henry Schein, Inc. | 662902 | Each | $88.8300 | 25 $2,220.75 4
Nashville Med. & EMS ) | Nobid
39 Thiamine; 200mg / 2mi vial T
, Moore Medical, LLC. | 67046 _ Each $11.7100 | 25 | $292.75 1
. _ Bound Tree Medical B | 1302 _ Each 0 $121200 |1 | $12.12 2
' Midwest Medical Supply | 63323-001302  Each $15.7800 25 | $394.50 3
Henry Schein, Inc. | 67457019602  Each  $341500 | 25 $853.75 4
Nashville Med. & EMS _ ~ No bid 5
40 Tranexamic Acid; 1000 mg / 10 mi - Vial B |
Bound Tree Medical | 5036546 | Each | $209500 | 10 520950 | 1
‘Moore Medical, LLC. | 24198 _ Each $361200 | 10 $361.20 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 39822-100001  Each | $47.2200 | 10 $472.20 3
Henry Schein, Inc. | 17478021710  Each  $520100 | 10 $520.10 4
Nashville Med. & EMS . i | No bid
41 Unistik 3 Extra Safety Lancets; 21G Depth 2.0 mm r
' _Bound Tree Medical | 1014 _ Each  $0.1097 | 100 | $10.97 1
' Nashville Med. & EMS ~ OM1014 _ Each $0.1190 4000 $476.00 2
| Henry Schein, Inc. | AT1012 | Each | $0.1500 100 $15.00 3
| Midwest Medical Supva - | AT1012 ~ Each | $0.1528 100 $15.28 B
T8 17-023 ALS
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BASE FOR

—— S AWARD :
UNIT
||NUM DESCRIPTION TEM # pascrom | (RIECR | CER | OIS | e
kT ~ AWARD S
Moore Medical, LLC. | 81002 Each | $0.1556 | 100 _
42 Vasopressin; 20 units / 1 mi - Vial R
Bound Tree Medical 995933 ~ Each | $195.1100 25 $4,877.75 1
| Henry Schein, Inc. | 42023016425  Each | $554.1200 25 $13,853.00 2
Moore Medical, LLC. | No bid
Nashville Med. & EMS _ Nobid
Midwest Medical Supply I No bid
43 Xoponex;0.63 mg /3 ml - Unit dose [ bri
Bound Tree Medical E . | 2870467 . Each | $0.8667 24 $20.80 1
Midwest Medical Supplv | 63402-051224 Each 510 5700 24 $253.68 2
Henry Schein, Inc. H | 5170527 Each | $34.0500 | 24 $817.20 3
Moore Medical, LLC. ~ Nobid
Nashville Med. & EMS | Nobid
44 mmiwmj,mnm Rty | :
_ Moore Medical, LLC. | 16273 Each | $0.1443 30 $4.33 1
Midwest Medical Supply | 00487-020101  Each ~ 50.3690 30 $11.07 2
Bound Tree Medical 5 I ~ Each | 503700 | 30 $11.10 3
Henry Schein, Inc. e | 487020160 | Each  $3.0900 60 $185.40 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | | Nobid
45 Ketamine, Class Iil, 50mg / ml, 10 mi Vial Lita -
' Bound Tree Medical [ ~ Each . $4.7250 10 | $47.25 1
i Henry Schein, Inc. | 409205310 ~ Each | $15.1600 1 | $15.16 2
‘ Midwest Medical Supply | | Nobid
~_Moore Medical, LLC. [ | Nobid
Nashville Med. & EMS L | Nobid
4  levophed,0.1% 4mg/4miVial 4 i
_ Moore Medical, LLC. o 21715  Each | $23.8000 10 $238.00 1
; Bound Tree Medical B _ Each | $25.1700 10 | $251.70 2
_ __Henry Schein, Inc. 144304 ~ Each | $77.1000 10 | $771.00 3
~ Midwest Medical Supply ~ No bid
~ Nashville Med. & EMS | ~ Nobid
47  M.AD. (Mucosal Alsomiutloq Device) AT
Henry Schein, Inc. B MAD300 | Each | $3.9500 [ 1 $3.95 1
Nashville Med. & EMS MAD300 ~ Each | $4.1000 25 $102.50 2
_ Moore Medical, LLC. | MAD301 ~ Each | $50000 | 1 $5.00 3
Bound Tree Medical | MAD300  Each  $5.0900 25 $127.25 4
Midwest Medical Supply | MAD300 ~ Each | $55100 25 | $137.75 5
48 Sodium Cloride N.S.; 0.9%, 1000 mi bag T
Moore Medical, LLC. | L8000 . Each | 524000 @ | 12 $28.80 1
Bound Tree Medical | 2B1324X | Each | 55.0209 | 14 $70.28 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 2B1324X Each | $s0700 | 14 $70.98 3
Henry Schein, Inc. | | Lsooo _Each 578000 1 $7.80 4
Nashville Med. & EMS k| | No bid
49 Sodium Cloride N.S.; 0.9%, 500 mi bag o
~ Bound Tree Medical 18001  Each  $2.2800 24 | $54.72 1
Moore Medical, LLC. 18001 Each  $2.3300 | 24 $55.92 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 281323Q Each | 543600 | 24 $104.64 3
~ Henry Schein, Inc. l | 07983-03 | Each | $20.0000 | 1 $20.00 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | Nobid
h Mwmmmwmmm'mwmmmummm,ﬁ
- long) No substitutions
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BASE FOR

) N — _______AWARD
UNIT/
WM oecrPTioN e potron| THERER [ onE | PwcEreR |
_ e AWARD 4
Midwest Medical Supply | US1160 | Each $1.5100 50 $75.50 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | US1160 Each | $1.5200 50 $76.00 2
Bound Tree Medical | US1160 Each ~ $1.9900 50 $99.50 3
Henry Schein, Inc. N _[_ US1160 Each $2.3300 50 $116.50 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | 5 o No bid I
& mmmm&&wwmmm'mmmmmmmmmn e
' long) No substitutions 1
. Midwest Medical Supply | US1165  Each  $14600 | 50 |
'  Bound Tree Medical | US1165 _ Each  $1.6900 | 50 |
' Henry Schein, Inc. | USs1165 ~ Each $3.8300 50 |
Moore Medical, LLC. | Nobid '
Nashville Med. & EMS [ | No bid '.
52 Protective IV Plus Catheters; 14 ga x 1.25" No substitutions i
Nashville Med. & EMS | 3068-01 Each | $1.3800 | 200 $276.00 1
Bound Tree Medical | 3068-01 Each | $1.6100 | 200 $322.00 2
Henry Schein, Inc. | 3068-01 Each $1.6500 200 | $330.00 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 3068-01 Each $1.6500 200 | $330.00 4
Moore Medical, LIC. | 3068-01 Each $1.7800 200 | $356.00 5
53 mwmmupxw'mwmﬁm ‘*ﬂ
1 Nashville Med. & EMS | 306201 | Each $1.3800 | 200 $276.00 1
i _ Bound Tree Medical | 306201 | Each $1.6100 | 200 $322.00 2
Henry Schein, Inc. - | 3062-01 Each $1.6500 200 $330.00 3
~ Midwest Medical Supply | 3062-01 Each | $1.6500 | 200 $330.00 4
Moore Medical, LLC. | 3062-01 Each $1.7800 | 200 $356.00 5
54  Protective IV Plus Catheters; BpuLzs'Nosubsﬂwﬂons =
Nashville Med. & EMS | 3065-01  Each | $1.3800 | 200 | $276.00 1
Bound Tree Medical 3065-01  Each $16100 | 200 | $322.00 2
' Henry Schein, Inc. | 3065-01 _ Each $1.6500 200 $330.00 3
Midwest Medical Supply 3065-01 ~ Each $1.6500 200 $330.00 4
Moore Medical, LLC. | 3065-01 ~ Each $1.7800 | 200 $356.00 5
55 Protective IV Plus Catheters; 20 ga x 1.25" No substitutions 43
Nashville Med. & EMS 306601  Each | $1.3800 200 $276.00
Bound Tree Medical | 3066-01 ~ Each | $16100 200 $322.00
Henry Schein, Inc. | 3066-01 ~ Each $1.6500 | 200 $330.00
[ Midwest Medical Supply 3066-01 | Each  $1.6500 200 | $330.00
- Moore Medical, LLC. | 306601 Each $1.7800 200 | $356.00
| 56 Protective IV Plus Catheters; 22 ga x 1" No substitutions g
Nashville Med. & EMS | 3060-01 Each $1.3800 200 | $276.00
Bound Tree Medical | 3060-01 Each $1.6100 200 | $322.00
,' Henry Schein, Inc. | 3060-01 Each $1.6500 200 $330.00
' _Midwest Medical Supply | 306001 Each $1.6500 200 $330.00
Moore Medical, LLC. 1 | 3060-01 Each | $1.7800 200 $356.00
‘57 Protective IV Plus c-mm,puuus'uo suhstltuuons
Nashville Med. & EMS | 3063-01 Each $1.3800 200 $276.00
Bound Tree Medical | 3063-01 ~ Each $1.6100 200 | $322.00
Henry Schein, Inc. | 306301 Each $1.6500 200 | $330.00
, Midwest Medical Supply | 3063-01 Each $1.6500 200 $330.00
| Moore Medical, LLC. | 3063-01 Each $1.7800 200 | $356.00
58 mmmlv.mmmmuaxruomm e
Bound Tree Medical i 3358 | Each | 51 9500 | 200 $390.00 1
Henry Schein, Inc. | 3358 Each $1 9900 | 200 $398.00 2
ITB 17-023 ALS
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L . AWARD
UNIT/ |
NUM DESCRIPTION ITEM # BASEFOR | | TICEPER ShE PRICE FER RANK
AWARD | UNIT PACK CASE
Midwest Medical Supply 3358 Each | $21100 | 200 $422.00 3
Moore Medical, LLC. | 3358 Each | $22052 | 200 $441.04 4
Nashville Med. & EMS . e a No bid |
59 LV. Solution Dextrose Injection DSW; 50 mi bag No substitutions v:m
Bound TreeMedical  2B0086  Each  $22500 | 9 $216.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply | 280086 _ Each | $2.6400 9 $253.44 2
HenrySchein, Inc. | 280086  Each  $8.8800 9% $852.48 3
Moore Medical, LIC. | | Nobid '
Nashville Med. & EMS ) _ | | Nobid
60 V. Solution Sodium Chloride Injection; 100 ml bag No substitutions i
[ Moore Medical, LLC. | 281307  Each  $1.8500 | 96 | $177.60 1
{ Bound Tree Medical | 281307 Each  $1.8900 9% | $181.44 2
‘j Midwest Medical Supply | 281307  Each | $2.3100 % | $221.76 3
' Henry Schein,inc. | 281307 Each  $82000 | 9% | $787.20 4
Nashville Med. & EMS _No bid ] _
61 mmeﬂmmuomm; Ty
Henry Schein, Inc. | ) | 303390  Each | $0.3800 100 $38.00 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 303390 ~ Each | $03930 | 1000 $393.00 2
~ Midwest Medical Supply | 303390 Each  $0.4020 1000 $402.00 3
~ Bound Tree Medical 303390 | Each  $0.4200 100 $42.00 4
 Nashville Med. & EMS | $0.4390 100 $43.90 5
62 Hypodermic Syringe Needle; 25 ga x 5/8"No substitutions e ide :‘,‘m
Henry Schein, Inc. 305122 ~ 1000Ea  $0.0074 1000 $7.39 1
Bound Tree Medical | 305122 ~ 1000Ea | $0.0463 1000 $46.30 2
Moore Medical, LLC. 305122  1000Ea  $0.0744 1000 $74.40 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 305122  1000Ea  $0.0760 1000 $76.00 4
Nashville Med. & EMS 305122 | 1000Ea | $0.0944 1000 $94.40 5
63 Hypodermic Syringe Needle; 21 ga x 11/2"No substitutions ﬂ
Henry Schein, Inc. | 305167 1000Ea  $0.0074 1000 $7.39 1
Bound Tree Medical | 305167 1000Ea | $0.0463 1000 $46.30 2
Nashville Med. & EMS | 305167  1000Ea  $0.0630 1000 $63.00 3
Moore Medical, LLC. 305167  1000Ea | $0.0744 | 1000 $74.40 4
Midwest Medical Supplv B | 305167 1000 Ea __Sp.D‘J’GO 1000 $76.00 5
64 Hypodermic Syringe Needle; 18 ga x 1"No substitutions 7'.3“
Henry Schein, Inc. [ | 305195  1000Ea  $0.0048 1000 | $4.75 1
Bound Tree Medical 305195  1000Ea | $0.0463 1000 | $46.30 2
[ Moore Medical, LLC. | 305195 _ 1000Ea  $0.0500 1000 $50.00 3
-' _ MidwestMedical Supply 305195  1000Ea  $0.0510 1000 $51.00 4
Nashville Med. &EMS 305195 1000Ea | $0.0740 1000 $74.00 5
65 Universal LV Standard Pump Set  No substitutions Sm
Bound Tree Medical i | Nobid
Moore Medical, LLC. ) " Nobid
Henry ich_ein, Inc. i B No bid
Nashville Med. & EMS | Nobid |
Midwest Medical Supply ~ Nobid |
66 “Wﬂﬁmcﬂmm:nmnhsuwmum m
Bound Tree Medical _}_ 5_0}-!550 | Each | $2.7500 10 $27.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS | 504550 | Each | $3.2900 10 $32.90 2
Moore Medical, LLC. | 504550 Each | $3.3900 10 $33.90 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 504550 _Each  $34700 | 10 $34.70 4
Henry Schein, Inc. - 504550 Each $4.0800 10 | %4080 5
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67 ETTube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 5.5 mm No substitutions T
Bound Tree Medical | 504555 Each | $2.7500 10 $27.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS : | 504555 | Each | $3.2900 10 $32.90 2
Moore Medical, LLC. | 504555 ~ Each | $3.3900 10 $33.90 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 504555 Each | $3.4700 10 $34.70 4
Henry Schein, Inc. | 504555 Each $4.0800 | 10 $40.80 5
68 ETTube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 6.0 mm No substitutions _
Bound Tree Medical | 504560 Each $2.7500 10 $27.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS . 504560  Each  $3.2900 10 $32.90 2
Moore Medical, LLC. | 504560 | Each $33900 | 10 $33.90 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 504560 Each $3.4700 | 10 $34.70 B
Henry Schein, Inc. 504560 Each $4.0800 | 10 $40.80 5
|69 ETTube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 6.5 mm No substitutions s el
Bound Tree Medical | 504565  Each $2.7500 10 $27.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS | 504565  Each | $3.2900 10 $32.90 2
Moore Medical, LC. | 504565 . Each $3.3900 | 10 $33.90 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 504565 . Each $3.4700 | 10 $34.70 K
HenrySchein,nc. | 504565 Each $4.0800 | 10 $40.80 5
70 ETTube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 7.0 mm No substitutions T
Bound Tree Medical | 504570  Each | $2.7500 10 $27.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS | 504570  Each | $32900 | 10 $32.90 2
Moore Medical, LLC. 504570  Each  $3.3900 10 $33.90 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 504570 | Each | $3.4700 10 $34.70 4
Henry Schein, Inc. | 504570 ~ Each | $4.0800 10 $40.80 5
71 ETTube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 7.5 mm No substitutions m
Bound Tree Medical s | 504575  Each | $2.7500 10 $27.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS | 504575 _ Each $3.2900 |10 $32.90 2
Moore Medical, LLC. | 504575  Each | $3.3900 10 $33.90 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 504575  Each | $3.4700 10 $34.70 4
Henry Schein, Inc. 504575  Each $4.0800 | 10 $40.80 5
72 ETTube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 8.0 mm No substitutions. m
Bound Tree Medical | 504580 ~ Each $2.7500 10 $27.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS | 504580 Each $3.2900 10 $32.90 2
Moore Medical, LLC. o | 504580 ~ Each $3.3900 | 10 $33.90 3
Midwest Medical Supply 504580  Each $3.4700 10 $34.70 4
Henry Schein, Inc. EE 504580 ~ Each $4.0800 | 10 $40.80 5
73 ETTube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 8.5 mm No substitutions ' ’t
Bound Tree Medical | 504585 _ Each $2.7500 10 $27.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS | 504585  Each $3.2900 | 10 $32.90 2
Moore Medical, LLC. ) | 504585 | Each $3.3900 i 10 $33.90 3
Midwest Medical Supply 504585 | Each | $3.4700 10 $34.70 B
Henry Schein, Inc. | 504585 | Each | $4.0800 10 $40.80 5
74 ETTube Flexi Set, Cuffed; 9.0 mm No substitutions i
Bound Tree Medical 504590 _ Each | $2.7500 | 10 $27.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS | 504590  Each | $32900 | 10 $32.90 2
Moore Medical, LIC. | 504590 ~ Each  $3.3900 10 $33.90 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 504590  Each $3.4700 10 $34.70 4
Henry Schein,Inc. | 504590  Each | $4.0800 10 $40.80 5
ET Tube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 2.5 mm No substitutions 'g'_
Bound Tree Medical | 506525 | Each $2.5000 10 $25.00 1
Nashville Med. & EMS | 506525  Each | $3.0900 10 $30.90 2
ITB 17-023 ALS
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Moore  Medical, LLC. | 506525 __Each - $3, 2800 10 $32.80 3
Midwest Medical Supply 506525 | Each | $3.3500 | 10 $33.50 4
Henry Schein, Inc. | 506525 ' Each | $3.7000 | 10 $37.00 S

76 ETTube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 3.0 mm No substitutions t_
Bound Tree Medical | 506530 Each | $2.5000 10 $25.00 1
Nashville Med. & EMS | 506530 _ Each | $3.0900 10 $30.90 2
Moore Medical, LLC. | 506530 | Each | $3.2800 10 $32.80 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 506530 | Each | 5_3 3500 10 $33.50 a
Henry Schein, Inc. | 506530 __Each | $3.7000 10 $37.00 5

77 ETTube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 3.5 mm No substitutions m
Bound Tree Medical | 506535 | Each $2.5000 10 $25.00 1
Nashville Med. & EMS | 506535  Each | $3.0900 | 10 $30.90 2
Moore Medical, LIC. | 506535 Each | $3.2800 10 $32.80 3

. Midwest Medical Supply | 506535 _Each  $3.3500 | 10 $33.50 4
Henry Schein, Inc. | 506535 | _Each $3.7000 10 | $37.00 5

78 ETTube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 4.0 mm No substitutions el
Bound Tree Medical | 506540 ~ Each $2.5000 | 10 $25.00 1
Nashville Med. & EMS 506540 _ Each $3 0900 | 10 $30.90 2
Moore Medical, LLC. _ | 506540 Each | $3.2800 10 $32.80 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 506540 | Each [ $3 .3500 10 $33.50 4
Henry Schein, Inc. 5 S | 506540 Each | $3.7000 | 10 $37.00 5

79 ETTube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 4.5 mm No substitutions _ *f_

. Bound Tree Medical | 506545 | Each $2.5000 | 10 $25.00 1

| Nashville Med. & EMS 506545 _ Each | $3.0900 10 $30.90 2

‘ Moore Medical, LIC. | 506545  Each  $3.2800 |10 | $32.80 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 506545 Each  $3.3500 10 | $3350 4
Henry Schein, Inc. 506545 | Each $3.7000 10 | $37.00 5

80 ETTube Flexi Set, Uncuffed; 5.0 mm No substitutions

, Bound Tree Medical | 506550 Each $2.5000 | 10 $25.00 1

- Nashville Med. & EMS | 506550 Each | $3.0900 | 10 $30.90 2
Moore M Medical LLC. | 506550 Each $3 2800 10 $32.80 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 506550 Each $3.3500 | 10 $33.50 4
Henry Schein, Inc. | 506550 Each i $3 7000 i 10 $37.00 5

8 nmmm,;.sm No substitutions -
Bound Tree Medical | 150055 _Each $2.5000 | 10 $25.00 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 150055 Each $3.2800 | 10 $32.80 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 150055 Each  $3.3500 10 $33.50 3
Nashville Med. & EMS | 150055 Each $3.9000 10 $39.00 4
Henry Schein, Inc. | 150055 Each | $4.0800 | 10 $40.80 5

82 Meditrace Electrodes, Kendall 530 Foam Electrode, Adult No substitutions .
Henry Schein, Inc. | 3101326 | Each $0.1433 | 600 $86.00 1
Bound Tree Medical | 3101326 | Each  50.1433 | 600 $86.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply | 3_1_91_326 _ Each | $0.1480 600 $88.80 3
Moore Medical, LLC. _ | 3101326 | Each | $0.1629 600 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | 3101326 | Each | $0.1950 600 5

83 -mmmtrmmmm Pedlntr!c Nosubstltutions I
Henry Schein, Inc. il 31439765 _ f.qch | $0.1563 | 600 1
Midwest Medical Supply | KEN31439766  Each  $0.1610 | 600 2
Bound Tree Medical Each 50.1800 | 600 3
Moore Medical, LLC. | No bid
Nashville Med. & EMS _ Nobid
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84 LV.Extension set, 8", mmmmmmwmm i
Henry Schein, Inc. i | Ms-83092 Each | $0.9000 50 $45.00 1
Nashville Med. & EMS | KA29018 Each | $0.9200 | 100 $92.00 2
Midwest Medical Supply MS-83092 Each | $0.9900 | 100 $99.00 3
Bound Tree Medical | 05-00811 Each | $1.1500 50 $57.50 4
Moore Medical, LLC. | | No bid
85 Web Alcohol Preps No substitutions il
Henry Schein, Inc. | 6818 _ 4000Ea | $0.0069 4000 $27.41 1
Midwest Medical Supply 6818 | 4000Ea  $0.0070 4000 $28.00 2
; Moore Medical, LLC. | 6818 | 4000Ea | $0.0072 | 4000 $28.80 3
_ Bound Tree Medical | 6818 | 4000Ea | $0.0097 | 4000 $38.80 4
[ Nashville Med. & EMS I _ No bid
B —ErE
; Moore Medical, LIC. | 4251 _ Each  $03032 250 $75.80 1
[ Midwest Medical Supply 4251 _ Each  $0.3100 250 $77.50 2
Henry Schein, Inc. | 4251  Each  $0.3200 250 $80.00 3
Bound Tree Medical 4251 | Each $0.3400 | 250 $85.00 4
Nashville Med. & EMS . | No bid ] .
' 87 Providine-lodine Prep Pads No substitutions 4_
Moore Medical, LLC. | 1108 Each | $0.0305 1000 $30.50 1
Midwest Medical Supply | 1108  Each | $0.0330 1000 $33.00 2
| Henry Schein, Inc. | 1108 _ Each  $0.0400 _ 1000 $40.00 3
' Bound Tree Medical | 1108 | Each | $3.6900 1000 $3,690.00 4
Nashville Med. & EMS 1108 _Each  Nobid
88 Transpore Surgical Tape; %" x 10 yards No substitutions _
. Bound Tree Medical | 15270 Each | $0.3033 24 $7.28 1
| Midwest Medical Supply | 15270 ~ Each $0.4200 24 $10.08 2
B Nashville Med. & EMS | 15270  Each | $0.4300 24 $10.32 3
: Henry Schein, Inc. | 15270  Each  $0.5800 24 $13.92 4
Moore Medical, LLC. | 15270 | Each | $0.5883 | 240 $141.19 5
89 Transpore Surgical Tape; 1" x 10 yards No substitutions ¥ b r
Bound Tree Medical ) | 15271 | Each $0.6067 12 $7.28 1
Midwest Medical Supply | 15271 | Each $0.8400 12 $10.08 2
Nashville Med. & EMS 15271  Each | $50.8600 12 $10.32 3
Moore Medical, LLC. | 15271  Each | $1.1175 | 120 $134.10 4
Henry Schein, Inc. | 15271 | Each | $1.1300 | 12 $13.56 5
%0 .msm.mmﬂauu;xspxw ~17/8" (adjustable length) No substitutions EY:
Bound Tree Medical | DINISISX | Each | $8.5900 10 $85.90 1
Henry Schein, Inc. | DIN1515X  Each | $17.7900 10 $177.90 2
Moore Medical, LIC. | DIN1515X Each | 5187300 10 $187.30 3
Midwest Medical Supply | DIN1515X _ Each. $19.1500 10 $191.50 4
Nashville Med. & EMS . No bid
91 Diagnostic Pen mmmw No substitutions <48
Moore Medical, LLC. | ADC351P Each _]_$_9.6250 . 360 $225.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply | ADC351P Each | $0.8500 | 6 $5.10 2
Henry Schein, Inc. | ADC351P Each | $0.8500 | 6 $5.10 3
Bound Tree Medical | ADC351P Each  $0.9650 6 $5.79 4
Nashville Med. & EMS ) No bid ;
92 Intedink Injection Site, Male Luer Lock Adapter No substitutions ﬂ
Nashville Med. & EMS 2N3399 Each | $0.7900 | 200 $158.00 1
[ Moore Medical, LIC. 2N3399 Each $1.4508 200 $290.16 2
T8 17-023 ALS
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Midwest Medical Supply | 2N3399 ~ Each $1.5200 . 200 $304.00 3
Bound Tree Medical | 2N3399  Each | $1.5800 200 $316.00 4
Henry Schein, Inc. 2N3399 | Each | $1.7400 200 $348.00 5
93 Adult Veni-Guard No mlmi#utlms g‘_
Bound Tree Medical 705-4431  Each $0.2700 | 500 $135.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply | 705-4431  Each | $0.3300 500 $165.00 2
: Nashville Med. & EMS 705-4431 _ Each | $0.3300 500 $165.00 3
; Henry Schein, inc. | 705-4431 _ Each | $0.4300 500 $215.00 4
i Moore Medical, LLC. 7054431 Each $0.4396 500 $219.80 5
| 94 Sharps Container, red / white; 1t No substitutions h
Moore Medical, LLC. 89005A __Each | $1.5700 | 100 $157.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply | 8900SA | Each | $1.6300 100 $163.00 2
Bound Tree Medical | 8900SA Each . $1.7800 1 $1.78 3
Henry Schein, Inc. B 8900SA Each $2.4100 1 $2.41 4
Nashville Med. & EMS 89005A | Each | $2.4900 | 1 $2.49 5
95 Sharps Container, red / white; 5 qt No substitutions l
_ HenrySchein,lnc. 31144010 . Each $2.4100 1 | 241 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 31144010 Each $2.5100 30 | $75.30 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 31144010  Each  $2.5900 30 | $77.70 3
Bound Tree Medical | 31144010 | Each | $2.7800 | 1 | s278 4
Nashville Med. & EMS 31144010 | Each | $3.8900 | 1 $3.89 5
9% w:mmﬂmwlmaauunwmmms _
Moore Medical, LLC. | 305488 | Each $3.8700 24 $92.88 1
Henry Schein, Inc. 305488 Each $3.8900 24 $93.36 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 305488 Each $4.0000 20 $80.00 3
Bound Tree Medical 305488 Each  $4.2700 24 $102.48 4
Nashville Med. & EMS ) | No bid |
97 Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #0 Premature No substitutions §_
Bound Tree Medical | 004850050  Each $3.8000 20 $76.00 1
Moore Medical, LLC. 004850050 Each $4.3600 20 $87.20 2
Henry Schein, Inc. N 004850050 | Each | $4.4600 20 $89.20 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 004850050  Each | $4.5100 20 $90.20 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | 004850050 ~ Each $5.4900 20 $109.80 5
98 Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #1 Infant No substitutions
Bound Tree Medical 004851100 | Each ~ $3.8000 20 $76.00 1
Moore Medical, LLC | 004851100 ~ Each $4.3600 20 $87.20 2
Henry Schein, Inc. B | 004851100  Each $4.4600 20 $89.20 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 004851100  Each | $4.5100 20 $90.20 4
Nashville Med. & EMS 004851100 Each $5.4900 20 | $109.80 5
99 Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #2 Child No substitutions 2
Bound Tree Medical | 00{1_8_5;_200 ~ Each = $3.8000 20 $76.00 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 004852200 | Each | $4.3600 20 $87.20 2
Henry Schein, Inc. | 004852200 | Each $4.4600 20 $89.20 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 004852200 . Each | 545100 20 $90.20 4
NashvilleMed. KEMS 004852200 Each $5.9500 20 | $119.00 5
1100 Laryngoscope Blade, Miller; #3 Medium Adult No substitutions. _
Bound Tree Medical 004853300  Each | $3.8000 20 $76.00 1
Moore Medical, LIC. 004853300 _ Each 43600 | 20 $87.20 2
Henry Schein, Inc. | 004853300  Each $4.4600 20 $89.20 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 004853300 | Each | $4.5100 20 $90.20 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | 004853300  Each  $5.9500 20 $119.00 5
IT8 17-023 ALS

PAGE 12 OF 16




BASE FOR

e = AWARD
UNIT /
NUM DESCRIPTION ITEM # BASE FOR | 3'::;"5“ ﬁ g’gm RANK
1 _AWARD
101 mmw #2 Child Nomhsﬂmﬂons oL
Bound Tree Medical | 004802200 | Each | $3.8000 20 $76.00 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 004802200 | Each _ _5_4 .3600 20 $87.20 2
Henry Schein, Inc. | 004802200 | Each | 44600 | 20 $89.20 3
Midwest Medical Supply i 004802200  Each $4.5100 20 $90.20 4
l Nashville Med. & EMS 004802200 Each. $4.7500 | 20 $95.00 5
102 Laryngoscope Blade, Macintosh; #3 Medium Adult No substitutions o
Bound Tree Medical | 004803300 _ Each | $38000 | 20 | $76.00 1
Moore Medical, LLC. 004803300 _ Each $4.3600 20 | $87.20 2
Henry Schein, Inc. - | 004803300 Each $44600 | 20 | $89.20 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 004803300  Each $4.5100 20 $90.20 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | 004803300  Each $4.7500 | 20 $95.00 5
m mmmdnﬁﬁ;“hm Adult No substitutions N M
Bound Tree Medical | 004804400 | Each | $3.8000 | 20 $76.00 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 004804400 _ Each $4.3600 20 $87.20 2
Henry Schein, Inc. | 004804400 | Each $44600 | 20 $89.20 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 004804400 | Each $4.5100 20 $90.20 4
Nashville Med. & EMS 004804400 | Each $4.7500 20 | $95.00 5
104 Surgilube Lubricant; Foilpac; 5 g No substitutions
Bound Tree Medical | 0281-020545  Each $0.1000 | 144 $14.40 1
Midwest Medical Supply | 0281020545  Each $0.1800 144 $25.92 2
Henry Schein, Inc. - | 0281-0205-45  Each | $0.2000 144 $28.80 3
Moore Medical, LLC. ol _No bid
Nashville Med. & EMS | No bid
1105 Esophageal Intubation Detector Bulb Model, Tube Chek-8 Nosubmmuons m
| Bound Tree Medical | 000172002  Each $1.9500 20 $39.00 1
' Henry Schein, Inc. | 000172002 . Each | $2.0000 20 $40.00 2
' Midwest Medical Supply | 000172002 _Each | $2.2400 | 20 $44.80 3
Moore Medical, LLC. 000172002 _ Each $2.5100 20 $50.20 4
Nashville Med. & EMS . | No bid |
1106 Full Kit Nebulizer Set w / Mouthpiece, Tee Adapter, Reservoir; 7' No substitutions i paey
Bound Tree Medical | 8900  Each | $0.6500 50 $32.50 1
Moore Medical, LLC. B 8900 ~ Each - $0.9500 50 $47.50 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 8300 each $1.0700 . 50 | $53.50 3
Henry Schein, Inc. 8900 Each  $6.7300 50 | $336.50 4
Nashville Med. & EMS No bid _!
Henry Schein, Inc. B | 211599-130EA  Each | $6.7300 | 1 5673 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 21-1599-130EA  Each $74110 | 10 | $74.11 2
Bound Tree Medical | 21-1599-130EA  Each | $7.4600 1 $7.46 3
Midwest Medical S_upplg_ | 21-1599-130EA  Each ] $7.7300 10 $77.30 4
Nashville Med. & EMS ! _|_Nobid
- 108 mwrmm Adult Nosubs!lmﬂms
Henry Schein, Inc. [ 600-10000 Each $2.4900 | 25 $62.25 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 600-10000 Each  $2.5800 100 | $258.00 2
Bound Tree Medical | 60010000  Each  $2.6500 25 | $66.25 3
L Midwest Medical Supply | 600-10000 Each $27800 | 25 | $69.50 4
NashvilleMed. &EMS | 600-10000 Each $28900 | 25 | $72.25 5
109 Thomas Endotrachael Tube Holder, Child o substitutions i
Henry Schein, Inc. | 600-20000 __' Each | $2.4900 25 $62.25 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 600-20000 each | $2.5800 100 $258.00 2
ITB 17-023 ALS
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Bound Tree Medical | 60020000  Each $2.6500 25 $66.25 3
Midwest Medical Supply | 600-20000 Each $2.7800 25 $69.50 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | 60020000  Each | $2.8900 25 §72.25 5
110  Combitube Roll-up Kit 37fr. No substitutions B
Henry Schein, Inc. | 518437 | Each | $380500 | 4 $152.20 1
| ~ Midwest Medical Supply 518437  Each | 5409600 4 $163.84 2
[ Moore Medical, LLC. | 5-18437 | Each $405000 | 4 | $162.00 3
| Bound Tree Medical | 518437 each 5439800 | 4 | $175.92 4
;' Nashville Med. & EMS ] No bid |
111 Combitube Roll-up Kit 41fr. No substitutions l
Henry Schein, Inc. 518441  Each $38.0500 4 $152.20 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 518441 Each $40.5000 | 4 $162.00 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 5-18441 ~ Each $40.9600 4 $163.84 3
Bound Tree Medical B 5-18441 _ Each | $43.9800 4 $175.92 4
Nashville Med. & EMS —| { No bid .
112 Coude Tip, Pediatric 10Fr x 70cm; 10 Fr x 70 cm  No substitutions _ 2
Midwest Medical Supply 212017010  Each | $40000 | 10 | $40.00 1
Bound Tree Medical 212017010  Each $4.2000 10 $42.00 2
Henry Schein, Inc. | 2120-17010 Each $4.4100 10 $44.10 3
Moore Medical, LLC. ~ Nobid , |
Nashville Med. & EMS . 2 | No bid ' [ .
113 Mmm'mrxwﬁhxmm No substitutions m
Midwest Medical Supply | 9021270  Each | $4.0000 | 10 $40.00 1
_Bound Tree Medical | 9-0212-70  Each $4.2000 10 $42.00 2
Henry Schein, Inc. | 9021270  Each $4.4100 10 $44.10 3
Moore Medical, LLC. | | Nobid ,
Nashville Med. & EMS Sl No bid |
114 30miSyringe No substitutions
Henry Schein, Inc. 301626 Each | 503100 [ 100 | $31.00 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 301626 Each  $03111 224 $69.69 2
Midwest Medical Supply | 301626 | Each | $0.3200 56 $17.92 3
Bound Tree Medical | 301626 | Each | $0.3348 100 $33.48 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | | | No bid
115 10 mi Syringe Luer-lock Tip  No substitutions
Bound Tree Medical | 309604  Each | 50.0900 | 100 | $3.00 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 309604 _ Each | $0.1039 400 | 34156 2
. Midwest Medical Supply 309604 | Each 501063 | 100 | 51063 3
| Henry Schein, Inc. | 309604 _ Each $0.1100 100 $11.00 4
' Nashville Med. & EMS 309604 | Each | $0.1400 100 $14.00 5
T e g me— T
Henry Schein, Inc. | 329424  Each | $0.2600 100 $26.00 1
_ Midwest Medical Supply | 329424  Each | $0.2710 | 100 $27.10 2
Nashville Med. & EMS 329424 Each | $03400 | 100 $34.00 3
Bound Tree Medical | 320424 Each | $0.5400 | 100 $54.00 a
Moore Medical, LLC. AR - ) No bid -
117 1miSyringe o substitutions
Bound Tree Medical | 309602 _ Each $0.0700 | 100 | $7.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply 309602 _ Each ~ $0.1100 | 200 | $22.00 2
Henry Schein, Inc. 309602 Each $0.1100 100 $11.00 3
Moore Medical, LLC. 309602  Each | $0.1102 | 1600 $176.32 4
Nashville Med. & EMS T N  Nobid |
ITB 17-023 ALS
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118 3ml Syringe Luer-Lok Tip llosubsﬂtuﬂons 13
Moore Medical, LLC. | 309657 | Each | 00639 | 800 $51.12 1
Midwest Medical Supply | 309657 ~ Each | _Sp 0650 200 $13.00 2
Henry Schein, Inc. | 309657 ~ Each | $0.0700 100 $7.00 3
Bound Tree Medical | 309657 ~ Each | $0.0700 | 100 $7.00 4
Nashville Med. & EMS 309657 Each  $0.1700 - 100 $17.00 5

‘119 mwmmmamumumm it

Henry Schein, Inc. - | 155723 | Each $0.7200 1 $0.72

, Midwest Medical Supply | 8888268086  Each $6.0000 10 $60.00 2
Bound Tree Medical | 8808268086 ~ Each $6.4500 10 $64.50 3
Moore Medical, LLC. | Nobid
Nashville Med. & EMS _ Ul - | No bid

120 Naso-gastric or Gastric sump tube; 48 inch L, 12 French, 4.0 mm on ;-
Midwest Medical Supply | 8888264929 | Each $1.7300 50 $86.50 1
Bound Tree Medical  1217-12 | Each  $1.9100 50 $95.50 2

' Henry Schein, Inc. | 121712 ~ Each $2.1100 | 1 $2.11 3
Moore Medical, LLC. | 1217-12 Each ~ $2.5700 | 50 $128.50 4
Nashville Med. & EMS i No bid

121 WUMWMQMLRMQJMW Pt
Midwest Medical Supply | 8888264945  Each $1.7300 | 50 . 1
Bound Tree Medical 1217-14 Each  $1.9100 50 . 2
Henry Schein, Inc. | 12]_.? 14 | Each | $2.1100 1 . 3
Moore Medical, LLC. | 121714 | Each | $2.5700 50 . 4
Nashville Med. & EMS ' [ No bid

122 Naso-gastric or Gastric sump tube; 48 inch L, 16 French, 5.3 mm 0D m

. Midwest Medical Supply | 8888264960  Each $1.7300 | 50 $86.50 1

! Bound Tree Medical | 121716 | Each | $1.9100 50 $95.50 2

'. Henry Schein, Inc. 121716 | Each $2.1100 1 $2.11 3

| Moore Medical, LLC. 121716 _ Each | $2.5700 50 $128.50 4

* Nashville Med. & EMS N No bid

3 MW&MU&P.,MW&{I‘;} - m
Midwest Medical Supply | 542450 ~ Each $0.1800 500 $90.00 1
Henry Schein, Inc. i | 542450 ~ Each [ $0.1800 50 $9.00 2
Bound Tree Medical | 542450 ~ Each $0.1988 50 $9.94 3
Moore Medical, LLC. 1} | Each $0.2630 50 $13.15 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | i | No bid |

124 Philips HeartStart MRX Monitor Paper 76X25 _

'. Midwest Medical Supply | 13755 _ Eachroll | $1.4300 50 $71.50 1

‘ Bound Tree Medical | 13755 ~ Eachroll = $1.5100 5 $7.55 2
Henry Schein, Inc. ) | 404570 . Eachroll | $2.6700 10 $26.70 3
Moore Medical, LLC. e No bid
Nashville Med. & EMS " Nobid
Henry Schein, Inc. | 871200 ~ 100Each = $0.0328 100 $3.28 1
Moore Medical, LLC. | 1501 100 Each = $0.0332 1000 $33.20 2
Midwest Medical Supply | B71200 | 100Each  $0.0352 1000 $35.20 3
Bound Tree Medical | 1501 | 100Each = $0.0378 100 $3.78 4
Nashville Med. & EMS | (T No bid

126 Adult/Child Pre-Connect Combo Defib Pd for Phillips Heartstart MRX T

, Bound Tree Medical | ~ Each $15.6900 10 $156.90 1

[ Nashville Med. & EMS | T10020-PHILIPS  Each $16.7900 10 $167.90 2

ITB 17-023 ALS
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Midwest Medical Supply | 2516HPC Each | $18.8900 10 $188.90 3

Henry Schein, Inc. | 239229 Each | $23.2800 10 $232.80 4

Moore Medical, LLC. i | Each $23.5000 10 $235.00 5
' ~ Bound Tree Medical | ~ Each  $16.4800 10 | $164.80 1

Midwest Medical Supply | 2603  Each $17.7700 10 | $177.70 2
; Nashville Med. & EMS _ P-PHILIPS  Each  $18.9900 10 | $189.90 3

_ HenrySchein,Inc. 7001946  Each | $21.9300 1 $21.93 4

Moore Medical, LLC. B Each | $23.2500 5 $116.25 5
VENDORS PHONE# E-VERIFY
'BOUNDTREE MEDICAL LLC., 500 Tuttle Crossing Bivd. Dublin OH, 43016 800-533-0523 193018
HENRY SCHEIN, INC., PO Box 3227, Irmo, SC 29063 800-845-3350 204153
'MOORE MEDICAL, LLC. 1690 New Britan Ave., Farmington, CT 03032 800-234-1464 290841
'MIDWEST MEDICAL SUPPLY CO. 13400 Lakefront Dr., Earth City, MO 63045 888-540-3232 1199641
NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS PRODUCTS, INC.PO Box 64, Springfield, TN 37172 615-384-0576 863032

Local Vendors are indicated by the designation (LV). Award based off of Local Preference is indicated by the designation (LPA).

Local Preference was not used to award this bid.

Minor discrepancies between the case price on the submitted bid and the award are due to roundings.

RECOMMEND AWARDING TO ALL VENDORS BASED ON PRICE AND AVAILABILITY FOR THE BID PERIOD 04/01/2017 - 03/31/2018.

éﬁ'ﬁ ()..Q_,

3/A0

ﬁt Canaday, HCBCC, Communiﬂ Safety Director

Date

Gilbert, HCBCC Purchasing Manager

RECOMMENDATION APPROVED BY:

J29/7
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