
IFB 17-059, Park Amenities

Tabulation

Item # Description

EST 

QTY Brand

Product 

#  Unit Price 

 Extended 

Price Brand

Product 

#  Unit Price 

 Extended 

Price Brand

Product 

#  Unit Price 

 Extended 

Price Brand Product #  Unit Price 

Extended 

Price Brand Product #  Unit Price 

Extended 

Price Brand

Product 

#  Unit Price 

Extended 

Price Brand

Product 

#  Unit Price 

Extended 

Price

1

Trash 

Receptacle 

48 Gallon

12 Ultra-site
EXT-45  $    131.58  $   1,578.96 

Webcoat TR55-55 

GALLON 256.00$     3,072.00$    

NO BID

-$           -$           

Witt 

Industries
EXP-52 162.00$     1,944.00$    

Pilot Rock CN/TB-

EXP52 227.10$     2,725.20$    

Global 

Industrial
237634B

K 118.56$     1,422.72$  

Witt

263-1170 175.28$     2,103.36$  

2

Picnic Table 

8’
4 Ultra-site

238-V8  $    723.29  $   2,893.16 

Webcoat

T8UL-

POLY 

CENTER

ED 650.00$     2,600.00$    

BSN 

1275377 880.97$     3,523.88$  

Ultra Site

238-V8 775.00$     3,100.00$    

Pilot Rock

XT/CB-8DW 764.10$     3,056.40$    

Global 

Industrial 277153B

K 570.91$     2,283.64$  

MYT 

COAT

543-6006 629.00$     2,516.00$  

3

Picnic Table 

8' ADA
2 Ultra-site

238H-V8  $    723.29  $   1,446.58 
Webcoat

T8ULHD

CPALT 632.00$     1,264.00$    
BSN 

1275438 874.23$     1,748.46$  
Ultra Site

238H-V8 845.00$     1,690.00$    
Pilot Rock

WXT/CB-

8DW 819.10$     1,638.20$    

Global 

Industrial

695289B

K 549.18$     1,098.36$  

MYT 

COAT 543-6007 601.00$     1,202.00$  

4

Picnic Table 

48" ADA
2

Ultra-site

358-H-

OY  $    731.92  $   1,463.84 Webcoat

T46OCTR

OLL-

3ADA 926.00$     1,852.00$    

NO BID  $            -   

-$           Ultra Site 358H-OVR 845.00$     1,690.00$    Pilot Rock

WXT/CB-

4VW/E 989.10$     1,978.20$    

Leisure 

Craft

250650B

K 763.04$     1,526.08$  

MYT 

COAT
543-6011 643.00$     1,286.00$  

5

Bleachers  5 

Row
1

National 

Recreatio

n

NB-

0515ADL

Y  $ 4,583.00  $   4,583.00 Webcoat

BL515NE-

5 ROW 3,850.00$  3,850.00$    BSN 1049185 4,573.79$  4,573.79$  

GT 

Grandsta

nds

GS-

0515ADC-

A 4,185.00$  4,185.00$    Gared

GSNB0515W

A 4,150.00$  4,150.00$    Ultra Play

NR-

0515AMC

MS 2,973.00$  2,973.00$  

Outdoor 

Aluminum 129-1106 2,700.80$  2,700.80$  

 $ 11,965.54 12,638.00$  9,846.13$  12,609.00$  13,548.00$  9,303.80$  9,808.16$  

plus delivery 1,498.00$  14,136.00$  

6

Bulletin 

Board 1 NO BID  $            -    $              -   Barco KMC7505 1,359.00$  1,359.00$    BSN 1162806 354.34$     354.34$     

Barco 

Products KMC7505 755.00$     755.00$       NOBID -$           -$             AABCO

ODCCW

W36YPR 439.17$     439.17$     Jay Hawk 289-1064 681.00$     681.00$     

7

Stell Flat Lid 

for Trash 

Receptacle  

(line 1) 12 Ultra-site

FTR-32-

08  $      85.46  $   1,025.52 Webcoat

Flattop55 

with 

Hardware 86.24$       1,034.88$    NO BID -$           -$           

Witt 

Industries FTZ256G 70.00$       840.00$       Pilot Rock T/TB-246 97.00$       1,164.00$    Witt FTZ256G 50.50$       606.00$     Witt 263-SPC 63.00$       756.00$     

8

Picnic Table 

48" ADA
2 Ultra-site

358-H-

OY  $    731.92  $   1,463.84 Webcoat

T46OCTR

OLL-

3ADA 926.00$     1,852.00$    NO BID -$           -$           Ultra Site 358H-OVR 845.00$     1,690.00$    Pilot Rock

WXT/CB-

4VW/E 989.10$     1,978.20$    

Leisure 

Craft

250650B

K 763.04$     1,526.08$  

MYT 

COAT
543-6011 643.00$     1,286.00$  

9

Bleachers  5 

Row
1

National 

Recreatio

n

NB-

0515ADL

Y  $ 4,583.00  $   4,583.00 Webcoat

BL515NE-

5 ROW 3,850.00$  3,850.00$    BSN 1049185 4,573.79$  4,573.79$  

GT 

Grandsta

nds

GS-

0515ADC-

A 4,185.00$  4,185.00$    Gared

GSNB0515W

A 4,150.00$  4,150.00$    Ultra Play

NR-

0515AMC

MS 2,973.00$  2,973.00$  

Outdoor 

Aluminum 129-1106 2,700.80$  2,700.80$  

ALTERNATE BIDS

Notes

Item #5 and #9 - Chainlink price -  Guardrail 

System $5380.00 Product # NB-0515AVPDLX Item 7 comes in green or galvanized only

Notes

Global Equipment Company Highland Products Group, LLC

BASE BID

TOTAL BASE BID

Company Custom Property Solutions, LLC NPCG, LLC - National Ground

Varsity Brands Holding Company Inc. dba 

BSN sports LLC Children's Specialities, Inc. Fry & Associates, Inc.


