HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
Purchasing Department

AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED BIDS

ITB 17-025
POLYETHYLENE PIPES AND COUPLERS

Bid opening: 3/15/17

Bidder: HD SupplyWaterworks, Ltd.

e BA)PERE.TYPECP | (4A)NONPERF. |\ o o | (6A)SMOOTH BORE
it W/KNITTED FABRIC TYPE C e it W/KNITTED FABRIC
PRICE/FT PRICE/FT PRICE/FT
- R —— o
10" $439 | $3.69  $6.67 $7.36
12"  $7.43 $6.51 701 $7.93
15" No bid 5968 . $9.04 $11.00
18" Nobid $1230  $13.04 $14.61
24" No bid 62014 2194 $23.96
30" Nobid | Nobid 53046 No bid
36" Nobid "~ Nobid . $38.94 No bid
coumer|  mpeReride | WBISUTCRLNONRERF | (st creLwiGaSkET | o Do
SIZE PRICE PEREA | FABRIC
o PRICE PER EA PRICE PER EA s iin I
8" Nobid | " No bid No bid No bid
10" Nobid No bid  s17.31 No bid
12" $10.00 $10.00  $19.78 $10.00
15" $16.66 ' $16.66 . s3461 $16.66
18" | $28.39 62839  $41.20 $28.39
24" %4004 $40.04 . 57.69 $40.04
30" $93.08  $93.08  $138.45 $93.08
36" $129.50 412950 418955 $129.50
VENDOR : | ~ PHONE E-VERIFY
HD Supply Waterwork;:-uli{d. 65'2rSH US H\I;/;301; Ta}hba, I;'L, 33610 813-623-3343 Confirmed
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Local Vendors are indicated by the designation (LV). Award based off of Local Preference is indicated by the

designation (LPA). Local Preference was not used to award this bid.

RECOMMEND AWARDING TO THE SOLE BIDDER, HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS, LTD., FOR THE BID PERIOD
04/01/2017 - 03/31/2018.

Wt Bl ;/2/7//7

Kyle GreendlCBCC Road & Bridge Superintendent Date
F-24-/7
Dgnielle Gilbert, HCBCC Purchasing Manager Date
RECOMMENDATION APPROVED BY:
3/69 /17
June Fisher, HCBCC County Administrator Date
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