## **Tab Sheet 2022-29 Processing of Annual Tax Statements and Receipts**

	Midwest		The Pre-Sort Center of	The Masters	EJ Rice Company
Company Bidding	Direct 2222	Input Technology, Inc.	Stockton DBA: PacWest	Touch, LLC 1405 N	PO Box 1398
	West 110th St.	4425 Hunt Ave.	Direct 496 S Uruapan Way,	Ash Street,	Springfield, MO.
	Cleveland, OH	St.Louis, Mo 63110	Dinuba CA. 93618	Spokane, WA.	65801
Printing to reflect cost per 1,000/ total					
Real Estate Tax Statements 75,000	\$ 5,750.15	\$ 2,228.00	\$4,125	\$35.00/M	No bid
Personal Property Tax Statements 50,000	\$ 3,895.90	\$ 1,486.00	\$2,750	\$35.00/M	No bid
Mechant Tax Statements 2,000	\$ 324.50	\$ 59.00	\$110.00	\$35.00/M	No bid
Delinquent Tax Statements 18,000	\$ 1,702.86	\$ 535.00	\$1,260.00	\$38.00/M	No bid
Single page tri-fold inserts 15,000	\$ 829.85	\$ 848.00	\$900.00	\$38.00/M	No bid
Paid Tax Receipts 90,000	\$ 1,604.40	\$ 1,536.00	\$3,780.00	\$15.00/M	No bid
Blank Paid Tax Receipts 50,000	\$ 1,099.00	\$ 959.00	\$700.00	\$15.00/M	No bid
Duplicate Statement blanks 50,000	\$ 2,396.00	\$ 1,439.00	\$1,250.00	\$17.00/M	No bid
Return envelopes 110,000	\$ 5,372.40	\$ 4,334.00	\$4,042.50	\$22.00/M	No bid
Statement Mailing Envelopes 110,000	\$ 6,187.50	\$ 4,814.00	\$5,071.00	\$25.00/M	No bid
Paid Receipt mailing envelopes 90,000	\$ 5,062.50	\$ 3,938.00	\$4,149.00	\$25.00/M	No bid
Data Processing	\$ 3,300.00	\$3,750/\$1,642	\$2,500.00	\$3.00/M	No bid
Multi-statement matching, inserting, processing	\$ 705.00	\$3,454/\$2,670	Included	\$39.00/M	No bid
Additional Fees/ explanation	N/A	N/A	N/A	None	No bid
					No bid
Total Proposed Pricing	\$39,985.06	\$33,692	\$33,692		No bid