

Portage Public Schools
RFP #10651 Surveillance Cameras
3/19/18 @ 2:00 pm

| | | | | | | |
|--|--|--|--|-----------------------------|--|--|
| Vendor Name | Mid-State Security | Presidio | Security 101 | Q3 Technologies | North American Video Inc. | Siemens Industry Inc. |
| Address (City, State) | Wyoming, MI | Caledonia, MI | Kalamazoo, MI | Kalamazoo, MI | Brick, NJ | Wyoming, MI |
| Contact Name | David Brainard | Ryan Bailey | Mike Johnson | Henry M Smith-LeJeune | Suzanne Thomas | David Bonofiglio |
| Contact E Mail | dbrainard@midstatesecurity.com | rbailey@presidio.com | mjohnson@security101.com | Not given | SuzanneT@navcctv.com | david.bonofiglio@siemens.com |
| Iran Econ Act, Familial & Legal Status Forms | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes | Yes |
| 12 ea Aviglion 9W-H3-3MH-DP1-B UNIT PRICE | | | | | | |
| | \$1,138.75 | \$1,125.00 | \$1,237.50 | \$1,907.17 | \$1,394.00 | \$1,184.21 |
| Total Cost for 12 of the above | \$13,665.00 | \$13,500.00 | \$14,850.00 | \$22,886.04 | \$16,728.00 | \$14,210.52 |
| 6 ea Aviglion 12W-H3-4MH-DC1 UNIT PRICE | | | | | | |
| | \$1,411.25 | \$1,215.00 | \$1,336.50 | \$2,059.74 | \$1,516.00 | \$1,278.95 |
| Total Cost for 6 of the above | \$8,467.50 | \$7,290.00 | \$8,019.00 | \$12,358.44 | \$9,096.00 | \$7,673.70 |
| Camera Mounts | | | | | | |
| Aviglion Pendant CM-MT-WALL1 | \$150.60 | \$42.00 | \$46.20 | \$72.00 | NO BID | \$44.21 |
| Total Cost for 12 of the above | \$1,807.20 | \$504.00 | \$554.40 | \$864.00 | #VALUE! | \$530.52 |
| Aviglion Compatible Ceiling Mount | NO BID | NO BID | \$62.70 | NOT NEEDED PER MR. VOMASTEK | NO BID | Included |
| Total Cost for 6 of the above | #VALUE! | #VALUE! | \$376.20 | #VALUE! | #VALUE! | #VALUE! |
| GRAND TOTAL | \$22,132.50 | \$20,790.00 | \$22,869.00 | \$35,244.48 | \$25,824.00 | \$21,884.22 |

Shane Howard 