## BID TABULATIONS ORANGE BEACH RECREATION COMPLEX NEW GYMNASIUM

DAI Project No. 3891.01 3-26-2019 2:00 PM CST Page 1 of 1

	Highland Wake Construction, LLC	THE GREEN-SIMMONS CO., INC.	STUART CONSTRUCTION, LLC	GATES CONSTRUCTION	SYCAMORE CONSTRUCTION
GENERAL					
SEALED ENVELOPE - PROPOSAL	YES	YES	YES	NO BID	NO BID
PROJECT NAME	YES	YES	YES		
BIDDERS NAME	YES	YES	YES		
NOTATIONS ON ENVELOPE	NO	NO	NO		
ASE BID					
ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDA 1-4	YES	YES	YES	- T	
BID BOND	YES	YES	YES		
BID BOND COMPANY	SureTec Insurance Company	The Guarantee CO. of North America USA	Western Surety Company		
CALENDAR DAYS					
G.C. LICENSE NO. & TYPE	BCU-4 #42473	BC BC-S #38125	BC # 53256		
BASE BID	\$1,223,000.00	\$1,294,600.00	\$1,469,000.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
NOTATIONS ON ENVELOPE	-	-	-	-	-
TOTAL BASE BID	\$1,223,000.00	\$1,294,600.00	\$1,469,000.00	\$0,00	\$0.00
LTERNATES					
ALTERNATE #1 (ACOUSTICAL WALL PANEL)	\$40,674.00	\$35,941.00	\$38,500.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
NOTATIONS ON ENVELOPE	-	-	-	-	-
TOTAL ALTERNATE #1	\$40,674.00	\$35,941,00	\$38,500.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
RUNNING SUBTOTAL	\$1,263,674.00	\$1,330,541.00	\$1,507,500.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
\$50,000.00 CONTINGENCY ALLOWANCE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED		7,00
REMOVAL/REPLACEMENT OF UNSUITABLE SOIL	\$38.00 per cubic yard	\$65.00 per cubic yard	\$30.00 per cubic yard		
GRAND TOTAL (BASE BID PLUS ALL ALTERNATES)	\$1,263,674.00	\$1,330,541.00	\$1,507,500.00	NO BID	NO BID

We hereby certify that the above is a true and accurate summary of bids for the above project.

ARCHITECT: Davis Architects, Inc.

ARCHITECT. Davis Alchitects, Inc.

Notary (My commission expires 1-77-21)

RACHEL ANNE ISBELL My Commission Expires September 22, 2020

