
IFB # 316-18 Course Aggregate & Miscellaneous Items

Bid Tabulation Sheet

October 18, 2018

Rip Rap Type 1 per ton No Bid No Bid $19.30 N/A $19.30 N/A

Rip Rap Type 3 No Bid No Bid $19.30 N/A $19.30 N/A

Surge per ton No Bid No Bid $17.80 N/A $17.80 N/A

Baby Surge per ton No Bid No Bid $17.80 N/A $17.80 N/A

Graded 

Aggregates Base 
per ton $14.44 No Bid $11.55 N/A $11.55 N/A

#34 Stone per ton No Bid No Bid $16.05 N/A N/a N/A

#4 Stone per ton No Bid No Bid N/A N/A $16.05 N/A

#57 Stone per ton No Bid No Bid $16.30 N/A $16.30 N/A

#89 Stone per ton No Bid No Bid $18.05 N/A $18.05 N/A

M-10 Screenings per ton No Bid No Bid $14.05 N/A $14.05 N/A

Sand per ton No Bid No Bid $15.05 N/A $15.05 N/A

0

Vendor's Delivery Fee:

$8.10/Ton

Yes

Two Days After Order

$6.50/Ton (GAB, 34, 4, 

57,89, M-10, sand, surge 

and baby surge) Rip Rap 

Type 3 - $8.50/Ton

Percentage (%) discount for other 

products not specifically listed in 

this IFB but may be needed. 

Percentage (%) off of published 

N/A

Vendor will accept invoice 

payment (net/30)?  
Yes

Vendor’s order processing time? 
One Day After Order

Gravel Type
Unit of 

Measure

Virgin 

Material Total 

Bid Price Per 

Ton

Vulcan Materials -   

Dahlonega

Virgin 

Material 

Total Bid 

Price Per 

Recycled Material 

Total Price Per 

Ton

Recycled 

Material Total 

Price Per Ton

Green Dream International

Vulcan Materials -        

Cherokee

Virgin Material 

Total Bid Price 

Per Ton

Recycled 

Material 

Total 

Price Per 

0

Yes

Two Days After Order

$6.25/Ton (GAB, 34, 4, 57,89, 

M-10, sand, surge and baby 

surge) Rip Rap Type 3 - 

$8.00/Ton



Awarded To: Vulcan Materials

Awarded Date: December 20, 2018

18.4 Miles

Rock Quarry Source Name and 

Number per GDOT's QPL #2:

Martin Marietta Ball Ground 

Quarry
Cherokee - QPL Source 

#143C

Mileage Distance from Plant to 946 

Burt Creek Rd, Dawsonville 21. Miles
15.6 Miles

Dahlonega Quarry - QPL 

Source #141C


