
TABULATION OF BIDS 

FOR 
 21-DPR-ITB-623 

Grass Mowing and Turf Management Services 
 

BIDS were opened by Tomeka D. Price, Procurement Officer at 1:05 P.M. on June 9, 2021. 
 
 
 

Name of Bidder Northeast 
Quadrant 

Northwest 
Quadrant 

Southeast 
Quadrant 

Southwest 
Quadrant 

Grand Total 

BrightView Landscape Services, Inc. 
 

No Bid 
 

$274,785.29 
 

No Bid No Bid 
 

$274,785.29 

J&M of Northern Virginia 
 

No Bid 
 

No Bid 
 

$139,164.00 
$186,801.00 

 
$325,965.00 

McDonnell Landscape Inc. 
 

$213,929.00 
 

$453,418.40 
 

$201,571.00 $319,787.00 
 

$1,188,705.40 

Virginia Snow and Ice 
 

$228,069.08 
 

$431,389.43 
 

$201,315.05 $275,277.28 
 

$1,136,050.84 

 

 

 

   
 
 


