RFQ #16-015 - COMMERCIAL GYM EQUIPMENT

TABULATION
Company Advanced Exercise Orthotech Sports Medical 2nd Wind Exercise
Pro Maxima Equipment Equipment Push Pedal Pull, Inc. Foremost Fitness Group Fitness Showcase BSN Sports, LLC NusStep, Inc. Equipment
FreeMotion TRUE
ProMaxima CLSX e 10.6 Precor EFX Spectrum Cybex 770AT
Elliptical Price CV-E22 $2,979.00 |Elliptical $3,950.67 |FMEL84414 | S 4,000.00 |815 S 4,803.34 [T51000 S 4,810.00 |Arc Trainer | $ 5,497.00 [No Bid No Bid Matrix A3x | $4,572.00
Begin 2016, End 2017 [Begin TBD, End 3 yrs after| 3yr parts & labor begins | 3yr begins time of delivery 3 yrs parts and labor 7yr Frame, 5yr Generator,
Elliptical Warranty for $275/yr install for $370 time of delivery for $500.00 3 years parts and labor begins time of delivery 3yr parts & labor 2
TRUE
OSR-0000 FreeMotion r Recumbent Cybex 770R
ProMaxima Activate Rec 10.4 Precor RBK Bike Step Thru CR800 Spirit 05003-HB -
Recumbent Bike CV-R22 $2,249.00 |Bike $2,038.57 [FMEX82514 | S 3,000.00 (615 $ 1,913.34 |CS900ROTFT | S 2,125.00 |Recumbent | $ 2,815.00 |#1364699 S 2,135.73 [TSXRW S 6,657.00 [Matrix R3x-C | $2,151.00
Begin 2016, End 2017 |Begin TBD, End 3 yrs after| 3yr parts & labor begins | 3yr begins time of delivery 3 yrs parts and labor Syr Parts & Electronics, 2yr| 5yr for component parts, |7yr Frame, 5yr Generator,
Bike Warranty for $275/yr install for $370 time of delivery for $250.00 3 years parts and labor begins time of delivery Labor, Lifetime Frame | 10yr Frame, begins time of 3yr parts & labor 2
OST-0100 FreeMotion TRUE Alpine
ProMaxima Activate i7.9 Precor TRM Runner Cybex 790T
Treadmill CV-T22 $3,749.00 |Treadmill $3,974.29 |[VMTL39811 | S 4,000.00 (811 S 4,848.34 |T11000 S 4,750.00 |Treadmill $ 5,815.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid
Begin 2016, End 2017 |Begin TBD, End 3 yrs after| 3yr parts & labor begins | 3yr begins time of delivery includes belt/deck begins
Treadmill Warranty for $275/yr install for $370 time of delivery for $500.00 3 years parts and labor time of delivery
Total $8,977.00 $9,963.53 $11,000.00 $11,565.02 $11,685.00 $14,127.00 S 2,135.73 S 6,657.00 $6,723.00
(Does not (does not
include include (Does not
Elliptical or Elliptical or include
Treadmill) Treadmill) Treadmill)




