
ESCAMBIA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL ENFORCEMENT COMMERCIAL/RESIDENTIAL ABATEMENT PROJECTS

Vendor Registry Quote#

Open Date: 2/1/2021

Bids Due Close Date: 2/09/21 @ 2:00 p.m.
Mandatory Walkthrough 2/04/21 8:30 a.m.

KMK Meadows Andala Bonners
Maintenance Enterprises Hauling

Project Address Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount

1 3140 KING ST $5,000.00 $8,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,426.00 $4,770.00 $2,150.00 $5,500 $5,500.00 

2 5684 NICHOLAS LN no bid $20,000.00 $7,200.00 $6,000.00 $3,960.00 $5,950.00 $6,500 $6,500.00 

3 5688 NICHOLAS LN $1,650.00 $6,000.00 $1,700.00 $2,500.00 $2,860.00 $1,900.00 $1,200 $7,500.00 

4 5527 TURKEY RD $2,045.00 $6,500.00 $2,700.00 $1,925.00 $3,140.00 $2,100.00 $2,500 $5,500.00 

5 5612 TURKEY RD no bid $8,000.00 $10,000.00 no bid $3,670.00 NO BID $4,500 $8,500.00 

6 5628 TURKEY RD $1,949.00 $4,500.00 $4,000.00 $1,200.00 $3,720.00 NO BID $2,500 $3,500.00 

7 5624 TURKEY RD no bid $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,100.00 $3,900.00 NO BID $3,000 $3,850.00 

8 5743 PERKINS ST $1,949.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,880.00 NO BID $2,500 $5,500.00 

9 1001 BREMEN AVE PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

10 1009 BREMEN AVE PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

11 214 SE KALASH RD $2,200.00 $1,500.00 $2,100.00 $1,975.00 $1,340.00 $950.00 $1,200 $4,850.00 

12 107 SE SYRCLE DR no bid $9,000.00 $10,000.00 $17,500.00 $4,570.00 $7,100.00 $8,500 $7,000.00 

13 3 EARL CT $2,200.00 $3,000.00 $1,700.00 $3,500.00 $2,970.00 $4,350.00 $2,500 $6,000.00 

14 1020 W MAXWELL ST $3,200.00 $1,300.00 $2,800.00 $1,500.00 $1,640.00 $850.00 $2,000 $700.00 

15 PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

16 2618 DELANO ST no bid $5,000.00 $7,700.00 $2,751.00 $3,960.00 $3,800.00 $6,000 $7,000.00 

17 3231 N Q ST $4,800.00 $3,750.00 $4,300.00 $3,500.00 $2,740.00 $6,200.00 $3,500 $4,000.00 

19 99 TRAVIS ST PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

20 8511 ROSE AVE $6,500.00 $7,000 $6,100 $1,500.00 $2,670.00 $2,750.00 $4,500 $3,850.00 

21 1504 PARKER RD PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

22 1960 PARKER RD no bid No bid 5,300.00 no bid no bid $4,450.00 no bid $4,500.00 

23 2120 HANDY RD $5,500.00 $5,500.00 10,000.00 $1,685.00 no bid NO BID no bid $3,500.00 

24 2230 HANDY RD $5,800.00 $5,500.00 6,200.00 $1,925.00 no bid $4,475.00 $5,500 $2,800.00 

25 406 BELMONT AVE PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

26 2832 MANDEVILLE LN PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

27 5346 WALES AVE PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

Vendor Totals $26,493.00 $63,550.00 $85,600.00 $41,151.00 $39,060.00 $42,550.00 $56,400.00 $90,550.00

RESULTS ARE UNDER REVIEW AND NOT FINAL UNTIL ALL INSURANCE AND PERMITTING REQUIREMENTS HAVE BEEN 

CONFIRMED DO NOT COMMENCE ANY WORK OR OBTAIN ANY PERMITS UNITL YOUR PURCHASE ORDER HAS BEEN 

RECEIVED FROM ESCAMBIA COUNTY.
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