
Porterville Unified School District Bid Solicitation 2020-2021 Solicitation is for Commercial Pricing

JANITORIAL 1

Janitorial Bid# SN-22-05
Vendor Name: GOLD STAR FOODS Vendor Name: P&R Paper Supply Company, Inc. Vendor Name: QYK Vendor Name: Sysco Vendor Name: Central Sanitary Supply

Description
*Estimated 

Usage Grain
M/
MA Bulk IW Acceptable Brands Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price

1
ALL TEMP RINSE

5 X Ecolab
NO BID NO QUOTE NO QUOTE - - - NO BID ECOLAB        6116811    2 #VALUE! ECO LAB No Bidtwo- 2.5gal case

2
BASH, TRASH CAN, CLEAR

25 X
NO BID REPUBLIC BAG INC REP-3339CL10 250/CS $0.11 $27.45 NO BID SYS CLS       H6639HCS  250 #VALUE! $31.26 Allstate Plastics - 1.0 MIL REP-33391.0 250/CS N/A $23.99)32 gallon

3
BAG, TRASH CAN, CLEAR

25 X
NO BID REPUBLIC BAG INC REP-4046CL10 250/CS $0.16 $39.25 NO BID SYS CLS       H8046SCS  125 #VALUE! $34.77 Oceania - 1.5 Mil REP-404615B 200/CS N/A $33.90)45 gallon

4
BLEACH, LIQUID

50 X
NO BID HASA, INC. HSA-2070 6/CS $1.83 $10.95 QYK BRANDS LLC QB1G 6 GAL/ CS 29.99 / case 1,499.50 SYS CLS    11009105041    6 #VALUE! $15.36 Pure Bright AP-GB6X1GL 6 Gal/CS N/A $11.94)six- 1 gallon case

5
CITRUS CLEANER, SPRAY

25 X
NO BID NO QUOTE NO QUOTE - - - NO BID KEYSTON 6101836 4 #VALUE! ECO LAB Maintex 164332BRDY 12 QT/CS N/A $30.48)6 bottles case, NO Substitutions

6
CLEANSER, CHLORINATED

25 X
NO BID COLGATE PALMOIVE COMPANY CPC-14278 24/CASE $1.04 $24.95 NO BID AJAX         195360   24 #VALUE! $14.44 21oz KK-3021 24/CS N/A $23.04)24 CT case

7
CONVI OVEN, SOLBLE TABLET

5 X
NO BID RATIONAL COOKING RAT-5600-210A 100/PL $0.80 $79.90 NO BID RATIONL      56.00.210  100 #VALUE! $79.30 No Bid90 CT pail

8
DEGREASER

10 X
NO BID GENLABS GEN-1878PR4 4/CS $5.13 $20.50 NO BID SYS REL        6100210    4 #VALUE! $22.33 Maintex B-3525 4 Gal /CS N/A $30.80)four- 1 gallon case

9
ECOLAB POT AND PAN SOLID

100 X Ecolab 6101350
NO BID NO QUOTE NO QUOTE - - - NO BID ECOLAB        6112963    4 #VALUE! ECO LAB No Bid2 CT case

10
ECOLAB SANITIZER, QUAT

100 X Ecolab 6100176
NO BID NO QUOTE NO QUOTE - - - NO BID ECOLAB        6100176    2 #VALUE! ECO LAB No Bid2 CT case

11
GREEN PAD, HEAVY DUTY

25 X
3M SCOTCHBRITE 200006 20CT $2.23 $44.64 ACS INDUSTRIES INC. ACS-SO96 60/CASE $0.19 $11.35 NO BID SYSCO      SYS-S096A    1 #VALUE! $6.21 ACS Industries 10/Pack C-86EA 6 Pack/CS N/A $38.40)heavy duty, 20 CT box

12
HAND WIPES

100 X
NO BID DIAMOND WIPES INT'L DMW-F2079 1000/CS $0.01 $9.95 QYK BRANDS LLC DJHSW700 700 CT/ 2 CT in a case 28.98 2,898.00 NICEPAK         P92084    6 #VALUE! $42.22 Handy Clean 60/Pack $15,369.00 24 Pck/CS N/A $116.00)1000 CT case

13
LAUNDRY DETERGENT

25 X
CHEMCOR CHEMICAL 200300 25LB $14.20 DIAMOND CHEMICAL LUS-50BLU 1-50#/EA $22.50 $22.50 NO BID KEYSTON        6100197    1 #VALUE! ECO LAB Exsl Ultra B-2007-50 50lb Pail N/A $30.90)40 pound pail

14
LAUNDRY DETERGENT, LIQUID

10 X
NO BID DIAMOND CHEMICAL LUS-410 4/CS $7.76 $31.05 NO BID ECOLAB        6101848    1 #VALUE! ECO LAB Spartan S-7003GL 4 Gal/CS N/A $63.96)

15
LIME DESCALER

5 X
NO BID CHEMCOR CHEMICAL CORP CHM-61501 4/CS $5.80 $23.20 NO BID KEYSTON        6100053    2 #VALUE! ECO LAB Chemcor Chemical Corp R-0500 4 Gal/CS N/A $36.60)four- 1 gallon case

16
OVEN CLEANER

10 X
NO BID CLAIRE MFG. CMC-CS233 12/CS $2.21 $26.55 NO BID KEYSTON        6100059    6 #VALUE! ECO LAB Claire  19oz cans CL-824EA 12/CS N/A $47.88)6 each case

17
POT AND PAN SOAP

10 X
NO BID GENLABS GEN-1885PR4 4/CS $4.01 $16.05 NO BID SYS REL        6100224    4 #VALUE! $21.73 Sparkle B-3170 4 Gal/CS N/A $21.76)four- 1 gallon case

18
POT AND PAN SOAP

25 X Palmolive
NO BID GENLABS GEN-1885PR5 1/EA $23.95 $23.95 NO BID Sparkle B-317050 5 Gal Pail N/A $26.20)5 gallon pail

19
SANITIZER TABLET

5 X
NO BID ECOLAB ECC-14821 4000/CS $0.03 $125.00 NO BID STERAMN            6-Q    6 #VALUE! $33.03 EfferSan 100 tabs/Jar IP-500-40020 10 Jar/CS N/A $265.00)100 CT case

20
SOAP, FLLED PADS

10 X
NO BID THE CLOROX COMPANY CLO-88320 180/CASE $0.21 $37.20 NO BID SYSCO     SYS-ISP-01   12 #VALUE! $49.83 ACS Industries   10/Box P-Hotel 12 Box/CS N/A $39.90)10 each case

21
STAINLESS STEEL SPONGE

20 X
NO BID ACS INDUSTRIES INC. ACS-434PB 72/CASE $0.35 $25.50 NO BID SYSCO      304PB-SYS    1 #VALUE! $20.66 Boardwalk L-Pad50 12/Carton N/A $13.20)12 CT case

22
STAINLESS STEEL, CLEANER, AEROSOL

5 X
NO BID CLAIRE MFG. CMC-CS227 12/CS $2.16 $25.95 NO BID Claire 12 oz K-SSA 12/CS N/A $52.80)6 each case

23
WIPES, CLOROX, SANITIZER

100 X
NO BID NICE-PACK INT'L NIC-P22884 1200/CS $0.04 $43.55 QYK BRANDS LLC DJDW700CT 700 CT/ 2 CT in a case 28.98 2,898.00 CLOROX          15949    6 #VALUE! $36.90 Progressive Products 80 wipes/Pck PP-37701 12 Pkg/CS N/A $58.00)1000 CT case


