
Porterville Unified School District  Bid Solicitation 2024-2025 School YearCold Foods Solicitation SN-25-02 Equal Opportunity Employer 

Gold Star Foods La Tapatia Sysco Foods Producer's Dairy

Line
Est. 

Usage
Item Name Description Preferred brand or Equal

Commercial Bid Pricing Commodity Bid Pricing (if available) Commercial Bid Pricing Commodity Bid Pricing (if available) Commercial Bid Pricing Commodity Bid Pricing (if available) Commercial Bid Pricing Commodity Bid Pricing (if available)

Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Mark Up Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Mark Up Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Mark Up Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Mark Up Brand

1 15
BAR, APPLE, BREAKFAST, GLUTEN 
FREE

IW, 60 41.4 OZ, GLUTEN FREE GLUTINO PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$43.98 60/1.4OZ $0.73 GLUTINO $76.39 60 / 1.4 OZ 1.27 GLUTINO

2 15
BAR, BBLUEBERRY, BREAKFAST, 
GLUTEN FREE

IW, 60 41.4 OZ, GLUTEN FREE GLUTINO PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$43.48 60/1.4OZ $0.72 GLUTINO $76.39 60 / 1.4 OZ 1.27 GLUTINO

3 15
BAR, STRAWBERRY, BREAKFAST, 
GLUTEN FREE

IW, 60 41.4 OZ, GLUTEN FREE GLUTINO PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$43.00 60/1.4OZ $0.72 GLUTINO $65.27 60 / 1.41OZ 1.09 GLUTINO

4 5 BUTTER, 1LB PRINTS
BULK, DOES NOT NEED TO BE NSLP 
COMPLIANT

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$153.91 36/1LB $0.13 GRASSLAND $105.30 30 / 1 LB 3.51 WHLFIMP

5 35 BUTTER, BULK, SALTED
BULK, DOES NOT NEED TO BE NSLP 
COMPLIANT

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
NO BID $108.53 4 / 5 LB 27.13 WHLFCLS

6 5 BUTTER, PATS, SALTED
IW, DOES NOT NEED TO BE NSLP 
COMPLIANT

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
NO BID $105.50 30 / 1 LB 3.52 WHLFIMP

7 35 BUTTER, UNSALTED BULK, 30# PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$108.65 30/1LB $0.11 PACKER LABEL $105.78 30 / 1 LB 3.53 WHLFIMP

8 350 BUTTERMILK, CARTON 1/2 GALLON PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
NO BID $18.37 6 / 0.5GAL 3.06 WHLFCLS 31.0152 12- 1/2 Gal 2.5846 Producers Dairy

9 25 CHEESE, CHEDDAR, MEDIUM LOAF
BULK, DOES NOT NEED TO BE NSLP 
COMPLIANT

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
NO BID $30.54 2 / 5 LB 15.27 BBRLIMP

10 25 CHEESE, CHEDDAR, MILD, SLICED BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$52.17 8/1.5LB $0.27 LAND O LAKES $26.93 8/1.5LB $0.14 LAND O LAKES $40.12 8 / 1.5 LB 5.02 BBRLIMP

11 25 CHEESE, COJITA BULK
PREFFERED BRAND OR 
EQUAL

NO BID NO BID /

12 25 CHEESE, CREAM, BULK, TUB BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$14.64 48OZ $0.24 PHILADELPHIA $44.69 4 / 3 LBS 11.17 WHLFCLS

13 200 CHEESE, CREAM, CUP iwM 1oz portion, low fat PHILADELPHIA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$19.26 100/1OZ $0.19 GREEN MOUNTAIN $25.99 100 / 1 OZ 0.26 WHLFCLS

14 250 CHEESE, JALAPENO CHEDDAR CUP IW, MUST MEET 1 M/MA LAND O LAKES PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$86.95 140/3OZ $0.62 LAND O LAKES $68.18 140/3OZ $0.49 LAND O LAKES $71.06 96 / 3.7OZ 0.74 TABATCH

15 25 CHEESE, MONTEREY JACK, SLICED BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$42.51 8/1.5LB $0.22 PACKER LABEL $40.32 8 / 1.5 LB 5.04 BBRLIMP

16 25 CHEESE, PEPPER JACK, LOAF BULK, PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
NO BID $30.27 2 / 5 LB 15.14 BBRLIMP

17 100 CHEESE, SHREDDED, CHEDDAR BULK, 5# BAG, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$60.13 4/5LB $0.19 LAND O LAKES $18.06 4/5LB $0.06 LAND O LAKES $54.13 4 / 5 LB 13.53 SYS CLS

18 25 CHEESE, SHREDDED, COLBY JACK BULK, 5# BAG, REDUCED FAT
PREFFERED BRAND OR 
EQUAL

NO BID NO BID /

19 25
CHEESE, SHREDDED, MONTEREY 
JACK

BULK, 5# BAG, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$68.14 4/5LB $0.21 BONGARDS $26.07 4/5LB $0.08 BONGARDS $56.39 4 / 5 LB 14.1 CASAIMP

20 125 CHEESE, SHREDDED, MOZZARELLA BULK, 5# BAG, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$60.26 4/5LB $0.19 CHOICE $54.52 4 / 5LB 13.63 AREZIMP

21 100 CHEESE, SLICED, AMERICAN BULK, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$49.82 4/5LB $0.16 LAND O LAKES $33.41 4/5LB $0.10 LAND O LAKES $57.75 4 / 5 LB 14.44 BBRLCLS

22 25 CHEESE, SLICED, CHEDDAR BULK, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$48.54 8/1.5LB $0.25 LAND O LAKES $23.30 8/1.5LB $0.12 LAND O LAKES $40.12 8 / 1.5 LB 5.02 BBRLIMP

23 25 CHEESE, SLICED, PEPPER JACK BULK, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$48.53 8/1.5LB $0.25 LAND O LAKES $23.29 8/1.5LB $0.12 LAND O LAKES $78.81 6 / 32 OZ 13.14 TILAMOK

24 200 CHEESE, STICK, COLBY JACK IW, MUST MEET 1 M/MA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$52.77 168/1OZ $0.31 LAND O LAKES $30.68 168/1OZ $0.18 LAND O LAKES $25.07 168 / 1OZ 0.28 LOL $25.07 168 / 1OZ $0.15 LOL

25 500 CHEESE, MOZZARELLA STICK, STRING IW, MUST MEET 1 M/MA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$39.64 168/1OZ $0.24 LAND O LAKES $17.55 168/1OZ $0.10 LAND O LAKES $21.13 168 / 1 OZ 0.26 LOL $21.13 168 / 1 OZ $0.13 LOL

26 20 CHEESE, PEPPER JACK BULK, BLOCK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
NO BID $30.27 2 / 5 LB 15.14 BBRLIMP

27 500 CINNAMON ROLL IW, MUST MEET 1 WG BUENA VISTA, EDNAS PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$46.87 72/3OZ $0.65 SHANNONS $36.06 100 / 2.7 OZ 0.36 PILLSBY

28 10 CREAM, HEAVY WHIPPING 1/2 GAL PRODUCERS PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
NO BID NO BID /

29 10 CREAMER, CUPS, DAIRY IW, ASSORTED FLAVORS PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$16.72 180/.38OZ $0.09NESTLE PROFESSIONAL $18.33 384 / 9 ML 0.05 CITVCLS

30 25 CREAMER, HALF & HALF, FAT FREE 1/2 GAL PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
NO BID $41.07 12 / 32 OZ 3.42 WHLFCLS

31 25 CREAMER, NON DAIRY, 1/2 & 1/2 IW PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$12.82 180CT $0.07INTERNATIONAL DELIGHT NO BID /

32 25
CREAMER, NON DAIRY, CARMEL 
MACCIATO

IW PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$15.44 192CT $0.08INTERNATIONAL DELIGHT $20.97 288 / 13 ML 0.07 INT DEL

33 25 CREAMER, NON DAIRY, HAZELNUT IW PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$15.44 192CT $0.08INTERNATIONAL DELIGHT $20.87 288 / 13 ML 0.07 CITVCLS

34 25 CREAMER, NON DAIRY, VANILLA IW PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$15.44 192CT $0.08INTERNATIONAL DELIGHT $20.87 288 / 13 ML 0.07 CITVCLS

35 100 EGGS, HARD BOILED BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$36.62 12/6CT $0.51 SUNNY FRESH $31.59 12/6CT $0.44 SUNNY FRESH $65.89 12 / 12 CT 5.49 WHLFIMP

36 15 EGGS, LIQUID, CARTON 1/2 GALLON PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$72.35 12/2LB $0.34 SUNNY FRESH $55.47 12/2LB $0.26 SUNNY FRESH $108.97 2 / 20 LB 54.49 WHLFIMP

37 20 EGGS, SHELLED, LARGE, USDA AA BULK, 15 DOZEN PER CASE PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
NO BID $60.20 1 / 15 DZ 60.2 WHLFIMP

38 35 MARGARINE BULK, 30 # PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
NO BID $21.63 30 / 1 LB 0.72 SYS CLS

39 25 MILK, ALMOND, VANILLA IW, 18/8 OZ SILK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$16.28 18/8OZ $0.90DANNON COMPANY INC $20.72 18 / 8 OZ 1.15 SILK

40 25 MILK, ALMOND. CHOCOLATE IW, 18/8 OZ SILK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$22.53 18/8OZ $1.25 SILK $20.72 18 / 8 OZ 1.15 SILK

41 150 SMOOTHIE, PEACH IW, MUST MEET 1/2 CUP FRUIT BAR FRESH PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$49.26 48/7.6OZ $1.03 BARFRESH $49.58 48 / 7.6FOZ 1.03 BARFRSH

42 150 SMOOTHIE, STRAWBERRY BANANA IW, MUST MEET 1/2 CUP FRUIT BAR FRESH PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$49.26 48/7.6OZ $1.03 BARFRESH $49.58 48 / 7.6 OZ 1.03 BARFRSH

43 900 SMOOTHIE,MANGO PINEAPLE IW, MUST MEET 1/2 CUP FRUIT BAR FRESH PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$49.26 48/7.6OZ $1.03 BARFRESH $46.44 50 / 7.6 OZ 0.93 TWISTGO

44 5 SOUR CREAM, BULK BULK, 32# TUB PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$12.45 5LB $0.17 DAISY $47.29 1 / 32 LB 47.29 WHLFCLS

45 200 SOUR CREAM, PACKET IW, 1 OZ PACKETS PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$20.63 100/1OZ $0.21 LAND O LAKES $15.57 100 / 1 OZ 0.16 WHLFCLS

46 300 TORTILLAS, 8 INCH BULK, MUST MEET 1 GRAIN, FRESH PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$3.96 2DZ $0.17 ROMEROS $24.30 9PKS. 20CNT. $2.70 PER PK. LA TAPATIA $44.91 24 / 12 CT $1.87 CASACLS

47 50 TORTILLAS, CHILE WRAP
BULK, MUST MEET 1 GRAIN, WG, 
FRESH

GOLDEN SUN, LA TAPATIA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$20.19 5/10CT $4.04 LA TAPATIA $20.00 5PKS. 10CNT $4.00 PER PK. LA TAPATIA $29.76 6 / 12CT $4.96 BBRLCLS

48 120 TORTILLAS, FLOUR, UNCOOKED
BULK, DOES NOT NEED TO BE NSLP 
COMPLIANT

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
NO BID $59.22 18PKS 10CNT $3.29 PER PK. LA TAPATIA $29.55 1 / 50 LB $29.55 MASECA

49 50
TORTILLAS, TOMATO BASIL, 12 INCH, 
WRAP

BULK, 1.3 G LA TAPATIA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$20.19 5/10CT $4.04 LA TAPATIA $20.00 5pks. 10cnt. $4.00 PER PK. LA TAPATIA $31.49 6 / 12 CT $5.25 BBRLCLS
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50 50 TORTILLAS, WRAP, VARIETY PACK
12 INCHM DOES NOT NEED TO BE NSLP 
COMPLIANT

MISSION PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$38.13 6/12CT $6.36 MISSION FOODS $38.50 6 / 12CT 6.42 MISSION

51 50 TORTILLAS,, SPINACH, WRAP BULK, 8 INCHM NUST NEET 1 WG GOLDEN SUN, LA TAPATIA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$20.19 5/10CT $4.04 LA TAPATIA $20.00 5PKS. 10CNT. $4.00 LA TAPATIA $29.79 6 / 12 CT $4.97 SYS CLS

52 100 WHIPPED TOPPING,
BULK, 12/ 16OZ, DOES NOT NEED TO 
BE NSLP COMPLIANT

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$47.00 12/16OZ $3.92 RICHS $41.06 12 / 16 OZ 3.42 SYS REL

53 1500 YOGURT, BANANA-STRAWBERRY
IW, 4 OZ, NON FAT, MIST MEET 1 
M/MA

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$17.26 48/4OZ $0.36 UPSTATE FARMS $22.73 48 / 4 OZ 0.47 YOPLAIT 14.789 4 oz 0.3081 Dannon

54 400 YOGURT, PARFAIT POUCH, VANILLA BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$29.02 6/4LB $0.45 YOPLAIT $28.93 6 / 4 LB 4.82 YOPLAIT

55 1500 YOGURT, RASPBERRY
IW, 4 OZ, NON FAT, MIST MEET 1 
M/MA

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$17.26 48/4OZ $0.36 UPSTATE FARMS $18.01 48 / 4 OZ 0.38 DANNON

56 1500 YOGURT, STRAWBERRY
IW, 4 OZ, NON FAT, MIST MEET 1 
M/MA

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$17.26 48/4OZ $0.36 UPSTATE FARMS $15.86 48 / 4 OZ 0.33 DANNON

57 50 YOGURT, VANILLA, LITE BULK, 32 OZ TUB PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$17.74 6/32OZ $0.55 YOPLAIT $9.57 12 / 6 OZ 0.8 YOPLAIT
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1 15
BAR, APPLE, BREAKFAST, GLUTEN 
FREE

IW, 60 41.4 OZ, GLUTEN FREE GLUTINO PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$43.98 60/1.4OZ $0.73 GLUTINO

2 15
BAR, BBLUEBERRY, BREAKFAST, 
GLUTEN FREE

IW, 60 41.4 OZ, GLUTEN FREE GLUTINO PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$43.48 60/1.4OZ $0.72 GLUTINO

3 15
BAR, STRAWBERRY, BREAKFAST, 
GLUTEN FREE

IW, 60 41.4 OZ, GLUTEN FREE GLUTINO PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$43.00 60/1.4OZ $0.72 GLUTINO

10 25 CHEESE, CHEDDAR, MILD, SLICED BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$26.93 8/1.5LB $0.14 LAND O LAKES

13 200 CHEESE, CREAM, CUP iwM 1oz portion, low fat PHILADELPHIA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$19.26 100/1OZ $0.19 GREEN MOUNTAIN

14 250 CHEESE, JALAPENO CHEDDAR CUP IW, MUST MEET 1 M/MA LAND O LAKES PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$86.95 140/3OZ $0.62 LAND O LAKES $68.18 140/3OZ $0.49 LAND O LAKES

15 25 CHEESE, MONTEREY JACK, SLICED BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$42.51 8/1.5LB $0.22 PACKER LABEL

17 100 CHEESE, SHREDDED, CHEDDAR BULK, 5# BAG, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$18.06 4/5LB $0.06 LAND O LAKES

19 25
CHEESE, SHREDDED, MONTEREY 
JACK

BULK, 5# BAG, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$26.07 4/5LB $0.08 BONGARDS

21 100 CHEESE, SLICED, AMERICAN BULK, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$49.82 4/5LB $0.16 LAND O LAKES $33.41 4/5LB $0.10 LAND O LAKES

22 25 CHEESE, SLICED, CHEDDAR BULK, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$23.30 8/1.5LB $0.12 LAND O LAKES

23 25 CHEESE, SLICED, PEPPER JACK BULK, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$48.53 8/1.5LB $0.25 LAND O LAKES $23.29 8/1.5LB $0.12 LAND O LAKES

25 500 CHEESE, MOZZARELLA STICK, STRING IW, MUST MEET 1 M/MA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$17.55 168/1OZ $0.10 LAND O LAKES

29 10 CREAMER, CUPS, DAIRY IW, ASSORTED FLAVORS PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$16.72 180/.38OZ $0.09NESTLE PROFESSIONAL

31 25 CREAMER, NON DAIRY, 1/2 & 1/2 IW PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$12.82 180CT $0.07INTERNATIONAL DELIGHT

35 100 EGGS, HARD BOILED BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$31.59 12/6CT $0.44 SUNNY FRESH

36 15 EGGS, LIQUID, CARTON 1/2 GALLON PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$55.47 12/2LB $0.26 SUNNY FRESH

39 25 MILK, ALMOND, VANILLA IW, 18/8 OZ SILK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$16.28 18/8OZ $0.90DANNON COMPANY INC

41 150 SMOOTHIE, PEACH IW, MUST MEET 1/2 CUP FRUIT BAR FRESH PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$49.26 48/7.6OZ $1.03 BARFRESH
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42 150 SMOOTHIE, STRAWBERRY BANANA IW, MUST MEET 1/2 CUP FRUIT BAR FRESH PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$49.26 48/7.6OZ $1.03 BARFRESH

43 900 SMOOTHIE,MANGO PINEAPLE IW, MUST MEET 1/2 CUP FRUIT BAR FRESH PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$49.26 48/7.6OZ $1.03 BARFRESH

50 50 TORTILLAS, WRAP, VARIETY PACK
12 INCHM DOES NOT NEED TO BE NSLP 
COMPLIANT

MISSION PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$38.13 6/12CT $6.36 MISSION FOODS

55 1500 YOGURT, RASPBERRY
IW, 4 OZ, NON FAT, MIST MEET 1 
M/MA

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$17.26 48/4OZ $0.36 UPSTATE FARMS

57 50 YOGURT, VANILLA, LITE BULK, 32 OZ TUB PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$17.74 6/32OZ $0.55 YOPLAIT
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4 5 BUTTER, 1LB PRINTS
BULK, DOES NOT NEED TO BE NSLP 
COMPLIANT

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$105.30 30 / 1 LB 3.51 WHLFIMP

5 35 BUTTER, BULK, SALTED
BULK, DOES NOT NEED TO BE NSLP 
COMPLIANT

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$108.53 4 / 5 LB 27.13 WHLFCLS

6 5 BUTTER, PATS, SALTED
IW, DOES NOT NEED TO BE NSLP 
COMPLIANT

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$105.50 30 / 1 LB 3.52 WHLFIMP

7 35 BUTTER, UNSALTED BULK, 30# PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$105.78 30 / 1 LB 3.53 WHLFIMP

9 25 CHEESE, CHEDDAR, MEDIUM LOAF
BULK, DOES NOT NEED TO BE NSLP 
COMPLIANT

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$30.54 2 / 5 LB 15.27 BBRLIMP

10 25 CHEESE, CHEDDAR, MILD, SLICED BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$40.12 8 / 1.5 LB 5.02 BBRLIMP

12 25 CHEESE, CREAM, BULK, TUB BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$44.69 4 / 3 LBS 11.17 WHLFCLS

15 25 CHEESE, MONTEREY JACK, SLICED BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$40.32 8 / 1.5 LB 5.04 BBRLIMP

16 25 CHEESE, PEPPER JACK, LOAF BULK, PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$30.27 2 / 5 LB 15.14 BBRLIMP

17 100 CHEESE, SHREDDED, CHEDDAR BULK, 5# BAG, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$54.13 4 / 5 LB 13.53 SYS CLS

19 25
CHEESE, SHREDDED, MONTEREY 
JACK

BULK, 5# BAG, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$56.39 4 / 5 LB 14.1 CASAIMP

20 125 CHEESE, SHREDDED, MOZZARELLA BULK, 5# BAG, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$54.52 4 / 5LB 13.63 AREZIMP

22 25 CHEESE, SLICED, CHEDDAR BULK, REDUCED FAT PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$40.12 8 / 1.5 LB 5.02 BBRLIMP

24 200 CHEESE, STICK, COLBY JACK IW, MUST MEET 1 M/MA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$25.07 168 / 1OZ 0.28 LOL $25.07 168 / 1OZ $0.15 LOL

25 500 CHEESE, MOZZARELLA STICK, STRING IW, MUST MEET 1 M/MA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$21.13 168 / 1 OZ 0.26 LOL

26 20 CHEESE, PEPPER JACK BULK, BLOCK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$30.27 2 / 5 LB 15.14 BBRLIMP

27 500 CINNAMON ROLL IW, MUST MEET 1 WG BUENA VISTA, EDNAS PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$36.06 100 / 2.7 OZ 0.36 PILLSBY

30 25 CREAMER, HALF & HALF, FAT FREE 1/2 GAL PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$41.07 12 / 32 OZ 3.42 WHLFCLS

32 25
CREAMER, NON DAIRY, CARMEL 
MACCIATO

IW PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$20.97 288 / 13 ML 0.07 INT DEL
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33 25 CREAMER, NON DAIRY, HAZELNUT IW PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$20.87 288 / 13 ML 0.07 CITVCLS

34 25 CREAMER, NON DAIRY, VANILLA IW PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$20.87 288 / 13 ML 0.07 CITVCLS

35 100 EGGS, HARD BOILED BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$65.89 12 / 12 CT 5.49 WHLFIMP

36 15 EGGS, LIQUID, CARTON 1/2 GALLON PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$108.97 2 / 20 LB 54.49 WHLFIMP

37 20 EGGS, SHELLED, LARGE, USDA AA BULK, 15 DOZEN PER CASE PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$60.20 1 / 15 DZ 60.2 WHLFIMP

38 35 MARGARINE BULK, 30 # PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$21.63 30 / 1 LB 0.72 SYS CLS

40 25 MILK, ALMOND. CHOCOLATE IW, 18/8 OZ SILK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$20.72 18 / 8 OZ 1.15 SILK

44 5 SOUR CREAM, BULK BULK, 32# TUB PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$47.29 1 / 32 LB 47.29 WHLFCLS

45 200 SOUR CREAM, PACKET IW, 1 OZ PACKETS PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$15.57 100 / 1 OZ 0.16 WHLFCLS

52 100 WHIPPED TOPPING,
BULK, 12/ 16OZ, DOES NOT NEED TO 
BE NSLP COMPLIANT

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$41.06 12 / 16 OZ 3.42 SYS REL

54 400 YOGURT, PARFAIT POUCH, VANILLA BULK PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$28.93 6 / 4 LB 4.82 YOPLAIT

56 1500 YOGURT, STRAWBERRY
IW, 4 OZ, NON FAT, MIST MEET 1 
M/MA

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
$15.86 48 / 4 OZ 0.33 DANNON
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Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Ann $ Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Mark Up Brand

46
Cold 

Foods
300 TORTILLAS, 8 INCH BULK, MUST MEET 1 GRAIN, FRESH PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

La Tapatia $24.30 9PKS. 20CNT. $2.70 PER PK. LA TAPATIA $7,290.00

47
Cold 

Foods
50 TORTILLAS, CHILE WRAP

BULK, MUST MEET 1 GRAIN, WG, 
FRESH

GOLDEN SUN, LA TAPATIA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
La Tapatia $20.00 5PKS. 10CNT $4.00 PER PK. LA TAPATIA $1,000.00

48
Cold 

Foods
120 TORTILLAS, FLOUR, UNCOOKED

BULK, DOES NOT NEED TO BE NSLP 
COMPLIANT

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
La Tapatia $59.22 18PKS 10CNT $3.29 PER PK. LA TAPATIA $7,106.40

49
Cold 

Foods
50

TORTILLAS, TOMATO BASIL, 12 INCH, 
WRAP

BULK, 1.3 G LA TAPATIA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
La Tapatia $20.00 5pks. 10cnt. $4.00 PER PK. LA TAPATIA $1,000.00

51
Cold 

Foods
50 TORTILLAS,, SPINACH, WRAP BULK, 8 INCHM NUST NEET 1 WG GOLDEN SUN, LA TAPATIA PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL

La Tapatia $20.00 5PKS. 10CNT. $4.00 LA TAPATIA $1,000.00

$17,396.40



Porterville Unified School District  Bid Solicitation 2024-2025 School YearCold Foods Solicitation SN-25-02 Equal Opportunity Employer 

Producers Producer's Dairy

Line
Est. 

Usage
Item Name Description Preferred brand or Equal

Commercial Bid Pricing Est Commodity Bid Pricing (if available)

Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Brand Ann $ Case $ Pack Size Serving $ Mark Up Brand

8
Cold 
Food

350 BUTTERMILK, CARTON 1/2 GALLON PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
Producers 31.0152 12- 1/2 Gal 2.5846 Producers Dairy $10,855.32

53
Cold 
Food

1500 YOGURT, BANANA-STRAWBERRY
IW, 4 OZ, NON FAT, MIST MEET 1 
M/MA

PREFFERED BRAND OR EQUAL
Producers 14.789 4 oz 0.3081 Dannon $22,183.50

$33,038.82


