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FRESH PRODUCE 1

Produce Bid# SN-22-03
Vendor Name: First Quality

Description

*Estimated 
Usage Bulk IW

Acceptable 
Brands Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price

1
Apples, Fugi, Whole

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Packer APPFJ138 138CT 0.2 27.6138 count

2
Apples, Fugi, Sliced

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Fresh Innovations APPSL100/2OZFJ 100CT 0.224 22.4must meet 1/2 cup fruit requirement

3
Apples, Gala, Whole

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Packer APPGA138 138CT 0.2 27.6138 count

4
Apples, Gala, Sliced

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Fresh Innovations APPSL100/2OZGA 100CT 0.224 22.4must meet 1/2 cup fruit requirement

5
Apples, Gold, Whole

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Packer APPGL138 NO BID NO BID NO BID138 count

6
Apples, Gold, Sliced

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Fresh Innovations NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDmust meet 1/2 cup fruit requirement

7
Apples, Red, Whole

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Packer APPRE138 138CT 0.2 27.6138 count

8
Apples, Red, Sliced

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Fresh Innovations APPSL100/2OZ 100CT 0.224 22.4must meet 1/2 cup fruit requirement

9
Bananas, Whole, Large

200 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Dole BAN4CLR 40# 0.247 22.25must meet 1/2 cup fruit requirement

10
Bananas, Whole, Supper, Petite

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Dole BANPE NO BID NO BID NO BID150 per case

11
Broccoli, Florets, Small Cut

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Church BROFL5 5# 10.5 10.55 lbs. bag

12
Broccoli, Florets, Small Cut

150 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1BROFL 100CT 0.3 30must meet 1/2 cup vegetable requirement

13
Carrots, Baby,

2800 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Bolthouse CARSN2.6 100CT 0.1975 19.75must meet 1/2 cup vegetable requirement

14
Cabbage, Purple, shredded

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Church CABRESH 4/5# 5.25 215 lbs. bag

15
Carrots, Baby

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Bolthouse CARBA5 4/5# 5.25 215 lbs. bag

16
Carrots, Shredded

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Bolthouse CARMATCH 4/5# 4 165 lbs. bag

17
Cantaloupe, Fresh, Chunks

10 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP MELCA1X1 5# 9.25 9.255 lbs. bag

18
Cantaloupe, Fresh, Chunks

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1MELCA 100CT 0.31 31must meet 1/2 cup fruit requirement

19
Cauliflower, Florets, Small Cut

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Church CAULFL5# 5# 9.25 9.255 lbs. bag
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20
Cauliflower, Florets, Small Cut

2800 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1CAULF 100CT 0.4 40must meet 1/2 cup vegetable requirement

21
Celery, Sticks, Fresh

2800 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1CELST 100CT 0.29 29must meet 1/2 cup vegetable requirement

22
Celery/Carrot Stick Mix, Fresh

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1CAR/CEL 100CT 0.34 34must meet 1/2 cup vegetable requirement

23
Cilantro, Fresh, cut

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID1 lbs. Bag 

24
Cucumber, Whole

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Packer CUC25 25# 14 14

25
Cucumber, Sliced, Coins

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP CUCCO 5# 6.75 6.755 lbs. bag

26
Cucumber, Sliced, Coins

8000 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1CUCCO 100CT 0.26 26must meet 1/2 cup vegetable requirement

27
Fresh Fruit, Diced, Luau Mix

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP FRU1G 2 GAL 25 25#2 lbs. bucket

28
Grapes, Seedless

2800 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1GRAPE 100CT 0.28 28must meet 1/2 cup fruit requirement

29
Honeydew, Chunks

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1MELHO 100CT 0.31 31must meet 1/2 cup fruit requirement

30
Honeydew, Chunks, Fresh

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP MELHOCH1X1 5# 9.25 9.255 lbs. bag

31
Jicama, Sticks, Fresh

6000 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1JICST 100CT 0.29 29must meet 1/2 cup vegetable requirement

32
Jicama, Sticks, Fresh,

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP JICST 5# 9.25 9.255lbs Bag

33
Lettuce Blend, Carrots, Cabbage, Iceberg, Romaine

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Church TOSROMX 4/5# 22 226/2# bags

34
Lettuce, Iceberg, Bulk

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Church LET 24CT 20.5 20.524 head Case

35
Lettuce, Iceberg, Shredded

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Church LETSH 4/5# 20.5 20.520# case

36
Lettuce, Romaine, Chopped

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Church LETROCH 6/2# 19.5 19.56/2# bags

37
Lettuce, Romaine, whole

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Church LETRO 24CT 21 2124 head Case

38
Lettuce, Romaine, fillets

5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Church LETROSINGLE NO BID NO BID NO BIDPre washed

39
Oranges, Whole, Fresh

55 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Bee Sweet ORA113 138CT 0.1775 24.5135 a case

40
Oranges, Wedged, Fresh

50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1ORAN 100CT 0.28 281/2 cup requirement

41

Pears, Whole, Fresh
2000 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Packer PEARBA135 135CT 0.23 31.2138 a case
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42

Pineapple, Chunks, Fresh
5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP PINCH 5# 12.5 12.55lbs. Bag

43

Pineapple, Chunks, Fresh
55 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1PINCH 100CT 0.42 42must meet 1/2 cup fruit requirement

44

Spinach, Bagged
5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Church SPI4/2.5 4/2.5# 16 16Prewashed #20 lbs. case

45

Onions, Bulk, Whole, Red
5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Packer ONIRE 25# 15 15#25 lbs. bag

46

Tomato, Grape/Cherry
5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Nat Feinn TOMGR12 NO BID NO BID NO BID12 baskets per case

47

Tomato, Grape/Cherry
2800 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1TOMCH 100CT 0.34 34must meet 1/2 cup vegetable requirement

48

Watermelons, Seedless, Chunks
50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1MELWA 100CT 0.34 34must meet 1/2 cup fruit requirement

49

Watermelon, Whole, Seedless
5 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

Packer MELWA NO BID NO BID NO BID

50

Zucchini Coins
50 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1SQUITCO 100CT 0.28 28must meet 1/2 cup fruit requirement

51

Zucchini Sticks
2800 x

USA sourced 
produce. 
California 
preferred

FQP 1SQUITSTK 100CT 0.3 30must meet 1/2 cup fruit requirement

*estimated usage= annual projected usage subject to change without notice

***Pricing is for delivery to multiple sites throughout multiple days of the week
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Vendor Name: Goldstar Vendor Name: Madera Produce

Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price Brand Vendor ID# Pack Size Price Per Serving Case Price

* 822490 138CT 0.165 22.8 US #1 WASHINGTON 1142 138CT 0.166 23

**** 820195 200/2OZ 0.188 37.71

* 822489 138CT 0.165 22.8 US #1 WASHINGTON 1161 138CT 0.166 23

**** 820195 200/2OZ 0.188 37.71 FRESH INNOVATIONS 1191 100CT 0.215 21.5

* 820253 138CT 0.172 23.8 US #1 WASHINGTON 1152 138CT 0.17 23.5

**** 822287 200/2OZ 0.218 43.65

* 820017 138CT 0.172 22.8 US #1 WASHINGTON 1128 138CT 0.166 23

**** 820195 200/2OZ 0.194 38.96 FRESH INNOVATIONS 1191 100CT 0.215 21.5

***** 820059 40LB .496/LB 19.85 DOLE, CHIQUITA, DEL MONTE 1310 110CT 0.172 19

***** 820061 150CT 0.132 19.9 DOLE, CHIQUITA 1325 150CT 0.133 20

* 820145 5LB 2.05/LB 10.25 FIRST QUALITY 7003 5# 0.056 5.75

* 822341 50/1.11OZ 0.357 17.85 FIRST QUALITY 8102 100CT 0.345 34.5

*** 800592 50/2.5OZ 0.227 11.39 KERN RIDGE 4001 200CT 0.112 22.5

*** 820239 5LB 0.976 4.88 GREEN GATE 7008 5# 0.061 4

*** 820157 5LB 0.942 4.71 KERN RIDGE 4009 5# 0.138 3.45

*** 820155 5LB 0.854 4.27 KERN RIDGE 7012 5# 0.146 3.65

** 822503 5LB 2.024 10.12 FIRST QUALITY 7056 5# 0.315 9.5

** 821842 50/2.7OZ 0.467 23.35 FIRST QUALITY 8103 100CT 0.325 32.5

* 820321 5LB 2.024 10.12 FIRST QUALITY 7021 5# 0.231 10.5
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* T.B.D. 50/1.75OZ 0.414 20.73 FIRST QUALITY 8104 100CT 0.395 39.5

* 820826 50/2.3OZ 0.35 17.5 FIRST QUALITY 8105 100CT 0.315 31.5

* 820230 50/3OZ 0.415 20.75 FIRST QUALITY 8507 100CT 0.365 36.5

* 822443 3CT/1LB 2.02/LB 2.02 COASTAL, GOLDEN WEST 4300 1 BUNCH 0.45

* 822392 6CT 0.958 5.75 PINOS, L&M, TRICAR 4500 5# 2.5

* 820166 5LB 1.45/LB 7.25 FIRST QUALITY 7039 5# 0.189 7

* 820827 50/2.58OZ 0.29 14.5 FIRST QUALITY 8106 100CT 0.285 28.5

** T.B.D. 2LB 3.10/LB 6.2 FIRST QUALITY 7124 2 GAL 0.945 27

** 822580 100/2.25OZ 0.27 27 HMC 2021 100CT 0.385 38.5

** 820998 48/3OZ 0.479 23.03 FIRST QUALITY 8107 100CT 0.325 32.5

** 822505 5LB 1.92/LB 9.6 FIRST QUALITY 7057 5# 0.38 10.5

** 822381 50/2.4OZ 0.402 20.1 FIRST QUALITY 8109 100CT 0.325 32.5

** 822464 5LB 2.05/LB 10.25 FIRST QUALITY 7045 5# 0.315 10.5

* T.B.D. 6/2LB 2.46 14.76 GREENGATE, DOLE, CHURCH BROS 7903 20# 15.75

* 820101 24CT 0.808 19.4 FOXY, DOLE, T&A 4802 24 CT 17.75

* 820171 20LB .675/LB 13.5 GREENGATE, DOLE, CHURCH BROS 7916 20# 13.75

* 820174 6/2LB 2.58 15.5 GREENGATE, DOLE, CHURCH BROS 4845 12# 15.75

* 820104 24CT 0.745 17.9 FOXY, DOLE, T&A 4840 24 CT 17.75

* T.B.D. 10LB 2.35 23.5 MANN 4841 15# 17.75

* 820047 138CT 0.137 19 KERN RIDGE, SK, FANCHER 1831 138CT 0.128 17.75

** 820216 50/4.7OZ 0.36 18 FIRST QUALITY 8114 100CT 0.305 30.5

* 820243 138CT 0.147 20.35 SCULLY, DIAMOND, YAKIMA 2915 135CT 0.19 25.75
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** T.B.D. 5LB 2.54/LB 12.7 FIRST QUALITY 7060 5# 0.447 13.25

** 820215 50/2.7OZ 0.507 25.35 FIRST QUALITY 8115 100CT 0.425 42.5

* T.B.D. 20LB 1.4 28 GREENGATE 5117 20# 29

* 820113 25LB .778/LB 19.45 DELANEA, PERRY &SONS 6323 25# 10.5

* 820138 12CT 1.28 15.36 SUNNYSIDE, NAT FEINN 3350 12 CT 15.75

* 820985 50/2.7OZ 0.43 21.5 FIRST QUALITY 8117 100CT 0.365 36.5

** 821009 48/3OZ 0.696 33.44 FIRST QUALITY 7058 100CT 0.365 36.5

* 820775 1EA 7 7 PAPPAS, GOODFELLOW, ALLEN 2300 1CT 3.5

* 822347 50/2.56OZ 0.39 19.5 FIRST QUALITY 8120 100CT 0.305 30.5

* 800510 50/3OZ 0.345 17.25 FIRST QUALITY 8121 100CT 0.305 30.5

i
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