Porterville Unified School District Bid Solicitation 2022-2023 School Year Solicitation is for COMMODITY PRICING pricing should reflect final delivered price after vendor mark up

. . .
Commodity Bid School Year 2022-2023 Bid# SN-23-06
Vendor Name: ePallet, Inc. GOLD STAR FOODS VALLEY FOOD SERVICE SYSCO NORTHERN CALIFORNIA
ITEM NAME DESCRIPTION FST. - Contributions Preffered Brand | Case |Serving| Price Case |serving| Price | Case |Serving| Price | Case |Serving| Price
Usage Grain M/MA or equivelent Brand |Vendor ID | Pprice |in case | Per Serving Brand Vendor ID | price | incase | Per serving | Brand Vendor ID Price |in Case | Per Serving Brand Vendor ID | price Case | Per Serving

1 | BAGEL, BREAKFAST SAUSAGE IW, whole grain, beef or turkey sausage 100cs | 1 1 |Ardella's, Schwan's, Beacon Street | No Bid - #DIV/0! TONY'S, #67625, 96/2.830Z 410049 $62.26| 96 $0.65 | Tony's 67625 $68.52 | 96 $0.71 | TONYS 7192928 $64.68 96 $0.67
2 | BAGEL, BREAKFAST SAUSAGE, SANDWICH IW, whole grain, beef or turkey sausage 100cs | 1.25 | 1.25 No Bid #DIV/0! TONY'S, #67625, 96/2.830Z 410049 $62.26| 96 $0.65 | Integrated €80916 $46.30 | 72 $0.64 | TONYS 7192872 $64.68 96 $0.67
3 | BEEF, BURGER, MINITWINS Ic‘:/;:ﬁg’e grom beefpoty minftwins N0 1000cs | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! NO BID HVALUE! | Integrated 47007 $40.04 | 50 | $0.80 |DON LEE 6941126 $55.00 75 $0.73
4 | BEEF, CHEESEBURGER IW,whole grain, beef patty, mini twins 1000cs [ 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! DON LEE FARMS, #QCB655, 72/4.550Z 403436 $66.57| 72 $0.92 | Integrated C47220 $66.30 75 $0.88 | DON LEE 4788373 $63.48 72 $0.88
5 | BEEF, PATTY BULK, low sodium >280mg 100cs 2 Ea::rtee' earated, JTW Advance No Bid #DIV/0! DON LEE FARMS, #CNQ162253, 240/2.250Z 403572 $73.85| 240 $0.31 | Don Lee CNQ262403K $48.26 | 200 $0.24 | DON LEE 2287039 $123.49| 192 $0.64
6 | BEEF, PHILLY STEAK IW 2.5 0z 192 per case/ 3.5 g sat fat 2 |Tyson No Bid #DIV/0! ADVANCE PIERRE, #10000097868, 30LB 406438 $100.11| 192 $0.52 $- #DIV/0! | TYSON 9999999 $169.78 192 $0.88
7 | BEEF, PhiLLY STEAK IW 2.5 0z 192 per case/ 4.5 g sat fat 2 |Tyson No Bid #DIV/0! ADVANCE PIERRE, #10000097868, 30LB 406438 $100.11| 192 $0.52 $- #DIV/0! | TYSON 9999999 $169.78 192 $0.88
8 | BEEF, RIB B QUE W/BUN IW, 4.71 0z, w/sauce, WG bun 1000cs | 2 2 |Integrated No Bid #DIV/0! INTEGRATED, #C46007, 75/4.360Z 402027 $60.00| 75 $0.80| Integrated €46007 $62.50 | 75 $0.83 |HOTOFFG 2918043 $60.71 75 $0.81
9 | BEEF, RIB B QUE, PATTY BULK, w/sauce 100cs 2 |/TM, Integrated, Advance Pierre | No Bid #DIV/0! | ADVANCE PIERRE, #10000013716, 100/3.250Z | 401372 $38.57| 100 $0.39| Don Lee CNQ512403 $51.12 | 201 $0.25 | PIERRE 2355089 $70.20| 100 $0.70
10 | BISCUIT & SAUSAGE ey 7 el sausade, whole arain Woes | 1] 1 No Bid #DIV/0! INTEGRATED, #C13018, 100/3.10Z 8D $67.38| 100 $0.67 $- #DIV/0! | HOTOFFG 7090158 $65.28| 100  $0.65
11 | BITES, BREAKFAST, CHICKEN SAUSAGE BULK, 25¢s 2 No Bid #DIV/0! NO BID 0 | #VALUE! |Foster Farms 96086 $21.39 #DIV/0! | TYSON 9901767 $87.31| 163 $0.54
12 | BITES, NACHO, LIL BITES BULK, whole grain corn flour, gluten free 25cs 2 2 | The Fathers Table No Bid #DIV/0! FATHERS TABLE, #77044, 8/2.25.8 406545 $48.69| 72 $0.68 S$- #DIV/0! | FATHTBL 4155648 $48.77 576 $0.08
13 | BREAD, GARLIC CHEESE BULK, 20z, whole grain 25¢s | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! BOSCOS, #10000048461, 72/2.230Z TBD $30.23| 72 $0.42 $- #DIV/O! | PILLSBY 7150133 $55.98 72 $0.78
14 | BREADSTICK, CHEESE STUFFED 1W, 2.860z, whole grain, NO substitutions 25cs 1 1 Bosco No Bid #DIV/0! BOSCOS, #17022101120, 144/2.150Z TBD $39.43| 144 $0.27 S- #DIV/0! | BOSCOS 3175953 $36.61 1 $36.61
15 | BREADSTICK, CHEESE STUFFED IW, 3.860z, whole grain, NO substitutions 100cs | 2 2 | The Max, Max Stick No Bid #DIV/0! MFG DISC #VALUE! |The Max 7738712602 $33.98 | 96 $0.35 | THE MAX 2259487 $34.67| 192 $0.18
16 | BURRITO, BEAN & CHEESE whole grain 1000cs | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS, #97576, 96/5.200Z 403406 $66.73| 96 $0.70 | Fernandos 21200 $63.99 | 96 $0.67 | ARDELLA 1650037 $66.27 54 $1.23
17 | BURRITO, BEAN & CHEESE No Bid #DIV/0! MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS, #67576, 48/5.200Z 403420 $32.51| 48 $0.68 S- #DIV/O! | FIESTA 1572540 $59.20 60 $0.99
18 | Cheese Bites v 2 2 | Wild Mikes No Bid #DIV/0! WILD MIKE'S, #11003, 240/10Z 405822 $57.18| 240 $0.24 $- #DIV/0! | WLDMIKE 7155843 $61.24 60 $1.02
19 | Cheese Bites Jalapeno Bulk 1360z 6 bags per case 2 2 | Wild Mikes No Bid #DIV/0! WILD MIKE'S, #11008, 240/1.060Z TBD $58.50| 240 $0.24 $- #DIV/0! | WLDMIKE 7013429 $54.18| 240 $0.23
20 | Cheese Cups I/W 30z cup Land O Lakes No Bid #DIV/0! LAND O LAKES, #39911, 140/30Z 403651 $58.52| 140 $0.42 $- #DIv/0! _[LoL 7000927 $54.64| 140 $0.39
21 | Cheese Pouch Bulk No Bid #DIV/0! LAND O LAKES, #39945, 6/1060Z 410080 $49.86| 212 $0.24[JTM 5705 $38.16 | 263 $0.15  [LOL 7196024 $70.21 6] $11.70
22 | Cheese Pull Aparts I/W, Whole Grain 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! ARDELLAS, #90129, 108/4.100Z 406666 $87.18| 108 $0.81 $- #DIV/0! | ARDELLA 9910626 $72.14 108 $0.67
23 | CHEESE, CUPS, JALAPENO 3.7 0z. portion 100cs 2 | Tabatchnick No Bid #DIV/0! TABATCHNICK, #99851, 96/3.70Z 406112 $60.68| 96 $0.63 S- #DIV/0! | TABATCH 4827220 $26.34 96 $0.27
24 | CHEESE, QUESADILLA, BREAKFAST 1000cs | 1 2 No Bid #DIV/0! ROSE & SHORE, #W24072, 72/2.20Z 406705 $45.16| 72 $0.63 | Integrated €36400 $46.50 | 100 $0.47 _|HOTOFFG 3058823 $45.00 100 $0.45
25 | CHEESE, QUESADILLA, GREEN SAUCE 1000cs [ 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS, #45227, 48/4.40Z 403966 $43.93| 48 $0.92 $- #DIV/0! [LOSCABO 3173741 $42.75 48 $0.89
26 | CHEESE, SHREDDED, CHEDDAR 20bs, 4 bags, reduced fat Scs No Bid #DIV/0! LAND O LAKES, #41749, 4/5# PCH 401146 $20.95| 320 $0.07 $- #DIV/0! | GR LAKE 3861125 NOBID |NOBID | #VALUE!
27  CHEESE, SHREDDED, COLBY JACK 20lbs, 4 bags, reduced fat Scs No Bid #DIV/0! NO BID #VALUE! $- #DIV/0! 9999999 NOBID |NOBID | #VALUE!
28 | CHEESE, SHREDDED, MOZZARELLA 201bs, 4 bags, reduced fat Scs No Bid #DIV/0! LAND O LAKES, #41698, 4/5# PCH 401140 $20.69| 320 $0.06 S- #DIV/0! [LOL 556076 $18.92 4 $4.73
29 | CHEESE, SLICED, AMERICAN reduced fat 100cs No Bid #DIV/0! LAND O LAKES, #46253, 6/5#-160CT 401166 $33.84| 480 $0.07 S- #DIV/O! _[LOL 8725091 $33.82 6 $5.64
30 | CHEESE, SLICED, CHEDDAR reduced fat Scs No Bid #DIV/0! LAND O LAKES, #44224, 8/1.5L.B 402003 $29.31| 192 $0.15 $- #DIV/O! [LOL 909246 $27.71 8 $3.46
31 | CHEESE, SLICED, PEPPER JACK block Scs No Bid #DIV/0! LAND O LAKES, #44238, 8/1.5L8 402004 $29.32| 192 $0.15 $- #DIV/0! _|LOL 909269 $27.72 8 $3.47
32 | CHEESE, SLICED, PEPPER JACK reduced fat Scs No Bid #DIV/0! LAND O LAKES, #44238, 8/1.5LB 402004 $29.32| 192 $0.15 $- #DIV/0! [LOL 909269 $27.72 8 $3.47
33 CHEESE, STICK, COLBY JACK reduced fat, 1 0z 100cs 1 No Bid #DIv/0! NO BID #VALUE! $- #DIV/0! [LOL 7795760 DISC DISC #VALUE!
34 | CHEESE, STICK, STRING reduced fat, 1 0z 100cs 1 No Bid #DIV/0! LAND O LAKES, #59703, 168/10Z 401174 $21.12| 168 $0.13 S- #DIV/0! | GR LAKE 1841939 $33.44 160 $0.21
35 | Chicken Bone In Wing Of Fire Bulk Tyson No Bid #DIV/0! MEG DISC HVALUE! $- #DIV/0! |TYSON 7110780 $68.62 3 $22.87
36 | Chicken Chunk Nashville Spicy Bulk Tyson No Bid #DIV/0! TYSON, #10286860928, 112/4.440Z 406492 $101.61| 112 $0.91 S- #DIV/0! | TYSON 2155929 $69.66 4 $17.42
37 | Chicken Tenderloin Breaded Bulk whole grain Whole muscle 1.410z 330 per _

case No Bid #DIV/0! TYSON, #17033220928, 330/1.50Z 406172 $90.85| 330 $0.28 $- #DIV/0! | GLDKIST 7054931 DISC__ |DISC | #VALUE!
38 | CHICKEN, DRUMSTICK, BREADED 440z, whole grain breading 1000cs 2 |Tyson No Bid #DIV/0! TYSON, #16660100928, 92/4.40Z 405424 $7330| 92 $0.80 $- #DIV/0! |TYSON 2746405 $68.21 1 $68.21
39 | CHICKEN, MANDARIN ORANGE low sodium, with sauce 25¢s 2 |Yang's No Bid #DIV/0! YANGS, #8-52724-15555-5, 1/43.5LB 403886 $126.96| 192 $0.66 | Yang's 8-52724-15552-4 | $136.66 | 192 $0.71 | YANGS 2819973 $123.58 6| $20.60
40 | CHICKEN, MEATBALLS 25cs 2 No Bid #DIV/0! TYSON, #10197770328, 2/5LB 403441 $26.55| 58 $0.46 $- #DIV/0! | TYSON 1541871 $25.35 2|  $12.68
41 | CHICKEN, NUGGETS white meat, whole grain breading 100cs | 2 2 |Integrated No Bid #DIv/0! TYSON, #10703640928, 32.81LB 404689 $71.21| 175 $0.41 $- #DIV/0! |TYSONRL 8412780 $26.07 2 $13.04
42 | CHICKEN, NUGGETS, SPICY white meat, whole grain breading 100cs | 1 1 No Bid #DIv/0! TYSON, #10703740928, 6/5.46LB 403660 $73.57| 150 $0.49 $- #DIV/0! | GLDKIST 7001053 DISC DISC #VALUE!
43 | CHICKEN, PATTIES, BREADED, CRISPY white meat, whole grain breading 100cs 2 |Tyson, Gold Kist, John Soule's No Bid #DIV/0! TYSON, #10703040928, 175/3.00Z 404679 $72.40| 175 $0.41 $- #DIV/0! | TYSON 5316627 $65.22 4 $16.31
44 | CHICKEN, PATTIES, SPICY, BREADED, CRISPY | white meat, whole grain breading 100cs Tyson, Gold Kist, John Soule's No Bid #DIV/0! TYSON, #10055670928, 148/3.260Z 404681 $71.15| 148 $0.48 $- #DIV/0! |TYSON 3009919 $67.00 4| $16.75
45  CHICKEN, SANDWICH, MAPLE white meat, whole grain bun 25¢s No Bid #DIV/0! NO BID #VALUE! $- #DIV/0! |HOTOFFG 7174249 DISC DISC #VALUE!
46 | CHICKEN, SWEET CHILI THAI low sodium, peanut free, with sauce 25¢s 2 |Yang's No Bid #DIV/0! YANGS, #8-52724-15550-0, 1/43.5L8 404027 $141.23| 192 $0.74 | Yang's 8-52724-15550-0 | $136.66 | 192 $0.71 | YANGS 3844612 $129.08 6 $21.51
47 | CHICKEN, TENDERS, CRISPY white meat, whole grain breading 100cs | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! TYSON, #10703340928, 4/7.965LB 403544 $66.96| 150 $0.45 $- #DIV/0! [TYSONRL 8496913 $49.15 2 $24.58
48 | CHICKEN, TENDERS, SPICY, CRISPY white meat, whole grain breading 100cs 2 |Tyson, John Soule's No Bid #DIV/0! TYSON, #10703440928, 31.86LB 404688 $71.08| 148 $0.48 $- #DIV/0! [TYSON 2189201 $83.98 4 $21.00
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49 | CHICKEN, TERIVAKI AND BROWN RICE 8oz, whole grain rice, low sodium sauce 100cs | 15 | 2 |vang's No Bid #DIV/0! YANGS, #8-52724-16667-4, 36/90Z 409702 $69.09| 36 $1.92 | Yang's 8-52724-15554-8 [$123.02 | 240 | $0.51 |USDA 7145267 $67.40 36 $1.87
50 | Corn Dog Mini Bulkc whole grain 2 2 |Farmiand No Bid #DIV/0! FOSTER FARMS, #96086, 2/5L8 409707 $23.71| 40 $0.59 $- #DIV/0! | FOSTRFM 5310361 $21.45 2| $1073
51 | CORN DOG, CHICKEN whole grain breading 100cs | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! FOSTER FARMS, #95150, 72/40Z 409658 $27.36| 72 $0.38 $- #DIV/0! | FOSTRFM 1604289 $26.87 72 $0.37
52 | DELI MEAT, TURKEY, BREAST, SLICED 25cs No Bid #DIV/0! JENNIE O, #256818, 12/1.5LB 405772 $47.14| 96 $0.49 S- #DIV/0! _|JENNIEO 2528636 $13.90 12 $1.16
53 LDEE/::«MW' TURKEY HANL SUCED, BXTRA e No Bid #DIV/0! JENNIE O, #256503, 12/1LB 400974 $30.20| 62 $0.49 $- #DIV/0! |JENNIEO 1126184 $28.59 12 $2.38
54 | Egg Patty Pre Cook Bulk 1 No Bid #DIV/0! SUNNY FRESH, #41710, 369/1.250Z 409758 $67.03| 369 $0.18 $- #DIV/0! | ABBTSFD 5064183 $26.85| 120 $0.22
55 | ENCHILADAS, CHEESE whole grain 100cs | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS, #64143, 144/20Z 403664 $51.88| 144 $0.36 | Integrated €80940 $39.71 | 120 $0.33 |HOTOFFG 2902072 $52.37| 120 $0.44
56 | ENCHILADAS, CHEESE, RED SAUCE whole grain 2500cs | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! MICHAEL B'S BESTWAY, #CCE12, 35/70Z 406591 $46.54| 35 $1.33| Integrated 80944 $50.08 | 42 $1.19 [HOTOFFG 7162301 $57.69 2 $1.37
57 | Fruit Cup Mix Berry I/W 4 0z 1/2 cup fruit equivalent No Bid #DIV/0! WAWONA, #059605-77, 96/40Z 406508 $46.59| 96 $0.49 $- #DIV/0! | WAWONA 7135158 $58.90 9 $0.61
58 | Fruit Cup Strawberry 1/W 4 02 1/2 cup fruit equivalent No Bid #DIV/0! WAWONA, #059680-77, 96/4.50Z 402040 $29.76| 96 $0.31 $- #DIV/0! | WAWONA 5865243 $71.44 9% $0.74
59 | PANCAKE, BREAKFAST, SANDWICH whole grain 1000cs | 1 1 |Integrated No Bid #DIV/0! INTEGRATED, #C99120, 100/2.610Z TBD $62.43| 100 $0.62 | Integrated €99120 $64.87 | 100 $0.65 | HOTOFFG 7090158 $65.28| 100 $0.65
60 | PASTA, ALFREDO SAUCE whole grain 500cs | 1 2 | No Bid #DIV/0! JTM, #5722, 6/5LB 403777 $51.58| 262 $0.20|JT™ 5722 $48.95 | 262 $0.19  [J1T™M 7091566 $38.53 30 $1.28
61 PASTA, CHEESEBURGER, MACARONI AND whole grain 25¢s 1 2 .

CHEESE No Bid #DIV/0! JTM, #CP5151, 6/5LB 401061 $59.50| 100 $0.60 S- #DIV/0! | USDA FP 1000361 $55.61 100 $0.56
62 | PASTA, MACARONI AND CHEESE whole grain, low sodium, boil in a bag 25 | 1 2 |landO Lakes No Bid #DIV/0! LAND O LAKES, #43277, 6/5.B 401923 $50.24| 80 $0.63 $- #DIV/0! _[LOL 4077426 $48.27 6 $8.05
63 | PASTA, MACARONI AND CHEESE whole grain 1000cs | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! LAND O LAKES, #43292, 6/5LB 405801 $50.78| 80 $0.63|JTM 5768 $43.36 | 80 $0.54 [LOL 7000903 $47.04 6 $7.84
64 | PASTA, RITTONI, WITH MEAT SAUCE 80z, heat and serve, black tray, whole grain 1000cs 2 | No Bid #DIV/0! JTM, #CP5591, 6/5L8 401076 $48.78| 64 $0.76 | JTM CP5501 $39.78 | 30 $133  |iTm 3934555 $38.53 30 $1.28
65 | PASTA, SPAGHETTI, WITH MEAT SAUCE boilin a bag, whole grain 25 | 1 2 | No Bid #DIV/0! JTM, #CP5590, 6/5L8 401074 $47.88| 64 $0.75|JTM CP5590 $43.27 | 64 $0.68  [JTM 7184157 $77.14 6| $12.86
66 | PASTA, SPAGHETTI, WITH MEAT SAUCE 8oz, heat and serve, black tray, whole grain 1000cs 2 | No Bid #DIV/0! JTM, #CP5502, 30/80Z 404722 $40.55| 30 $1.35|JTM CP5502 $37.93 | 30 $1.26  [JT™ 1634908 DISC__ |DISC__| #VALUE!
67 | PIZZA, 16” ROUND, PEPPERONI 5.180z, whole grain, turkey pepperoni 25es | 2 2 |BigDaddy's No Bid #DIV/0! BIG DADDY'S, #68592, 72/5.130Z 405934 $54.42| 72 $0.76 | Big Daddy 68592 $68.83 #DIV/0! | BGDADDY 3849140 $70.17 1| 7017
68 | PIZZA, BREAKFAST, TURKEY SAUSAGE whole grain 1000cs | 1 | 175 |Tony's No Bid #DIV/0! TONY'S, #63912, 128/3.310Z 403216 $44.32| 128 $0.35| Tony's 63912 $50.55 | 128 $0.39  |TONYS 2795751 $53.88| 100 $0.54
69 | PIZZA, BREAKFAST, TURKEY SAUSAGE whole grain, pre sliced 25¢s | 1 1 |Tony's No Bid #DIV/0! TONY'S, #63913, 100/3.670Z 403948 $55.20| 100 $0.55 | Tony's 63913 $59.74 | 100 $0.60 |TONYS 656094 $42.23 128 $0.33
70 | PIZZA, CALZONE 4.690z, whole grain, low sodium 1000cs | 2 2 Albie's 829 $76.26 48 $1.59 GILARDI, #16272-20120, 60/4.690Z 405433 $48.61| 60 $0.81 | Tasty Brand 53201 $70.88 | 96 $0.74 | BUENVST 7093566 $78.06 80 $0.98
71 | PIZZA, CHEESE 4.50z, whole grain, low sodium 1000cs | 2 2 |Tony's No Bid #DIV/0! TONY'S, #72580, 60/5.030Z 406067 $43.41| 60 $0.72 | Tony's 72580 $49.35 | 60 $0.82 | TONYS 5243702 $36.80 96 $0.38
72 | PIZZA, PINWHEEL, CHEESE 4.690z, whole grain, low sodium 25¢s | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! EASTSIDE ENTREES, #25401, 96/4.10Z 406802 $73.19| 96 $0.76 $- #DIV/0! _|EASTSID 4564876 $66.80 13 $0.70
73 | PiZzA, SANDWICH, PEPPERONI 4.460z, whole grain, turkey pepperoni 25cs | 2 2 |Tony's No Bid #DIV/0! BEACON STREET, #55290, 48/4.460Z TBD $34.42| 48 $0.72 | Big Daddy 55290 $39.92 | 48 $0.83 | BGDADDY 7151786 $27.27 48 $0.57
74 | PiZZA, TURKEY PEPPERONI 4.690z, whole grain, low sodium 1000cs | 2 2 |Tony's No Bid #DIV/0! TONY'S, #78369, 60/4.980Z 403557 $47.86| 60 $0.80 [ Tony's 78357 $49.88 | 60 $0.83 | TONYS 5243718 $48.37 [NO BID | #VALUE!
75 | PizzA, TURKEY PEPPERONI 5", whole grain, low sodium 25cs | 2 2 |Tony's No Bid #DIV/0! TONY'S, #72581, 60/4.880Z 405460 $46.48| 60 $0.77 | Tony's 72581 $51.43 | 60 $0.86 | TONYS 1427719 $53.80|NO BID | #VALUE!
76 | Potato Crinkle Cup Bulk Low Sodium No Bid #DIV/0! MCCAIN FOODS INC, #OIF00055A, 6/5LB 401206 $22.97| 243 $0.09 $- #DIV/0!_[SYS REL 1994294 $29.26 6 $4.88
77 | Potato Hashbrown Bulk Low Sodium No Bid #DIV/0! MCCAIN FOODS INC, #1000006188, 6/5LB 406308 $37.46| 189 $0.20 S- #DIV/0!_[SYS IMP 5021210 $52.35| 240 $0.22
78 | Potato Wedge Bulk Low Sodium No Bid #DIV/0! MCCAIN FOODS INC, #1000000496, 6/5LB 403701 $32.38| 165 $0.20 $- #DIV/0! _[SYS IMP 2000812 $46.41 6 $7.74
79 | POTATO, FRIES, SPICY, SEASONED low sodium, >200mg 25cs | 2 McCain No Bid #DIV/0! MCCAIN FOODS INC, #MCX04717, 6/5LB 403283 $32.30| 199 $0.16 $- #DIV/0! _[SYS IMP 7132388 $37.99 6 $6.33
80 | POTATO, ROUNDS; {tater tots) fow sodium, >200mg 25cs | 2 No Bid #DIV/0! MCCAIN FOODS INC, #1000002789, 6/5LB 405282 $33.50| 190 $0.18 $- #DIV/0! | MCCAIN 5100938 $48.14 6 $8.02
BL | Sandwich talian iYW whole grain No Bid #DIV/0! TASTY BRANDS, #70014, 72/4.50Z 403862 $78.25| 72 $1.09 | Tasty Brand 70014 $75.72 | 72 $1.05 | TASTYB 2713992 $78.80 72 $1.09
82 | SANDWICH, CROISSANT, STEAK AND CHEESE | whole grain, IW 25¢s | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! NO BID #VALUE! $- #DIV/0!_[IFS 406957 $64.74| 100 $0.65
83 [ SANDWICH, GRILLED CHEESE, THREE CHEESE _ | whole grain 1000cs | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! INTEGRATED, #C13400, 72/4.190Z TBD $43.19| 72 $0.60 | Integrated €13400 $43.96 | 72 $0.61 |HOTOFFG 8836296 $59.00 72 $0.82
84 [ SANDWICH, PEANUT BUTTER W/JELLY whole grain, strawberry, thaw & serve 100cs | 1 1 |Smuckers, Advanced Pierre No Bid #DIV/0! SMUCKERS, #5150006961, 72/2.60Z 404615 $45.45| 72 $0.63 51 1 $4423 | 72 $0.61 | SMUCKER 2223465 $42.89 72 $0.60
85 | SANDWICH, PEANUT BUTTER W/JELLY whole grain, grape, thaw & serve 100cs | 1 1 | Smuckers, Advanced Pierre No Bid #DIV/0! SMUCKERS, #5150006960, 72/2.60Z 404614 $43.44| 72 $0.60 51 $42.26 | 72 $0.59 | SMUCKER 2223453 $40.87 72 $0.57
86 | SANDWICH, SOYBUTTER W/JELLY whole grain, 2.40z, thaw & serve 100cs | 1 1 |Albies No Bid #DIV/0! ALBIES FOODS, #607, 72/2.40Z 134543 $55.98| 72 $0.78 $- #DIV/0! | ALBIES 7154794 $44.89 40 $1.12
Ly B e e B @ No Bid #DIV/0! MFG DISC HVALUE! $- #DIV/0! | BAKCRFT 7028433 |pisc_ |pisc | #vALUE!
88 | SANDWICH, TURKEY AND CHEESE 3.40z, whole grain Hawatian rofl turkey ham | 1000cs | 1 1 |Integrated No Bid #DIV/0! INTEGRATED, #C13018, 100/3.10Z TBD $67.38| 100 $0.67 $- #DIV/0! _|HOTOFFG 3975673 $66.65| 100 $0.67
89 [SANDWICH, TURKEY AND CHEESE, WEDGE | whole grain 1000cs | 2 2 |Tasty Brand No Bid #DIV/0! TASTY BRANDS, #70013, 72/4.50Z 404020 $77.12| 72 $1.07 | Tasty Brand 70013 $74.72 | 72 $1.04 |TASTY B 2805687 $72.75 72 $1.01
90 | SPAGHETTI, MEAT SAUCE, whole grain pasta 1000cs | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! JTM, #CP5590, 6/5LB 401074 $47.88| 64 $0.75[JT™ CP5578 $36.70 | 85 $0.43  [J1TM 1634908 DISC DISC | #VALUE!

TACO, BEEF STICK whole grain, beef and cheese 1000cs [ 2 2 |Integrated No Bid #DIV/0! INTEGRATED, #270019, 50/4.60Z 400930 $42.90| 50 $0.86 | Integrated 45019 $37.93 | 50 $0.76 | THE MAX 8810439 $60.38 96 $0.63
91 | TACO, TOTALLY TACO 4.090z, whole grain 25¢s | 175 | 2 |The Max No Bid #DIV/0! THE MAX, #77387-12714, 96/4.090Z 402030 $62.52| 96 $0.65 $- #DIV/0! [ MICHLB 7136449 $82.07 72 $1.14
92 | TAMALE, CHICKEN must meet 29 & 2 m/ma 25¢s | 2 2 No Bid #DIV/0! MICHAEL B'S BESTWAY, #TAC32, 72/5.50Z 404391 $8230| 72 $1.14 $- #DIV/0! | POSADA 4897373 NOBID |NOBID | #VALUE!
93 | TAQUITO, BREAKFAST, CHORIZO AND CHEESE | 2.40z, whole grain 25cs | 1 1 [Integrated No Bid #DIV/0! INTEGRATED, #C18021, 100/2.40Z 406469 $47.75| 100 $0.48 | Integrated C18021 $48.91 | 100 $0.49 [JENNIEO 7067628 $60.52 4|  $15.13
94 | TURKEY, CHUNKS IN GRAVY fow sodium, fully cooked, boil in bag 500cs 2 |lennie-0 No Bid #DIV/0! JENNIE O, #284728, 4/7LB 400984 $64.72| 113 $0.57 $- #DIV/0! |JENNIEO 6962603 $89.36| 138 $0.65
95 | TURKEY, TACO FILLING fully cooked, no fillers, heat and serve 25cs 2 Jennie-O No Bid #DIV/0! MEFG DISC HVALUE! [JTM 5202 $3s.ﬁﬁ 139 50.28
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