Porterville Unified School District Bid Solicitation 2022-2023 School Year

Solicitation is for COMMERCIAL PRICING

Supplies Bid School Year 2022-2023 Bid# SN-23-04

Vendor Name:

SYSCO NORTHERN CALIFORNIA P&R Paper INLAND SUPPLY CO INDIVIDUAL FOODSERVICE OR
\TEM NAME DESCRIPTION EST.  Contributions  Preffered Brand Case Pack/Size Price Case Serving Price Case Serving Price Case Serving Price Case Serving Price
Usage Grain M/MA  orequivelent Brand Vendor ID Price in Case Per Serving Brand |[Vendor ID| price inCase | Perserving | Brand |VendorID| price inCase | Perserving | Brand [VendorID| price inCase | Perserving | Brand [VendorID| price inCase | PerServing
1 |APRONS, BIB, CLOTH 5 SYsCo 2764017 $54.47 6 $9.08 WINCO IND| WIN-BA-323 $5.25 1 $5.25 | JOHN RITZE| 21900210 $91.29 12 $7.61 | CHEF WORK SMW2451 4 $5.61 1 $5.61 $- #DIV/0!
2 | APRONS, DISPOSABLE 10 SYS CLS 5330899 $38.67 500 $0.08 LIFE GUARD| LIG-2442 $36.50 1,000 $0.04 | PRIME SOUJ 75007243 | $105.56 1000 $0.11| AMERCARE| 153112442  $34.36| 1000 $0.03 $- #DIV/0!
3 | BAG, FOIL PLAIN, SANDWICH 25 MCNAIRN 9428004 $93.23 1000 $0.09 BAGCRAFTP PPC-300533  $55.95 1,000 $0.06 | NOVOLEX B| 10901533 $95.05 1000 $0.10 | BAGCRAFT | 15065 1000]  $66.59| 1000 $0.07 #DIV/0!
4 | BAG, FOIL, CHEESEBURGER cheeseburger printed on exterior 25 MCNAIRN 9572652 $121.09 1000 $0.12 BAGCRAFTP|PPC-300529  $55.95 1,000 $0.06 #DIV/0! | BAGCRAFT |F65C/30052  $79.77| 1000 $0.08 #DIV/0!
5 | BAG, FOIL CHICKEN chicken prined on exterior 25 MCNAIRN 698837 NOBID | NOBID #VALUE!  BAGCRAFTP|PPC-444492  $55.95 1,000 $0.06 #DIV/0! | BAGCRAFT [444492100(  $45.51| 1000 $0.05 #DIV/0!
6 |BAG, FOIL, HAMBURGER hamburger printed on exterior 25 MCNAIRN 470112 $80.00 1000 $0.08 BAGCRAFTF PPC-300527  $55.95 1,000 $0.06 | NOVOLEX B| 10901523 |  $118.13 1000 $0.12 | BAGCRAFT |F65H/3005  $79.03| 1000 $0.08 #DIV/0!
7 | BAG, FRENCH FRY 50 MCNAIRN 9655879 $48.71 1 $48.71 _ CALIFORNIA CLB-6SB $14.95 2,000 $0.01 #DIV/0! [CALBAG _|6DW 2000/ $15.77| 2000 $0.01 #DIV/0!
8 | BAG, HOT DOG, FOIL 10 MCNAIRN 5887827 $39.89 2000 $0.02 BAGCRAFTP|PPC-300455  $56.10 1,000 $0.06 $- 0 #DIV/0! |BROWN | F-9 (5A10), $56.49| 1000 $0.06 #DIV/0!
9 | BAG, HOT DOG, PLAIN WHITE 25 MCNAIRN 9640525 $129.68 1000 $0.13 CALIFORNIA CLB-9HP $21.95 2,000 $0.01 [OLEX BAGCH 72021000 | $50.87 2000 $0.03 [ CALBAG | 29DW-HOT $26.30| 2000 $0.01 #DIV/0!
10 | BAG, LUNCH SACK 10 ERTHPLS 1594060 $15.71 500 $0.03 AJM PACKAQ AJM-6LB $13.20 500 $0.03 #DIV/0! |PACKER _|IFS6B, 500/ $13.04| 500 $0.03 #DIV/0!
11 | BAG, SANDWICH 500 MCNAIRN 9427907 $53.72 2000 $0.03 CALIFORNIA CLB-195B $22.05 2,000 $0.01 #DIV/0! |CALBAG _|19DW2000]  $24.11| 2000 $0.01 #DIV/0!
12 | BAR TOWELS 10 SYSCO 5756465 DISC DISC #VALUE! _ PEERLESS V| PEM-T5822(  $45.20 1 $45.20 | ITW PROFEY 21389415 $94.34 150 $0.63 | CHICOPEE [8252,150/  $55.68| 150 $0.37 #DIV/0!
13 | BEARD COVERS 10 HANGARD 3290097 $34.12 1000 $0.03 CELLUCAP N CEL-BP-400| $43.00 1,000 $0.04 | PRIME SOUJ 75009262 $44.49 1000 $0.04 [JW 17908 (688! $31.82| 1000 $0.03 #DIV/0!
14 | BOWL, FOAM 22 OUNCE 250 PACTIV 5879465 $66.47 504 $0.13 PACTIV (PCA MBL-TH1-0 $93.85 500 $0.19 | PACTIV COR| 16200177|  $129.75 504 $0.26 | PACKER _ [17915500/(  $61.11| 500 $0.12 #DIV/0!
15 | BOWL, FOAM 22 OUNCE, LID 250 PACTIV 7881776 $152.61 504 $0.30 SOL-PAK |SPK-CDLO6S|  $42.50 504 $0.08 | PACTIV COR| 16202228 |  $179.96 504 $0.36|PACKER 22255500/  $51.11| 500 $0.10 #DIV/0!
16 | Box Pizza Clamshell Wedge 10 DIXIE 5884424 $69.13 200 $0.35 PACTIV (PC/ DOP-D168C|  $58.90 400 $0.15 $40.28 500 $0.08|sap 7816,400/q  $74.35| 400 $0.19 #DIV/0!
17 |BOX, PizzA 30 AREZCLS 5787247 $26.99 50 $0.54 WINSIGHT I| WIN-16PIZ $36.25 50 $0.73 #DIV/0! |PACKER | 26056 50/C $29.39 50 $0.59 #DIV/0!
18 | Box, Pizza Clamshell 10 DIXIE 5884424 $69.13 200 $0.35 PACTIV (PC/ DOP-D168C|  $58.90 400 $0.15 #DIV/0! _[sap 9866 200/C $52.06| 200 $0.26 #DIV/0!
19 | BUN RACK COVER 10 SYs CLS 5854377 $12.32 50 $0.25 NP&PC - HA HND-RP805 $15.20 50 $0.30 | ELKAY PLAS] 32815281 $32.89 #DIV/0! | ELKAY 65559 (BOR| $16.14 50 $0.32 #DIV/0!
20 | Container Fry 200 SYSTRNZ 2004236 $27.61 1000 $0.03 PACTIV (PCA DOP-DFRY3] _ $110.25 1,000 $0.11|SOUTHERN | 18407013|  $136.08 1000 $0.14|sap 8070, 1M/C{  $68.08| 1000 $0.07 #DIV/0!
21 | CONTAINER, FOAM 4 oz, foam 50 DART 4088761 $43.01 1000 $0.04 DART CONT]| DRT-4)6 $44.25 1,000 $0.04 | WINCUP 19400404 $37.22 1000 $0.04 | DART 416 20/50/q $45.22| 1000 $0.05 #DIV/0!
22 | CONTAINER, FOAM 8oz, foam 200 SYSco 3291143 $75.26 1000 $0.08 DART CONT| DRT-85J20 $77.90 1,000 $0.08 [ WINCUP 19401788 $32.16 500 $0.06 | DART 85J20 20/5( $80.82| 1000 $0.08 #DIV/0!
23 | CONTAINER, FOAM, HINGED 1 compartment 10 SYSTRNZ 7192580 $34.06 150 $0.23 REPUBLIC P| RPP-71594 $19.90 200 $0.10 | TEKNI-PLEX| 30400017 $47.75 200 $0.24 | RECYCLUM | HT81-BAG 2| $23.98 200 $0.12 #DIV/0!
24 | CONTAINER, FOAM, HINGED 3 compartment 10 SYSTRNZ 7196530 $20.97 150 $0.14 REPUBLIC P| RPP-71426 $20.65 200 $0.10 | TEKNI-PLEX| 30400993 $47.71 200 $0.24 | RECYCLUM | HT83-BAG 2| $23.98 200 $0.12 #DIV/0!
25 | CONTAINER, FOAM, LID 200 DART 4096293 $26.01 1000 $0.03 DART CONT| DRT-20JL $46.65 10,000 $0.00 #DIV/O! | DART 6JL 10/100 $27.20| 1000 $0.03 #DIV/0!
26 | CONTAINER, FOAM, LID must be compatible with line 11 10 DART 4097457 $45.39 1000 $0.05 DART CONT DRT-6JL $27.15 1,000 $0.03 #DIV/0! | DART 20IL, 10/10 $46.79| 1000 $0.05 #DIV/0!
27 | CONTAINER, HINGED, CLEAR 16" 50 GENPAK 7563653 $82.26 200 $0.41 ROYAL INTE| RFS-RPS16 $26.45 200 $0.13 | DOMO INDY J0560206 $72.07 200 $0.36| EATERY _ [45174 (RPT $28.88 200 $0.14 #DIV/0!
28 | CONTAINER, HINGED, CLEAR 24" 100 GENPAK 3467289 $125.20 200 $0.63 ROYAL INTE| RFS-RPS24. $38.10 200 $0.19 | DOMO INDY J0560204 $65.19 150 $0.43 | EATERY 45233 (RPT! $43.18 200 $0.22 #DIV/0!
29 | CONTAINER, HINGED, SALAD, LARGE 10 GENPAK 7124704 $134.49 200 $0.67 PACTIV (PCA PCA-YCI8-11] $60.20 100 $0.60 #DIV/0! | PACTIV YCI8-1120, $47.73 250 $0.19 #DIV/0!
30 | CONTAINER, LARGE SALAD, PLATTER 10 PACTIV 1909886 $139.15 37500 $0.00 WNA INC. - | PAR-21611 $52.50 250 $0.21 #DIV/0! _|ATRIUM _ [21611, 250, $55.78| 250 $0.22 #DIV/0!
31 | CONTAINER, LARGE SALAD, PLATTER, LID 10 PAR PAK 6209064 DISC DISC #VALUE! WNA INC. - | PAR-21611 $52.50 250 $0.21 #DIV/O! |ATRIUM  |21611, 250/ INCL. 250 $- #DIV/0!
32 | Container, Microwaveable Combo 4oz 500 HD 7105942 $40.67 150 $0.27 PACTIV (PCANEW-ES04 | $120.25 500 $0.24 #DIV/0! | ANCHOR ?:otiloozl,s $89.66| 500 $0.18 #DIV/O!
33 | CONTAINER, PLASTIC 550z 25 SYS REL 7064615 $65.03 2000 $0.03 CARRYOUT | COB-VBPC5| $51.30 2,500 $0.02 | PACIFIC LINH J0020032 $99.66 2500 $0.04| PACKER | 62079, 250¢ $41.25| 2500 $0.02 #DIV/0!
34 [CONTAINER, PLASTIC 4oz 10 SYS REL 7064604 $63.66 3000 $0.02 CARRYOUT | COB-VBPCA4| $42.10 2,500 $0.02 | PACIFIC LINH J0020030 $81.21 2500 $0.03 | PACKER _ [61251, 250 $36.25| 2500 $0.01 #DIV/0!
35 | CONTAINER, PLASTIC, LID 4 0z, must be compatible with line #31 50 SYS IMP 7793736 $35.42 2400 $0.01 CARRYOUT | COB-VBPCLI $30.40 2,500 $0.01 #DIV/O! | PACKER 61255, 250! $27.69| 2500 $0.01 #DIV/0!
36 | CONTAINER, PLASTIC, LID 3250z 10 SYS IMP 7793736 $35.42 2400 $0.01 CARRYOUT | COB-VBPCL $30.40 2,500 $0.01 | PACIFIC LINH J0020033 $59.19 2500 $0.02| PACKER | 61255, 2501 $27.69| 2500 $0.01 #DIV/0!
37 | Cup Tumbler 100z 20 CAMBRO 5083050 $22.06 24 $0.92 CARRYOUT | COB-VG10C|  $35.95 1,000 $0.04| WNA COME| 12200085 $71.62 500 $0.14 | RECYCLUM | PBS10-CUP, $32.47| 1000 $0.03 #DIV/0!
38 | CUP, HOT, PAPER 20 SYS CLS 1995675 $125.42 1000 $0.13 GRAPHIC PA INT-12HDQ) $48.80 1,000 $0.05 | GRAPHIC PAl 13400297 $72.49 1000 $0.07 [ LOLLICUP | C-K512W 1d $49.72| 1000 $0.05 #DIV/0!
39 | CUP, PLASTIC, CLEAR 12/ 160z 20 ERTHPLS 7131355 $50.43 420 $0.12 CARRYOUT { COB-AC16 $56.90 1,000 $0.06 | RPLANET EA L0520004 $109.77 1000 $0.11]IFS IFS-KC125 2 $48.86| 1000 $0.05 #DIV/0!
40 | CUP, WATER, PAPER 550z 10 FABRKAL 5505183 NO BID NO BID #VALUE! _ AJM PACKAQ AJM-DC5M! $72.05 2,400 $0.03[SOLOCUP | 18201076 $305.15 3000 $0.10| GENPAK _ |F550,20/25 $112.59| 5000 $0.02 #DIV/0!
41 | FILM< LAYOVER, PLASTIC 100 SYS CLS 7435191 $24.15 1 $24.15 #N/A No Quote |No Quote No Quote | K PACK 19980002 $21.69 #DIV/0! | K-PACK 21122, 18X $13.35 1 $13.35 #DIV/0!
42 | FOIL, HEAVY DUTY 10 SYS CLS 6938377 $185.58 1 $185.58 CARRYOUT  COB-11805- $48.85 1 $48.85 | SUPREME S{J10400641 $64.21 #DIV/0! |PERRIN'S |IFS-181000K $47.73 1 $47.73 #DIV/0!
43 | FOIL, SHEET, WITH CHECKER DESIGN 10 9999999 NO BID NO BID #VALUE! _ BAGCRAFTP PPC-300842  $78.95 2,000 $0.04 #DIV/O! | BAGCRAFT |3008424/5(  $144.05| 2000 $0.07 #DIV/0!
44 | FOIL, SHEETS 100 SYS CLS 6938526 $182.83 2400 $0.08 CARRYOUT | COB-51210{  $66.10 3,000 $0.02 | SUPREME 5¢ /1040068 $100.49 #DIV/O! |PACKER  [IFS7216/50]  $54.12| 3000 $0.02 #DIV/0!
45 | FORK, HEAVY, EBONY, PLASTIC 10 SYS IMP 7989207 $104.34 1000 $0.10 NUTRIBON I| NTR-6860 $18.00 1,000 $0.02 #DIV/0! | IFS IFS-PPF-B, 1| $12.94| 1000 $0.01 #DIV/0!
46 | FORK, MEDIUM, WHITE, PLASTIC 10 SYS CLS 7947304 $57.04 1000 $0.06 NUTRIBON [ NTR-3640 $7.35 1,000 $0.01 #DIV/0! | PACKER  [9956515, 1q $6.39| 1000 $0.01 #DIV/0!
47 | GLOVE, NITRILE, PGT AND PAN 50 HANGARD 8518052 $18.55 12 $1.55 SAFETY ZON SAF-GNGF-l|  $15.10 12 $1.26 #DIV/0! |IMPACT _ [1741612/P]  $212.19 24 $8.84 | UPC GENER| NPF $54.00 1000 $0.05
48 | GLOVES, VINYL, POWDER FREE, EXTRA LARGE 200 SYS CLS 8399737 $38.65 1000 $0.04 CARRYOUT | IMP-64V30( $23.50 1,000 $0.02 | WINSIGHT I{ F6950019 $43.37 1000 $0.04 [ JOHNSON  |17364-DZRY S - UPC GENER| VPF-XL $32.75 1000 $0.03
49 | GLOVES, VINYL, POWDER FREE, LARGE 200 SYS CLS 5478536 $38.65 1000 $0.04 CARRYOUT | IMP-64V30( $23.50 1,000 $0.02 | WINSIGHT I{ F6950018 $43.37 1000 $0.04| PACKER | 65594 10/1 $23.77| 1000 $0.02 | UPC GENER| VPF-L $32.75 1000 $0.03
50 | GLOVES, VINYL, POWDER FREE, MEDIUM 200 SYS CLS 5478526 $38.65 1000 $0.04 CARRYOUT | IMP-64V30(  $23.50 1,000 $0.02 | WINSIGHT I{ F6950017 $43.37 1000 $0.04 | PACKER | 65593 10/1 $23.77| 1000 $0.02 | UPC GENER| VPF-M $32.75 1000 $0.03
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51 | GLOVES, VINYL, POWDER FREE, SMALL 200 SYS REL 951980 $35.35 1000 $0.04 CARRYOUT | IMP-64V30( $23.50 1,000 $0.02 | WINSIGHT If F6950016 $43.37 1000 $0.04| PACKER _ [65592 10/1 $23.77| 1000 $0.02 | UPC GENER| VPF-S $32.75 1000 $0.03
52 | HAIRNETS 10 HANGARD 4455386 $155.99 1440 $0.11 CELLUCAP M CEL-HN400H $86.00 1,440 $0.06 | CELLUCAP M 24664500 |  $172.39 1440 $0.12 | PACKER 65603 10/1 $23.77| 1000 $0.02 #DIV/0!
53 | Lid, Foil Pans Half 10 SYS CLS 6938211 $60.52 100 $0.61 CARRYOUT | COB-VBHLF: $18.65 100 $0.19 #DIV/0! | CELLUCAP | HN400BK, 1| $83.49| 1440 $0.06 #DIV/0!
54 |Lid, Hot Cup 10 syscLs 2000513 $76.49 1000 $0.08 GRAPHIC PAINT-LHRDS _ $41.75 1,200 $0.03 #DIV/O! | PERRINS _|IFS101230, $2532| 100 $0.25 #DIV/0!
55 |Lids, Foil Pans Full must be compatible with line 35 10 SYS CLS 7293257 $119.85 80 $1.50 CARRYOUT | COB-VBFSL $25.30 50 $0.51 #DIV/0! | IMEX 49210,20/9  $30.80| 1000 $0.03 #DIV/0!
56 | MASK, FACE, DISPOSABLE 10 PACKER 7128365 $15.90 50 $0.32 AMERICAN | APP-MASK- $5.25 50 $0.11 | WINSIGHT I| F6950102 $48.85 1000 $0.05 | PERRIN IFS112045 9 $31.52 50 $0.63 #DIV/O!
57 | NAPKIN, BEVERAGE 10 SYS CLS 2980407 $40.89 3000 $0.01 SOUTH SEA{ SSI-VBBEVN $9.75 3,000 $0.00 | SUPREME 5¢J1040035 $18.04 4000 $0.00| PACKER _ [14755 50/8 $3.95 50 $0.08 #DIV/0!
58 | NAPKIN, LOW FOLD, DISPENSER 10 TORKADV 1330687 $61.17 6000 $0.01 SOUTH SEA{ S51-90001V $26.75 8,000 $0.00 | BUNZL REDI| 73002654 $58.54 8016 $0.01 | PATERSON [397512 16/ $16.35| 4000 $0.00 #DIV/0!
59 | NAPKIN, TALL FOLD 10 ERTHPLS 7352388 $50.45 6000 $0.01 SOUTH SEA{ SSI1-480308¢ $22.90 10,000 $0.00 | ROYAL PAPE| A0360020 $64.90 10000 $0.01 NO BID #DIV/0!
60 | PAN LINERS 500 SYSCO 6787774 $68.51 1000 $0.07 DURA SOUR| DSP-DSWPL| $37.20 1,000 $0.04 | PRIME SOUf 75003991 $63.64 1000 $0.06 | STAND ALO| SA-50120/  $26.70| 10000 $0.00 #DIV/0!
61 | PAN, FOIL, FULL PAN 10 SYS CLS 7293283 $99.58 40 $2.49 CARRYOUT | COB-VBFDS $51.40 50 $1.03 #DIV/O! |PERRIN'S |27-11000/q  $37.24| 1000 $0.04 #DIV/0!
62 | PAN, FOIL< HALF PAN 10 syscLs 7465969 $99.24 100 $0.99 CARRYOUT | COB-VBHLF|  $18.65 100 $0.19 #DIV/0! | PERRIN'S |IFS-6120,50  $52.33 50 $1.05 #DIV/0!
63 | PAPER PLACEMATS 250 SYSCO 5411723 $22.50 1000 $0.02 HOFFMASTI HOF-PM32( $20.10 1,000 $0.02 #DIV/0! | PERRIN'S | IFS-6112, 1q $36.61 100 $0.37 #DIV/0!
64 | PLATE, FOAM 9" 10 SYS CLS 1555313 $73.92 500 $0.15 REPUBLIC P| RPP-71532 $17.40 500 $0.03 #DIV/0! | PATERSON |32-750 100 $16.61| 1000 $0.02 #DIV/0!
65 |Plates Paper 8 10 syscLs 8593602 $42.47 500 $0.08 CARRYOUT {| BRG-VBAYO! $32.85 500 $0.07 #DIV/0! |PACTIV__ |TH1-00094  $20.25| 500 $0.04 #DIV/0!
66 | Plates Paper 6" 10 SYS CLS 8593610 $54.66 1000 $0.05 CARRYOUT | BRG-VBAYO| $30.50 1,000 $0.03 #DIV/O! | PACKER  |9922385, 9" $32.95 500 $0.07 #DIV/O!
67 |PVC ROLL 10 SYS CLS 7435332 $22.89 1 $22.89  ANCHOR PA| ANC-30700 $27.25 1 $27.25 #DIV/O! |PACKER | IFS-PL6, 1M| $26.20| 1000 $0.03 #DIV/0!
68 | PVC, SHEETS 10x10 10 REYNOLD 4270963 $34.63 1900 $0.02 ANCHOR PA| ANC-E1510 $8.95 irl $8.95 #DIV/0! | K-PACK 21123RL $16.52 1 $16.52 #DIV/0!
69 | PVC, SHEETS 12x12 10 SYS CLS 7435191 $24.15 1 $24.15 ANCHOR PA| ANC-E1512 $12.15 1rl $12.15 #DIV/0! | ANCHOR |E151010 $9.20 1 $9.20 #DIV/0!
70 | PVC, SHEETS 1ax14 10 REYNOLD 4471306 $55.43 1200 $0.05 ANCHOR PA| ANC-E1514: $10.95 1rl $10.95 #DIV/0! |ANCHOR 2120120 $12.52 1 $12.52 #DIV/0!
71 | SPOONS, HEAVY, EBONY x PACTIV 2520631 $51.12 1000 $0.05 NUTRIBON | NTR-6862/6  $18.00 1,000 $0.02 #DIV/0! |ANCHOR _|E151414 $11.14 1 $11.14 #DIV/0!
72 | SPOONS, MEDIUM, WHITE 10 SYS CLS 7963253 $70.11 1000 $0.07 NUTRIBON | NTR-3642 $7.35 1,000 $0.01 #DIV/0!_|IFS IFS-PPS-B, 1 $12.94| 1000 $0.01 #DIV/0!
73 | SPORKS KIT, MEDIUM 1000 DOWELL 1706213 $57.69 1000 $0.06 CARRYOUT { COB-SPORK: $14.75 1,000 $0.01 #DIV/0! | PACKER  |9956529, 1 $6.36| 1000 $0.01 #DIV/0!
74 | THERMOMETER, DIGITAL PROBE 10 COOPER 4708495 $43.98 1 $43.98  WINCO IND|WIN-TMT-D|  $11.36 1 $11.36 | WINCO DW| 633600741 $12.27 1 $12.27 | PACKER __[3606 1000/! $14.44| 1000 $0.01 #DIV/0!
75 | THERMOMETER, OVEN 50 SYSCO 4049573 $5.42 1 $5.42 WINCO IND| WIN-TMT-O $3.25 1 $3.25 #DIV/0! |TAYLOR  |102339868|  $42.84 1 $42.84 #DIV/0!
76 | THERMOMETER, PROBE 100 SYSCO 6869051 $178.22 1 $178.22  DIAMOND \| DMW-F244! $20.95 1,000 $0.02 #DIV/O! | TRUTEMP |SMW1099 3 $2.72 1 $2.72 #DIV/0!
77 | THERMOMETER, REFRIGERATOR 0 sYsco 1953942 $10.72 2 $5.36 WINCO IND| WIN-TMT-R $3.15 1 $3.15 #DIV/O! |WINCO  |14468, EACI $2.57 1 $2.57 #DIV/0!
78 | THERMOMETER, WIPES 100 ECOLAB 1261357 $12.59 200 $0.06 COOPER-AT| CPA-9150-0]  $20.95 2,000 $0.01 #DIV/0! | TRUTEMP |SMW1100 { $2.72 1 $2.72 #DIV/0!
79 | TRAY, BLACK 4oz Polar Pak 21927 | paR pak 2181469 $44.40 2500 $0.02 WNA INC. - | PAR-29427 $37.20 2,500 $0.01 #DIV/0! | DIAMOND V| F2449PKT 1 $22.73| 1000 $0.02 #DIV/0!
80 |Tray Single Serve 4oz 300 SYSTRNZ 2004269 $17.76 1000 $0.02 WNA INC. - | PAR-29427 $37.20 2,500 $0.01 #DIV/0! | ATRIUM _ |29427, 2501 $39.57| 2500 $0.02 #DIV/0!
81 | TRAY, FOIL, WITH LID 100 PACTIV 8810622 $147.70 250 $0.59 CARRYOUT {| COB-VB3CO)| $75.25 250 $0.30 #DIV/0! | ATRIUM | 29427, 250! $39.57| 2500 $0.02 #DIV/0!
82 | TRAY, PAPER, CARRYOUT SNAP 1000 SANAPKG 7036711 $51.64 500 $0.10 SOUTHERN | SOU-0122 $40.00 500 $0.08 #DIV/0! | WILKINSON|D59-6170CH  $78.81| 250 $0.32 #DIV/0!
83 | Tray, Plastic Black 18" 100 SYSCO 5948948 $151.97 36 $4.22 WNA INC. - | WNA-A518| $47.25 25 $1.89 | HFA INC 31040090|  $311.03 60 $5.18 [ sQpP 39269 (719 $35.99 500 $0.07 #DIV/0!
84 |Tray, Plastic Black 16" 10 SYSCo 5948922 $129.05 36 $3.58 WNA INC. -| WNA-A516| $36.25 25 $1.45 [ HFA INC 31040091 $244.80 60 $4.08 | PAR-PAK [ 51800 50/C $96.62 50 $1.93 #DIV/0!
85 |Tray, Plastic Black 2" 10 SYSCO 5948898 $74.97 36 $2.08 WNA INC. - | WNA-A512 $17.30 25 $0.69 | HFA INC 31040092  $150.50 60 $2.51| PAR-PAK | 51600 50/Ct $75.91 50 $1.52 #DIV/0!
86 | TRAY, PLASTIC, 2 COMPARTMENT, BLACK 100 MPLETRD 7104076 $41.27 120 $0.34 HN/A No Quote |No Quote No Quote #DIV/0! | PAR-PAK  |51200 50/C $33.75 50 $0.68 #DIV/O!
87 | TRAY, PLASTIC, 3 COMPARTMENT, BLACK 100 MPLETRD 7102517 $41.22 120 $0.34 #N/A No Quote | No Quote No Quote #DIV/0! | DETROIT FO|GP-567,1M]  $70.47| 1000 $0.07 #DIV/0!
88 | TRAY, STYROFOAM 2500 ICONGBL 7198770 $57.31 500 $0.11 RPP-71440 $24.10 500 $0.05 | SANTA ANA| 63440035 $68.88 500 $0.14 | DETROIT FO| GP-563, 1M, $72.10| 1000 $0.07 #DIV/0!
REYMA  |T5CST,500/f  $26.69| 500 $0.05
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