IFB PR 21-006 Record of Bids*

Group 1
Item No. |, . o uom Adams Fence Associated Fence of Liberty Fence & Supply Western Fence Co.
Line Iltem Description Glendale
1 Labor and materials to install 100 feet of typical fence, chain link (9 ga) 6’ tall with rails, posts, concrete and 1 each 3’ x 6’ gate Per 100 feet| $ 22.76| $ 3,956.00| $ 3,925.00| $ 2,475.20
2 Fence fabric per specifications, 6 GA, 8’ high, 2” mesh Linear Foot | $ 22.65| $ 26.95| $ 17.60( $ 14.77
3 Fence fabric per specifications, 9 GA, 4" high, 2” mesh Linear Foot | $ 7.25($ 595| $ 5.40| $ 2.32
4 Fence fabric per specifications, 9 GA, 5’ high, 2’ mesh Linear Foot | $ 9.06| $ 7.95| $ 6.75| $ 2.90
5 Fence fabric per specifications, 9 GA, 6’ high, 2” mesh Linear Foot | $ 10.75| $ 9.25| $ 8.10| $ 3.48
6 Fence fabric per specifications, 9 GA, 8’ high, 2” mesh Linear Foot | $ 14.00 $ 11.75] $ 10.60] $ 4.62
7 Fence fabric per specifications, 9 GA, 10’ high, 2” mesh Linear Foot | $ 17.50| $ 16.75| $ 13.80( $ 5.76
8 Fence fabric per specifications, 11 GA, 4’ high, 2” mesh Linear Foot | $ 6.45| $ 5.45| $ 520 $ 1.66
9 Fence fabric per specifications, 11 GA, 5’ high, 2’ mesh Linear Foot | $ 8.06| $ 7.75| $ 6.50| $ 2.06
10  |Fence fabric per specifications, 11 GA, 6’ high, 2” mesh Linear Foot | $ 9.67| $ 8.95| $ 7.80[ $ 2.47
11 Fence fabric per specifications, 11 GA, 8 high, 2” mesh Linear Foot | $ 12.90( $ 11.25( $ 14.40( $ 3.31
12 |Fence fabric per specifications, 11 GA, 10’ high, 2” mesh Linear Foot | $ 16.15( $ 16.50( $ 13.00 $ 4.13
13 Terminal post, per specifications, 2-7/8” od x 0.160 wall Linear Foot | $ 14.38( $ 18.32| $ 720.00( S 5.23
14  |Terminal post, per specifications, 2-3/8” od x 0.160 wall Linear Foot | $ 11.76 | $ 20.67| $ 669.00| $ 3.23
15 |Line post, per specifications, 2-3/8” od x 0.160 wall Linear Foot | $ 11.75( $ 10.45( $ 393.00( $ 3.23
16 |Line post, per specifications, 2-3/8” od x 0.130 wall Linear Foot | $ 11.75( $ 10.25( $ 383.00| $ 3.23
17 Line post, per specifications, 1-7/8” od x 0.130 wall Linear Foot | $ 10.36| $ 9.25| S 278.00( S 2.42
18  |Top rail tubing, per specifications, 1-5/8” od x 0.110 wall Linear Foot | $ 265 $ 3.25] $ 345([ $ 1.49
19  |Top rail tubing, per specifications, 1-7/8” od x 0.110 wall Linear Foot | $ 3.25| $ 3.97( $ 460]| S 1.79
20 |Top rail tubing, per specifications, 1.9” od x 0.110 wall Linear Foot No Bid S 6.50( $ 4.60| $ 1.79
21 Double Drive Gate, Fence Height 4' Linear Foot | $ 56.50| $ 75.00| $ 46.00| S 21.72
22 |Double Drive Gate, Fence Height 5' Linear Foot | $ 70.62| $ 85.00| $ 57.50| $ 23.08
23 Double Drive Gate, Fence Height 6' Linear Foot | $ 84.75| $ 95.00| $ 69.00| $ 24,71
24  |Double Drive Gate, Fence Height 8' Linear Foot | $ 112.99] $ 125.00| $ 92.00| $ 35.57
25 Double Drive Gate, Fence Height 10’ Linear Foot No Bid S 150.00| $ 115.00| $ 54.30
26 |Labor rate for fence repairs Per Hour No Bid S 75.00| $ 69.75] $ 55.00
27  [Labor rate for security gate repairs Per Hour No Bid S 195.00| $ 125.00( $ 55.00
28 |Rental of a 4’ x 12’ section of portable fencing including all required hardware, panel stands (feet) Per Month | $ 44.64| S 18.00( $ 7.20( $ 2.40
29 |Rental of a 6’ x 12’ section of portable fencing including all required hardware, panel stands (feet) Per Month | $ 44.64| S 24.00| $ 7.50[ $ 2.40
30 |Rental of a 8 x 12’ section of portable fencing including all required hardware, panel stands (feet) Per Month | $ 44.64| S 40.00| $ 54.80| $ 3.20
31  |Mobilization + Demobilization (All Sizes) PerEvent | $ 225.00( $ 750.00 $ 1,375.00| $ 400.00
32 |2500 PSI Concrete (Post Footings) 1 - 3 Yards CubicYard | $ 240.50( $ 315.00( $ 289.50( $ 108.60
33 2500 PSI Concrete (Post Footings) 4 - 6 Yards CubicYard | $ 193.75| $ 185.00| $ 279.50( $ 108.60
34  |2500 PSI Concrete (Post Footings) Over 6 Yards CubicYard | $ 154.25| $ 175.00| $ 269.50( $ 108.60
Optional Items
35 42" MAG 145 Handrail , 3 rail Under 100 LA $ 42.50
36 42" MAG 145 Handrail , 3 rail Over 100 LF| $ 40.25
35 Fence Repair Mobilization Charge. Per Day 325.00 Per Day S 325.00
36 Emergency Security Gate Service Call. Per Call 2,500.00 Per Call S 2,500.00
37 Non-Emergency Security Gate Service Call. Per Call 1,200.00 Per Call S 1,200.00
38 Rental Fence Stand-By Labor Fee. Per Hour 175.00 Per Hour S 175.00
39 Rental Fence Install Fee. Per Foot 2.50 Per Foot S 2.50
40 Rental Fence Removal Fee. Per Foot 1.50 Per Foot S 1.50
Group 2
x A Lo Adams Fence S T e T Woestern Fence Co.
Line ftem Description of Glendale Supply
Las Ligas Park Lump Sum| 5 1250000 | 5 2753300| 5 2697694 | 5 13,872.00
Festival Fields Park Lump Sum| 5 73.00000| 5 9897700 | 5 8611938 5 12 838.40
Friendship Park Lump Sum| 5 1795750 | & 1396000 | 5 2325586 | 5 51,952.00
Grand Total| & 109,457.50 | 5 14647000 | 5 136,352 18 | 5 78,662.40

Bid Opening Date: 09/24/2020
Bid Opening Time: 5:00 PM
*This is just a record of bids. Procurement will evaluate the responsivenss of each bid and the publish the formal bid tabluation. Opened By: Jill Lin, Senior Buyer



Group 2

Associated Fence | Liberty Fence &
. L UuoM Adams Fence Western Fence Co.
Line Item Description of Glendale Supply
Las Ligas Park Lump Sum| S 12,500.00( S 27,533.00| $ 26,976.94| S 13,872.00
Festival Fields Park Lump Sum| S 79,000.00 | S 98,977.00| S 86,119.38| S 12,838.40
Friendship Park Lump Sum| S 17,957.50( $ 19,960.00| S 23,255.86| S 51,952.00
Grand Total| S 109,457.50 | S 146,470.00 | S 136,352.18 | S 78,662.40




