
Pump Station Projects

IFB#2018-3282-4520-19

Bid Tabulation

Company Name

The 

Cedars/Windsor 

Hill/Pump Station 

#86

White Church 

Pump Station 

#103

Baker's 

Landing/Archdal

e Pump Station 

#107

Tranquil Acres 

Pump Station #105

Tyvola Drive Pump 

Station #6

Archdale/Indigo 

Fields Pump Station 

#16

Green Construction 

Company
No Bid

$320,000.00 

Alternate Bid 

$335,000.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid $493,500.00

MJL

$237,800.00 

Alternate Bid 

$261,800.00

$348,000.00 

Alternate Bid 

$372,000.00

$203,500.00

$375,000.00 

Alternate Bid 

$399,000.00

$166,000.00 

Alternate Bid 

$194,200.00

$543,500.00

Level Utilities

$98,712.00 

Alternate Bid 

$119,550.00

$131,234.00 

Alternate Bid 

$152,072.00

$60,739.00

$128,526.00 

Alternate Bid 

$149,364.00

$98,278.00 

Alternate Bid 

$122,759.00

$301,945.00

McClam & Associates

$139,000.00 

Alternate Bid 

$163,000.00

$195,000.00 

Alternate Bid 

$219,000.00

$117,000.00

$245,000.00 

Alternate Bid 

$269,000.00

$126,000.00 

Alternate Bid 

$144,000.00

$417,000.00

Apparent Low Bid


