TULARE CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT
600 NORTH CHERRY ST.

TULARE, CALIFORNIA 93274

BID NO. 2018/2019 - DUE Thursday , April 4,2019 — 2:00 P.M. - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES

DESCRIPTION -- Bid on Bran ifi ri I-- i
ITEM NO. SCi 0 do a d Specified 0. ts equa ary. | uniT Central Poly Central Sanitary i ConServ Flag Focus Groupo GTE Inter.borf ) Inter.bor? ) Inter.bori ) Inter.borf ) P &R Paper Pyramid —— Unipak
specify your brand in column provided. Corp. Supply Company Packaging "A" | Packaging "B Packaging "C Packaging "D
790071 WAXIE SHIELD
_ Aurelia-Med- . . . W8645M NITRILE PF
MEDIUM NITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES-6.MIL DIAMOND GLOVE - Handarmor Diamond Gloves # NPFG-E, Sample Aurelia-Med-NPFG]Aurelia-Med-NPFG]Aurelia-Med-NPFG NETCHOICE- | Tradex#NMD400| EXAM GLOVES BLUE
C-1-135 100 EA NEPF-63M GDNPF105M NEPF-63M 4C1195 E, Sample #C-1- | E, Sample #C-1- | E, Sample #C-1- 00516 3.29/32.90|  3.98/398.00 MED 10/100 5.78/578.00
100 GOLVES PER BOX 5.89/589.00 6.25/625.00 7.10/710.00 230133400 135334/334 | 135334/334 | 1353.34/334 s ' ' : :
790069 WAXIE SHIELD
. . . . . W8645L NITRILE PF EXAM
LARGE NITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES-6. MIL DIAMOND GLOVE - Handarmor Diamond Gloves # Aurelia-Lrg-NPFG{ Aurelia-Lrg-NPFG- | Aurelia-Lrg-NPFG- | Aurelia-Lrg-NPFG- NETCHOICE- Tradeex GLOVES BLUE LG 10/100
C-1-136 120 | EA NEPF-63L GDNPF1052 NEPF-63L E, Sample #C-1- | E, Sample #C-1- | E, Sample #C-1- | E, Sample #C-L- |0 oo o f - #NLQ40O 5 78169360
100 GLOVES PER BOX 5.89/706.80 6.25/750.00 7.10/85.00 136 3.34/400.80 | 136 3.34/400.80 | 136 3.34/400.80 | 136 3.34/400.80 3230 3.98/477.00 B9
790073 WAXIE SHIELD
_ . . . Aurelia-XL-NPFG- W8645XL NITRILE PF
C.1137 |XLARGENITRILE EXAMINATION GLOVES-6. MIL | /| L\ D | e D e et | & oo et | e Sumpl st | ESaMPle #C-1+ | NETCHOICE- | Tradex #NXLAOO | EXAM GLOVES BLUE XL
100 GLOVES PER BOX 5.80/824.60 6.25/875.00 7.10/994 137 3.34/467.60 | 137 334/467.60 | 137334146760 | ., 4%7 6 00518 4.6/32.90 |  3.98/577.20 107100 5.78/809.20
573136 PRO SUPER
COACH PRO 10
c1.13g |VACCUMBAGS-PRO-TEAMTRIANGULAR (6 QT | 50 | by CENRCBASS T Pro Tefg"/piéom Sl vosn INTERCEPT MICRO
FOR CORDLESS VAC) 1/PACK#107313 5.39/1,940.40 7.85/2,826.00 8.17PK/2941.20 FILTERS 10/PK
18.91/6807.60
573138 PRO SUPER
GENRIC BAGS- PT- Pro Team G.K PROTEAM- COACH PRO 6
C-1-139 VACCUM BAGS-PRO-TEAM TRIANGULAR (10 QT 40 | PK JANPTSCP #107314 10/pkg 107314 NO BID INTERCEPT MICRO
FOR CORDLESS VAC) 1/PACK#107314 5 00123060 9 80/392 772/308.80 FILTERS 10/PK
14.44/577.60
573139 PROTEAM 107315
HEPA FILTER REPLACEMENT CARTREIDGE FOR PT-1073155T - PRO Pro Team gk proteam HEPA EXHAUST FILTER
C-1-140 12 PK TEAM 7.60/91.20 #107315 2/pkg 107315 NO BID 2/PACK 11.66/139.92
CORDLESS VAC'Z/PACK #107315 ' ’ 7.90/94.80 34.27/411.24
C-3-176  |Green Brite Brand Multi-Carpet Cleaner; 4 Gal. Per 88 | EA 1070660 WAXIE-GREEN
C ENCAPSULATING
ase C2631TLC Canbara #1110 chemcor CARPET EXTRACTION
TRAFFIC 10.75/946 chemical corp- NO BID CLEANER GL 4/
LANEG.50/572 ' 30301 23.00/506 21.10/1,856.80
C-4-177 Green Rinse Floor Neutralizer - 4 Gal. Per Case 64 | EA 320250 WAXIE-GREEN
A FLOOR CONDITIONER
CE00507 Chemcore . ¢ ‘?mlc‘" NEUTRALIZER 2X90/.5 0Z
4.401281.60 #82001 chemica’ corp- NO BID PACKETS / PRICED @
Aes 5.25/336 82001 TUB 25.19/1,612.16
15.12/241.92
D-01-42 430 | EA  |(LoopEnd)Golden] oo e WaXIE LARGE
Mop Heads, 320z Cotton:Flo Pac #9553 X- GOLDEN STAR PM- Gold Star #ASB5- acsindustries- | - Star #ASBSX| 1\ e SUPER LOOP
: i SCXLB XL 5.20/2,496.00 M8532 5:39/2587.20 MOP HEAD 12/CS
Large:Headband & Tailband (12 per case) 4.4412,131.20 AT 56.28/2,251.20 | (144 ea min
order) 8.53/4,094.40
D-01-43 100 | EA C-932B IMPACT Impact tolco-120119 | COMMeMal 1 ao00u5 WAXIE SPRAY
BOTTLES-SPRAY BOTTLE ONLY, Continental #924B (24 o0z.) 5032WG .40/40 #5024WG-EA 41/41.00 #924B .5.3/53.00 BOTILE - 2407 74174
.5/50.00 (50 ea min order)
D-01-44 200 | EA _ 890040 WAXIE TRIGGER
Continental | SPRAYER FOR 24 0Z &
TRIGGER SPRAYER ASSEMBLY ONLY (For 24 oz. Bottle) €-922999 IMPACT Impact #5806 tolco-110501 #902BW7 320Z SPRAY BOTTLE
Continental #902BW7; 8" 5906 .43/86 .56/112 .49/98.00 .49/98.00 (50 ea 54/108
min order)
D-02-34 100% Cellulose Scrubber Sponge Impact Products #7130P: 5 15 csS 350170 3M SCOTCH-
BRITE 63 LIGHT DUTY
Sponges per ka/CS acs industries- Impact#7130P
C-74 ACS SC200 Impact #7130P SC200 30.95/524.25 (15 SCRUBBING SPONGE -
18.4/276 5/pkg 8.00/120 oo 20 PER CASE
23.41/351.15 min order)

36.04/540.60




TULARE CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT
600 NORTH CHERRY ST.

TULARE, CALIFORNIA 93274
BID NO. 2018/2019 - DUE Thursday , April 4,2019 — 2:00 P.M. - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTIC.)N -- Bid on Bra.md Specified o.r its equal-- ary. | unir Central Poly Central Sanitary D ey ConServ Flag Focus Groupo GTE Inter.borf ) Inter.bor? ) Inter.bori ) Inter.borf ) P &R Paper Pyramid e Unipak
specify your brand in column provided. Corp. Supply Company Packaging "A" | Packaging "B Packaging "C Packaging "D
D-08-11 STERILIZED WIPING RAGS - White Cotton; Terry Cloth 270 | cs 770262 RECYCLED
Reclaimed (Only 10 Ib. Box) AMERICAN TEXTILE # 5123 HOSPECO 340-10 | Hospelo 537-10 H(;Zp%% i340- peerless-173410 I WHITE TOWELS/RAGS -
OX ****25 LBS****
14/3,780.00 13.50/3,645.00 14.35/3,874.50
/ 14.15/3,820.50 / 5081/13,718.70
D-08-8 TRASH CAN LINERS - Large Poly Bags — High | 720 | CS Alstat 7"’\/‘:|3C6’1\M‘(VTA§(')ER3;§3§317
. . state .
Density; 38" x 60" (17 Microns) Color: Natural, Central Poly 1\ | STATE 386017N #H386017N INT-3860-XH, | INT-3860-X-Hvy, | INT-3860-H, | INT-3860-Med, | Republic Bag- ROLL LINER 10120 UPC 386017 N
#CP3860N17R 20.8/14.976.00 200/cs Sample #D-08-8A | Sample #D-08-8B | Sample #D-08-8C | Sample #D-08-8D| N386017CR NO BID (200/CS) 27.63/19,893.60 17.58/12,657.60
Coreless Rolls (200 per case) 19.8/14,256 Rt 9115.120 21.98/15,825.60 | 18.34/13.204.80 | 16.48/11,865.60 | 14.98/10,785.60 | 21.94/15,796.8 DS SRS
D-08-9 192 | CS
WASTEBASKET LINERS — Small Poly Bag - L R —" #H’*S'Bs;tfw INT-3037-Med, | INT-3037-Reg, | INT-3037-Rey, | INT-3037-Reg, | Republic Bag- 704525 WAXIE 30X37 10 UPC 303710 N
High Density; 30" x 37" (10 Microns) Color: #CP3037N10R Sample #D-08-9A | Sample #D-08-9B | Sample #D-08-98 | Sample #D-08-98 [  N303710CR NO BID MIC NAT CORELESS
15.212,918.40 14.4/2.764.80 S007cs 16.48/3,164.16 | 13.24/2542.08 | 13.24/2542.08 | 13.24/2542.08 | 21.94/3,068.16 ROLL LINER 20125 13.80/2,649.60
Natural, Coreless Rolls (500 per case) ' 14.50/2,784.00 ' : : : g
(500/CS) 20.59/3,953.28
D-08-24 24 1030610 WAXIE CSL
] ] CALCIUM SCALE LIME
Briter N Ever Pionner Chem PC1000 Qt NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID REMOVER QT 12/CS
10.51/252.24
D-09-6 FACIAL TISSUES - Two-Ply; White; Georgia Pacific Mfg. # 320 | cs AG-547 INTEGRITY _ General Paper [g51410 48100
48100 (30 boxes per case) Central Poly #2930|  / SO-11513 LIVI i?’;g%g@g' Forza byGTE Morex-FT301002 14“5:/”4675302180 PREFERENCE WHITE
1361/4,35520 | 16.61/3,395.20 FT1 10.5/3,360 12.29/3,932.8 ' >80 |FACIAL TISSUE - 30X100
bx/cs 12/3,840 (100cs min ~ |20.36/6,515.20
17.50/5,600 order)
D-10-1 TOILET SEAT COVERS - Half Fold (White 540 | PKG HS:E?SOHLSDCTEIELCE\;CSLEEET
Paper) Health Gards # HG-5000 (250 Per Pack) Royality #RP- Health Gards | COVERS 250CT (CS OF
(20 Packs per Case) GP-47046 H6-5000 HFTSE-20P Morex-TSC500 #DS5000 20)CASE ONLY $33.40
INTEGRITY 1.1/594 |  1.70/918.00 250/pkg 21.60/583.20 |1.66/896.40 (400| PER CASE 1.67/901.80
1.23/664.20 pkg min order)
D-10-2 TOILET TISSUE - 2-ply ; Georgia Pacific Roll 504 | CS
h I I 851336 WAXIE 027
Master — (770 sheets per Roll; 48 rolls per case) FB-2478BR/ GP- Georgia Pacific softtouch-ST027 EVERLAST 2-PLY HIGH
for Roll Master Dispenser Model # 19027 19027 38/20,520.00 #19027 250 FT 48 34.59/17.433.36 NO BID CAPACITY BATH TISSUE
49.00/24,696.00 tlics 110/55,440 : et 48800800 SHEETS***
49.73/25,063.92
D-10-3 PLEATED WATER CUPS, Solo #450, 3-1/2 oz. 3 CS Genpak 110350 450 3 1/2 07
PC-450 GENPAK #W450F Solo-450 NO BID PAPER WATER CUPS
(100 cups per box/ 5000 cups per case) 49.75/149.25 2500/cs 97.24/291.72 12.60/367 86
51.10/153.30 : :
D-10-4 PAPER TOWELS 12-ROLL PER CASE 350 1150 | CS Roality #GGP 656082 SCA RK350A
. oality - _
ROLL Marcal #p720N | TRTK-350 KRAFT TR14550 12 | ForzabYGTE Total Paper TORK UNIVERSAL HAND
HRT 350' 12/CS HRT350B 835KT20 NO BID
17.7120,355 15.95/18,342.50 riics 15.39/17,698.5 14.74/16,951.00 TOWEL NATURAL 12/350
IR0 15.50/17,825.00( "~ EE : Gt 17.86/20,539.00
D-WALL-45 |MOP HANDLE, WOOD, Quick Change (12 Per Case)| 36 | EA
" _RO" . PM-HQC83 ABCO #01204- ACS Industries- | Impact #WH937 650641 WAXIE 60 IN
(7" Head - 60" Handle); Impact #WH93 GOLDEN STAR NE-EA M8901 15.99/575.64 (36| WOOD QUICK-WAY MOP
5.1/183.60 5.60/201.60 68.76/206.28 | eaminorder) | HANDLE 7.58/272.88
D-WALL-55 |BUCKET, IMPACT #5510R 12 | EA 292714 SA IMPACT
5510RS 10 QT BUCKET
C'%SlgzggACT 'mpgc;s#/gT OR NO BID NO BID RED W/ WHITE
o . SANITIZER IMPRINT
14.71/176.52
”n H
D-WALL-56 VEHI?LE BRUSH, Polyftyrene 2-112 ”Wlde.and 12 | EA FP.1234 CARLISLE ABCO #BH- S 2060110 10-N TRUCK
1-1/2" Thick. Trim 2-1/2" — Length 14"; Carlisle 36123423 18009-EA 15.40/184.80 NO BID WASH BRUSH
#361234 17.49/209.88 13.15/157.80 . . 14.71/176.52
D-WALL-66 [SQUEEGEE RUBBER REFILL 16" EA Unger #RT400-
SE-16R 1.5/9 PACK NO BID NO BID NO BID

2.80/16.80




TULARE CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT
600 NORTH CHERRY ST.

TULARE, CALIFORNIA 93274

BID NO. 2018/2019 - DUE Thursday , April 4,2019 — 2:00 P.M. - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES
DESCRIPTION -- Bid on Brand Specified or its equal-- Central Poly | Central Sanitary ) ConServ Flag Interbora Interbora Interbora Interbora . . .
ITEM NO. e ) T e SR, QTY. | UNIT Corp. supply CCP Industries Company Focus Groupo GTE packaging "A" | Packaging"B" | Packaging"C" | Packaging "D" P &R Paper Pyramid Waxie Unipak
D-WALL-69 TOILET BOWL BRUSH SYNTHETIC - 21" 48 | EA FP-313 CARLISLE I t #220 CAR-36100624 Ru:fszrsT;id Tﬁ?ﬁ?o?&?%@i
. - mpac - g
HANDLE (48/ Case)’ Carlisle #36100624 363300 3.1/148.80 3.10/148.80 3.10/148.80 1.79/85.92 (48 BRUSH 3.44/165.12
min order)
K R " i . u Impact #9200 2030931 9200 (C-20X
D-WALL-70 [Plunger Force Cup 6 Dla.meter cup: shaped 18 12 | ea FP 4391 IMPACT 61'385/8220 Boardwalk 9201 3;22:::(():11:; 0sn 9200 L(UNGEL
handle (12 per case) Carlisle #364386 9200 3.58/42.96 3984776 |77 L e 6.46/7752
D-WALL-71 [LAMBSWOOL DUSTER TELESCOPIC 60 | EA Lambstan Spec | 80170 WAXIE #360
C-4573300 LAMBSWOOL DUSTER 304
CARLISLE # 4573300 GARLISLE Impact #3105 CAR-4573300 #350ex 59 IN 8.36/501.60
6.00/360 8.50/510 | 4.19/251.40 (60
8.99/539.40 )
ea min order)
K - i i} 290980 34108 100
D-WALL-74 [SINGLE EDGE RAZOR BLADES Single Edge, 6 BX BRB-1X BLADES LSJr';g;:; ?(L)J(r)\;g( - Impact #34108 | 5L ADES FoR SAFETY
100 Blades Per Box #UNG-SRB3 5.5/33 15.60/93.60 5.99/35.94 SCRAPER 8.94/53.64
D-WALL-77 |KEY- BAK STAINLESS CHAIN-KEY HOLDER 40 | EA o BID ;)%YOEB(/;E O BID o BID
w/24" Stainless Steel Chain #0005-011 12/480
D-WALL-80 [PUMICE SCOURING STICK, PORCELAIN/TILE | 20 | EA ) US Pumice 1030451 PUMIE
C-PS US PUMICE Pumice Co. fuom12 SCOURING STICK
16203240 #PUM-12 NoBID [ 19/43;:80 20 PUMICE BAR 12/CS
oeles. 1.80/36 AR ea 1.95/39
min order)
D-WALL-81 [Push Broom Coarse, Heany Polypropylene Stiff 2 — ABCO 46112007 Sﬁ‘?ig";ﬁ%’gi gE'SNH
Bristles (broom only no handle) Carlise #367236 EA GOLDENSTAR 9/18 7 0014 NO BID NO Bid BROOM 24.33/48.66
D-WALL-85 |[BROOM, SYNTHETIC - ANGLE CUT- SOFT 72 | EA 4065000 ABCO 4BR. ABCO Hbrig2dmh Zgg‘;iogxg’g;*;i*;“
BLACK BRISTLE Carlisle # 4065000 CARLISLE 1024MH c;xg;ggicl%o 3.99/287.28 (72| BROOM 11.93/858.96
8.99/647.28 5.26/378.72 ’ ’ ea min order)
K _ 2050981 WAXIE 60 IN
D-WALL-86 HANDLE - 60" no threads, for Squeegee or Window 10 EA PM-60TH v o TAPERED BROOM HAND
. GOLDENSTAR BWK #125 4.00/40 NO BID 2.99/29.90 (10 1 48144580
Brush; CLEAN IT SUPPLY #BWK125 ey e e 4844,
D-WALL-93 |36" DUST MOP REFILL - DISPOSE PREMIER 192 | EA D|56p58953;\13\fé\>[<)|5§?weop
GS-AST36W ACS Industries- |Greenwood #607
#120420 GOLDENSTAR GO'dSS;r/f’SEﬁ'%W M9136 3.34/641.28 (48 | HEAD 12/CS 7.09/1,361.28
4.49/862.08 R 31.56/1,009.92 | ea min order)
E-1-101 DRUM DOLLY for 32 or 44 Gal. Garbage Can; 37 | EA ) Continental BES;EODZSC‘&R‘;‘LJX‘CDK
. . avex -
Continental #3255 (Twist-on) C-3244-p CONTICO #274TCDOLLY NO BID #3255 22.00/817.33
3255 17/629 20/740.00 18.98/702.26 (24
’ ea min order)
E-1-92 DOORMAT SMALL - BLACK FINGERTIP 180 | EA CM-10524X32 Apache #39-372-| 232020 WAXIE 2X3 GRAY
24"y 3" CACTUS MAT Catns 2.8 | Catcus #35-2432 NG BID 0900 BRUSH STEP MAT
" 17.9/3,222 ’ 26.00/4,680 13.98/2516.40 11.88/2,138.40
s (72 ea min order)
E-1-93 MOP BUCKET, Plastic 44 Qt. Continental #403- | 26 | EA contential 335-
. - C-335-3YW Rubber Maid #FG-
3YW; Yellow; with Casters CONTICO 618688YEL NO BID 20 ;‘1’“’03 o8 NO BID
30.99/805.74 160.00/4,160 S
(12 ea mon order
E-1-97 MOP WRINGER - DOWN PRESS, 32 Oz., 20 | EA S 000y C:;‘al';if&/a'
. - mpact
Continental Co. #SW7YW CONTICO 42.95/859 67.50/1,350 NOBID 1,7 68/959.60 (20 NOBID
ea min order)
E-2-106 WASTEBASKET (Round) 44-3/8" — Continental 132 | EA Continental rZong}\fS S?ﬁoﬁl\(ﬂ:ﬁ/@é
#4438BE; Beige; 6/cs C-4438BE CONTICO Contenental C::;g‘;g?' NG BID . 4#9‘23;35 OE e8| QT WASTEBASKET
8.8/1,161.60 4438BE 19.89 16502178 (72 24 Min 11.80/1,557.60

order)




TULARE CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT
600 NORTH CHERRY ST.

TULARE, CALIFORNIA 93274

BID NO. 2018/2019 - DUE Thursday , April 4,2019 — 2:00 P.M. - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES

DESCRIPTION -- Bid on Brand Specified or its equal-- Central Poly | Central Sanitary ) ConServ Flag Interbora Interbora Interbora Interbora . . .
ITEM NO. e ) T e SR, QTY. | UNIT Corp. supply CCP Industries Company Focus Groupo GTE packaging "A" | Packaging"B" | Packaging"C" | Packaging "D" P &R Paper Pyramid Waxie Unipak
E-2-107 WASTEBASKET (Rectangular) 28-1/8" Qt. 24 | EA Continental 7302§2§§EQTT %LR\;\’?STE
Continental #2818BE; Beige; 12/cs C-2818B CONTICO Contenental | Impact #DTC2808 Hospital Spec #2818BE 32.94/790.56
3.3/79.20 2818BE 6.89 5.45/130.80 20.84/500.16 |3.69/88.56 (24 ea
min order)
E-2-108 SOILED NAPKIN CAN- METAL WHITE - FLOOR | 17 | EA Impact #1115 | 020720 WHITE METAL
WM-2211 HOSPECO Impact #1115 NG BID 15 95/499.66 16 | FLOOR RECEPTACLE
UNIT IMPACK PRODUCT 1115 23.90/407 83 45/765.00 -98/492.66 ( 29.86/507.62
ea min order)
E-2-94 MOP BUCKET, Plastic 35 Qt. Continental #335- 3 EA 660023C 335-3 CM
. R Continental #335 YELLOW 35QT MOP
3YW; Yellow; with Casters WP-2635Y Contenental 335] Impact #2635- CAR-369054 | 3vW:vYellow | BUCKET 71.01/213.03
30.99/92.97 3Yw89.89 | 3Y45/135.00 50.85/152.55 |39.98/119.96 (12
ea min order
E-2-95 MOP PLASTIC BUCKET With/CASTERS 26 qt. 4 EA . Contential #276-
C-226-3YW #274Mac\)lz)é;CKT NO BID Syw NO BID
CONTICO 27.25/109 VPE 36.00/144 33.98/135.92
(4ea Mine order)
i i i _ San Jamar
E-3-112 Toilet Tissue Dispenser — SAN JAMAR MODEL # 70 | Ea NG BID GLSMR3300TBL ARBE00TBK O BID O BID O BID
GLSMR3300TBK 28.00/1960.00 22.60/1,582
E-3-117  [WD-40 Lubricant Spray; 9 oz. Aerosol 24 410372 WAXIE
WD-40 WD40- INDUSTRIAL SILICONE
EA WD-40 (1002) #WDF490026 WD_40 Company: WDF490040 LUBRICANT SPRAY 11 0Z
4.9/117.60 8oz 12/cs 4900 7.46/179.04| 6.89/165.36 (24 |  CAN 12/CS 4.25/102
5.50/132.00 ea min order)
E-3-119 Urinal Block with Screen (12 units per box) 24 Impact #9400C 162057 WAXIE-GREEN
1.20/28.80 Impact #94gos | URINAL SCREEN MANGO
EA C-165 AMERICAN Boardwalk-1001 |, o0 2o’ e WITH GREEN
SAN.86/20.64 11.04/2208 77 0 ) DEODORANT BLOCK
min order 1.20/28.80
E-3-120 TOILET BOWL DEODORANT- One Piece 48 | EA Big;gl'q‘i‘/‘;"ies 16&:?\']5?(\2’22')ET%T£¥G
H . H n " X
Disposable Plastic Container, BIG "D O BID 1.70/81.60 BIG D Industries- | RIMSTICK W/BLUE
INDUSTRIES # 601 (4 Oz.) 12 Per Box; 12 684 13.92/55.68 DEODstQQJziLOCK
Boxes per Case o
E-3-122 DISINFECTANT SPRAY 16 oz. Aerosol Can (12 | 288 | EA 170041 WAXIE HOSPITAL
Per Case) Chase SPRAY SURFACE
C-014 CHASE #4334104 Claire MFG-1002 ;2:5/87’1‘;3324(112‘; Ci';'f';gg?&jffogéz
2.15/619.20 16.50z 12/cs 51.48/1,235.52 [ 777 R
2.10/604.80 ea min order)
E-3-124 AIR FRESHENER AEROSOL SPRAY 1 UN 336 | EA 160301 WAXIE KLEEN-AIR
K-AIR FRESH WILD Chase Claire MFG.160 | #433-4113 MOUNT MIST DRY AR
LAVENDER #4334113 150z 43.08/1, 206,24 | >43/816:48 (144| FRESHENER CAN 12/CS
2.1/705.60 12/cs 2.25/756 : e ea min order) 3.64/1,223.04
E-3-138 Sani-SORB Absorbent Deodorant (controls 50 H76171 HILLYARD Fresh # 6-14-SS-S-
Odors- Minerlas EA 4.99/249.50 BX 12 0z blbx NOBID NOBID
: : 40/2000
E-3-139 Pumps for 1 Gallon Jugs 20 mnact 904 Tolco #160100 (890210 1 OZDISPENSING
EA C-91.39/27.8 n NO BID 189/37.80 (20 |  PUMP 3.69/73.80
3.00/60 ;
min order)
F-3-151 BOWL MOP SQUEEGEE w/Built-in Wringer 110 | EA ) Impact #3600 |2060440 3600 BIG DIPPER
C-890 BOARDWALK Impact #3600- ACS Industries- |\ o) o' (77 | BOWL MOP 2.75/302.50
Impact #3600 (72 per case) 149/163.90 EA 1.60/176.00 B222.83/91.30 | >/
each min order)
261314 3M 14-IN WHITE
ARSI . : 3-M14W NIAGRA 3M BWK #4014WHI ACS41-14 SUPER POLISH PAD
14" White Scrubing Pads (5 in a pack) 25 | PK 791197 50 10.50/262.50 7.29/182.25 (25 #4100 3.45/86.25
24.89 NO BID ea min order)
LED1 #ALO6132
LED 12W-T-8 Pluag & Play (4 Ft Lamp) 2600 EA NO BID 9.00/23,400.0 NO BID NO BID NO BID




