IFB #17-008 - BROCHURE/NEWSLETTER PRINTING AND MAILING

TABULATION
Compan Wolfe Graphics, Inc dba
pany Advance Mailing Columbine Printing | A Graphic Resource, Inc.| Messenger Print Group Minuteman Press Presort, Inc. Gibson Printing, Inc.
Description Qty per Number of Price per Extended Price per Extended Price per Extended Price per Extended Price per Extended Price per Extended Price per Extended
P Publication | Publications | publication Price publication Price publication Price publication Price publication Price publication Price publication Price
F;:);:T;S 18,000 3 per year NO BID NO BID $8,300.00 | $24,900.00( $5,716.00 |$17,148.00| * $5690.00 | $17,040.00 NO BID NO BID $8,980.00 |$26,942.97 | $12,005.00 | $36,015.00
g?géﬁi?:; 200 3 per year NO BID NO BID $70.00 $210.00 $42.00 $126.00 $38.00 $114.00 NO BID NO BID $9,058.00 |$27,174.00 | $12,144.00 | $36,432.00
Additional 4 Up to 3 per
pages if 18000 P earp NO BID NO BID $1,600.00 | $4,800.00 | $1,224.00 | $3,672.00 | $1,247.00 | $3,743.00 NO BID NO BID $10,593.00 | $31,780.83| $727.00 $2,181.00
needed y
ﬁ‘i‘;r‘t‘ page 18000 | P ;‘;:rper NOBID | NOBID $1,890.00 | $5,670.00 | $2,620.00 | $7,860.00 | NOBID | NOBID $1,760.00 | $5,283.00
ﬁigf page 1800 | P ;‘;:rper NOBID | NOBID $4,020.00 |$12,060.00| $3,390.00 |$10,199.00| NOBID | NO BID $3,611.00 |$10,833.00
Add 1 double- Up to 3 per
sided postcard 18000 P earp NO BID NO BID $1,620.00 | $4,860.00 | $1,700.00 | $5,100.00 NO BID NO BID $1,944.00 | $5,832.00
insert y
Cost for
NO BID er page $8.00 er page * er page er page NO BID er page $25.00 er page $40.00 er page
changes made per pag per pag per pag per pag per pag per pag per pag
after proof is per 15
supplied NO BID |per change $5.00 per change * per change $16.25 minutes NO BID |per change $25.00 |[perchange | $100.00 [Per Hour
Ne\\//\llssll(()et[]ter 18,000 6 per year NO BID NO BID $3,032.00 |[$18,192.00( $2,745.00 | $16,470.00| $2,063.00 |$12,378.00( $4,000.00 |$24,000.00| $3,201.16 |$19,206.96| $3,581.00 | $21,486.00
ﬁgt\?\:glc:—:‘r':?;rs 200 6 per year NO BID NO BID $20.00 $120.00 $19.00 $114.00 $12.00 $72.00 $44.00 $262.00 $3,228.40 |$19,370.40| $3,672.00 | $22,032.00
Additional 4 Up to 6 per
pages if 18000 P earp NO BID NO BID $1,718.00 |$10,308.00 | ** $1295.00 | $7,770.00 | $1,160.00 | $6,960.00 | $1,760.00 |$10,608.00| $4,576.19 |$27,457.14( $905.00 $5,430.00
needed y
Cost for
NO BID er page 8.00 er page * er page er page er page 25.00 er page 40.00 er page
changes made per pag $ per pag per pag per pag per pag $ per pag $ per pag
after proof is per 15
supplied NO BID |per change $5.00 per change * per change $16.25 minutes $17.50 |per change $25.00 [perchange | $100.00 [Per Hour
N-g\r/]vilztzer 600 4 per year NO BID NO BID $365.00 $1,460.00 $326.00 $1,304.00 $635.00 $2,540.00 $255.00 $1,020.00 $150.00 $600.00 $415.00 $1,660.00
Additional 200 Uptodper | nopip | noBiD | $110.00 | $440.00 | $80.00 | $32000 | $70.00 | $280.00 | $85.00 | $340.00 | $40.00 | $160.00 | $173.00 | $692.00
Newsletters year
Additional 4 Up 10 4 per
pages if 600 P yearp NO BID NO BID $325.00 $1,300.00 $229.00 $916.00 $255.00 $1,020.00 $185.00 $740.00 $25.00 $1,000.00 $492.00 $1,980.00

needed




Company

Advance Mailing

Columbine Printing

A Graphic Resource, Inc.

Messenger Print Group

Wolfe Graphics, Inc dba
Minuteman Press

Presort, Inc.

Gibson Printing, Inc.

Description

Qty per
Publication

Number of
Publications

Price per Extended
publication Price

Price per Extended
publication Price

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Price per Extended
publication Price

Price per Extended
publication Price

Price per Extended
publication Price

Cost for
changes made
after proof is
supplied

NO BID |per page

$8.00 per page

$5.00

per page

per page

per page

$25.00 |per page

$40.00 |per page

NO BID |per change

$5.00 per change

per change

$16.25

per 15
minutes

$17.50 |per change

$25.00 |per change

$100.00 [Per Hour

RENEWALS

Percentage
increase based
on previous
year for 2™
Contract Year

0%

0%

2%

0%

6.50%

5%

0%

Percentage
increase based
on previous
year for 3"
Contract Year

5%

0%

2%

3%

6.50%

5%

0%

Percentage
increase based
on previous
year for 4™
Contract Year

0%

0%

2%

3%

6.50%

5%

0%

MAILING

Description

Qty per
Publicatio
n

Number of
Publications

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Fun Times
Brochure —
Printed with
ECRWSS
Postal Local
Customer and
ship to a bulk
mailing
company or
Post Office

16,000

3 per year

$ 1,700.00 | $5,100.00

$150.00 $450.00

$640.00

$1,920.00

included

$0.00

NO BID NO BID

$640.00 $1,920.00

NO BID NO BID




Company

Advance Mailing

Columbine Printing

A Graphic Resource, Inc.

Messenger Print Group

Wolfe Graphics, Inc dba

Minuteman Press

Presort, Inc.

Gibson Printing, Inc.

Description

Qty per
Publication

Number of
Publications

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Price per
publication

Extended
Price

Fun Times
Brochure —
Out of Area
addresses will
be provided by
City. Firm to
print and affix
addresses as
specified

2,000

3 per year

$ 300.00

$ 900.00

$225.00

$675.00

included in
above price

$0.00

** $290.00

$870.00

NO BID

NO BID

$200.00

$600.00

NO BID

NO BID

Fun Times
Brochure —
*Extras as
indicated by the
City per issue
and delivered
to Progress
Park

PER 100

3 per year

$ 30.00

$ 900.00

$11.00

$33.00

$21.00

$0.00

*** $19.00

$57.00

NO BID

NO BID

$25.00

$75.00

NO BID

NO BID

Vision
Newsletter —
Printed with an
ECRWSS label
and ship to a
bulk mailing
company

16,000

6 per year

$ 1,700.00

$ 5,100.00

$150.00

$900.00

$640.00

$3,840.00

$2,179.00

$13,074.00

NO BID

NO BID

$560.00

$3,360.00

NO BID

NO BID

Vision
Newsletter —

Out of Area
addresses will
be provided by
City. Firm to
print and affix
addresses as
specified

2,000

6 per year

$ 300.00

$ 900.00

$225.00

$1,350.00

included in
above price

$0.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$150.00

$900.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Vision
Newsletter —

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




Wolfe Graphics, Inc dba

Company - . - . . . . .

Advance Mailing Columbine Printing | A Graphic Resource, Inc.| Messenger Print Group Minuteman Press Presort, Inc. Gibson Printing, Inc.

Description Qty per Number of Price per Extended Price per Extended Price per Extended Price per Extended Price per Extended Price per Extended Price per Extended
Publication | Publications | publication Price publication Price publication Price publication Price publication Price publication Price publication Price

*Extras as
indicated by the| PER 100 6 peryear | $ 30.00| $ 90.00 $11.00 $66.00 $9.50 $0.00 *** $6.00 $36.00 $25.00 $150.00
City per issue NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
and delivered
to City Hall
The Biz -
Addresses
provided by the 600 3peryear | $ 160.00( $ 480.00( $160.00 $480.00 $130.00 $390.00 $210.00 $630.00 NO BID NO BID $150.00 $450.00 NO BID NO BID
City for each
issue.

* 3 pages- 0. 4th page $60. Nongqualifying ECRWSS will

additional pages $13

** it is cheaper to print 8

extra pages than to print 4.

addl. Cost $747.00.
extended $4482

* includes ECRWSS mail
prep 16M PCS.

address at a higher rate.

** plus $85.00 NCOA if

needed. Up to 5000 ink jet

addresses
*** plus $35.00 delivery




