CITY OF WENTZVILLE - PRINTING SERVICES RFP #B812WZ093

BID TABULATION - corrected 10-15-2012
'l'lll\\

Estimated
ITEM/DESCRIPTION Quantity
ITEM 1. VISION NEWSLETTER:
1.a. VISION Newsletter 11,400

Total for item 1.a.:

1.b. Proof charge per publication:
Total for Item 1.b.:

1.c. Cost for additional 4 pages:

1.f. Cost for Changes:

TOTAL FOR ITEMS 1.a., 1.b,, 1.c., and L.f.:
Percentage increase for 2nd Year:
Percentage increase for 3rd Year:
Percentage increase for 4th Year:

4-YEAR TOTAL:

NOTES:

ATTACHMENT B

A Graphic Resource Paperleaf Swift Print FedEx Office
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
$2,020.00 022 $2,508.00 $2,340.00 0.2798 $3,189.72
x 6 publications: x & publications: x 6 publications: x 6 publications:
$12,120.00 $15,048.00 $14,040.00 $19,138.32
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
x 6 publications: x 6 publications: % 6 publications: x 6 publications:
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$978.00 $984.00 $1,155.00 $1,400.00
$60.00 $10.00 $35.00 $60.00
$13,158.00 $16,042.00 " $15,230.00 $20,598.32
0% based on prior yr 10% basedonYr 1 See note below 2%
3% based on prior yr 10% based on Yr 2 -|See note below 2%
3% based on prior yr 10% basedonYr3 See note below 2%
$53,828.06 sce note below $74,450.92 $84,881.52
Note: AGR bid states "Prices based on /¢ \\\ 042 NOTE: Swift Print bid states paper

current paper cost, availability and
freight costs-both are subject to
review",
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prices subject to change with each
order.

jet, address and mail as a flat to local
post office.

$365.00 additional per 11,400 for ink-




CITY OF WENTZVILLE - PRINTING SERVICES RFP #B12WZ093
BID TABULATION - corrected 10-15-2012

ITEM 2. BUSINESS CARDS:

Business Cards: 20 boxes of 250

10 boxes of 500
TOTAL FOR ITEM 2.

Percentage increase for 2nd Year:
Percentage increase for 3rd Year:
Percentage increase for 4th Year:

ITEM 2: 4-YEAR TOTAL:

NOTES::

ATTACHMENT B

A Graphic Resource Paperleaf Swift Print FedEx Office
No Bid $3000  $600.00 $345.00 No Bid
No Bid $35.00 $350.00 $395.00 No Bid
$950.00 $740.00

10% basedonYr1 See note below

10% based on Yr 2 See note below

10% based on Yr 3 See note below
No Bid $4,408.95 No Bid

Note: AGR bid states "Prices based on
current paper cost, availability and
freight costs-both are subject to
review".

In accordance with Wentzville/Title 1, Government Code, Chapter 142, Resolution 11-400, the City shall award the
contract to the “best” bid, not necessarily the lowest bid. The contract award shall be based on the bid submission
and additional information provided that, in the City’s sole discretion, best meets the interests and requirements of
the City. The City reserves the right, in its sole discretion, to reject any or all bids, or portions thereof, to waive

technicalities or deficiencies in any or all the bids.
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NOTE: Swift Print bid states paper
prices subject to change with each
order.




CITY OF WENTZVILLE - PRINTING SERVICES RFP #B12W2093
BID TABULATION - corrected 10-15-2012

Estimated
ITEM/DESCRIPTION Quantity
ITEM 1. VISION NEWSLETTER:
1.a. VISION Newsletter 11,400

Total for Item 1.a.:

1.b. Proof charge per publication:
Total for item 1.b.:

1.c. Cost for additional 4 pages:

1.f. Cost for Changes:

TOTAL FOR ITEMS 1.a., 1.b,, 1.c., and 1%.:
Percentage increase for 2nd Year:
Percentage increase for 3rd Year:
Percentage increase for 4th Year:

4-YEAR TOTAL:

NOTES:

ATTACHMENT B

A Graphic Resource Paperleaf Swift Print FedEx Office
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
$2,020.00 022 $2,508.00 $2,340.00 0.2798 $3,189.72
x 6 publications: X 6 publications: x 6 publications: x 6 publications:
$12,120.00 $15,048.00 $14,040.00 $19,138.32
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
x 6 publications: x 6 publications: x 6 publications: x 6 publications:
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$978.00 $984.00 $1,155.00 $1,400.00
$60.00 $10.00 $35.00 $60.00
$13,158.00 $16,042.00 $15,230.00 $20,598.32
0% based on prior yr 10% basedonYr1 See note below 2%
3% based on prior yr 10% based on Yr 2 See note below 2%
3% based on prior yr 10% based on Yr 3 See note below 2%
$53,828.06 See note below $74,450.92 $84,881.52

Note: AGR bid states "Prices based on
current paper cost, availability and
freight costs-both are subject to
review".
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NOTE: Swift Print bid states paper
prices subject to change with each
order.

$365.00 additional per 11,400 for ink-
jet, address and mail as a flat to local
post office.




CITY OF WENTZVILLE - PRINTING SERVICES RFP #B12WzZ093

BID TABULATION - corrected 10-15-2012

iTEM 2. BUSINESS CARDS:
Business Cards:

TOTAL FOR ITEM 2.
Percentage increase for 2nd Year:

Percentage increase for 3rd Year:
Percentage increase for 4th Year:

ITEM 2: 4-YEAR TOTAL:

NOTES:

In accordance with Wen

20 boxes of 250
10 boxes of 500

ATTACHMENT B

A Graphic Resource Paperleaf Swift Print FedEx Office
No Bid $30.00 $600.00 $345.00 No Bid
No Bid $35.00 $350.00 $395.00 No Bid
$950.00 $740.00
10% based on Yr 1 See note below
10% based on Yr 2 See note below
10% basedonYr3 See note below
No Bid $4,408.95 No Bid

Note: AGR bid states "Prices based on
current paper cost, availability and
freight costs-both are subject to
review",

ille/Title 1, Government Code, Chapter 142, Resolution 11-400, the City shall award the

contract to the “best” bid, not necessarily the lowest bid. The contract award shall be based on the bid submission
and additional information provided that, in the City’s sole discretion, best meets the interests and requirements of

the City. The City reserves the right, i
technicalities or deficiencies in any or ali the bids.

its sole discretion, to reject any or all bids, or portions thereof, to waive
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NOTE: Swift Print bid states paper
prices subject to change with each
order.






