Bid Tabulation ATTACHMENT C
Printing Services for Parks Brochure, IFB # B14WZ206
Walsworth Paper Leaf A Graphic The UPS
Vendors Publishing Eazy Business Printing & | Resource, Inc. | KB Offset Store Signature
Company, Inc. Mailers, Inc.* Design, Inc. *ok Printing, Inc.| 4757*** Offset**** NPC, Inc.

Year 1
a. Printing S 6,365.00 | S 9,395.00 (S 7,036.00(S 6,189.60|S 5,015.00|S 9,922.85|S 5,135.85 | S 6,335.00
b. + brochures S 65.00 | S 150.00 | S 75.00 | S 41.84 | S 60.00 | S - S 4383 | S 55.00
c. 4 add pages S 938.00 | 100.00 [ S  870.00 (5537.93){ S 970.00 | S 1,364.32 | S 497.62 | S 250.00
d. 4-6 page insert | S 1,474.00 | S 2,515.00 | $§ 1,250.00 | $ 631.47 | S 2,250.00 | No Bid S 497.62 | S 1,900.00
e. Postcard S 837.00 | 1,193.00 | $ 1,170.00|$S 1,612.53|S 975.00 | No Bid S 969.57 | $§ 1,085.00

Year 1 Total X 3§ 22,409.00 | S 32,143.00 | $ 24,473.00 | $ 20,316.71 | $19,300.00 | $ 31,132.87 | S 17,416.19 | S 22,295.00

Year 2

Year 3

a. Printing S 6,690.00 | S 9,860.00 [ S 7,515.00 |$S 6,424.22|S 5,185.00 | $ 10,339.56 [ S 5,238.57 | $ 6,580.00
b. +200 brochures | $ 67.00 | S 150.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 43.18 [ S 61.00 | S - S 4471 (S 60.00
c. 4 add pages S 962.00 | S 125.00 [ $ 1,005.00 | S (554.57)[ S 977.00 [ S 1,41150 S 507.57 | S 265.00
d. 4-6 page insert | S 1,510.00 | $ 2,710.00 [ S 1,300.00 | $ 661.19 [ S 2,410.00 | No Bid S 507.57 | S 1,982.00
e. Postcard S 858.00 | S 1,245.00 | $ 1,225.00 | S 1,672.00 [ $ 1,100.00 | No Bid S 988.96 | S 1,130.00

Year 2 Total X 3 |§ 23,467.00 | S 33,810.00 | $ 26,155.00 [ $ 21,094.46 | $20,103.00 | $ 32,430.18 | S 17,764.52 | S 23,177.00

a. Printing $ 6,944.00 [$  10,135.00 | $ 7,730.00 [$ 6,671.14 | $ 5,362.00 | $ 10,339.56 | $ 5,343.34 | $ 6,830.00
b. + 200 brochures| $ 69.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 4452 S 62009 - [S 4530 | S 65.00
c. 4 add pages 3 986.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $  (571.62)[ S 981.00 S 1,411.50]$ 517.72 | $ 282.00
d. 4-6 page insert | $ 1,548.00 | $ 2,890.00 | $ 1,375.00 | $ 692.13 | $ 2,550.00 | No Bid 3 517.72 | $ 2,065.00
e. Postcard 5 880.00 | $ 1,290.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,679.16 | S 1,250.00 | No Bid $  1,008.74 | S 1,177.00
S 24,315.00 | 5  34,885.00 | $ 27,050.00 | $ 21,857.61 | $20,929.00 | $ 32,430.18 [ $ 18,119.50 | $ 24,079.00
Printing Tota

Years 1-3 $ 70,191.00 | $ 100,838.00 | $ 77,678.00 | $ 63,268.78 | $60,332.00 | $ 95,993.23 [ $ 53,300.21 | $ 69,551.00




Bid Tabulation ATTACHMENT C
Printing Services for Parks Brochure, IFB # B14WZ206

Walsworth Paper Leaf A Graphic The UPS
Optional Mail Publishing Eazy Business Printing & | Resource, Inc. | KB Offset Store Signature
Service Company, Inc. Mailers, Inc.* Design, Inc. *ok Printing, Inc.| 4757*** Offset**** NPC, Inc.

Mail Service Retail

Indicia (X 14,756) |No Bid S 0.035 |No Bid No Bid $0.023 $0.000|No Bid S 0.018
Mail Service Out

of Area (X 1,470) [No Bid S 0.060 |No Bid No Bid $0.169 $0.000|No Bid S 0.018
Postage Indicia (X

14,756) No Bid S 0.190 [No Bid No Bid $0.277 $0.215(No Bid S 0.157
Postage Out of

Area (X 1,470) No Bid S 0.480 |No Bid No Bid $0.965 $0.590|No Bid S 0.484
Total Year 1 X 3 No Bid S 12,341.70 [No Bid No Bid $18,281.34 | S 12,119.52 |No Bid S 9,959.40

Mail Service Retail

Indicia (X 15,000) [No Bid $0.035 |No Bid No Bid $0.026 $0.000 |No Bid $0.018
Mail Service Out

of Area (X1,470) |No Bid $0.060 |No Bid No Bid $0.172 $0.000 |No Bid $0.018
Postage Indicia (X

15,000) No Bid $0.205 |No Bid No Bid $0.345 $0.215 |No Bid $0.162
Postage Out of

Area (X 1,470) No Bid $0.500 [No Bid No Bid $1.111 $0.590 |No Bid $0.498
Total Year 2 X3  [\[e}:ifs! $13,269.60 [No Bid No Bid $22,353.03 | $12,276.90 (No Bid $10,375.56




Bid Tabulation ATTACHMENT C
Printing Services for Parks Brochure, IFB # B14WZ206
Walsworth Paper Leat A Graphic The UPS
Optional Mail Publishing Eazy Business Printing & | Resource, Inc. | KB Offset Store Signature
Service Company, Inc. Mailers, Inc.* Design, Inc. ok Printing, Inc.| 4757*** Offset**** NPC, Inc.

Mail Service Retail

Indicia (X 15,250) |No Bid $0.035 |No Bid No Bid $0.029 $0.000 |No Bid $0.018
Mail Service Out

of Area (X 1,470) |No Bid $0.060 [No Bid No Bid $0.188 $0.000 |No Bid $0.018
Postage Indicia (X

15,250) No Bid $0.220 |No Bid No Bid $0.444 $0.215 |No Bid $0.167
Postage Out of

Area (X 1,470) No Bid $0.520 [No Bid No Bid $1.265 $0.590 [No Bid $0.513
Total Year 3 X 3 No Bid $14,224.05 [No Bid No Bid $28,047.48 | $12,438.15 |No Bid $10,805.46
Mailing Tota

Years 1-3 No Bid $39,835.35 [No Bid No Bid $68,681.85 | S 36,834.57 [No Bid S 31,140.42

*Eazy Business Mailers Inc. line d bid for seperately 4 page insert and 6 page insert. Year 1 4pages $1958. Year 2 4pages $2150. Year 3 4 pages $2320.

** A Graphic Resource, Inc. noted size of publication as 8.5"X10 7/8". Line d, 4-6 page insert, was changed to 8 pages to a 28 page brochure.
***The UPS Store did not bid lines d and e.
****Signature Offset line d bid 4 pages only, no bid for 6 page insert.






