RFB 2019-7 AGGREGATE/CINDER MATERIALS

BID OPENED 11/19/2018 10:00AM
|

Vendor Name and Address o
Mid Mo B Capital Quarries Co Riverstone Quarry B Iron Mountain Trap_ Fred Weber Inc | D
e 2604 N Stadium blvd PO Box 105050 8554 Hwy O VR 2320 Creve Coeur MillRd | 2320 Creve Coeur Mill Rd
Columbia Mo 65202 Jeffarson City Mo 65110 5662 Hwy 47, Un Maryland Hgts Mo 63043 Maryland Hgts Mo 63043
Jtem Price per Ton- Price per Ton Price per Ton- Price per Ton Price per Ton- Price per Ton Price per Ton- Price per Ton- Price per Ton
picked up [per Mile-delivered |picked up [per Mile-delivered |picked up /[per Mile-delivered |picked up /per Mile-delivered |picked up /per Mile-delivered
%" Clean N/A Available on request i $14.00|Available on request $10.50| priced by mil?age_ No bid No bid -
1" Minus N/A Available on request $6.85 | Available on request $6.00 | priced by mileage  |No bid B $5.00 |Quoted on request
1" Minus (Wet Base) N/A Available on request | N/A N/A $6,20| priced by mil No bid Nobid
1" clean §10.65/
» - 25
17 Clgan or-HBase 1" Base $6.65 Available on request 102 Available on request $10.50| priced by mil No bid - L $10.00 |Quoted on request
2" Minus CN/A Available on request $6.85 | Available on request $6.00| priced by mileage  |No bid _ $5.00 |Quoted on request
" s 2" Clean $8.75
2" Clean or-2=Hase 2" Base $6.65 Available on request 10 Available on request $8.95 | priced by mileage No bid $9.00 |Quoted on request
3" clean 38.75
" g N/A
Tl 3" Baes 36.65 Available on request N/ _'I o ~|No bid No bid -
3"-5" Clean (Gabion) N/A Available on request §8.75| Available on request $8.95 |priced by mileage  [No bid - No bid
4" Minus $7.40 |Available on request $6.85| Available on request $6.00| priced by mileage  |No bid No bid
Gabion/Rip Rap N/A Available on request - $11.50|Available on request $16.00| priced by mileage | No bid - $16.00 |Quoted on request
8" Clean N/A Available on request $11.50|Available on request $12.75 | priced by mil No bid No bid
Type 1 Rock Blanket $11.40 |Available on request $14.25 | Available on request $14.00|priced by mileage  |No bid ~ |Nobid
Type 2 Rock Blanket $12.40 |Available on request $14.25 | Available on request $14.00|priced by mil No bid _ |Nobid eee 0
Type 5 Base/Blanket o §$7.40 |Available on request $8.25 |Available on request _ $6.20|priced by mileage  [No bid No bid
Quarry Rock/Shot Rock $5.40 |Available on request $5.75 | Available on request $5.25 | priced by mileage | No bid B No bid
Trap Rock N/A Available on request|N/A N/A $11.00 |Quoted on request |[Nobid
Pea Gravel N/A Available on request|N/A N/A - No bid No bid -
Fill Dirt N/A Available on request [$75.00 per load Available on request No bid No bid
Eco Sand N/A Available on request |N/A N/A No bid . No bid
Sand _|NA __ |Available on request |N/A N/A o No bid No bid —
Cinders N/A Available on request |N/A N/A Il $10.50 |Quoted on request |No bid
Screenings $5.50 |Available on request $4.50|Available on request $2.00| priced by mil Nobid | $1.00 |Quoted on request
3/8" clean N/A Available on request _$14.00|Available on request $10.50 | priced by mileage  |No bid No bid -
Top Soil N/A Available on request |N/A |N/A B No bid No bid B
Additions noted: ) .
1" Road Rock - $8,50 - Price FOB New Melle Location 2710 Hwy F
4" - 6" Clean $11.40




